
How do traditions connect generations, and how 
might this be represented through photography? 
Inspired by the Jewish Museum’s permanent 
collection—a unique collection of nearly 30,000 
works of art and objects spanning 4,000 years  
of history—the Museum’s Teen Interns invite 
middle and high school students to submit 
original photographs that explore connections 
between history and contemporary life. This 
prompt is open to your creative and artistic 
interpretation and students may submit up  
to three distinct photographs. 

All images and content must be the student’s 
own original work and free from copyright 
restrictions. Winning photographs will be 
featured on the Jewish Museum’s website  
and social media platforms. Winners will also 
receive an American Express gift card. 

Please use this form to submit your photograph 
by May 31, 2024.

For more information, please email 
teenprograms@thejm.org.

TEEN PHOTO CONTEST: 
TIME AND TRADITION

5th Ave at 92nd St, NYC 
TheJewishMuseum.org 
212.423.3200

Image: Untitled (Grandma Holding Brian’s Letter and Photos), 1982-85, Gay Block. 
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https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfdS0zYaXdEltNPmIRPczptytgHDuUDt3gRmhmqE8gWUkeVkg/viewform
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