
PROCEEDINGS OF THE EVANGELINE PARISH SCHOOL BOARD 

Ville Platte, Louisiana 

June 16, 2021 

 Members of the Evangeline Parish School Board met this day in a regular scheduled meeting at 

6:00 P.M. at the Evangeline Parish Media Center, 607 Harvey LeBas Drive, Ville Platte, LA 70586.   

Board members present were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Board members absent were Mr. Micheal W. Fontenot and Mrs. Sheila Joseph.   

Also, in attendance were Superintendent Darwan Lazard, CFO Amy Lafleur, Board Attorney 

Betsy Jackson and Special Counsel Bob Hammonds; Director Kelli Lafleur (special education) and 

Interim Barbara Victorian (child nutrition program); Supervisors: Grace Sibley (Title I), Johnny Deshotel 

(Career/Technical, Secondary, and Transportation), Penny McDaniel (Title I) and Keith Scott (special 

education); Principals: Helena Francois (BHS), Rico Guillory (MHS), Alice Lejeune (PPHS), and Chenile 

Tezeno (VPHS). 

Board President Wayne Dardeau declared a quorum and ordered members to proceed with the 

business of the day at 6:00 p.m.  

Item # 1 – Minutes from previous meeting dated June 2, 2021 were presented for approval. 

Motion was made by Mrs. Peggy Forman, seconded by Mr. Arthur Savoy, and recommended by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard to approve minutes from previous meeting dated June 2, 2021. 

There was no objection, question or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously. 

Item # 2A – Minutes from Executive Committee Meeting dated June 14, 2021 was presented. 

PROCEEDINGS OF THE EVANGELINE PARISH 

EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE MEETING 

JUNE 14, 2021 

Members of the Evangeline Parish School Board Executive Committee met this day in a 

schedule Executive Committee Meeting. 

 Committee members present were: Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. 

Nancy Hamlin, and Chairperson Peggy Forman.    

 Non-committee board members present was Board President Wayne Dardeau. 

 Others in attendance were Superintendent Darwan Lazard, CFO Amy Lafleur; Director 

Kelli Lafleur (special education), Supervisor Keith Scott (special education).  

Committee Chairperson Peggy Forman declared a quorum and ordered members to proceed with 

the business of the day at 1:05 P.M. 

  Item #1 – FISCAL AGENT AGREEMENT  

 CFO Amy Lafleur explained that Hancock Whitney Bank submitted a proposal for banking 

services for the Evangeline Parish School District for three years (July 1, 2021 through June 30, 

2021. This is the same bank that the District is presently using.   CFO Lafleur explained that, 

because of the size of the parish, we do not have to bid out the fiscal agent, but the District has 

chosen to continue with the practice of accepting proposals.   CFO Lafleur explained that the last 

time a bank other than Hancock Whitney Bank submitted a proposal was in 2007.   

 A fee scheduled for banking services was submitted with the proposal, as Hancock Whitney 

Bank’s corporate re-structuring no longer allows them to provide banking services to the district 

for free.  However, Hancock Whitney Bank is offering an Earnings Credit Rate (ECR), on non-

interest-bearing accounts, of 0.25%, which should offset the monthly service activity charges.   

 CFO Lafleur explained that the District’s Certificate of Deposits (CD) are located at 

another local bank.  The CDs are required to be pledged.  The bank must be large enough to 

pledge all of the securities required to house us as a District.   In the past, there was one bank that 

had to be dropped off of the list to submit proposals, because they were not able to pledge our 

securities properly.   

 CFO Lafleur explained that the District will save money in keeping with the same bank, by 

not having to have any programming changes made within our software. 



 Motion was made by Ms. Nancy Hamlin, seconded by Ms. Georgianna Wilson, and 

recommended by Superintendent Darwan Lazard to appoint Hancock Whitney Bank as fiscal 

agent for the Evangeline Parish School Board for three years (July 1, 2021 through June 30, 2024). 

 There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in 

attendance. 

 Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Nancy 

Hamlin, and Executive Committee Chairperson Peggy Forman. 

 Motion carried unanimously. 

   Item #2 – ESSER UPDATE  

CFO Amy Lafleur gave a report, as of June 7, 2021, on ESSER grants.    

ESSER 1 is comprised of three different “pots of money”,  GEER, Incentive, and Formula.  

Monies for ESSER I were received in April 2020.  The District received $444,164.00 for the GEER 

grant and has expended all of the grant money.  The GEER grant was largely for devices and 

connectivity related to hybrid learning.  The District received $400,207.00 for the Incentive grant, 

of which $395,734.51 has been expended, with outstanding purchase orders totaling $3,052.00, 

leaving a remaining balance of $1,420.49.  The Incentive grant was largely for Tier I curriculum 

and tutoring.  The remining monies of the Incentive grant is for tutoring and non-public funds.  

The District received $2,760,758.00 for the Formula grant, of which $2,432,325.72 has been spent, 

with open purchase orders totaling $251,838.44. leaving a balance of $76,593.84.  The remaining 

balance is for social emotion health, hotspot services and sanitation supplies.   When asked when 

does all of the ESSER money have to be expended, CFO Lafleur stated that the ESSER grant 

monies must be expended by September 2024.   

There was some discussion regarding the social emotional component of the ESSER grants.  

CFO Lafleur explained that in the beginning services for this component were contracted out, but 

the District will be looking at hiring a person in a permanent position, as there seems to be a great 

need of this required service. 

Special Education Director Kelli Lafleur explained that Tier I of the social emotional 

component is for all students.  If it is determined that additional services are needed for any 

student, this will be done under Tier II and Tier III is for students with severe social emotional 

needs.   

In March 2021, the District received $4,988,878.00 for ESSER 2.0 and is slated to received 

$4,988.878.00 in January 2022. 

In March 2021, The District received $4,481,724.00 for ESSER 3.0, which represents 20% 

of the grant, which is to be used for evidenced-based expenditures.  It is unknow when the District 

will receive the remining 80% of the ESSER 3.0 grant, which is $17,926,898.00. 

CFO Lafleur explained that the plans for ESSER 1, ESSER 2, and ESSER 3 were developed 

in the same manner as all other grants (Title I, IDEA, Educational Excellence, REAP, Title II, pre-

school, 8g.).  It has not been customary for grant proposals to be brought before the Board to 

approve a plan.  The administration develops proposals for grants, using the guidelines of 

allowable expenditures provided by LDOE, USDOE, or the grant provider, and proposals  are 

submitted to the appropriate entity for approval.  General Fund is brought before the Board, 

because it does not have all of the strict guidelines that grants have.  Although, the Evangeline 

Parish School Board is not involved in the development and approval of grant proposals, the Board 

does approve all expenditures of all grants which, exceed the amount the Superintendent is 

authorized to approve.   

CFO Lafleur explained that the 20% of the ESSER 3 monies that has been received can 

only be spent for evidence-based academic expenditures – summer learning and enrichment, 

tutoring, after-school programming, other, social emotional/mental health and extended school day 

or extended school year.  These monies cannot be used for COVID stipends.   

The ESSER grant proposal does include monies for  COVID stipends and related benefits.  

The amount of the proposed stipend has not been released because the District has not received 

final approval on the proposal.   There is always a concern that the budget may not be approved in 

the manner in which it was written, which could possibly affect the amount of the stipend.     

Committee Chairperson Peggy Forman stated that she is not in favor of funding anything 

until the District is sure the grant money is approved and will not come out of the General Fund.   

There was some discussion regarding the distribution of the excess sales tax checks.  CFO 

Lafleur stated that the sales tax collections for the fiscal year ends June 30th of each year.  The 

excess sales tax checks are not distributed until November and persons eligible for this check must 

still be employed in November of that particular year.   

Board President Wayne Dardeau expressed some concern regarding the time of the 

distribution because there are personnel who will continue working until November, in order to get 

the sales tax check, and then leave.  He feels this is putting a burden on the District to get 

replacement personnel at that time. 

CFO Lafleur stated that this is the way the District has always chosen to handle this 

situation for several decades. 

CFO Lafleur explained that ESSER 2 and ESSER 3 monies were to be used to keep schools 

open and closing the instructional gaps due to the pandemic.  These grants have very specific 

“strings attached”.  Any expenditure for the ESER grants must meet one of the Education 

Improvement Codes (EIC) for the grant.   

CFO Lafleur reviewed new positions which were being added to the District using grant 

monies.  All of the positions are ten-month positions, with the exception of the Curriculum Data 

Analyst, which is a twelve-month position.   The grant allows for two Curriculum Specialists  – 



Grades K-8 (for eight schools); two Curriculum Specialist for Grades 9-12 (for the four high 

schools); one Curriculum Specialist – Special Education (for the twelve schools of the District); four 

Career & College Readiness Strategist (one for each high school), eight Instructional Strategists 

(one for each K-8 school); eight Literacy Interventionist Paraprofessionals (one for each K-8 

school) and one Curriculum Data Analyst for the District, who will disaggregate all data for all 

different curriculums.  These positions are designed to assist the teachers in helping their students 

learn more and perform better.  Persons appointed to these positions will be assigned a homebase 

school, but will travel where needed in the parish.  A Literacy Coach position was added, using the 

Super Ap grant.  The Literacy Coach will be used to help schools which have been labeled UIR.  

There will be one person for this position and that person will be housed and used primarily at Ville 

Platte Elementary School, because they have been labeled UIR in multiple places.  The Literacy 

Coach may also be utilized at Bayou Chicot Elementary School, when needed, because they have 

been labeled UIR in a sub group.   

Superintendent Lazard stressed the fact that persons in these positions will not be another 

person to help out in the office.  They will be in the classrooms with teachers and students and will 

go where ever they are needed in the parish.   

Item #3 – UPDATE ON CAMPUS IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM (CIP)   

Superintendent Darwan Lazard explained that the plans for the Campus Improvement 

Program are in the process of being implemented with the bidding process for some of the projects 

to be undertaken set to begin soon.  Meetings were undertaken at each campus and 

Superintendent Lazard has had conversations with Mr. Mike Holt in an effort to get this project 

started.   The amount of money a campus is allocated depends on the number of students enrolled 

on the campus, with the allocation being $800 per student.  The larger number of students enrolled 

on a campus, the more money allocated to that campus. 

  After some discussions with the bonding attorney’s office, it was their recommendation that 

the issuance of bonds was the best way to utilize the funds for the undertaking of this project.   

Even then, nothing is done before the approval of a majority vote of the Board.   

Superintendent Lazard stated that this project was first mentioned at the April 21, 2021 

board meeting, where the project was just briefly touched upon.  At the meeting of May 5, 2021, 

the Board gave preliminary approval.  At the May 19, 2021 meeting, the bonding attorney was in 

attendance and board members had the opportunity to ask any questions they may have had 

regarding the best way to finance this project.  There are a number of different ways the District 

could have financed this project, but the Board’s bonding attorney felt that with a 1.5% interest 

rate, offered by a local bank, the best way for the Evangeline Parish School District to utilize the 

funds available and finance this project was by the issuance of bonds through the Bonding 

Commission for the State of Louisiana.    

The District has used this method on several occasions in the past to finance projects.  

Examples of some projects financed with the issuance of this type of bond, in recent times, are: 1) 

Bayou Chicot Elementary School sewer plant project, 2)  construction projects associated with re-

organization, 3)  technology infrastructure improvements at all of the schools and construction of  

the Teacher Training and Technology Building.   

Superintendent Lazard stated that board members deserve a lot of credit because, although 

the Campus Improvement Program will not fix all of the needs of the campuses, their support of 

the Campus Improvement Program is a good first step in the right direction to address the more 

pressing needs of the schools in Evangeline Parish.   This $4.7 million project will address issues 

on all twelve campuses, not just some of campuses, as was the situation during re-organization.    

Superintendent Lazard stated that board members also deserve a lot of credit for approving 

a raise for all employees of the District for the upcoming fiscal year.   This raise is separate from 

what the state may possibly do or the ESSER stipend, which has been submitted to the state for 

approval.  No other surrounding district is doing all of this for its employees.   

CFO Lafleur stated there seems to be some confusion regarding bonds.  Bonds are debt 

security issued by states, cities, counties, or parishes.  There are two types of bonds:  1) General 

obligation and  2) revenue.   Revenue bonds are much like the ad valorem tax that Pine Prairie 

and Basile passed, where the revenue stream that the people vote for will pay back the debt.  

General obligation bonds usually means excess revenue.  Just as in the bonds to be issued for the 

Campus Improvement program, the bonds issued for re-organization ($4 million), the 5th and 6th 

grade building project at Ville Platte High School ($900,000.00), technology ($2.45 million), and 

Bayou Chicot Elementary School sewer plant were general obligation bonds using excess revenue 

from the District’s Constitutional Parishwide Ad Valorum taxes.  No  for any of the above-

mentioned projects.    

Committee chairperson Peggy Forman stated it is a credit to the administration and to the 

Board that the District is able to spend this amount of money, to improve the District schools, 

without having to tax the people.  The project will be money well spent, has been designed well, 

and she is very pleased that board members saw the need and voted to proceed with the project.  .   

Motion was made by Ms. Nancy Hamlin, seconded by Mrs. Karen Vidrine, and 

recommended by Superintendent Darwan Lazard to adjourn the meeting at 2:20 PM. 

There was no question, comment or objection from committee members or audience in 

attendance.   

 Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Nancy 

Hamlin, and Chairperson Peggy Forman.    

 Motion passed unanimously. 

 Meeting adjourned. 



Motion was made by Ms. Nancy Hamlin, seconded by Ms. Georgianna Wilson, and 

recommended by Superintendent Darwan Lazard to approve minutes from the Executive Committee 

Meeting dated June 14, 2021. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously. 

Item #2B – Motion was made by Mrs. Peggy Forman, seconded by Mrs. Karen Vidrine, and 

recommended by Superintendent Darwan Lazard to approve action taken at Executive Committee 

Meeting dated June 14, 2021. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously.    

Board President Wayne Dardeau informed board members that he had been given information by 

two teachers in Rapides Parish that they had received a check for a COVID stipend and excess sales tax 

combined.  Since that time, Mr. Dardeau has learned that this was incorrect.  The check was for sales tax 

only.  Mr. Dardeau stated that as soon as the administration is informed that the proposal submitted to 

LDOE is approved, as submitted, all employees will be informed of the stipend amount approved.  The 

information is not being released prior to full approval by the LDOE, in an effort to prevent 

misinformation being disseminated.  

Item # 3 – Supervisor Johnny Deshotel informed board members that four Ville Platte High 

School students are recipients of Rotary Club Camp invitation and two of these recipients are also 

recipients of Rotary Club Scholarships.  Supervisor Deshotel informed board members he was sad to 

report that he had received information that the Rotary Club Camp invitations had been cancelled due to 

COVID.  Supervisor Deshotel introduced the four students along with some of their high school 

accomplishments. 

Ms. Brianna Freeman is an 11th grade student at Ville Platte High School.  She is the daughter of 

Amelia Thomas.  Brianna is part of the Student Council, BETA, FBLA, and the CNS program for the 

year 2021.  Brianna cheers for the Ville Platte High School football and basketball teams.  She also 

loves to cook.  Brianna’s future plans are to be a travel nurse. 

Ms. Erin Fontenot is the daughter of Samantha and Shannon Fontenot.  She is looking forward to 

her senior year at Ville Platte High School.  Ms. Erin has been a member of the Senior Beta Club since 

her freshman year, Student Council since sophomore year and is a member of Ville Platte High School’s 

first National Honor Society.  Erin has taken dual enrollment classes at LSUE and hopes to graduate high 

school with an Associate Degree in Biological Sciences.  After high school, Erin has not decided which 

university she will attend, but plans to pursue a Bachelor Degree in Biological Sciences.  After receiving 

her Bachelor Degree, Erin plans to attend graduate school in the Physical Assistant Program.  When not 

studying, Erin can most likely be found working at the Crawfish Barn in Reddell or spending time with 

her family and friends. 

Jashalynn Thomas is the daughter of Yvonne Doucet and Jarette Thomas and the oldest sibling of 

four.  She is sixteen years old and will be a 12th grader at Ville Platte High School during the 2021-2022 

school year.  Jasalynn is a recipient of Rotary Club scholarship.  Jashalynn participates in BETA Club, 

Student Council, cheerleading, JROTC, FEEP Club and is Class Vice-President.  Jashalynn is employed 

at Sonic in Ville Platte, where she has recently moved up into management.  After high school, Jashalynn 

plans to use her determination to get into medical school and become a pediatrician. 



Gabrielle Thille is the seventeen-year old daughter of David and Amanda Thille of Ville Platte.  

She is the grand-daughter of DeLouis Daire and the sister of Dr. Katelyn Thille Bordelon and Ms. Jillian 

Thille, who are all Ville Platte High School alumni.  Gabrielle is a Senior Academic Honor Student at 

Ville Platte High School and has participated in the dual enrollment program with LSUE since her junior 

year.  After graduating high school, Gabrielle plans to pursue a career as a physical therapist, specializing 

in Sports Medicine.  Gabrielle is a member of the Ville Platte football program serving as a football 

trainer for five years, three of which have been as Head Football Trainer.  She also served as the softball 

statistician for two years and a track trainer for one year.  Some of Gabrielle’s clubs, organizations and 

honors include:  Class President for four years, Student Council member for four years, BETA Club 

member for four years, 2019 Principal’s List, 2020 Principal’s List, 2021 Faculty’s List, numerous 

Student of the Week awards, 2021 Rotary Youth Leadership award and 2021 Ville Platte Rotary Club 

Scholarship recipient.  In her free time, Gabrielle works at Super Snow on Main Street in Ville Platte and 

enjoys traveling and visiting with friends and family.   

The four students expressed their thanks to Superintendent Darwan Lazard and the Evangeline 

Parish School Board for the invitation to be recognized at the board meeting tonight.  They also wanted 

to express a special thanks to Ms. Chenile Tezeno, principal of Ville Platte High School, for her guidance 

and unwavering support during this past school year.  

Item # 4 – Superintendent Darwan Lazard stated he had asked Supervisor Sherral Tezeno and 

Supervisor Johnny Deshotel to come up with a way to honor/recognize our four high schools for their 

accomplishments.  The District’s four high schools were recognized in an article in the US News & 

World Report honoring Best High Schools. A “Best High School” banner was presented to the principal 

of the four District high schools (Helena Francois - BHS, Rico Guillory - MHS, Alice Lejeune - PPHS, 

and Chenile Tezeno - VPHS).  Superintendent Lazard stated it was his hopes that the banner would be 

displayed in a prominent area at each high school.   

Item # 5 – Special Education Kelli Lafleur informed board members that Evangeline Parish 

School District, for the first time, would begin a Special Olympics team this upcoming school year.  A 

committee was convened and it was decided the district would start small, staying in parish, with the 

hopes of expanding to other parishes in the future.  In 2021-2022, the Evangeline Parish Special 

Olympics will have three sports:  Summer Sport (Bowling), Fall/Winter Sport (Corn Hole), and Spring 

Sport (Track and Field).  In 2021-2022 school year grades 6th – 8th will participate; in 2022-2023 school 

year grades 9th - 12th will be added, with grades 6th – 12th participating; in 2023-2024 school year grades 

pre-kindergarten – 5th will be adding, with grades pre-kindergarten – 12th grade participating.     

Item # 6 – Special Education Kelli Lafleur informed board members that Special Education 

Supervisor Keith Scott had completed Special Education Fellowship, which is a year-long, 

comprehensive development program for novice special education leaders across the state. The fellowship 

was at no cost to the District and provided in-person training, coaching, and a community of practice that 

instilled the knowledge and skills that the next generation of leaders need to lead and sustain change to 

improve outcomes for students with disabilities.   

Special Education Keith Scott addressed the board giving a brief explanation of the process he 

went through in the Fellowship program.  He explained that participants in the program were assigned 

mentors by the state.  In working with the mentor, they looked at problems occurring in the District and 

ways to come up with solutions for these problems.    

Item # 7 – Board members were reminded that if they wished to attend the Southern Leadership 

Conference in Biloxi, Mississippi, July 18 – 20, 2021, they needed to inform the Central Office, if they 

had not already done so, in order that registration and hotel accommodations could be taken care of 

appropriately. 

.Item # 8– EPSB Sales Tax Comparison Chart for May 2021 was presented as information. 

 



MONTH 2020-2021 
MONTHLY 

BUDGET 

PERCENT OF 
BUDGET 

2020-2021 
ACTUAL 

2019-2020 
ACTUAL 

FY 2021 TO FY 
2020 

VARIANCE 

JULY $    608,333.33 118.37% $    720,054.76 $    654,090.48 $   65,964.28 

AUGUST $    608,333.33 114.46% $    696,327.90 $    598,031.13 $   98,296.74 

SEPTEMBER $    608,333.33 104.42% $    635,212.67 $    604,350.72 $   30,861.95 

OCTOBER $    608,333.33 118.26% $    719,437.08 $    661,514.41 $   57,922.67 

EXCESS      0.0% $      16,782.46  $   16,782.46 

NOVEMBER $    608,333.33 116.44% $    708,348.99 $    790,560.79 ($   82,211.80) 

DECEMBER $    608,333.33 100.18% $    609,430.02 $    556,094.60 $   53,335.42 

JANUARY $    608,333.33 131.60% $    800,557.44 $    669,680.84 $  130,876.60  

FEBRUARY $    608,333.33 105.72% $    643,103.71 $    582,665.29 $   60,438.42 

EXCESS       0.00% $     22,581.68   

MARCH $    608,333.33 102.73% $    624,918.02 $    529,524.03 $   95,393.99 

APRIL $    608,333.33 193.35% $ 1,176,210.09 $    696,808.13 $   479,401.96 

MAY $    608,333.33 133.68% $    813,226.53 $    595,600.51 $   217,626.02 

YTD TOTAL $  6,691,666.64 122.33% $  8,186,191.35 $ 6,938,920.96 $  1,247,270.39 

 

There was no question or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Item # 9A – CFO Amy Lafleur informed board members there was only bid for the Workers’ 

Compensation Insurance.  This is the same company the District had the insurance with last year.  In the 

past, the company has provided a dividend to the District, which the board has authorized to be used as a 

safety grant for the schools.  It is due to the efforts of the schools that has enabled the District’s safety 

ratings to go down.  The Workers’ Compensation insurance quote for the 2021-2022 fiscal year is 

$320,990, which is up from last year by $40,132.  This does not take in account any dividends or the 

audit done at the end of the payroll.     

Motion was made by Board Vice-President Scott Limoges, seconded by Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, and 

recommended by Superintendent to accept the low-price quote from Lemoine Ins. For Workers’ 

Compensation insurance. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously. 

Item # 9B  - CFO Lafleur explained that the valuation of the District’s property is so large that it 

is insured in layers.  The first layer is for the first $10 million; layer two is $15 million above the first 

$10 million; third layer is the remaining balance above the $25 million.  CFO Lafleur met with 

representatives of ISU Lemoine Insurance, who have been waiting and in conversation with many 

companies.  Some companies have given quotes only to change the quotes later.  Some would only write 

$7 ½ million on the second layer, instead of the full $15 million.  At the recommendation of ISU 

Lemoine Insurance, the administration has decided to wait until ISU Lemoine Insurance can get all of the 

quotes, put it together to be the most cost advantageous to the Evangeline Parish School System.  The 

District has been assured by ISU Lemoine Insurance that we will have our insurance in place before July 

1, 2021.  CFO Amy Lafleur stated that the District would like to plan on taking the lowest price quote, 

once that information has been provided, which is expected to be within the next week. 

CFO Lafleur stated that she is asking the Board to give Superintendent Darwan Lazard the 

authority to accept the low-price quote, upon its arrival.   A copy of the price quote will be mailed to 

board members, once received, so they may be informed.   

Motion was made by Mr. Lonnie Sonnier and seconded by Mrs. Peggy Forman to give 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard the authority to accept the low-price quote for Workers’ Compensation 

Insurance, once it is received. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously. 

CFO Amy Lafleur thanked the representative from ISU Lemoine Insurance for their efforts and 



help in this matter. 

Item # 10 – Special Education Director Kelli Lafleur reminded board members of the 

presentation by representatives of Louisiana Virtual Medical Alliance (LMVA) at the last board meeting, 

when LMVA presented information regarding bringing tele-health to the District’s students and staff 

members.  The contracts referred to in this item are for LMVA to bring tele-health, to students and 

faculty, to all twelve of the District’s schools. 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard informed board members that the contracts were reviewed by Mr. 

Hardie, of Hammonds & Sills.   

Motion was made by Mrs. Peggy Forman, seconded by Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and recommended by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard to approve contracts for LVMA – Telehealth for all District schools. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously.    

Item # 11 – CFO Amy Lafleur explained to board members that the wresting team and 

powerlifting teams in the parish are growing.  The salary schedule did not provide for a stipend for 

assistant coaches in these two sports.  The number of students participating in these sports have increased 

and the season has been expanded.  Due to these facts, it was felt that a stipend for assistant coaches, for 

these two sports, was needed to be incorporated into the salary schedule.  It would be the same as 

assistant coaches in other sports, ½ the amount of the head coach for the appropriate sport, which is $358 

for wresting/powerlifting.  CFO Lafleur explained that the District allows for one allocation for an 

assistant coach.       

Motion was made by Mr. Arthur Savoy, seconded by Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, and recommended by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard to approve adding coaching supplement for Assistant Wresting and 

Assistant Powerlifting coaches to the salary schedule. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously.    

Item # 12 – Bids for Milk/Milk Related Products and Juices for 2021-2022 fiscal year were 

presented for approval. 

2021-2022 MILK BID 
ITEM EST QTY UNIT PRICE 

BORDEN 

BORDEN 

EXTENDED 

UNIT PRICE 

PRAIRIE 
FARMS 

PRAIRIE FARMS 

EXTENDED 

APPLE JUICE 350 $   0.1600 $        56.000 $   0.1750 $         61.250 

GRAPE JUICE 350 $   0.1900 $         6.500 NO BID NO BID 

ORANGE JUICE 350 $   0.1700 $        59.500 $   0.1750 $         61.250 

MILK, CHOC. FAT FREE 251,000 $   0.2578 $     64,707.800 $   0.2500 $      62,750.000 

MILK, CHOC, LOW FAT 1% 251,000 $   0.2564 $     64,356.400 $   0.2500 $      62,750.000 

MILK, LACTAID 25 $   2.4000 $        60.000 $   1.3330 $         33.325 

MILK – SKIM WHITE 3250,000 $   0.2624 $     65,600.000 $   0.2500 $      62,500.000 

MILK, STRAW, FAT FREE 200,000 $   0.2623 $     52,460.000 $   0.2500 $      50,000.000 

MILK, STRAW, LOW FAT 1% 200,000 $   0.2609 $     52,180.000 NO BID NO BID 

MILK, WHITE, LOW FAT 1% 750 $   0.2587 $       194.025 $   0.2500 $        187.500 

SOUR CREAM 10 $     9.50 $        95.000 $   8.5000 $         85.000 

STRAWBERRY YOGURT 750 $   0.3500 $       262.500 NO BID NO BID 

TOTALS   $     299,915.73  $      238,118.33 

 

** BIDS AWARDED ON “ALL OR NONE” BASIS ** 

(PER PAGE 5 OF BID PACKET UNDER “AWARDS SECTION”; THE EVANGELINE PARISH SCHOOL BOARD 
RESERVES THE RIGHT TO SELECT A BID IN WHOLE OR IN PART, TO REJECT ANY/AND ALL BIDS, AND TO 

WAIVE FORMALITIES.” 

 

Motion was made by Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr., seconded by Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, and recommended 

by Superintendent Darwan Lazard to approve low bid price from Borden’s for Milk/Milk Related 

Products & Juices for 2021-2022 fiscal year, as per the recommendation of Interim CNP Director Barbara 



Victorian. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously.    

Item # 13 – Price quotes for a new ADA ramp at BHS football stadium bleachers, using Basile 

Maintenance, were submitted for approval. 

VENDOR PRICE QUOTE 

Insight, Inc. $ 35,100.00 

Educational Furniture and Equipment $ 36,149.00 

School and Office Products $ 41,465.00 

 

Motion was made by Mr. Nick Chaumont, seconded by Mrs. Peggy Forman, and recommended 

by Superintendent Darwan Lazard to approve low price quote from Insight, Inc., in the amount of 

$35,100.00, for a new ADA ramp at BHS football stadium, using Basile Maintenance. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously.    

Item #14 – The following requisitions were presented for ratification/approval: 

A. Ratification of WEX Bank -- $14,068.66 for Regular Education Fuel, 

Maintenance Fuel, and Special Education Fuel using General Fund (Requested 

by Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Johnny Deshotel) 

B. Ratification of Varsity Spirit Fashion -- $12,413.65 for VPHS cheerleaders using 

Ville Platte High School funds (Requested by Superintendent Darwan Lazard and 

presented by CFO Amy Lafleur) 

C. SASC, LLC -- $26,043.86 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students at Basile High School using ESSER 3.0 funds (Requested by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Sherral Tezeno) 

D. SASC, LLC -- $50,418.13 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students at Bayou Chicot Elementary School using ESSER 3.0 funds (Requested 

by Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Sherral Tezeno) 

E. SASC, LLC -- $24,813.56 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students at Chataignier Elementary School using ESSER 3.0 funds (Requested by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Sherral Tezeno) 

F. SASC, LLC -- $6,362.17 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students at James Stephens Montessori School using ESSER 3.0 funds 

(Requested by Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor 

Sherral Tezeno) 

G. SASC, LLC -- $27,023.06 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students at Mamou High School using ESSER 3.0 funds (Requested by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Sherral Tezeno) 

H. SASC, LLC -- $24,905.36 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students at Vidrine Elementary School using ESSER 3.0 funds (Requested by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Sherral Tezeno) 

I. SASC, LLC -- $6,840.67 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students at Ville Platte Elementary School using ESSER 3.0 funds (Requested by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Sherral Tezeno) 

J. SASC, LLC -- $38,262.19 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students at Ville Platte High School using ESSER 3.0 funds (Requested by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Sherral Tezeno) 

K. SASC, LLC -- $22,540.96 for 6th – 8th grade science materials for teachers and 

students for all 6-8 school in Evangeline Parish School District using ESSER 3.0 

funds (Requested by Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor 

Sherral Tezeno) 

L. Penske -- $21,750.00 for purchase of used Penske truck for warehouse using 

CNP “ No Kid Hungry” grant (Requested by Superintendent Darwan Lazard and 

presented by Interim CNP Director Barbara Victorian) 

 

Motion was made by Mrs. Peggy Forman, seconded by Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr., and recommended 

by Superintendent Darwan Lazard to ratify/approve requisitions, as presented. 



There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously. 

Item #15 – The following invoice(s) were presented for approval: 

A. First Student -- $418,550.55 for May 2021 transportation services using General 

Fund ($416,635.35) and ESSER ($1,915.20) (Requested by Superintendent 

Darwan Lazard and presented by Supervisor Johnny Deshotel) 

B. First Student -- $ 10,109.40 for School for the Deaf transportation services using 

IDEA funds (Requested by Superintendent Darwan Lazard and presented by 

Supervisor Johnny Deshotel and Special Education Director Kelli Lafleur) 

C. Lafayette Parish School System -- $19,283.20 for interpreters’ services for 2020-

2021 using IDEA funding (Requested by Superintendent Darwan Lazard and 

presented by Special Education Director Kelli Lafleur) 

 

Motion was made by Ms. Nancy Hamlin, seconded by Mrs. Peggy Forman, and recommended by 

Superintendent Darwan Lazard to approve payment of invoices, as presented. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously. 

Item #16– Personnel matters were presented as information: 

Item # 16A – PERSONNEL CHANGES/RESIGNATIONS; RETIREMENTS; 

REASSIGNMENTS; TERMINATIONS: 
BASILE HIGH SCHOOL 

Patsy McClelland, special education teacher, submitted letter of retirement effective 6/5/2021 

Cheryl Reed, school secretary, submitted letter of retirement effective 11/1/2021 

BAYOU CHICOT ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Angela White, regular education/elementary teacher, submitted letter of resignation effective 8/6/2021 

James Larry Fontenot, custodian, reassigned from PPHS effective 6/8/2021 

MAMOU ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Melissa Wilmart, regular education/French Immersion teacher, submitted letter of resignation effective 

6/9/2021 

PINE PRAIRIE HIGH SCHOOL 

Simeon Burton, special education teacher, submitted letter of resignation effective 5/29/2021 

Heather Ardoin, regular education/elementary teacher, submitted letter of resignation effective 6/7/2021 

VILLE PLATTE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Meghan Harvey, regular education/elementary teacher, submitted letter of resignation effective 6/5/2021 

VILLE PLATTE HIGH SCHOOL 

Beulah Hardy, regular education/elementary teacher, submitted letter of resignation effective 6/1/2021 

Michael Bradley, regular education/band teacher, submitted letter of resignation effective 6/5/2021 

W.W. STEWART ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Lisa Feucht, regular education/kindergarten teacher, submitted letter of resignation effective 5/29/2021 

Angela McGehee, pre-kindergarten teacher, submitted letter of retirement effective 6/10/2021 

Item # 16B - APPOINTMENT OF SUMMER SCHOOL PERSONNEL 

EVANGLEINE CENTRAL SCHOOL 

Monique Fontenot, virtual summer school teacher 

VILLE PLATTE HIGH SCHOOL 

Steven Manuel, summer school administrator 

Helen Patrick, summer school teacher 

Tricia Richard, summer school teacher 

SCHOOL NURSES 

Joan Fontenot (BHS) 

Macie Fontenot (BHS) 

Lainey Bordelon (EC) 

Linzy Landreneau (MHS) 

Wanda Goudeau-Dupre (MHS) 

Damaina Slaughter (PPHS) 

Natalie Payne (PPHS) 

Pam Fontenot (VPHS) 

Item # 16C – APPOINTMENT OF PROFESSIONAL PERSONNEL 

BAYOU CHICOT ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Latisha Johnson, tutor (maximum 14 hours; Title I school-wide funding) effective 4/28/2021 – 5/19/2021 



Debra LeBlanc, tutor (maximum 22 hours; Title I school-wide funding) effective 5/5/2021 – 5/13/2021                                                             

CENTRAL OFFICE 

Aaron Miller, data analyst, effective 6/14/2021 for the remainder of 2020-2021 fiscal year and 2021-2022 

fiscal year (ESSER funding) 

Item # 16D – RE-APPOINTMENT/APPOINTMENT OF SUPPORT PERSONNEL 
BASILE HIGH SCHOOL 

School clerk - Patsy Ivory; cafeteria manager – Sheila Lejeune; cafeteria technicians - Victoria Evans, 

Tammy Johnson, Brenda McClelland, and Lena Oliver 

BAYOU CHICOT ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manager - Nadine Lemoine; cafeteria technicians - Brookie Causey, Karen Forman, Amanda 

Holden, Ivalene Johnson, Barbara Marcantel, Michelle Ortego, Jacqueline Sam, and Lisa Siffert; bus 

driver - Jacquline Hill; bus aide - Delores Avie 

CHATAIGNIER ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manage - Sheila Thomas (reassigned from JSM); cafeteria technicians - Nicole Gooden, Kristy 

Shepherd, Barbara Stagg, Quanda Wilson; bus driver – John Grady Pitre 

JAMES STEPHENS MONTESSORI SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manager - Monica Rollins (reassigned from VPHS); cafeteria technicians - Lisa Arvie, Ruthie 

Arvie, Lora Edwards, and Yvonne Hall 

MAMOU ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manager - Stephanie Ardoin; cafeteria technicians - Pascha Anderson, Anna Douget, Tressie 

Guillory, Carrie Nell Jack, Alisa Mire, and Mary Rideau 

MAMOU HIGH SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manager - Demetrius Murphy (no longer MHS/WWS); cafeteria technicians - Lisa Anderson, 

Tammy Celestine, Sue Fontenot, Tracy Hunt, Angela Lafleur, Paige Williams; bus drivers - Madeline 

Berzas, Vickie Deshotel, Donald Fontenot, and Shane Granger; bus aide - Beverly Terry 

PINE PRAIRIE HIGH SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manage - Kimberly Rollins; cafeteria technicians - Mary Freeman, Alice Johnson, Felicia 

Morrow, Monda Sharpe, Sherri Sharpe, Jennifer Soileau, and Latisha Whittington; bus drivers - Melissa 

Causey, Michael Johnson, and Norman Johnson 

VIDRINE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manager - Noreen Manuel; food production manager - Jeanella Thomas (reassigned from VPE); 

cafeteria technicians - Felicia Anderson, Louanna Arvie, Cynthia Carraway, Elsie Deshotel, and Veronica 

Richardson; bus driver - Mignonne Crisp 

VILLE PLATTE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manager - Patricia Odom (removed from interim status); cafeteria technicians - Shannon 

Ardoin, Sarah Ceaser, Wendy Johnson, Mazel Lewis, and Judy Young 

VILLE PLATTE HIGH SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manager - Nicole Poullard, (reassigned from CE); interim food production manager - Ethel 

Smith; cafeteria technicians - Mary Anthony, Deborah Barron, Tammy Freeman, and Joanetta Thomas; 

bus drivers - Evalyn Alfred, Shounda Jack, and Angie Soileau 

W.W. STEWART ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Cafeteria manager - Francheska Semien; cafeteria technicians - Kaye Blakeslee, Mary Marlene Guidry, 

Carla Jenkins, and Madeline Reed 

MEDIA CENTER 

Transporter - Sterling Coleman 

 Ms. Wanda Skinner asked if the number of cafeteria technicians employed at a school is 

determined by the number of students. 

 Interim CNP Director Barbara Victorian explained that there is a formula set by USDA that 

determines how many cafeteria technicians are needed at a school. 

 Item #13 – Superintendent’s Comment 

• Superintendent Darwan Lazard informed board members that summer programs are 

going on throughout the parish:  Summer Remediation and Summer Enrichment; some 

in June and some in July; Elementary, Middle School, and High School.  Between June 

and July there should be approximately 766 students participating in summer remediation 

or summer enrichment programs.  Information received today: June enrichment (K-8 – 

108 students; June remediation (K-8) All grades ELA – 354 students; July enrichment 

(K-8) 56 students; July remediation (K-8) K-2 ELA and 3-8 Math – 248 students; High 

School summer remediation (virtual and in-person grades 6 – 12) – 105 students; High 

School June enrichment – 30 students; High School July enrichment – 42 students; High 

School LEAP 2025 remediation – approximately 35 students; AHEC of a Summer 

Program – 6 students at Mercy Regional and 6 students at Savoy Medical Center for a 

total of 12 students.  All four high schools and Evangeline Central are being used.  In 

the month of June, the enrichment program is June 15 – 17 and 22 – 24.  In the month of 

July, the enrichment program is July 6 -8 and 13 – 15.  Summer school programs are 



Monday through Thursday and Enrichment programs are Tuesday through Thursday.   

• Superintendent Darwan Lazard informed board members that Special Education Director 

Kelli Lafleur has been selected to serve as a member of the State LDOE Committee for 

LEAP Connect.   

• Superintendent Darwan Lazard informed board members that the Special Education 

Department has received High Cost grant Round 2 in the amount of $237,645.00. 

• Superintendent Darwan Lazard assured board members that as soon as he receives 

notification from the Louisiana Department of Education regarding the status of the 

District’s ESSER proposal it will be shared with all employees and board members.  A 

stipend for all District employees has been written in the ESSER proposal.  He is hoping 

he is able to do this very soon, as the proposal has made it through two out of three 

approvals.   

o Ms. Wanda Skinner asked Superintendent Darwan Lazard to inform board 

members first, as they will be receiving calls and would like to be able to answer 

any questions they may be asked.   

Motion was made by Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, seconded by Mrs. Peggy Forman, and recommended 

by Superintendent Darwan Lazard to adjourn the meeting at 6:40 PM. 

There was no objection, question, or comment from board members or audience in attendance. 

Voting for the motion were Mrs. Karen Vidrine, Ms. Georgianna Wilson, Ms. Wanda Skinner, 

Mr. Arthur Savoy, Mr. Nick Chaumont, Board President Wayne Dardeau, Board Vice-President Scott 

Limoges, Mr. Lonnie Sonnier, Mrs. Peggy Forman, Ms. Nancy Hamlin, and Mr. Ellis Guillory, Sr. 

Motion carried unanimously. 
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