

Awarded Vendor List

P.E./Athletic Supplies, Equipment & Related Services

<i>Company Name</i>	<i>Bid Number</i>	<i>Page Number</i>	<i>HUB/MWBE</i>
<i>Alert Services, Inc.</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>1</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>All Awards</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>7</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>All Stars Screen Printing & Embroidery</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>7</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Aluminum Athletic Equipment Company</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>7</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>American Team Sports</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>1</i>	<i>-</i>
	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>7</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>BenchDaddy.com</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>7</i>	
<i>Big Game</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>7</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Bill Fritz Sports Corporation</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>1</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Bill Guthrie Sports, Inc.</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>1</i>	<i>Yes</i>
	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>7</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>BSN Sports, LLC</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Cheerleading Company</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>1</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Cheers, Etc., Inc.</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>1</i>	<i>Yes</i>
	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Conner Athletic Products, Inc. dba Power Lift</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>1</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Custom Sportswear, Inc.</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Early Childhood, LLC dba Discount School Supply</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Exclusive Decals & Screenprinting</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>First to the Finish</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Gandy Ink</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Gilman Gear</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Goodtimes Screen Printing, LLC</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Gopher Sport</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>-</i>
	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>9</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>GTM Sportswear</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Henry Schein, Inc.</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>High End Advertising</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>-</i>
	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>9</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Lakeshore Learning Materials</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>9</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>LISCO Sports</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>9</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>MCM Sporting Goods</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>3</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Medco Supply</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>3</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>MFAC, LLC</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>3</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Midway PSG dba Pasadena Sporting Goods</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>3</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Nasco</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>3</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Oates Specialties, LLC</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>3</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>PepWear, LLC</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>3</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Porta Phone Company</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>Yes</i>

<i>PowerDrive Training Products, LLC</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>9</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Power Systems, LLC</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>-</i>
	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>9</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>ProMaxima Manufacturing, Ltd</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Pyramid School Products</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>Yes</i>
	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>9</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>RGV Swim Shop</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>RH Custom Sporting Goods</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Riddell</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Rogers Athletic Company</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>5</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>S & S Worldwide</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>5</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>School Health Corporation</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>10</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>School Outfitters</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>10</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>School Specialty</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>5</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>School Tee Factory</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>10</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Score Sports</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>10</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Spectrum Corporation</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>11</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Swim Shops of the Southwest, Inc.</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>5</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>The Library Store, Inc.</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>5</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>The Soccer Corner</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>11</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Tim Elliott dba Elliott's Custom Golf</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>5</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Titan Support Systems, Inc.</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>6</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>T-Shirt Express</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>6</i>	<i>Yes</i>
	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>11</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>T-Shirt Gallery & Sports</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>6</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>U.S. Games</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>11</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Varsity Spirit Fashions</i>	<i>2017-58</i>	<i>6</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Xizaka, LLC</i>	<i>2018-34</i>	<i>11</i>	<i>-</i>

La Joya Independent School District
Bid 2017-58 - P.E./Athletic Supplies, Equipment & Related Services Catalog Bid

Vendor	Contact	Phone/Fax	Phone for Checking Orders	Discount	Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)
Alert Services, Inc. P.O. Box 1088 San Marcos, TX 78667-	Sharon Morin Bid Agent	Ph: (830) 372-3333 Fax: (830) 372-1447	(800) 688-3767	20% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 15% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	5 - 7 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. Orders under \$50.00 are subject to a \$5.00 minimum order charge.					
America Team Sports 1909 N. Glenville Dr. Suite 200 Richardson, TX 75081-	Matt Smith School Sales	Ph: (972) 231-8326 Fax: (972) 231-9555	(972) 231-8326	10- 40% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10- 40% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	7- 30 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Drop ship only. Other catalog: www.americateamsports.com					
Bill Fritz Sports Corporation 1072 Classic Road Apex, NC 27539-	Bill Fritz President	Ph: (800) 234-1004 Fax: (919) 362-1750	(800) 234-1004	10% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	10 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Other catalog: Athletic Connection.					
Bill Guthrie Sports, Inc. 5701 W. Expressway 83 Harlingen, TX 78552-3610	Joey Mackie President	Ph: (956) 428-6462 Fax: (956) 428-7074	(956) 428-6462	15% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 15% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	8 - 10 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. Other Catalogs: Bill Guthrie Sports, Inc. 15%, Champro 15%, Cramer 15%.					
Cheerleading Company 11350 Hillguard Road Dallas, TX 75243-	Erika Lee Accounting Manager	Ph: (800) 411-4105 Fax: (800) 411-0842		3% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	Shipping is based on total dollar amount of order
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices.					
Cheers, Etc. Inc. 1355B N. Glenville Dr. Richardson, TX 75081-	Gabriela Lener Bid Coordinator	Ph: (214) 319-2613 Fax: (214) 319-9110		0% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	Uniforms are custom made. We try to accommodate time frame
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices.					
Connor Athletic Products, Inc. dba Power Lift P.O. Box 348 Jefferson, IA 50129-	Mike Richardson Sales & Marketing Director	Ph: (800) 872-1543 Fax: (515) 386-3220		5% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 5% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	42 - 56 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. Freight varies depending on the items being purchased.					

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
Early Childhood, LLC dba Discount School Supply 2 Lower Ragsdale Dr. #200 Monterey, CA 93940-	Kierston Young Bid Officer	Ph: (800) 836-9515 Fax: (800) 993-3609		18% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 18% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	2 - 5 Business Days 2 - 6 Weeks on Drop Ship
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Free shipping on stock items over \$99.00. Drop ship items pay 15% for shipping. Multiple catalogs are published each year. Pricing is subject to change based on current catalog. Inside delivery withing 3 feet of door.					
First to the Finish 2341 Plum Street Edwardsville, IL 62025-	Gary L. Snider Sales Manager	Ph: (800) 747-9013 Fax: (877) 631-9687		20% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 20% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 20% for Repair services.	2 - 3 Business Days for In-stock items
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. 2 - 4 Weeks delivery on freight or special orders with print.					
Gopher Sport 2525 Lemond ST SW Owatonna, MN 55060-	Trent Spatenka Bid Analyst	Ph: (800) 533-0446 Fax: (888) 319-7452	(855) 500-2746	10% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	7- 14 Business Days for In-stock items
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Free shipping does not apply to Truck-ship items. Discount does not apply to only Gopher items.					
GTM Sportwear 520 McCall Rd. Manhattan, KS 66502-	Heather Widler Bid Specialist	Ph: (800) 336-4486 Fax: (888) 539-3615	(800) 336-4486	0% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	21 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. No freight charges for orders over \$100.00. \$5.95 for orders under \$100.00.					
Henry Schein Medical, a Division of Henry Schein, Inc. 135 Duryea Road E270 Melville, NY 11747-	Joanne Viggiano Bid Department Supervisor	Ph: (800) 851-0400 Fax: (866) 738-8999		18% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	2 - 3 Business Days for Stocked items
Special Notes: F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Freight is free for orders over \$150.00. Hazardous materials are subject to Department of Transportation Hazardous Materials handling charge of \$30.00. Office supplies are excluded from the Catalog Discount Program. Prescription items are excluded. Manufacturer freight charges will apply for all equipment, ie: ice machines, furniture, etc., and would be considered dock to dock delivery only. All products offered in the Catalog Discount Program are subject to our Terms of Sale. Exceptions: Gatorade High School & Youth Package, Mueller M-Pack packages, Maico products, Hawk grips, Normal Tec, Chattanooga Genysis Electrotherapy, Epi-pens, Game Ready products.					
High End Advertising 2504 Santa Paula Mission, TX 78572-	Katia Moya Owner	Ph: (956) 600-7777 Fax:	(956) 600-7777	0% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	15 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices.					

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
MCM Sporting Goods, Inc. 1302 North Conway Mission, TX 78572-	Jorge Garza Store Manager	Ph: (956) 581-1632 Fax: (956) 581-1685	(956) 581-1632	10% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	14- 21 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices.					
Medco Supply 500 Fillmore Ave. Tonawanda, NY 14151-	Leslie Wilmot Sales Coordinator	Ph: (800) 556-3326 Fax: (800) 222-1934	(800) 889-1994	0- 18% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0-18% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	5 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. For orders over \$90.00, all items are quoted F.O.B. For Capital items, may incur liftgate, inside delivery or installation charges. Certain items may incur FAA required hazardous material fee of \$25.00. Exceptions include: Gatorade, RX items, Vectra Genysis, Gameready, ice machines, whirlpools, AEDs and rehydration items to be quoted on an as needed basis.					
MFAC, LLC (M-F Athletic) 1600 Division Rd. West Warwick, RI 02893-	Brittany Santiago Bidding Agent	Ph: (800) 556-7464 Fax: (800) 682-6950		10% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	3- 5 Business Days for In-stock items
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. 10% discount excludes: sales, pits, hurdles, pole vault poles, crossbars, timing systems, software, cardio equipment, weight equipment, in-ground equipment, items requiring special shipping or truck shipment by common carrier. Other exclusions may apply. Freight will be charged on all items on the exclusion sticker. Other catalog: Perform Better.					
Midway PSG dba Pasadena Sporting Goods 115 E. Pasadena Freeway Pasadena, TX 77506-	Mike Kimball General Manager	Ph: (713) 477-7151 Fax: (713) 477-1276	(713) 477-1276	0 -50% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0- 50% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0- 50% for Repair services.	15- 30 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. Maximum freight charge is 6% except for large or bulky items.					
Nasco Education, LLC 901 Janesville Ave. Fort Atkinson, WI 53538-	Dave Johnson Manager of Contract Sales	Ph: (800) 558-9595 Fax: (800) 372-1236	(800) 558-9595	10% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	3 - 5 Business Days ARO
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. \$50.00 minimum order requirement after discount is applied.					
Oates Specialties LLC 151 FM 1696 Road East Huntsville, TX 77320-	Drayton Pittman Account Manager	Ph: (936) 295-4459 Fax: (501) 632-2316	(936) 295-4459	0% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	1- 5 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices.					
PepWear, LLC 1540 High Meadows Way Cedar Hill, TX 75104-	Heather Fults Purchasing	Ph: (800) 587-4287 Fax: (800) 430-3226	(877) 899-1919	2% for P.E./Athletic supplies.	10 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. UPS ground charges. Other Catalog: www.pepwear.com					

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
Porta Phone Co. P.O. Box 560 Narragansett, RI 02882-	Gail Twombly Accounts Manager	Ph: (800) 233-1113 Fax: (401) 789-7300		10% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	5 -7 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices.					
Power Systems PS, LLC 5700 Casey Dr. Knoxville, TN 37909-	Shay Wells Bid Sales Representative	Ph: (800) 321-6975 Fax: (865) 671-1450		25% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 25% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	5 - 6 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices.					
ProMaxima Manufacturing, Ltd 5310 Ashbrook Dr. Houston, TX 77081-	Lily Gonzalez Administrative Assistant	Ph: (713) 667-9606 Fax: (713) 667-9941	(800) 231-6652	1-30% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 1-30% for P.E./ Athletic equipment.	30- 40 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. Shipping and installation is not included in the discount price sheet. Please call in with model number and quantity for shipping cost. Other catalog: Coaches Heavy Metal.					
Pyramid School Products 6510 N. 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908	Ken Miller Bid Department	Ph: (800) 792-2644 Fax: (813) 621-7688	(800) 792-2644	25% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 25% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	10- 14 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Discount is from ChampionSports.com catalog only. \$50.00 minimum order. Hula hoops are charged actual freight.					
RGV Swim Shop 200 N. Bryan Rd., Ste 103 Mission, TX 78572-	Arnold Perez Owner	Ph: (956) 624-6050 Fax:		0% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	20 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices.					
RH Custom Sporting Goods 3705 Whitewing Ave. McAllen, TX 78501-	Gerardo Hinojosa Owner	Ph: (956) 227-7407 Fax: (956) 529-5113		0% for P.E. /Athletic supplies. 0% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	20 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices.					
Riddell 6846 Alamo Downs Parkway San Antonio, TX 78238- 4516	Robin Campbell Hotchkiss Bid Coordinator	Ph: (800) 275-9844 Fax: (210) 684-4744	(800) 275-9844	1- 40% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 1- 40% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 1- 23% for Repair services.	30 Business Days ARO or less
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Some of the larger or unusual items need freight added to them, ie: large tackling sled or dummies, basketball goals, batting cages or tunnels, foul poles or any other large piece of equipment. All screen printing and embroidery charges will be quoted upon request. Other catalog: www.riddell.com					

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
Rogers Athletic Company 3760 W. Ludington Drive Farwell, MI 48622-	Nathan Yurhouse Inside Sales/Bid Coordinator	Ph: (800) 248-0270 Fax: (888) 549-9659	(800) 248-0270	5% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 5% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	14- 30 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Shipping charges will be pre-paid and added to customer invoice. Other catalog: Rogers Athletic Football 2017 (5% discount).					
S & S Worldwide 75 Mill Street Colchester, CT 06415-	Jenna Schall Sr. Bid Anslst	Ph: (800) 642-7354 Fax: (800) 432-2842	(800) 243-9232	18% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 18% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	30 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Free freight except for drop ship items. Shipping will be charged prepaid and added to invoice. If no loading dock for drop ship items, contact customer service for quote for inside delivery and truck with a liftgate.					
School Specialty, Inc. W6316 Design Drive Greenville, WI 54942-	Amy Fuss Assistant Secretary	Ph: (888) 388-3224 Fax: (888) 675-1775	(888) 388-6344	34% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 12% for P.E./Athletic equipment.	3- 10 Business Days for In-stock items
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. School Specialty Inc. is not free for catalog purchases. Inside delivery is limited to standard carrier practices such as to a front desk. Discount terms will be fixed for the first year of the bid but are not guaranteed for additional years. Catalog prices are subject to change each January. Delivery is typically 3-10 business days for In-stock items but is not guaranteed within that time frame. Returns may be subject to a re-stocking fee unless due to our error or problems with the merchandise. Other catalogs: School Specialty Education Essentials Catalog, School Specialty Art Education Catalog/SAX, School Specialty Special Needs Catalog/Abilities, School Specialty Physical Education & Recreation Catalog/Sportime, School Specialty Early Childhood Catalog/Childcraft, School Specialty Furniture & Equipment Catalog, School Specialty Safety and Security/Guardian. These catalogs may contain a limited number of items that are listed as "Net Price". Net Price items are not eligible for any discounts. Also excluded is any catalog that bears the notation "No other discounts apply".					
Swim Shops of the Southwest Inc. 5010-M Louetta Rd. Spring, TX 77379-	Cindy Andrews Purchasing Admin.	Ph: (281) 376-4460 Fax: (281) 251-1459	(281) 376-4460	0- 30% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 0- 30% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	10- 15 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. Freight charged on over-weight & over-sized items. Other Catalog: www.swimshops.com					
The Library Store, Inc. 301 E. South St., P.O. Box 0964 Tremont, IL 61568-0964	Shayla Hill Bid Specialist	Ph: (800) 548-7204 Fax: (800) 320-7706		10% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	3- 5 Business Days for In-stock items
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices.					
Tim Elliott dba Elliott's Custom Golf 712 N. 77 Sunshine Strip #20 Harlingen, TX 78550-	Tim Elliott Owner	Ph: (956) 428-5448 Fax: (956) 428-5448		10- 46% Off MSRP for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10- 46 % Off MSRP for P.E./Athletic equipment. 10- 46% off MSRP for Repair services.	10- 14 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. Unless used golf balls, they will take longer. \$10.00 per bag shipping charges; this is over and above the discount. \$5.00 per piece embroidery; this is over and above the discount. We are a golf account holder and in some cases we are not able to purchase non-golf apparel.					

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
Titan Support Systems, Inc. 9830 South Padre Island Dr. Corpus Christi, TX 78418-	P.M. Alaniz President	Ph: (800) 627-3145 Fax: (361) 937-1836	(800) 627-3145	See Attached School Discount Price List.	30 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices. Other catalog: School Discount Price List.					
T-Shirt Express 203 East Palma Vista Dr. Mission, TX 78572-	Eduardo Sandoval Owner	Ph: (956) 585-5990 Fax: (956) 585-5330	(956) 585-5990	10% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 10% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 10% for Repair services.	10 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is Not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash Carry" prices.					
T-Shirt Gallery & Sports 5815 A Weber Road Corpus Christi, TX 78413-	Andrea M. Valenti Vice President	Ph: (361) 852-8992 Fax: (361) 852-0096	(361) 852-8992	5- 30% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 5- 30% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 5- 30% for Repair services.	20- 30 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Other catalog: www.tshirtgalleryandsports.com					
Varsity Spirit Fashions 6745 Lenox Center Ct., Ste. 300 Memphis, TN 38115-	Cathy Ray Bid Coordinator	Ph: (800) 533-8022 Fax:		5% for P.E./Athletic supplies. 5% for P.E./Athletic equipment. 0% for Repair services.	30 - 60 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is Not for "Cash Carry" prices. Delivery depends on when orders are received/processed and availability. Other catalog: Varsity Spirit and Fashion.					



LA JOYA INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

P.E./Athletic Supplies, Equipment & Related Services Catalog Bid #2018-34 Tabsheet

Vendor	Contact	Phone	Discount	Delivery	Awarded
All Awards 104 Moorefield Rd. Mission, Tx 78572	Rene Guerra Owner allawards2578@gmail.com	Ph: 956-867-3760	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment	Business days: 8-10 Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
All Stars Screen Printing & Embroidery 402 E. Coma Ave. Hidalgo, Tx 78557	Sandra Vela Jose Lopez Office Manager Owner embrotexas@yahoo.com	Ph: 956 843-7221	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 8-10 Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Aluminum Athletic Equipment Company 1000 Enterprise Drive Royersford, PA 19468 www.aaesports.com Vendor Reference Number	Tom Syron V.P. Sales toms@aaesports.com 180029	Ph: 800-523-5471 X-109 Fax: 610 825 2378	14% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 14% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 20 + Destination FOB LJISD: Yes	Yes
Deviations Noted					
Exclusions: Pole vault & high jump crossbars, vaulting poles, MBS-40/MBS-35, FBS-40/FBS-35, portable press box-donkey's, UST-7.5/P-CT					
America Team Sports 1909 N. Glenville Dr., Suite 200 Richardson, TX 75081 www.americateamsports.com Other Catalogs	Matt Smith School Sales matt@americatamsports.com 10-40%...Catalog Discount Form Available Upon Request	Ph: 972-231-8326 Fax: 972-231-9555	40% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 40% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 11-14 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Vendor Reference Number					
#2018-34					
Deviations Noted					
Discount Percentage is a range from 10-40%...Catalog Discount Form is Available Upon Request					
BenchDaddy.com P.O. Box 15 Princeton, TX 75407 www.benchdaddy.com Other Catalogs	Michael Womack Owner info@benchdaddy.com The prices listed reflect the 33% discount already applied.	Ph: 214 299-0132 Fax: 972 236-0049	33% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 33% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 33% for Repair Services	Business days: 11-14 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Big Game 13835 Welch Rd. Dallas, TX 75244 www.biggameusa.com Freight Charges	Josh Eells Sales Manager jeells@biggameusa.com Prices quoted does not contain freight; (Fed Ex Ground rates apply).	Ph: 972-292-0700 Fax: 972-292-1558	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 15-19 Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Deviations Noted					
Prices quoted do not contain freight; Fed Ex Ground rates apply					
Bill Guthrie Sports, Inc. 5701 W. Expressway 83 Harlingen, Tx 78552 www.billguthriesports.com Deviations Noted	Edna Estrada Sales Rep ednae@billguthriesports.com 15 % Bill guthrie Sports, 15% Champro, 15% Champion, 10% Cramer, 10% Mueller Bill Guthrie Sports, Champro, Champion, Cramer, Mueller	Ph: 956-428-6462 Fax: 956-428-7074	15% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 15% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 8-10 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes

BSN Sports, LLC P.O. Box 7726 Dallas, TX 75209 www.bsnsports.com	John Stafford Bid Specialist bsnbid@bsnsports.com	Ph: 1 800 527 7510 Fax: 800-365-7653	10% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 10% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 4-7 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	If inside delivery is required for a freight truck shipped item , add 17% of priced line item to to order.				
Vendor Reference Number	18-52792				
Deviations Noted	See exception list attached. Minimum order of \$50 per purchase order. If inside delivery is required for a freight truck shipped item , add 17% of priced line item to to order.				
Cheers Etc., Inc. 1355B North Glenville Drive Richardson, TX 75081 www.cheersetc.com	Patricia Joaquim Owner cheersetc@gmail.com	Ph: 214-319-2613 Fax: 214-319-9110	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 20 +	Yes
Freight Charges	0\$0.00 - \$500.00				
Custom Sportswear, Inc. 8 Enterprise Court Sewell, NJ 08080 www.customsportswear.net	Ron Duzenski Sales Manager Bids@customsportswear.net	Ph: 800- 697-0330 ext. 120 Fax: 856- 589-1033	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 8-10 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes	Yes
Other Catalogs	"School Spiritwear, by Custom Sportswear, Inc." - 0%; "Field Day, by Custom Sportswear, Inc." - 0%				
Exclusive Decals & Screenprinting 415 N. Inspiration Road. Alton, TX 78573-1666	Jose Flores Owner exclusivesigns@gmail.com	Ph: 956-584-0101	10% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 10% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 10% for Repair Services	Business days: 11-14	Yes
Gandy Ink 2027 Industrial Ave San Angelo, TX 76904 www.gandyink.com	Courtney Bryant Sales Representative courtney.bryant@gandyink.com	Ph: 800-999-8137 ext. 306 Fax: 866-949-6999	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment	Business days: 4-7 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Gilman Gear PO Box 97 30 Gilman Road Gilman, CT 06336 www.gilmangear.com	Deborah Gibbs Accounts Receivable accountsreceivable@gilmangear.com	Ph: 860-383-1967 Fax: 860-823-1859	5% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 5% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 5% for Repair Services	Business days: 8-10 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	Freight is prepaid and added to invoice with catalog discount.				
Vendor Reference Number	2018-0025				
Deviations Noted	Freight is prepaid and added to invoice.				
Goodtimes Screen Printing, LLC 1416 Vida Entera St. Alamo, TX 78516	Arthur Gonzalez, Manager gtprinting956@gmail.com	Ph: 956-638-1509	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment	Business days: 8-10 Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Other Catalogs	Sanmar.com, Bawonline.com, A4.com, Badgersport.com				
Deviations Noted	We don't have a catalog but will give 20% discount off the above sites for merchandise, plus cost of printing or embroidery.				

Gopher Sport 2525 Lemon St SW PO Box 998 Owatonna, MN 55060-0998 www.gophersport.com, www.gopherperformance.com, www.pwap.com, www.moving- minds.com	Brad Williams Territory Sales Manager bradwilliams@gophersport.com	Ph: 800-533-0446 Fax: 888-319-7452	10% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 10% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 4-7 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	Gopher Sport, Gopher Performance, Moving Minds, Play with a Purpose				
Freight Charges	Free shipping does not apply to Truck-Ship items				
Vendor Reference Number	2018-34 Bid				
Deviations Noted	Discount does not apply to Only From Gopher (OFG) items				
High End Advertising 2504 Santa Paula Mission, TX 78572 www.highendad.com	Katia Moya Owner kmoya@highendad.com	Ph: 956-600-7777	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 15-19 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	San Mar, A4				
Lakeshore Learning Materials 2695 E Dominguez St Carson, CA 90895 www.LakeshoreLearning.com	Penny Stone Order Processing orderdept@lakeshorelearning.com	Ph: 800 778-4456 Fax: 800 537-5403	5% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 5% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 8-10 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	Lakeshore Early Childhood, issued January 2018 / Lakeshore Elementary, issued February 2018 / Online catalog, www.LakeshoreLearning.com				
Vendor Reference Number	Please reference "Per Bid #2018-34" on all purchase orders.				
LISCO Sports 2101 E. 50th St Lubbock, TX 79404 www.liscosports.com	Steve Lanham Owner lisco@swbel.net	Ph: 806-762-5126 Fax: 806-762-5455	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment	Business days: 8-10 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	www.liscosports.com				
Freight Charges	Pre-paid / Charged Back				
Power Systems, LLC 5700 Casey Dr. Knoxville, Tn 37909 www.power-systems.com	Shay Wells Bid Sales Manager biddepartment@power-systems.com	Ph: 865-862-7886 Fax: 865-671-1450	25% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 25% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 4-7 Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	Shipping determined by weight and destination address				
PowerDrive Training Products, LLC 3736 Bee Cave Rd. West Lake Hills, Tx 78746 www.powerdrivetraining.com	Doug English CEO doug@powerdrivetraining.com	Ph: 512 271 7693	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 11-14 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Pyramid School Products 6510 N. 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908 www.championsports.com Freight Charges	Candy Estes Customer Service Manager orders@pyramidsp.com	Ph: 800-792-2644 Fax: 813-621-7688	25% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 25% for P.E./Athletic Equipment -2% for Repair Services	Business days: 15-19 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes	Yes
Vendor Reference Number	2018-34LAJOYA				

School Health Corporation 865 Muirfield Drive Hanover Park, IL 60133 www.schoolhealth.com	OrderProcessing orders@schoolhealth.com	Ph: 866-323-5465 Fax: 800-235-1305	12% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 12% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 4-7 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	2017 Sports Medicine Catalog or current catalog				
Freight Charges	Free shipping on orders over \$125				
Vendor Reference Number	3400295				
School Outfitters 3736 Regent Ave Cincinnati, OH 45212 www.schooloutfitters.com	SalesDepartment sales@schooloutfitters.com	Ph: 800-260-2776 Fax: 800-494-1036	2% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 2% for P.E./Athletic Equipment	Business days: 20 + Destination FOB LJISD: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	www.schooloutfitters.com				
Freight Charges	Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by item and manufacturer.				
Deviations Noted	Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line item and will vary by items ordered. - Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of debris services are available for an additional charge. - Delivery times may vary by item and manufacturer and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly communicated at the time of order. - Discounts are being offered off of our already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com - Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! - You must call to receive your contracted prices. See attached Deviations page.				
School Tee Factory 8 Enterprise Court Sewell, NJ 08080 www.schoolteefactory.com	Ron Duzenski Sales Manager Bids@schoolteefactory.com	Ph: 888-301-3110 ext. 120 Fax: 856-589-1033	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 8-10 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes	Yes
Other Catalogs	School Tee Factory Price List - 0%, quantity-based discount				
Freight Charges	Free shipping on orders over \$1000.00. Standard UPS delivery fees apply to orders below \$1000.00				
Score Sports 726 E. Anaheim St. Wilmington, CA 90744 https://scoresports.com/	Kathie Arzate Sales Representative Karzate@scoresports.com	Ph: 800-626-7774 ext 1152 Fax: 800-426-1222	27% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 27% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 8-10 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Other Catalogs	SCORE Soccer Catalog, SCORE Baseball Catalog, and SCORE Basketball Catalog				
Freight Charges	Freight is charged by Weight and Speed of delivery. SCORE uses UPS mode of delivery.				
Vendor Reference Number	Reference Account # 602827				
Deviations Noted	SCORE has a range of catalog discounts for La Joya ISD. Soccer discount range is 10.5-33%, Baseball is 7.42-40.13%, Basketball is 13.36-28.67%, and Supplies/Equipment 4%-27%. Discounts are not applicable for Paint and its accessories or Soccer Goals and its accessories.				

Spectrum Corporation 10048 Easthaven Blvd. Houston, TX 77075 spectrumscoreboards.com	Lisa Kennedy Executive Sales Assistant lisa@specorp.com	Ph: 713-944-6200 Fax: 713-944-1290	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 4% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 20 + Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Freight Charges	Pre-paid shipping charges will be added to all shipments.				
The Soccer Corner 1820 Cott Rd. Plano, Tx 75075 www.TheSoccerCorner.com	Mark Robinson Director of School Sales Mark@TheSoccerCorner.com	Ph: 972-422-1006 Fax: 972-422-0006	20% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 20% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 20 + Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	Nike soccer, Adidas soccer, UA soccer, Kwik goal, Puma soccer, Champion sports, and any soccer related company's catalog we will offer				
Freight Charges	20% Discount. We will provide shipping quotes on all bids.				
Tshirt Express 203 E. Palma Vista Mission, TX 78572	Eduardo Sandoval Owner tshirtexpress06@sbcglobal.net	Ph: 956-585-5990 Fax: 956-585-5330	10% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 10% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 15-19 Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Other Catalogs	Augusta, Holloway, Teamworks				
U.S. Games P.O. Box 7726 Dallas, TX 75209 www.usgames.com	Chris Bloomfield National Bid Director usgamesbid@usgames.com	Ph: 800-327-0484 x7324 Fax: 800-365-7653	15% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 15% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 4-7 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	If inside delivery is required, add 17% of priced item to the order 18-52793				
Vendor Reference Number					
Deviations Noted	See exception list attached. Minimum order of \$50.00 per Purchase order				
Xizaka, LLC 6658 Western Rd. Mission, Tx 78574	Rigo Lopez Owner xizakallc@gmail.com	Ph: 956-310-8438	0% for P.E./Athletic Supplies 0% for P.E./Athletic Equipment 0% for Repair Services	Business days: 4-7 Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes