

Awarded Vendor List

Food & Paper Goods Catalog Bid

<i>Company Name</i>	<i>Bid Number</i>	<i>Page Number</i>	<i>HUB/MWBE</i>
492 BBQ	2019-11	10	Yes
Advantage Supply	2017-37	3	Yes
Alex's Catering	2019-11	10	-
Alicia's Su Cocina, LLC	2019-29	12	Yes
Allen Industrial Supply	2018-02	6	-
Balli's Social and Event Center	2017-57	5	-
Belinda Balli Catering	2017-57	5	-
CC Distributors	2019-29	12	-
CCValley, Inc. dba CiCi's Pizza Valley	2017-24	1	Yes
Chick-fil-A Sharyland Towne Crossing	2019-29	12	Yes
Chick-fil-A Palmhurst	2018-02	6	-
Coastal Deli, Inc. dba Jason's Deli	2017-24	1	-
Corner Bakery Café Palms Crossing	2018-02	6	Yes
Dairy Queen (Lynn Lee, Inc.)	2018-02	6	Yes
Dick & Jane Baking Company	2019-29	12	-
Dispose N' Save	2018-32	8	Yes
Dominos Pizza - Penitas, TX	2017-37	3	-
Dominos Pizza - Alton, TX	2017-37	3	-
El Puerto del Tio Jerry	2018-45	9	-
El Taco Mananero	2018-32	8	-
Es Foods	2019-29	12	-
Felix Meat Market	2018-32	8	-
Flores Floral	2019-29	12	-
Fresco Green Deli	2019-11	10	-
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	2017-37	3	-
	2018-32	8	-
	2018-45	9	-
Gulf Coast Paper Co. Inc.	2017-24	1	-
HEB #448	2018-02	6	-
Irma's Sweet Shoppe	2019-29	12	-
J.J.'s Party House	2017-24	1	-
Kona-Ice	2017-24	1	Yes
L'Pastel	2018-02	6	Yes
La Brisa South Texas Distributing	2017-24	1	Yes
La Estrella Catering	2017-24	1	-
Leo's Drive Inn #2, 3, 4 & 5	2019-29	12	-
Lucel Enterprises, Inc. dba Golden Fried Chicken	2017-37	3	-
M & V Catering	2017-24	1	-
Medek, LLC	2017-57	5	Yes
Nothing Bundt Cakes	2018-45	9	-
Pagarci Supply Distributors	2017-24	2	-
	2017-57	5	-
Pappa's Pizza	2019-11	10	Yes
	2019-29	13	Yes
Past & Present	2017-24	2	-
Peter Piper Pizza	2019-29	13	-

<i>Quill Corporation</i>	<i>2019-11</i>	<i>10</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>RJ/S Rental & Catering</i>	<i>2019-29</i>	<i>13</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Rossy Floreria</i>	<i>2017-24</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>RREAL II, Inc. dba Subway</i>	<i>2017-37</i>	<i>3</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>S & S Valley Foods (The Halal Guys)</i>	<i>2019-11</i>	<i>10</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Sam's Club #8250 - E. Jackson</i>	<i>2017-37</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Sam's Club #4850 - North 10th</i>	<i>2017-37</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>School Specialty</i>	<i>2017-24</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Sysco Central Texas, Inc.</i>	<i>2017-57</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>-</i>
	<i>2019-100</i>	<i>10</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>The Platinum Packaging Group</i>	<i>2018-02</i>	<i>6</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Tyson Foods, Inc.</i>	<i>2019-11</i>	<i>11</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Unipak Corporation</i>	<i>2018-45</i>	<i>9</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Valley Ice Cream, Inc.</i>	<i>2017-24</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Victoria's Tea Room</i>	<i>2017-37</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Virginia's Cakes</i>	<i>2018-32</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>Yes</i>
<i>Wal-Mart #3320 - Palmhurst, TX</i>	<i>2017-37</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Wal-Mart #4508 - Penitas, TX</i>	<i>2017-37</i>	<i>4</i>	<i>-</i>
	<i>2018-02</i>	<i>7</i>	<i>-</i>
<i>Whataburger Restaurants, LLC</i>	<i>2018-02</i>	<i>7</i>	<i>-</i>

La Joya Independent School District

Bid 2017-24 - Food and Paper Goods Catalog

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
CCValley, Inc. dba CiCi's Pizza Valleywide P.O. Box 3990 McAllen, TX 78502-3990	Cynthia Benavides President	Ph: (956) 994-1050 Fax: (956) 994-0430	(956) 600-7719	10%-20% for Food and Paper Goods	0-3 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices. Valleywide - Mission, McAllen, Weslaco, Harlign and Brownsville					
Coastal Deli, Inc. dba Jason's Deli 6000 S. Staples, Suite 300 Corpus Christi, TX 78413-	Robert Becquet Vice President	Ph: (361) 854-5446 Fax: (361) 854-0565	(956) 664-1700	0% for Food and Paper Goods	Same Day
Special Notes: Bid is not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
Gulf Coast Paper Co. Inc. 635 Billy Mitchell Blvd. Brownsville, TX 78521-	Ronald De Leon Sales Representative	Ph: (956) 541-2281 Fax: (956) 541-6917	(956) 541-2281	30% for Food and Paper Goods	7-10 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
J.J.'s Party House 201 N. Bicentennial Blvd. McAllen, TX 78501-	Oralia M. Karam Owner	Ph: (956) 686-6461 Fax: (956) 686-1433	(956) 686-6461	5% for Food and Paper Goods	3 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
Kona-Ice 1524 Bluebonnet Avenue Edinburg, TX 78539-	Bryant Morrison Secretary/Treasurer	Ph: (956) 873-6619 Fax:	(956) 873-6619	See attached attachment #1	Same day
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is not for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
La Brisa South Texas Distribution 1007 W B Street Mission, TX 78572-	Facundo Salinas Owner	Ph: (956) 227-0408 Fax:	(956) 227-0408	0% for Food and Paper Goods	1-2 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is not for "Cash-Carry" prices. Frozen milk and water-based popsicles USDA Smart Snack Approved.					
La Estrella Catering 125 W. 3rd Street La Joya, TX 78560-	Guadalupe E Mendiola Owner	Ph: (956) 519-1978 Fax:	(956) 519-1978	0% for Food and Paper Goods	Varies
M & V Catering 206 Silverado Drive West Mission, TX 78572-	Valentin Contreras Owner	Ph: (956) 960-4065 Fax:	(956) 960-4065	0% for Food and Paper Goods	2 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
Pagarci Supply Distributors 214 East Coma Street, Ste., D-07 Hidalgo, TX 78557-	Patricia Pena Owner	Ph: (956) 522-3759 Fax:	(956) 522-3759	5% for Food and Paper Goods	10 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
Past & Present 209 W. 1st St. La Joya, TX 78560-1585	Cristina A. Salinas Owner	Ph: (956) 585-6303 Fax:	(956) 585-6303	0% for Food and Paper Goods	1-2 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
Rosy Floreria 1709 Azalia Street Mission, TX 78573-	Laurencio Barrera Owner	Ph: (956) 583-6751 Fax: (956) 583-6751	(956) 583-6751	0% for Food and Paper Goods	2 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
School Specialty, Inc. W6316 Design Drive Greenville, WI 54942-	Amy Fuss Assistant Secretary	Ph: (888) 388-3224 Fax: (888) 675-1775	(888) 388-6344	36% for Food and Paper Goods	3-10 Business Days ARO
Special Notes: Bid is not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD – will be shipped F.O.B., but any freight will be added to the invoice. Bid is not for "Cash-Carry" prices. Catalog discounts are subject to freight. Refer to our cover letter for full terms. Use Vendor Reference Number when placing orders: 7782219482					
Valley Ice Cream, Inc. 5803 West Mile 3 Road Mission, TX 78572-	Cipriano Valle Co-Owner	Ph: (956) 583-7700 Fax:	(956) 583-7700	0% for Food and Paper Goods	1 Business Day
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					

La Joya Independent School District

Bid 2017-37 - Food & Paper Goods Catalog

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
Advantage Supply P.O. Box 471103 Fort Worth, TX 76147-	Carol Bane CEO	Ph: (817) 377-8094 Fax: (817) 768-2452		Up to 85% for Food & Paper Goods, Up to 85% for Food & Paper Goods Equipment & Up to 85% for Small Kitchen Appliances/Kitchenware	2-3 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is no F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
Dominos Pizza #8053 1715 Hwy 83 (C-1) Penitas, TX 78576-	Thomas Benevente Owner	Ph: (956) 584-0404 Fax: (956) 584-0410	(956) 584-0404	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Varies
Special Notes: Bid is not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
Dominos Pizza #8077 306 E. Main St. Suite #4 Alton, TX 78573-	Thomas Benevente Owner	Ph: (956) 581-9300 Fax:	(956) 581-9300	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Varies
Special Notes: Bid is not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc. 315 S. Closner Edinburg, TX 78539-	Customer Service	Ph: (956) 383-3861 Fax: (956) 383-4674	(956) 383-3861	Up to 45% for Food & Paper Goods, Up to 25% for Food & Paper Goods Equipment & Up to 25% for Small Kitchen Appliances/Kitchenware & Up to 10% for Repair Services	1-5 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
Lucel Enterprises, Inc. dba Golden Fried Chicken P. O. Box B La Joya, TX 78560-	Anita De La Garza Owner	Ph: (956) 584-1432 Fax: (956) 686-0526	(956) 584-1432	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Varies
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
RREAL II, Inc. dba Subway #34837, #47230, #51737, #57721 & #67892 P.O. Box 8095 Mission, TX 78572-	Efrain Villarreal Owner	Ph: (956) 929-8964 Fax: (956) 583-5595		0% for Food & Paper Goods	Same Day or As Requested
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					

<i>Vendor</i>	<i>Contact</i>	<i>Phone/Fax</i>	<i>Phone for Checking Orders</i>	<i>Discount</i>	<i>Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)</i>
Sam's Club #4850 7601 N. 10th McAllen, TX 78501-	Carlos Garcia Manager	Ph: (956) 278-8824 Fax:	(956) 278-8824	0% for Food & Paper Goods, 0% for Food & Paper Goods Equipment & 0% for Small Kitchen Appliances/Kitchenware & 0% for Repair Services	Same Day
Special Notes: Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
Sam's Club #8250 1400 E. Jackson St. McAllen, TX 78503-	Carlos Garcia Manager	Ph: (956) 618-3363 Fax: (956) 618-5252	(956) 618-3363	0% for Food & Paper Goods, 0% for Food & Paper Goods Equipment & 0% for Small Kitchen Appliances/Kitchenware & 0% for Repair Services	Same Day
Special Notes: Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
Victoria's Tea Room 1524 N. Conway Avenue Mission, TX 78572-	Isaias Rodriguez Owner	Ph: (956) 279-5284 Fax:		0% for Food & Paper Goods	1-2 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
Wal-Mart #3320 215 E. 3 Mile Line Palmhurst, TX 78574-	Yecenia Gutierrez Co-Manager	Ph: (956) 519-8453 Fax: (956) 519-2295	(956) 519-8453	0% for Food & Paper Goods, 0% for Food & Paper Goods Equipment & 0% for Small Kitchen Appliances/Kitchenware & 0% for Repair Services	Same Day
Special Notes: Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					
Wal-Mart #4508 1705 Expressway 83 Penitas, TX 78576-	Joe Montalvo Store Director	Ph: (956) 580-6840 Fax: (956) 580-4393	(956) 580-6840	0% for Food & Paper Goods, 0% for Food & Paper Goods Equipment & 0% for Small Kitchen Appliances/Kitchenware	Same Day
Special Notes: Bid is for Cash-Carry prices.					

La Joya Independent School District
Bid 2017-57 - Food and Paper Goods Catalog Bid

Vendor	Contact	Phone/Fax	Phone for Checking Orders	Discount	Delivery (Business days after receipt of P.O.)
Balli's Social and Event Center 1620 E. Griffin Pkwy Mission, TX 78572-	Aaron Balli Owner	Ph: (956) 585-5755 Fax: (956) 821-5944	(956) 821-5944	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Varies
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
Belinda Balli Catering 1620 E. Griffin Pkwy. Mission, TX 78572-	Belinda Balli Owner	Ph: (956) 960-6612 Fax:	(956) 960-6612	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Varies
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
MEDEK, LLC 3800 South "M" Street McAllen, TX 78503-	Dennis Garcia President	Ph: (956) 655-7980 Fax: (855) 633-3577	(956) 655-7980	20% for Food & Paper Goods, 0% for Food & Paper Goods Equipment, 0% for Small Kitchen Appliances/Kitchenware, 0% for Repair Services	3 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
Pagarci Supply Distributors 214 East Coma Street, Ste., D-07 Hidalgo, TX 78557-	Patricia Pena Owner	Ph: (956) 522-3759 Fax:	(956) 522-3759	10% for Food & Paper Goods, 10% for Food & Paper Goods Equipment, 5% for Repair Services	10 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is not F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is not for "Cash-Carry" prices.					
Sysco Central Texas, Inc. 1260 Schwab Rd. New Braunfels, TX 78132-	Rebecca Dresch Bid Contracts Manager	Ph: (830) 730-1209 Fax: (855) 656-4432	(830) 730-1209	"See Attachments" for Food & Paper Goods, "See Attachments" for Food & Paper Goods Equipment, "See Attachments" for Small Kitchen Appliances/Kitchenware, 0% for Repair Services	14 Business Days
Special Notes: Bid is F.O.B. Destination La Joya ISD. Bid is not for "Cash-Carry" prices.					



LA JOYA INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT Bid

2018-02 Food & Paper Goods Catalog Tabsheet

Vendor	Contact	Phone	Discount	Delivery	Awarded
Allen Industrial Supply 1309 Business Park Drive Suite A Mission, TX 78572	Jessie Raya Account Manager jraya@allenindustrialsupply.com	Ph: 956-655-9770 Fax: 956-584-2277	15% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 10 - 12 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	15				
Vendor Reference Number	Yes				
Chick-fil-A Palmhurst (Palmhurst Leadership, LLC) 214 E Mile 3 North Rd. Palmhurst, TX 78573 www.chick-fil-a.com/Palmhurst	Laura Sanchez Director 03883@chick-fil-a.com	Ph: 956-580-9991 Fax: 956-580-9994	Discounts vary based on the different school meal options (between 10-20% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: same day/next day Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	Delivery charges are applied on delivery orders equaling less than \$100				
Corner Bakery Cafe Palms Crossing (CB Cafes Mcallen 1, LLC) 3400 Expressway 83 Ste 780 Mcallen, TX 78599	Adrian Olivarez or Krysti Trevino General Manager or Catering Manager Cbcpalmscrossing@sbgglobalfoods.com	Ph: 956-800-6279 Fax: None	0% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: When needed Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Other Catalogs	0				
Dairy Queen (Lynn Lee Inc.) 208 North Cage Pharr, TX 78577	Mark Gamboa Field Marketing Manager markg@thedqteam.com	Ph: 956-330-0790 Fax: 956-787-8749	Discount Varies for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: Company does not deliver Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Deviations	Yes				
Deviations Noted	If we do deviate from the terms and conditions, it will all be based on the school budget. If the school budget changes, so will our prices. All is based on budget.				
Vendor Reference Number	PO required only if school requires for payment.				
HEB #448 1840 W. Palma Vista Drive Palmview, TX 78572	Manager Unit Director s448aa@heb.com	Ph: 956-585-3161 Fax: 956-585-7467	0% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: Same day Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Other Catalogs	N/A				
Deviations	Yes				
Deviations Noted	We do not accept PO but will accept credit card				
L'Pastel 2505 E. Griffin pkwy Mission TX Mission, TX 78572	Leticia or Ruben Vela None thinkjesus@sbgglobal.net	Ph: 956-585-4030 Fax: None	10% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 1 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
The Platinum Packaging Group 7627 Somerset Blvd Paramount, CA 90723 platinumpkggroup.com	Ruth Sanchez Office Manager sales@platinumpkggroup.com	Ph: 562-630-6700 Fax: 562-630-6716	1% 10 days, net 30% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 10-15 business days. Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes

Wal-Mart Store #4508
(Wal-Mart Corporation)
1705 Expy 83
Penitas, TX 78576

Amanda Nino
Assistant manager
Nino790@gmail.com

Ph: 956-580-6840
Fax: 956-580-4393

0% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog
Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes

Freight Charges

N/A

Deviations Noted

N/A

Whataburger Restaurants, LLC
300 Concord Plaza
San Antonio, TX 78216

General Manager

Ph: See Below

0% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog
Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes

Yes

Deviations

Yes

Yes

Deviations Noted

Bid applies to La Joya, TX 7450 Hwy 83/Store #603: (956) 519-4661 , Mission, TX, 201 E Griffin Parkway/Store #807: (956) 581-2021, Mission, TX E.9th St/Store #191: (956) 581-2121

& Mission, TX 2510 E Expwy 83/Store #719: (956) 583-2131, Palmhurst ,TX 4321 N. Conway Ave./ Store # 925 (956) 583-4003 and Palmview, TX 2916 W Epwy 83/Store #618:

(956) 519-8488 locations.

Please see attached Form 1295 & Deviations file.



LA JOYA INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Food and Paper Goods Catalog Bid #2018-32 Tabsheet

Vendor	Contact	Phone	Discount	Delivery	Awarded
Dispose N' Save 5 Getzel Berger Blvd. Monroe, NY 10950	Chanie Schnitzer Secretary Abraham@disposensave.com	Ph: 845-781-2450 Fax: 845-781-2455	50% Off Current Catalog% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 1-5 Days ARODestination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
El Taco Mananero 8245 N. Moorefield Rd. Mission, TX 78574	Juan Muniz Owner jmuniz33@yahoo.com	Ph: 956-491-9837 Fax: n/a	0% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 1 day Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Felix Meat Market PO Box 176 La Joya, TX 78560	Felix Alaniz Owner	Ph: 956-585-6571 Fax: None	0% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: Varies Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc. 315 S. Closner Edinburg, TX 78539 www.gatewayp.com	Customer Service csr.rgv@gatewayp.com	Ph: 956-383-3861 Fax: 956-316-0253	Up to 50% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 1 Day ARO Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Other Catalogs		Gateway online catalog at www.gatewayp.com			
Virginia's Cakes 709 N. Tom Gill Rd Penitas, TX 78576	Virginia Alvarado Owner virginiascakes53@gmail.com	Ph: 956-424-9029 or 956-821-8442 Fax: None	0% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 0 Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes



LA JOYA INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Food and Paper Goods RFP #2018-45 Tabsheet

Vendor	Contact	Phone	Discount	Delivery	Awarded
El Puerto del Tio Jerry 2418 W. Palma Vista Dr. Palmview, TX 78572	Gerardo Chapa Owner gerardo.chapa.jr@hotmail.com	Ph: 956-252-3937	8% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 1 Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc. 315 S. Closner Edinburg, TX 78539 www.gatewayp.com	Rudy Castilleja Account Manager csr.rgv@gatewayp.com	Ph: 956-383-3861 Fax: 956-316-0253	45% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 1-10 days Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Other Catalogs		Gateway Online Catalog at www.gatewayp.com			
Deviations Noted		Please note that the percentage discount varies for Food and Paper Good catalog up to 45%			
Nothing Bundt Cakes 3400 W. Expressway 83, Bldg 700, Suite 740 McAllen, TX 78501 nothingbundtcakes.com	Michael Amaya Manager mcallen@nothingbundtcakes.com	Ph: 956-631-2324	10% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 5 days Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges		\$20.00 delivery fee; depending on size of order fee will be waived			
Unipak Corp. POB 300027 Brooklyn, NY 11230 www.unipakcorp.net	Brian Marcus President unipakcorp@aol.com	Ph: 718-677-1065 Fax: 718-677-9371	20% for Food and Paper Goods Catalog	Business days: 1-10 Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes



LA JOYA INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Food & Paper Goods RFP #2019-11 Tabsheet

Vendor	Contact	Phone	Discount	Delivery	Awarded
492 BBQ 4126 N. FM 492 Mission, TX 78574	Guadalupe J. Garza Jr. Manager 492bbq@gmail.com	Ph: 956-222-4242	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 5 Days Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Alex's Catering 703 E 9th St Suite A Mission, TX 78572	Susana Baez Owner alex_susie_villa@yahoo.com	Ph: 956-458-0804	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: On day of event. Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Freight Charges Deviations Noted	No Charge Please call for quote.				
Fresco Green Deli 310 W. Palma Vista Dr. Palmview, TX 78572 www.facebook.com/Fresco-Green-Deli-Now-Open-324483808002829/	Saul Diaz Owner	Ph: 956-890-0059 / 956-780-2478	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 5 Business Days Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges Vendor Reference Number	No charges; free delivery 9500098				
Pappa's Pizza 301 N. Alton Blvd., Suite 5 Alton, TX 78573	Yoly Ramon Sales altonpappaspizzahr@gmail.com	Ph: 830-765-7676; 956-513-0105	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 1 Day Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	\$2.50; 3 mile range, \$5.00; 6 mile range, \$7.50; 10 mile range and \$10.00; 10-15 mile range				
Quill Corporation 100 Scheller Road Lincolnshire, IL 60069 www.quill.com	Conni Montrose Team Manager Bid Department e-order@quill.com	Ph: 800-634-4809 x6295 Fax: 800-789-2016	Please refer to attached reference letters explaining your discounts.% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 1-2 Days; stock items ARO Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Freight Charges Vendor Reference Number Deviations Deviations Noted	Refer to delivery policy attached. 18-17533 Yes Refer to all legal documents attached. Delivery, Return policy.				
S & S Valley Foods, LLC (The Halal Guys) 101 East Expressway 83, Suite 190 McAllen, TX 78501	Gerardo Higareda Director of Operations gerardo.valleyfoods@gmail.com	Ph: 956-648-5998	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 1 Day Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Sysco Central Texas 1260 Schwab Rd. New Braunfels, TX 78132 www.sysco.com	Rebecca Dresch and Rita Kolberg (Customer Service Manager) Government Contracts & Bid Manager dresch.rebecca@ctx.sysco.com and kolberg.rita@ctx.sysco.com	Ph: 830-730-1209 and 830-730-1155 Fax: 855-656-4432	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: Most Within 1 Week. Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Vendor Reference Number Deviations Deviations Noted	PO number required Yes Force Majuere attached.				

Tyson Foods, Inc. 2200 Don Tyson Parkway Springdale, AR 72762 https://www.tysonfoodservice.com/your-channel/k-12	Lisa Sullivan (Waypoint, Inc.) Waypoint Broker Lisa.Sullivan@asmwaypoint.com	Ph: 972-219-6718 Fax: 972-219-6744	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: *Varies* Please see Cover Letter	Yes
<hr/>					
Vendor Reference Number	RFP 2019-11				
Deviations	Yes				
Deviations Noted					



LA JOYA INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Food & Paper Goods RFP #2019-29 Tabsheet

Vendor	Contact	Phone	Discount	Delivery	Recommendation
Alicia's Su Cocina LLC 101 S. Main Peñitas, TX 78576	Jose Monroy Jose Monroy jr General mgr ASC20171@outlook.com	Ph: 956-331-7886 or 956-432-8957	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: Same day Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Deviations Noted	Call for quote				
CC Distributors PO Box 85 La Feria, TX 78559 www.ccdistributors.com	Victor Carreon Sales Representative victore@ccdistributors.com	Ph: 361-443-5680 Fax: 361-289-6290	15% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 3-5 Days Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	\$8.99 shipping fee on orders under \$75.00				
Vendor Reference Number	2019-29 - Food & Paper Goods				
Chick-fil-A Sharyland Towne Crossing 2501 E. US Expressway 83 Mission, TX 78572 www.chick-fil-a.com/ sharylandtownecrossing	Any member of Management Manager 01837@chick-fil-a.com	Ph: 956-682-0055 Fax: 956-682-2945	Varies % for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: Same Day Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Deviations	Yes				
Deviations Noted	Discount will depend on order.				
Dick and Jane Baking Company 900 Wilshire Drive #202 Troy, MI 48084 www.dickandjanebakingco.com	Mike Lukas VP mike@dickandjane.us	Ph: 248-752-3811 Fax: 248-519-2399	School discount already applied to price listing % for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 14 Business days from placement of PO Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Deviations	Yes				
Deviations Noted	Item 9.Delivery Time - 14 business days on receipt of Purchase order				
ES Foods 20 Crossways Park N. Woodbury, NY 11797 esfoods.com	Palma Connell Office Manager pconnell@esfoods.com	Ph: 516-682-5494 Fax: 516-364-7478	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 14 Days Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: No	Yes
Flores Floral 1412 E. Expressway 83 Penitas, TX 78560	Diana Flores Owner floresflowers386@gmail.com	Ph: 956-580-8186	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: Depending on order. Destination FOB LJISD: Yes	Yes
Irmis Sweete Shoppe 120 E Park Newcombe Pharr, TX 78577	Irma Elizondo Owner iownirmas@aol.com	Ph: 956 787 -7131 Fax: 956 787-7292	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 4 Days Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	\$10.50 delivery fee				
Leo's Drive In 1114 E Palma Vista Dr P.O. Box 1120 Mission, TX 78573	All Leo's Drive In Stores All managers leosdrivein@rgv.rr.com	Ph: 956-585-3818 956-585-0323 ,956-583-9898 , 956-585-8411 956-584-3441 Fax: 956-585-3884		Business days: 5 Days Destination FOB LJISD: No Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	No shipping allowed				

Pappa's Pizza 301 N. Alton Blvd., Ste 5 Alton, TX 78573	Yoly Ramon Owner altonpappaspizzahr@gmail.com	Ph: 830-765-7676	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 1 Day Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	\$2.50 3 mile range, \$5.00 6 mile range, \$7.50 10 mile range, \$10.00 10-15 mile range				
Vendor Reference Number	9565130105				
Peter Piper Pizza 4445 N. Mesa Suite 100 El Paso, TX 79902 www.peterpiperpizza.com	Cris Saenz, or any Manager at the Palmview Peter Piper Pizza location Field Marketing Representative, or Manager at the Restaurant csaenz@pizzaproperties.com	Ph: Cris Saenz: 956-635-1106 or Restaurant: 956-519-2590	10% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: We ask for at least 2-3 days notice, but will do all we can to help with last minute orders. Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Freight Charges	No delivery fee, we just ask for a minimum order of \$100 for delivery. Carry out is always available no minimum				
Deviations	Yes				
Deviations Noted	We also offer seasonal and partner in education discounts that are often greater than 10%. The specials change and are based on our current ad campaign at the time. Please call or email for current specials				
RJ/S Rental & Catering 2217 Lusby St. Mission, TX 78574	Roberto Garcia Owner s.garcia274@yahoo.com	Ph: 956-342-5515 Fax: 956-581-2630	0% for Food & Paper Goods	Business days: 0-3 Days Destination FOB LJISD: Yes Bid for Cash-Carry Prices: Yes	Yes
Deviations	Yes				
Deviations Noted	Varias				



October 2, 2018

Sylvia Zapata
Director of Purchasing & Warehouse
La Joya Independent School District
201 East Expressway 83
La Joya, TX 78560

Quill Bid Number: 18-17533
Customer Bid Info: 2019-11 (Food & Paper Goods)
Account Number: 2260944

Dear Sylvia Zapata,

Thank you for your recent bid request. We appreciate your interest in Quill and are pleased to offer your organization the below category discounts along with free shipping through December 31, 2021.

- 10% Janitorial Supplies*
- 10% Stock Furniture*
- 12% Ink & Toner*
- 15% all other categories such as Office and School Supplies*

Below are a few guidelines that we ask for you to follow to ensure the proper pricing and handling of your purchase orders:

- ☐ Verbal or written acceptance is requested to guarantee your discounts. Please see attached Bid Award Form. If any additional recap information is available, please forward as well. (this will allow us to review and revise our pricing in the future in order to continue to provide the best product pricing available)
- ☐ Please use the Quill bid number above, Quill item numbers and prices that are referenced on your bid when placing purchase orders for easy and accurate processing. Orders will ship and invoice the same day, if orders must invoice and/or ship on or after a certain date this must be indicated clearly on your purchase order.
- ☐ Please email your tax exempt form to taxexempt@quill.com or fax to 800-499-8805.

Quill.com offers easy online ordering with visibility to your special item pricing as well as your extra discount at www.Quill.com.

Thank you once again for choosing Quill. We look forward to working with you in the future.

Sincerely,
Quill's Bid Department

*Discount does not apply to Dell™ ink & toner; computer peripherals (digital cameras, scanners, PDAs and software); e-readers; desktop, laptop, netbook, and tablet computers; electronic office machines (copiers, fax machines and LCD projectors); printers; multifunction machines; office communications equipment (phones, radios, DVD players, TVs, VCRs, and camcorders); vending and gumball machines; refurbished and closeout merchandise; taxes or freight charges. Sale prices, free offer deals, Top Seller/Best Price items, special order items and items beginning with the prefix "SPW" or "UNI", or indicated as an 'extended assortment' item are also excluded from this discount offer. We reserve the right to change our programs and their benefits, including shipping charges.



100 Schelter Road
Lincolnshire, IL 60069
P: 800.634.4809
F: 800.789.2016
www.quill.com

Sales Contact Information

Christopher Denton

National Account Manager

Phone: (800) 789-7020 ext. 1468

Fax: (888) 888-8250

Email: Christopher.Denton@quill.com

Sales Team Manager

Therese Schwarz

Phone: (800) 789-7020 ext. 4352

Email: Therese.Schwarz@quill.com

Bid Department Email

bid@quill.com



Delivery Policy

- 99% in stock rate, 98% on time delivery

Standard Shipping is via UPS or Local Carrier within 1-2 business days (Mon-Fri) ARO.

- UPS automatically provides inside delivery (the driver will bring the merchandise inside to a main location-no desk top delivery).
- Standard shipping for items w/prefix of JV are normally 1-2 business days ARO, however, large quantities of an item may require longer delivery times-up to 5-7 business days ARO
- No shipping or processing fees.
- Only within the 48 contiguous states.

Large Volume Orders may ship via Truck - Tailgate Delivery within 2-7 business days ARO.

- Tailgate Delivery means the driver is only responsible to get cartons to the end of the truck and customer is responsible for unloading and bringing inside the building. No shipping or processing fees
- A call 24 hours before a truck delivery can be arranged at no charge.
- Lift gates (cargo lift) can be requested for truck orders at no charge- you must note the PO.
- For an additional fee of \$25.00 the driver will assist in unloading cartons from truck and bringing inside the building.
- Installation and or set/up is not included. Additional charges will apply based on weight and site conditions. Please call for quote.
- Pallet size is 48" X 42"
- We cannot guarantee full carton shipments due to our automated order system.
- In order to provide prompt delivery of your order, we may have to utilize stock from multiple warehouse locations.
- We cannot guarantee palletized shipments for large orders due to our automated order system.
- For us to ship larger quantities and provide prompt delivery service, we may have to utilize stock from multiple warehouse locations.

Quill's **Future Delivery** option enables a school to plan for future needs while securing today's low sale prices

- Schedule delivery and billing up to 4 months from the time of submitting your order
- Just write "Future Delivery" on your purchase order and the date you want the order to ship. If ordering online, simply click "Delayed Shipment" on the checkout screen.

Back Order Procedure

Quill LLC operates 25 warehouses nationwide and partners with vendors and wholesalers to deliver products. If the warehouse nearest your location doesn't have the item, Quill will use one of its other warehouses or vendor/wholesaler to deliver the product in 1-2 business days for stock items. As a second option, Quill will suggest an item of equal or higher value at the same price. In the rare event that an item has to be backordered, Quill will notify you via phone, email, or fax of the issue and time frame you can expect your item.



Return Policy

If there's a problem with your order or you need to make a return, we will do whatever it takes to make it right. Unless otherwise noted below, merchandise must be returned within 30 days for full credit, refund or replacement. Machines and furniture must be returned in the original box.

ORIGINAL MANUFACTURER INK & TONER RETURN POLICY: Unopened and unexpired Original Manufacturer ink & toner cartridges such as, but not limited to, cartridges, drums, maintenance kits, fusers, developer kits, transfer kits, cleaning units, and waste toner bottles/containers may be returned within 30 days of purchase for full credit or replacement. Please check to make sure you've ordered the correct cartridge before opening the packaging (use our Ink & Toner Finder at www.quill.com/ink-toner-finder). We will not accept returns on merchandise that has been opened and is not defective.

QUILL BRAND INK & TONER GUARANTEE: Quill Brand ink & toner cartridges are guaranteed to be free from defect regardless of the age of the product. If a defect occurs, we'll be happy to exchange it or provide a full refund. Quill Brand cartridges are manufactured to the highest standards in materials and workmanship to meet O.E.M. (Original Equipment Manufacturer) yield and performance standards.

TECHNOLOGY AND BUSINESS MACHINES (RETURN WITHIN 14 DAYS): Non-defective technology and business machine items such as, but not limited to, printers, copiers, shredders, laminators, fax machines, computer accessories, networking, cameras, scanners, monitors, projectors, video equipment and consumer electronics must be returned within 14 days of the date of receipt and meet the following conditions: Returns must contain all original packing materials (including box), UPC codes on the box, all product documentation, parts, and accessories. Defective products must be handled under each manufacturer's guidelines.

COMPUTERS/LAPTOPS/NOTEBOOKS/TABLETS (RETURN WITHIN 14 DAYS): All computers, laptops, notebooks and tablets must be returned within 14 days of the date of receipt for a full credit or refund. To return a computer, laptop, notebook or tablet, it must be returned in the original box with the UPC code, all original packaging materials, product documentation, parts and accessories. All returns will be inspected and must be 100% complete. Defective products must be handled under the guidelines stated in the warranty and repair policy sheet included with the product.

- Panasonic computers have limited-exchange privileges that require manufacturer approval of any exchanges as a result of a defective product within 14 days of purchase. Prior to returning computers from this brand, you must contact a manufacturer agent to obtain a return authorization number or code. Contact: Panasonic at 855-772-8324.

VENDING EQUIPMENT (RETURN WITHIN 30 DAYS): The following policy covers non-defective vending equipment that includes, but is not limited to, bulk vending machines (gumball machines), electronic and mechanical snack machines, beverage machines, change machines and accessories. Defective products must be handled under each manufacturer's guidelines. Items must be returned within 30 days and meet the following conditions:

- The box must contain all original packing materials (where applicable), UPC codes on the box, all product documentation as well as all parts and accessories. All returns will be inspected and must be 100% complete. Non-perishable free items included with a specific product purchase must be returned as well to receive credit.

BOXED, LICENSED AND DOWNLOADED SOFTWARE (RETURN WITHIN 30 DAYS): Unopened boxed software that we currently sell must be returned in the original, unopened packaging within 30 days from receipt of product for a full credit, return or replacement unless noted by the manufacturer. Any defective boxed software must be returned within 30 days and will be exchanged for the exact same software title version. Software licensing varies by manufacturer; call 800-789-1331 for details. Multiple licenses may not be returned beyond 30 days for any reason unless authorized by the manufacturer. Downloadable software is not returnable or refundable.

FURNITURE: Furniture items such as, but not limited to, chairs, desks, tables, partitions, cabinets, chair mats, lamps and all furniture decor must be returned within 30 days and meet the following conditions: Returns must contain all original packing materials (including box), UPC codes on the box, all product documentation, parts, and accessories. Defective products must be handled under each manufacturer's guidelines. All returns will be inspected and must be 100% complete.

Warranty Information

<http://www.quill.com/content/iw/help/policies.cshtml?icid=ft:g,pssy>

- **How can I obtain a manufacturer's product warranty information?**
 - To obtain a manufacturer's telephone number for warranty information, please [email us](mailto:solutions@quill.com), solutions@quill.com.
 - Please include the product name, manufacturer and model number or Quill.com item number. Browse our assortment of [SquareTrade warranties](#) for service plans you can purchase through Quill.com.
- ***How can I obtain product recall information?***
 - To obtain a manufacturer's telephone number for recall information, please email us, solutions@quill.com
 - Please include the product name, manufacturer and model number or Quill item number.
 - The products identified below are subject to recall in the United States.
 - The recall information provided here is based on manufacturers' and regulatory agencies' press releases that involve products previously sold through Quill.com. Information on each recalled product, and the steps you should take if you own such a product, are also set forth in more detail below.
 - For products recalled through the U.S. Consumer Product Safety Commission, visit the CPSC Web site at www.cpsc.gov for additional information or call the CPSC recall consumer hotline at 800-638-2772.
 - For products recalled through the U.S. Food and Drug Administration, visit the FDA Web site at www.fda.gov for additional information or call the FDA at 888-463-6332.
- ***What do I do if a product I bought has been recalled?***
 - Please contact the manufacturer for specific instructions.





School
Specialty®

Nov. 16, 2016

Attn: Sylvia G. Zapata, Dir. of Purch. & Warehouse
La Joya ISD
Purchasing Dept.
201 East Expressway 83
La Joya, TX 78560

Account No: 273433

RE: 2017-24 Food and Paper Goods Catalog

School Specialty is pleased to offer you the following catalog discount terms.

Discount:

Catalog List Price Less **36%** on Supply items in the current School Specialty catalogs listed below. *

Catalog List Price Less **25%** on Furniture items in the current School Specialty catalogs listed below. *

School Specialty Education Essentials Catalog

School Specialty Art Education Catalog / SAX

School Specialty Special Needs Catalog / Abilitations

School Specialty Physical Education & Recreation Catalog / Sportime

School Specialty Early Childhood Catalog / Childcraft

School Specialty Furniture & Equipment Catalog

School Specialty Safety and Security / Guardian

* These catalogs may contain a limited number of items that are listed as "Net Price". Net Price items are not eligible for any discounts. Also excluded is any catalog that bears the notation: "No other discounts apply".

Contract Period:

Valid from 1/01/2017 - 12/31/2019. Pricing for this **contract period is effective upon notification of award**, referencing our Bid #7782219482 to bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com.

Freight Terms:

Parcel Orders \$49.00 or greater ship free of charge (7 & 9 prefix items).

Parcel Orders less than \$49.00 will be charged \$9.95.

Truck and Freight shipments will be charged a minimum of \$99.00 or 15% of the item price, whichever is greater (6 & 8 prefix items).

Timeframe for Delivery: 3 - 10 days after receipt of order (averages 3 - 5 days)

Sincerely,

Mary Steichen
Bid Operations Coordinator