
Divine Alignment - Week 1 

Psalm 133:1 (NKJV)

Behold, how good and how pleasant it is for brethren to dwell together in unity!


Psalm 133:2 (NKJV)

It is like the precious oil upon the head, running down on the beard, the beard of 
Aaron, running down on the edge of his garments.


Psalm 133:3 (NKJV)

It is like the dew of Hermon, descending upon the mountains of Zion; for there 
the Lord commanded the blessing—life forevermore.


1. Alignment with God requires that we come under the authority of God. 

1 John 3:4 (NKJV)

Everyone who sins breaks the law; in fact,

sin is lawlessness.


Judges 17:6 (NKJV)

In those days there was no king in Israel; everyone

did what was right in his own eyes.


1 Samuel 15:22 (NKJV)

So Samuel said: “Has the Lord as great delight in burnt offerings and sacrifices, 
as in obeying the voice of the Lord? Behold, to obey is better than sacrifice, and 
to heed than the fat of rams.


1 Samuel 15:23 (NKJV)

For rebellion is as the sin of witchcraft, and stubbornness is as iniquity and 
idolatry. Because you have rejected the word of the Lord, He also has rejected 
you from being king.”


2 Timothy 3:16-17 (NIV)

All Scripture is God-breathed and is useful for teaching, rebuking, correcting and 
training in righteousness, so that the servant of God may be thoroughly 
equipped for every good work.


Romans 13:1-2 (NKJV)

Let every soul be subject to the governing authorities. For there is no authority 
except from God, and the authorities that exist are appointed by God. Therefore 
whoever resists the authority resists the ordinance of God, and those who resist 
will bring judgment on themselves. 




Ephesians 1:22-23 (NLT)

God has put all things under the authority of Christ and has made him head over 
all things for the benefit of the church. And the church is his body… 


1 Peter 2:13-14 (NIV)

Submit yourselves for the Lord’s sake to every human authority: whether to the 
emperor, as the supreme authority, or to governors, who are sent by him to 
punish those who do wrong and to commend those who do right. 


Ephesians 5:22-23 (NKJV)

Wives, submit to your own husbands, as to the Lord. For the husband is head of 
the wife, as also Christ is head of the church; and He is the Savior of the body.


Ephesians 5:25 (NKJV)

Husbands, love your wives, just as Christ also loved the church and gave 
Himself for her.


Ephesians 6:1-3 (NKJV)

Children, obey your parents in the Lord, for this is right. “Honor your father and 
mother,” which is the first commandment with promise: “that it may be well with 
you and you may live long on the earth.”


Ephesians 1:22-23 (NLT)

God has put all things under the authority of Christ and has made him head over 
all things for the benefit of the church. And the church is his body… 


Romans 10:9 (ESV)

If you confess with your mouth that Jesus is Lord and believe in your heart that 
God raised him from the dead, you will be saved. 


Matthew 7:21 (NKJV)

“Not everyone who says to Me, ‘Lord, Lord,’ shall enter the kingdom of heaven, 
but he who does the will of My Father in heaven.


Matthew 7:22 (NKJV)

Many will say to Me in that day, ‘Lord, Lord, have we not prophesied in Your 
name, cast out demons in Your name, and done many wonders in Your name?’


Matthew 7:23 (NKJV)

And then I will declare to them, ‘I never knew you; depart from Me, you who 
practice lawlessness!’”




Luke 6:46

“Why do you call me, ‘Lord, Lord,’ and do not 

do what I say?”


John 14:21 (NKJV)

He who has My commandments and keeps them, it is he who loves Me. And he 
who loves Me will be loved by My Father, and I will love him and manifest 

Myself to him.”


2. Alignment with God requires that we come into agreement with God. 

Job 22:21 (ESV)

“Agree with God, and be at peace; thereby good 

will come to you.”


Matthew 18:19 (NIV)

“Again I say to you that if two of you agree on earth concerning anything that 
they ask, it will be done for them by My Father in heaven.”


Romans 12:1 (NIV)

Therefore, I urge you, brothers and sisters, in view of God’s mercy, to offer your 
bodies as a living sacrifice, holy and pleasing to God—this is your true and 
proper worship.


Romans 12:2 (NIV)

Do not conform to the pattern of this world, but be transformed by the renewing 
of your mind. Then you will be able to test and approve what God’s will is—his 
good, pleasing and perfect will.


Acts 16:6-7 (NKJV)

Now when they had gone through Phrygia and the region of Galatia, they were 
forbidden by the Holy Spirit to preach the word in Asia. After they had come to 
Mysia, they tried to go into Bithynia, but the Spirit did not permit them.


Acts 16:8-9 (NKJV)

So passing by Mysia, they came down to Troas. And a vision appeared to Paul 
in the night. A man of Macedonia stood and pleaded with him, saying, “Come 
over to Macedonia and help us.”


Acts 16:10 (NKJV)

Now after he had seen the vision, immediately we sought to go to Macedonia, 
concluding that the Lord had called us to preach the gospel to them.




3. When I come under the authority of God, and into agreement with God, 
there will be a release of the anointing of God. 

Psalm 91:1 (NKJV)

He that dwelleth in the secret place of the most High shall abide under the 
shadow of the Almighty.


Psalm 91:2 (NKJV)

I will say of the Lord, He is my refuge and my fortress: my God; in him will I trust.


Psalm 91:3 (NKJV)

Surely he shall deliver thee from the snare of the fowler, and from the noisome 
pestilence.


Psalm 91:4 (NKJV)

He shall cover thee with his feathers, and under his wings shalt thou trust: his 
truth shall be thy shield 

and buckler.


Psalm 91:5-6 (NKJV)

Thou shalt not be afraid for the terror by night; nor for the arrow that flieth by 
day; nor for the pestilence that walketh in darkness; nor for the destruction that 
wasteth at noonday.


Psalm 91:7 (NKJV)

A thousand shall fall at thy side, and ten thousand at thy right hand; but it shall 
not come nigh thee.


Psalm 91:9-12 (NKJV)

Because thou hast made the Lord, which is my refuge, even the most High, thy 
habitation; There shall no evil befall thee, neither shall any plague come nigh thy 
dwelling. For he shall give his angels charge over thee, to keep thee in all thy 
ways. They shall bear thee up in their hands, lest thou dash thy foot against a 
stone.


Psalm 91:13-16 (NKJV)

Thou shalt tread upon the lion and adder: the young lion and the dragon shalt 
thou trample under feet. Because he hath set his love upon me, therefore will I 
deliver him: I will set him on high, because he hath known my name. He shall 
call upon me, and I will answer him: I will be with him in trouble; I will deliver him, 
and honour him. With long life will I satisfy him, and shew him my salvation.


Deuteronomy 28:1-2 (NKJV)




“Now it shall come to pass, if you diligently obey the voice of the Lord your God, 
to observe carefully all His commandments which I command you today, that 
the Lord your God will set you high above all nations of the earth. And all these 
blessings shall come upon you and overtake you, because you obey the voice of 
the Lord your God:


Deuteronomy 28:3-4 (NKJV)

Blessed shall you be in the city, and blessed shall you be in the country. Blessed 
shall be the fruit of your body, the produce of your ground and the increase of 
your herds, the increase of your cattle and the offspring of your flocks.


Deuteronomy 28:5-6 (NKJV)

Blessed shall be your basket and your kneading bowl. Blessed shall you be 
when you come in, and blessed shall you be when you go out.


Deuteronomy 28:7 (NKJV)

The Lord will cause your enemies who rise against you to be defeated before 
your face; they shall come out against you one way and flee before you seven 
ways.


Deuteronomy 28:8 (NKJV)

The Lord will command the blessing on you in your storehouses and in all to 
which you set your hand, and He will bless you in the land which the Lord your 
God is giving you.”


Deuteronomy 28:14 (NKJV)

“But it shall come to pass, if you do not obey the voice of the Lord your God, to 
observe carefully all His commandments and His statutes which I command you 
today, that all these curses will come upon

you and overtake you.”



