

Geauga Park District

2019 Aggregate Stone Materials Bid Tabulation

3.5.2019

BID ITEM DESCRIPTION	SHELLY MATERIALS	ARMS TRUCKING COMPANY
NORTH OPERATIONS/BIG CREEK PARK		
ODOT Screenings #10 - Limestone {Powder}	\$22.85	\$21.83
ODOT #304 - Limestone	\$20.90	\$21.46
ODOT Recycled #304	\$18.25	\$18.45
ODOT #411 - Limestone	\$22.80	\$21.88
ODOT Recycled #411	No Bid	No Bid
ODOT 1s & 2s - Limestone	\$26.45	\$26.73
ODOT Recycled 1s & 2s	No Bid	\$19.95
Type C - Limestone	\$46.50	\$46.90
SOUTH OPERATIONS		
ODOT Screenings #10 - Limestone {Powder}	\$22.85	\$22.83
ODOT #304 - Limestone	\$20.90	\$22.46
ODOT Recycled #304	\$18.25	\$18.45
ODOT #411 - Limestone	\$22.80	\$22.88
ODOT Recycled #411	No Bid	No Bid
ODOT 1s & 2s - Limestone	\$26.45	\$27.73
ODOT Recycled 1s & 2s	No Bid	\$19.95
Type C - Limestone	\$46.50	\$46.90
WEST OPERATIONS		
ODOT Screenings #10 - Limestone {Powder}	\$22.85	\$21.83
ODOT #304 - Limestone	\$20.90	\$21.46
ODOT Recycled #304	\$18.25	\$18.45
ODOT #411 - Limestone	\$22.80	\$21.88
ODOT Recycled #411	No Bid	No Bid
ODOT 1s & 2s - Limestone	\$26.45	\$26.73
ODOT Recycled 1s & 2s	No Bid	\$19.95
Type C - Limestone	\$46.50	\$46.90