
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

SMALL SIZE UTILITY VEHICLE - 4X4 (Specification #23)
 
Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc. 2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) Western $25,315.00
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) Western $25,970.00
Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc. 2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) Northern $25,165.00
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) Northern $25,720.00
Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc. 2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) Central $25,215.00
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) Central $25,795.00
Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc. 2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) Southern $25,265.00
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) Southern $25,820.00
 
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) Western $32,419.00
ALT - Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM 2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) Western $33,086.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) Northern $32,269.00
 2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) Northern -- NB --
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) Central $32,344.00
 2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) Central -- NB --
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) Southern $32,369.00
 2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

SMALL SIZE UTILITY VEHICLE - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #23

2018 Jeep Wrangler Sport 4x4 (JKJL72) 
2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE TO
MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE
REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND SIRENS SECTION WITHIN
THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARDED VENDOR
PRICING.

ENGINE:1.

Manufacturer's standard gasoline engine, alternator, battery and cooling package.a.

TRANSMISSION/AXLES:2.

Four wheel drive to include Automatic locking hubsa.
Manufacturer's standard automatic transmission/transaxleb.

PERFORMANCE ITEMS:3.

Manufacturer's standard power steeringa.
Manufacturer's standard gaugesb.

COMFORT ITEMS:4.

Manufacturer's standard air conditioning with 134A systema.
Manufacturer's standard tinted glassb.
Manufacturer's standard radioc.
Manufacturer's standard floor coveringd.
Manufacturer's standard production seats. Purchaser will select color at time of order.e.
Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).f.

SAFETY ITEMS:5.

Dual outside mirrors and inside rear view mirrora.
Manufacturer's standard air bagsb.
Rear view back-up camerac.

BRAKES:6.

Four wheel anti-lock disc brakes, ABS systema.

TIRES AND WHEELS:7.

Manufacturer's standard tires and wheelsa.
Manufacturer's spare tire and rim, if availableb.

CHASSIS, FRAME, CAB:8.
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CHASSIS, FRAME, CAB:8.

Manufacturer's standard front and rear bumpersa.
Manufacturer's standard fuel tankb.
Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agenciesc.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

SMALL SIZE UTILITY VEHICLE - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #23

2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72)
The Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $32,419.00 $32,269.00 $32,344.00 $32,369.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Downgrade option – specify NA 
Downgrade option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

AHT 1 Upgrade – specify 
Trailer Tow Group •Class II Receiver Hitch •Trailer Tow w/4-Pin Connector Wiring  1 

$494.001

AAJ 1 Upgrade – specify 
Connectivity Group •Vehicle Information Center (LAZ) •Tire Pressure Monitoring Display (XGM) •Uconnect Voice
Command w/Bluetooth •Remote USB Port  1 

$794.001

AJP 1 Upgrade – specify 
.Power Convenience Group •Security Alarm •Power Heated Mirrors •Remote Keyless Entry •Auto Dim Mirror w/Reading
Lamp •Power Windows, Front 1-Touch Down •Power Locks  1 

$1,594.001

MX3 1 Optional Equipment – specify 
.Black Three Piece Hardtop •Freedom Panel Storage Bag •Rear Window Defroster •Rear Window Wiper/Washer •Delete
Sunrider Soft Top •Tinted RR Qtr & Liftgate Windows  1 

$990.001

XBM 1 Optional Equipment – specify 
Remote Start System  1 

$494.001

CWA 1 Optional Equipment – specify 
Mopar Slush Mats 1 

$74.001

Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 

VEHICLE: Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72)
DEALER: AutoNation CDJR

Pembroke Pines
AutoNation CDJR
Pembroke Pines

AutoNation CDJR
Pembroke Pines

AutoNation CDJR
Pembroke Pines

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $32,419.00 $32,269.00 $32,344.00 $32,369.00
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Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 

TTG 1 Temporary Tag $25.001

TER 1 Transfer existing registration 
Includes Overnight Shipping to End User 1 

$155.001

NST 1 New state tag 
Includes Overnight Shipping to End User 1 

$225.001

Maintenance plan – specify NA 
Maintenance plan – specify NA 

GCM5100N 1 Warranty – specify 
Maximum Care Extended Warrantee 5 Years 100,000 miles -$100 Deductible 1 

$3,595.001

GCM7150N 1 Warranty – specify 
Maximum Care Extended Warrantee 7 Years 150,000 Miles $100 Deductible 1 

$4,655.001

VEHICLE: Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72)
DEALER: AutoNation CDJR

Pembroke Pines
AutoNation CDJR
Pembroke Pines

AutoNation CDJR
Pembroke Pines

AutoNation CDJR
Pembroke Pines

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $32,419.00 $32,269.00 $32,344.00 $32,369.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

SMALL SIZE UTILITY VEHICLE - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #23

2018 Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72)

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Jeep Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $33,086.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options Western

Northern
&
Central
&
Southern

Downgrade option – specify NA 
Downgrade option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 
Delete Option – specify NA 

 

Order Code Add Options Western

Northern
&
Central
&
Southern

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Upgrade – specify NA 
Upgrade – specify NA 
Upgrade – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 

VEHICLE: Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $33,086.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
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Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Optional Equipment – specify NA 
Temporary Tag $6.50 
Transfer existing registration $78.38 
New state tag $118.56 
Maintenance plan – specify NA 
Maintenance plan – specify NA 

MANUFACTURER 1 Warranty – specify 
3 YEAR OR 36,000 MILE BUMPER TO BUMPER 5 YEAR OR 60,000 MILE POWERTRAIN 1 

Std1 

Warranty – specify NA 

VEHICLE: Wrangler Rubicon 4x4 (JKJS72) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $33,086.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
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