
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

1/2 TON 4-DOOR EXTENDED WHEELBASE 6 PASSENGER UTILITY VEHICLES - 4X4 (Specification #32)
 

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500
(CK15906/1FL) Western $40,875.00

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc. 2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500
(CK15906/1FL) Western $41,148.00

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500
(CK15906/1FL) Northern $40,795.00

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc. 2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500
(CK15906/1FL) Northern $40,898.00

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500
(CK15906/1FL) Central $40,675.00

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc. 2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500
(CK15906/1FL) Central $40,998.00

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500
(CK15906/1FL) Southern $40,775.00

ALT - Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines 2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500
(CK15906/1FL) Southern $40,994.00

 
Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines 2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) Western $75,549.00
 2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) Western -- NB --
Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines 2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) Northern $75,449.00
 2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) Northern -- NB --
Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines 2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) Central $75,149.00
 2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) Central -- NB --
Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines 2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) Southern $74,949.00
 2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) Southern -- NB --
 
Duval Ford 2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) Western $41,809.00
ALT - Bartow Ford 2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) Western $41,875.00
Bartow Ford 2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) Northern $41,875.00
ALT - Duval Ford 2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) Northern $41,911.00
Prestige Ford 2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) Central $40,899.00
ALT - Bartow Ford 2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) Central $41,875.00
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Prestige Ford 2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) Southern $40,999.00
ALT - Bartow Ford 2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) Southern $41,875.00
 
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) Western $43,545.00
 2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) Western -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) Northern $43,445.00
 2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) Northern -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) Central $43,345.00
 2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) Central -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) Southern $43,445.00
 2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

1/2 TON 4-DOOR EXTENDED WHEELBASE 6 PASSENGER UTILITY
VEHICLES - 4X4

SPECIFICATION #32
2018 Chevrolet Suburban 1500 (CK15906/1FL) 
2018 Chevrolet Suburban HD (CK35906) 
2018 Ford Expedition MAX (K1G/100A) 
2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE TO
MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE
REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND SIRENS SECTION WITHIN
THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARDED VENDOR
PRICING.

ENGINE:1.

Manufacturer's standard gasoline engine, alternator, battery and cooling package.a.

TRANSMISSION/TRANSAXLE:2.

Four wheel drive to include automatic locking hubs, includes all required options.a.
Limited slip differential or traction control on 4-wheel drive.b.
Manufacturer's standard automatic transmission/transaxle.c.

PERFORMANCE ITEMS:3.

Manufacturer's standard power steering.a.
Manufacturer's standard gauges.b.

COMFORT ITEMS:4.

Manufacturer's standard floor covering.a.
Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).b.
Manufacturer's standard air conditioning with 134A system.c.
Manufacturer's standard tinted glass all around.d.
Manufacturer's standard AM/FM stereo.e.
Power windows, power door locks, cruise control and tilt steering wheel.f.
Seating: Manufacturer's standard front and rear seatsg.

SAFETY ITEMS:5.

Dual outside mirrors and inside rearview mirror.a.
Electronic Stability Control Systemb.
Interior dome lights with left and right door activated switches.c.
Manufacturer's standard air bags.d.
Tire Pressure Monitor Systeme.

BRAKES:6.
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Four wheel anti-lock brake ABS system.a.

TIRES AND WHEELS:7.

Full size spare tire and rim, if available.a.
Manufacturer's standard tires and wheels.b.

CHASSIS, FRAME, CAB:8.

Full perimeter frame, ladder type.a.
Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agencies.b.
Manufacturer's standard fuel tank.c.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

1/2 TON 4-DOOR EXTENDED WHEELBASE 6 PASSENGER UTILITY
VEHICLES - 4X4

SPECIFICATION #32

2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906)
The GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $43,545.00 $43,445.00 $43,345.00 $43,445.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
3rd row seat NA 
Deep tinted glass NA 
On-Star NA 
Satellite radio NA 
Delete Options - Specify NA 
Delete Options - Specify NA 
Delete Options - Specify NA 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Bi-fuel model - specify NA 
CNG model - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 

DENALI 1 Engine upgrade - specify 
Includes all items in SLT package plus: 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 with Active Fuel Management, Direct Injection and Variable
Valve Timing, includes aluminum block construction (420 hp [313 kW] @ 5600 rpm, 460 lb-ft of torque [624 N-m] @
4100 rpm), Display, driver, Audio system feature, Bose Centerpoint Surround Sound premium 10-speaker system, 8"
customizable, Active Noise Cancellation, Headlamps, projector beam, high intensity discharge, Moldings, body-color
bodyside with bright inserts, Alternator, 170 amps, Suspension Package, Magnetic Ride Control, Wheels, 20" x 9"
(50.8 cm x 22.9 cm) ultra bright machined aluminum, Trailer brake controller, integrated  1 

$18,085.001

Engine upgrade - specify NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
Limited slip differential Std 

3KR 1 Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable 
Dealer provided and programmed third key and remote.  1 

$373.001

Air conditioning - front and rear Std 
AZ3 1 Captain chairs, front 

Seats, driver and passenger front, individual seats. Derived from a RPO (AE7) 40-20-40 split bench seat with the 20%
section removed which also removes the USB port and input jack for audio system. Seats are manual, not power. Does
not include a floor console. All exposed floor area will remain untrimmed. ***CENTER SEAT DELETE, NO FLOOR
CONSOLE FOR 9S1-vinyl & 9U3-cloth*** - Base Model Only.- or - (DRC - Dealer remove center section leaving
bare floor ADD $110) - or - (CC-F-THOS-16 - Troy Products 16" wide body console with vehicle specific floor plate,
4" dual internal cupholder, 3" shallow console tray, (3) 12V DC outlets, height adjustable 5"x8" armrest, and blank
filler plates. $880) - ADD - (CC-F-THOS-22 - 22" wide body console with vehicle specific floor plate, 4" dual internal
cupholder, 3" shallow console tray, (3) 12V DC outlets, height adjustable 5"x8" armrest, and blank filler plates. $920)
- or - (CC-F-THOS-16FB - Troy Products 16" wide body console with vehicle specific floor plate, 4" dual internal cup

($100.00)1

VEHICLE: Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $43,545.00 $43,445.00 $43,345.00 $43,445.00
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holder, 3" shallow console tray, (3) 12V DC outlets, 9" lidded file box at rear console with large leather pad, and blank
filler plates. $1075) ***Specify agency radio make / model when ordering for desired faceplate(s)***  1 

ATN 1 Captain chairs, middle 
2nd row bucket with power release, requires SLT upgrade.  1 

$794.001

Cloth 2nd row seat Std 
Console 
FACTORY CONSOLE IS STANDARD This cannot be removed for emergency equipment installation, if you want to
install emergency console you must order option AZ3 below. - ADD - (C-VS-1000-GMC-1 : Havis "retail"
Tahoe/Yukon/Suburban/Yukon XL factory center console mounting kit (does not include factory console) $269.)  1 

Incl.1

Floor carpet with color keyed floor mats 
Factory carpet floor covering with carpet floor mats - or - (WTF - HD molded floor liners 1st, 2nd, & 3rd row,
includes freight and installation $349)  1 

Std1

PCI PCW 1 Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) 
Convenience Package, Inside rearview mirror auto dimming, power adjustable pedals, powerr liftgate, universal home
remote & Driver Alert Package- Forward Collision Alert, lane keep assist, intellibeam headlamps, and safety alert
seat. - NOTE - (Colors - Standard colors available on this mode are Summit white and Onyx black. Other color
choices available in metallic paint for additional charge of $394, tint coat paints $494, and tri-coat paints $994,
contract dealer for color charts.) - or - (DLTH - Dealer installed leather seating surfaces on front 2 rows $1497)  1 

$1,273.001

Remote vehicle start Std 
SafeStop vehicle anti-theft - key activated or emergency lights activated, plug-&-play for most
Ford and Chevy fleet vehicles, dealer installed in 20 minutes or less 

NA 

SLT 1 Seat trim upgrade - specify 
SLT Package includes: forward collision alert, lane departure warning, safety alert seat, 2 - pos memory seating, push
button keyless start, pwr heated adj pwr folding mirrors painted body color with ground illumination, power rear
lifgate, CD Player, seats, perforated, leather-appointed, full-feature reclining bucket, with 12-way power driver and
front passenger seat adjuster, including 6 way power driver and passenger, 2 way power recline. 4 way power lumbar
for driver and passenger, heat/cool with memory (no memory lumbar), Seats, heated and cooled driver and front
passenger seat cushions and seat backs with perforated leather-appointed seating, heated second row 60/40
split-folding bench, power configurable, third row 60/40 split-bench power fold, steering column, power tilt and
telescopic, heated leather wrapped steering wheel, universal home remote, includes garage door opener,
programmable, passive entry system, power adjustable pedals, 5 Aux 12V outlets, rear cross traffic alert, side blind
zone alert, upgraded interior lighting.  1 

$9,050.001

Side air protection (may affect cage availability) Std 
Tremco anti-theft - foot activated, dealer installed NA 
All terrain tires NA 
Backup alarm, factory installed 
Vehicle comes standard with reverse sensing system  1 

NA1

BUA 1 Backup alarm, dealer installed 
Dealer installed STAR 90db exterior back up alarm.  1 

$179.001

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at
rear of vehicle) - factory installed 

Std 

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at
rear of vehicle) - dealer installed 

NA 

B86 1 Body side molding 
Body colored body side modlings. - or - (B85 - Bright body side moldings $149.) - or - (TGK 5T4 - Special paint solid
one color exterior body colored parts VICTORY RED WA9260 $648)  1 

$99.001

Daytime running lights Std 

VEHICLE: Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $43,545.00 $43,445.00 $43,345.00 $43,445.00
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VK3 1 Front license bracket 
Must be factory ordered (Dealer provided $79)  1 

NC1

Full size spare tire and rim Std 
NHT JL1 GU6 NQH
DB2 1 

Heavy duty towing package, includes HD class III receiver hitch 
Includes 3:42 rear axle ratio, electronic brake controller, HD Suspension, 2 Spd Active Transfer Case, Rigid draw bar,
2" ball, pin, & clip.  1 

$879.001

Immobilize daytime running lights NA 
Mirrors, camper type, fleet only NA 

N2 1 Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire $169.001

Standard towing package Std 
RSF 4 1 Rainshields - flange style 

Weather Tech flange style rain shields, four doors. ($145 for front driver/passenger door glass only)  1 
$189.001

Skid plate package NA 
WGG 1 Wrap-around grille guard 

Westin Sportsman / Sterling vehicle specific wrap around grille guard, add $300 for Winch Mount Plate. - add - (8KW
- VR8000 Warn 8,000lb recovery winch with remote $1195).  1 

$995.001

RS 4 1 Vent visors - stick-on style 
Weather Tech stick on vent visors, four doors. ($145 for front driver/passenger door glass only)  1 

$189.001

Go Rhino 5000 Series Push Bumpers NA 
PB12 1 Setina PB100A12 – 12" Aluminum Push Bumper $595.001

PB16 1 Setina PB100A16 – 16" Aluminum Push Bumper $595.001

PB300-T 1 Setina PB300 Push Bumper 
Setina BodyGuard PB300 aluminum push bumper ? or ? (PB400?T ? Setina BodyGuard PB400 aluminum push
bumper $635) ? or ? (PB450L2?T Setina BodyGuard aluminum push bumper with (2) built in LED's $1265)) ? or ?
(PB450L4?T Setina BodyGuard aluminum push bumper with (4) built in LED's $1655) (For lighted push bumpers,
specify LED color ie red, blue, amber, white)  1 

$685.001

Pro-Gard P2600 Series Polycarbonate (Lexan) Cage with sliding window, full width lower
extension panel, dealer installed 

NA 

Setina 8S Lexan cage with 1/2 lexan and 1/2 expanded metal with full lower extension panel,
dealer installed 

NA 

Setina #10 Series Lexan Cage with sliding window, full width lower extension panel, dealer
installed 

NA 

12VS-P 1 Setina #12 Series Lexan Cage, partition installed behind 2nd row seat 
Setina model #12-VS rear partiton between 2nd row seat & cargo area, poly carbonate window. - or - (12VS-EM -
Setina model #12-VS rear partiton between 2nd row seat & cargo area, vinyl coated expanded metal $760.) - or -
(TROY TH15-SQ-R rear partition with square-hole pattern. Includes cargo side window panels. $835.)  1 

$800.001

K-9 Container. All aluminum In-Vehicle (rear seat area) K-9 Container to protect the public,
officer, K-9, and vehicle. Please specify vehicle year, make and model. Call for installation,
shipping, and/or delivery prices. 

NA 

Electronic Remote Rear Door Opening system to be used with the K-9 Container. Allows the
officer to release the K-9 from the vehicle from a remote position. 

NA 

Heat Alarm System to be used in a K-9 vehicle. Warns officer when dangerously high
temperatures are inside the vehicle. 

NA 

VEHICLE: Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $43,545.00 $43,445.00 $43,345.00 $43,445.00
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RSL SUV 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Roadside lighting SUV package incudes: Whelen four corner hide away LED kit, STAR 8-LED traffic advisor mounted
in rear window glass dual color (AMBER/CLEAR), STAR D-LITE grille lights (AMBER), STAR D-LITE rear lights
(AMBER) installed in rear quarter glass, wired to 6-switch controller. - or - (ALB-TA - STAR dual color
(Amber/White) LED Light Bar with Front Takedowns, Side Alley lights, and Rear Arrow Stick Traffic Advisor $1895) -
add - (20074- LED Go Light with dash and wireless remote, installed $696.)  1 

$1,895.001

CM-TH15-SA-LED 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Troy Products passenger seat mount computer mount stand with swing-arm and docking station mount.) - add - (SL -
upgrade to swing arm with slide out feature $ 110.) - add - (CM-LT-1500 - Troy Products deluxe laptop tray $360)  1 

$555.001

PKG-PSM-276 /
UT-101 1 

Optional equipment - specify 
"Havis Premium computer mount stand, bolts to passenger seat mount. Package includes a heavy-duty vehicle specific
base plate, heavy-duty pole with height adjust handle, swing arm motion device with tilt-swivel and stability support
arm with Havis universal laptop mount non-electronic tray adjustable to fit and secure a large variety of laptop
models. "  1 

$965.001

RAM-VB-###-SW1 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Ram vehicle specific no-drill laptop mount, includes freight and installation. - add - (806-1206 - 600w Xantrex pure
sine wave inverter, installed $429.) - add - (806-1210 - Xantrex 1000w pure sine wave power inverter mounted behind
passenger seat or under rear seat, includes 808-9001 Xantrex user control / ignition control switch mounted to dash.
$798).  1 

$519.001

3BLS 1 Optional equipment - specify 
3rd Brake Light Safety Pulse "Rear Collision Avoidance" (Pulses 3rd Brake Light (4) times upon application of brake
pedal to increase driver awareness behind you when stopping) - and - (SAFE-T - Amerex 5lb Fire extinguisher, First
Aide Only first aid kit, and King James & Co road triangles $329) - add - (DT2 - Dealer installed SolarGuard deep
tint film on driver and pass doors $149) - and - (WSTP - add $49 for SolarGuard windshield strip)  1 

$229.001

LABOR 1 Labor rate per hour 
(Labor Rates Based on Single Vehicle Build)  1 

$110.001

TEMP-TAG 1 Temporary tag $45.251

TRANS-TAG 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
Includes temp tag & two way overnight shipping for signature.  1 

$198.851

NEW-TAG 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Includes temp tag & two way overnight shipping for signature.  1 

$248.331

D-R9Y 1 Maintenance Plan - specify 
24mo / 24k mile scheduled maintenance program to include oil / filter change, 4-wheel tire rotation, and conduct a
27-point vehicle inspection. The plan covers up to (4) service visits within the 24 month period.  1 

$67.001

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

AMW 1 Warranty - specify 
All VENDOR INSTALLED aftermarket equipment subject to 1 year parts only warranty FOB Alan Jay Fleet
Processing Center, Sebring FL. Reference FSA Contract Terms and Conditions 3.21 - Vendor Installed.  1 

Incl.1

APPMG575 1 Warranty - specify 
Ally Protection Plan Major Guard 5 years or 75,000 mile Extended Warranty for Commercial Use with $0 Deductible.
(Emergency Use Surcharge Add $1775.)  1 

$3,240.001

APPMG6100 1 Warranty - specify 
Ally Protection Plan Major Guard 6 years or 100,000 mile Extended Warranty for Commercial Use with $0
Deductible. (Emergency Use Surcharge Add $1775.)  1 

$3,791.001

VEHICLE: Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $43,545.00 $43,445.00 $43,345.00 $43,445.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

1/2 TON 4-DOOR EXTENDED WHEELBASE 6 PASSENGER UTILITY
VEHICLES - 4X4

SPECIFICATION #32

2018 GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906)

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The GMC Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
3rd row seat 
Deep tinted glass 
On-Star 
Satellite radio 
Delete Options - Specify 
Delete Options - Specify 
Delete Options - Specify 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Bi-fuel model - specify 
CNG model - specify 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
Engine upgrade - specify 
Engine upgrade - specify 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
Limited slip differential 
Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable 
Air conditioning - front and rear 
Captain chairs, front 
Captain chairs, middle 
Cloth 2nd row seat 
Console 
Floor carpet with color keyed floor mats 
Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) 
Remote vehicle start 
SafeStop vehicle anti-theft - key activated or emergency lights activated, plug-&-play for most
Ford and Chevy fleet vehicles, dealer installed in 20 minutes or less 
Seat trim upgrade - specify 

VEHICLE: Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
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Side air protection (may affect cage availability) 
Tremco anti-theft - foot activated, dealer installed 
All terrain tires 
Backup alarm, factory installed 
Backup alarm, dealer installed 
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle) - factory installed 

BUC 1 Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle) - dealer installed 

1

Body side molding 
Daytime running lights 
Front license bracket 
Full size spare tire and rim 
Heavy duty towing package, includes HD class III receiver hitch 
Immobilize daytime running lights 
Mirrors, camper type, fleet only 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire 
Standard towing package 
Rainshields - flange style 
Skid plate package 

WGG 1 Wrap-around grille guard 1

Vent visors - stick-on style 
Go Rhino 5000 Series Push Bumpers 
Setina PB100A12 – 12" Aluminum Push Bumper 
Setina PB100A16 – 16" Aluminum Push Bumper 
Setina PB300 Push Bumper 
Pro-Gard P2600 Series Polycarbonate (Lexan) Cage with sliding window, full width lower
extension panel, dealer installed 
Setina 8S Lexan cage with 1/2 lexan and 1/2 expanded metal with full lower extension panel,
dealer installed 
Setina #10 Series Lexan Cage with sliding window, full width lower extension panel, dealer
installed 
Setina #12 Series Lexan Cage, partition installed behind 2nd row seat 
K-9 Container. All aluminum In-Vehicle (rear seat area) K-9 Container to protect the public,
officer, K-9, and vehicle. Please specify vehicle year, make and model. Call for installation,
shipping, and/or delivery prices. 
Electronic Remote Rear Door Opening system to be used with the K-9 Container. Allows the
officer to release the K-9 from the vehicle from a remote position. 

VEHICLE: Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
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Heat Alarm System to be used in a K-9 vehicle. Warns officer when dangerously high temperatures
are inside the vehicle. 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Labor rate per hour 
Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: Yukon XL 1500 (TK15906) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
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