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Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

1/2 TON 4-DOOR CREW CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4 (Specification #51)

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.
Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.

ALT - Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.

Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines

ALT - Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

Coggin Ford

ALT - Duval Ford
Coggin Ford

ALT - Duval Ford
Prestige Ford

ALT - Duval Ford
Coggin Ford

ALT - Prestige Ford

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.
Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.

ALT - Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)
2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)
2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)
2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)
2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)
2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)
2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)
2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)

2018 Ford F-150 (W1E)
2018 Ford F-150 (WIE)
2018 Ford F-150 (W1E)
2018 Ford F-150 (W1E)
2018 Ford F-150 (WIE)
2018 Ford F-150 (W1E)
2018 Ford F-150 (W1E)
2018 Ford F-150 (WIE)

2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)
2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)
2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)
2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)
2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)
2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)
2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)
2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)

2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)
2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)
2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

$24,978.00
$24,998.00
$24,868.00
$24,928.00
$24,778.00
$24,968.00
$24,807.00
$24,928.00

$25,696.00
$25,968.00
$25,596.00
$25,968.00
$25,789.00
$26,240.00
$25,898.00
$26,150.00

$25,177.00
$25,199.00
$24,999.00
$25,127.00
$24,977.00
$25,099.00
$25,127.00
$25,149.00

$29,429.00

—-NB --
$29,299.00
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Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc.
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines
Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc.
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines
Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc.
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines
Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc.
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines

2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)
2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)
2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)
2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)
2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)

2018 Ram 1500 (DSG6LIS)
2018 Ram 1500 (DS6LIS)
2018 Ram 1500 (DS6LIS)
2018 Ram 1500 (DSG6LIS)
2018 Ram 1500 (DS6LIS)
2018 Ram 1500 (DS6LIS)
2018 Ram 1500 (DSG6LIS)
2018 Ram 1500 (DS6LIS)

2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)
2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)
2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)
2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)
2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)
2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)
2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)
2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

- NB --
$29,319.00
- NB --
$29,349.00
—-NB --

$23,745.00
$23,879.00
$23,545.00
$23,729.00
$23,595.00
$23,804.00
$23,695.00
$23,829.00

—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
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1/2 TON 4-DOOR CREW CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #51

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 (CK15543)
2018 Ford F-150 (W1E)

2018 GMC Sierra 1500 (TK15543)

2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)

2018 Ram 1500 (DS6L98)

2018 Toyota Tundra Short Bed (8359)

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE TO
MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE
REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND SIRENS SECTION WITHIN
THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARDED VENDOR
PRICING.

1. ENGINE:
a. Manufacturer's minimum 6 cylinder gasoline engine, alternator, battery and cooling package.
2. TRANSMISSION/AXLES:

a. Manufacturer's standard automatic transmission and axles.
b. Four wheel drive with automatic locking hubs, includes all required options.
c. Limited slip differential on 4-wheel drive.

3. PERFORMANCE ITEMS:

a. Manufacturer's standard power steering.
b. Manufacturer's standard gauges.

4. COMFORT ITEMS:

a. Manufacturer's standard air conditioning with 134A system.

b. Manufacturer's standard tinted glass all around.

c. Manufacturer's standard AM/FM stereo.

d. Heavy duty rubber floor covering instead of carpet.

e. Manufacturer's standard production seats. Purchaser will select color at time of order.
f. Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).

5. SAFETY ITEMS:

a. Dual outside mirrors and inside rearview mirror.
b. Interior dome lights with left and right door activated switches.
c. Manufacturer's standard air bags.

6. BRAKES:

a. Four wheel anti-lock brake ABS system.
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7. TIRES AND WHEELS:

a. Manufacturer's standard tires and wheels.
b. Full size spare tire and rim, if available.

8. CHASSIS. FRAME, CAB:

a. Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agencies.
b. Manufacturer's standard fuel tank.

c. Manufacturer's standard front and rear bumpers.

d. Manufacturer's standard bed.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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SPECIFICATION #51

2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)

The Nissan Titan S (38018) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $29,429.00 $29,299.00 $29,319.00 $29,349.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:

Titan S (38018)

DEALER: Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $29,429.00 $29,299.00 $29,319.00 $29,349.00
Order Code Delete Options All Zones
AM/FM stereo radio NA
Air conditioning NA
Full size spare tire and rim NA
Limited slip differential on 4-wheel drive NA
Order Code Add Options All Zones
Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.
Engine upgrade - specify Std’
No Up Grades: Standard Engine is 5.6 liter V8 (390 HP / 394 1b. ft.) 7 speed Automatic Transmission 1
Engine upgrade - specify NA
Bi-fuel model - specify NA
CNG model - specify NA
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) Incl.
Battery, 650 cca or greater NA
Dual batteries NA
7,700 lbs. GVWR NA
Electric Electric brake controller $385.001
B 1 Dealer Installed 1
rake
Traction control Std
38218 ! Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) $2,665.001
(SV UPGRADE PKG) Standard drive train; 5.6 liter V8 (390 HP / 394 Ib. ft.), 7 speed Automatic Transmission, Final Drive
Ratio (2.937); Crew Cab S features plus: 18" x 8" Silver Painted Alloy Wheel, P265/70/R18 Tires, Chrome Front and Rear
Bumper, Chrome Door Handles, Power Adjust Outside Mirror w/ Heat, Chrome Grille with Painted Insert Fender louver
with V8 ENDURANCE Badge, Side Turn Signal Lamp on Mirror Housing, Glovebox Interior Lamp, Illuminated Vanity
Mirrors with Extensions, Standard Floor Carpet, Cloth Seat w/ Vinyl Bolster, Overhead Console with Sunglass Holder,
Grocery Hooks on Cushion Backside, Mood Light, Trailer Swaly Control, Advanced Drive-Assist® Display,
NissanConnect? with Mobile Apps, SiriusXM Satellite Radio;
38418 ! Seat trim upgrade - specify $6,516.001

"(Pro 4X Upgrade Package) Crew Cab SV features plus: Shift-on-the-fly 4WD system, Intelligent Key, 2-speed transfer case
with 4Hi and 4Lo, Rear A/C Vent, Bilstein Off-Road Monotube Shocks, Hill Descent Control, Dual Zone Automatic
Temperature Control, Electronic Locking Rear Differential, Automatic on-off Headlights, 110V Power Outlet on Back of
Console, 12V Power Outlet Inside Console Box, 18"" Alloy Wheels Painted Dark Finish, P275/70/R18 All Terrain Tires,
Factory-Applied Spray-on Bedliner, NissanConnect with Navigation and Mobile Apps 7" Color Display, ""PRO-4X""
bedside decal, Oil pan, fuel tank, transfer case, and lower radiator skid plates; Rain Sensing Wipers, SiriusXM, Receiver
Hitch, SiriusXM Travel Link™ (Weather, Fuel prices, Movie listings and Stock Info) 4-pin / 7-pin Wiring Harness, Nissan
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

L94

3rd key !

Cab Steps !

Single spot
Light !
Dual
Spotlight !

Vent Visors |

TO1

WGG !

Aluminum
1
Box

Titan S (38018)
Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand

Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
Western Northern Central Southern
$29,429.00 $29,299.00 $29,319.00 $29,349.00

Voice Recognition for Navigation and Audio, Convex Spotter Mirror, Siri Eyes Free, Fog Lamps, Dual front captain's
chairs with 8-way power driver seat, Power Adjustable Lumbar, PRO-4X style cloth seating surfaces, PRO-4X branded

floor mats, Under Seat Storage with Fold Flat Floor, Unique Interior Trim and Leather Steering Wheel with Contrasted

Stitching, and Blind Spot Warning (w/ Rear Cross Traffic alert;" 1

Power windows/door locks Std
Speed control Std
Tilt steering wheel Std
Passenger dome lamp Std
Bucket seats in lieu of bench seat Na!
40-20-40 Front Seats Standard Available in Pro-4x upgrade pkg 1

Carpet in lieu of rubber floor covering Na!
Included with SV Upgrade Package 1

Floor mats $145.00"
Floor Mats All Season Floor Mats Carpeted Required with SV Upgrade Pkg. Code L92 Option cost $195.00 1

Deep tinted glass Std
Sliding rear window Std
AM/FM radio with single CD Std
On-Star NA
Satellite radio Na!
Included with SV Upgrade Package 1

Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable $347.00"
Includes Dealer Programming

Side air bags Std
Cab Steps $368.00"
REQUIRES SV Upgrade Package and U01/CN1 SV Comfort and Convenience Package; 1

Long bed in lieu of short bed NA
Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed $490.001
LED bulb is $175.00 extra 1

Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed $890.00"
LED bulb is $350.00 extra |

Vent visors - stick-on style $145.00"
Front door only; Rear doors Option price $185.00 1

Rainshields - flange style NA
Bug shield NA
Trailer tow mirrors $465.00"

SV TOW PACKAGE - TOW MIRRORS (MANUALLY EXTENDING w/HEAT AND PUDDLE) REQUIRES SV
CONVENIENCE (U01/CNV) and SV Upgrade Package; 1

Wrap-around grille guard $1,090.001
Dealer installed Grill guard: Winch mount plate additional $300 1

Aluminum tool box $468.00"
14" deep box, $45.00 extra for 18" deep Box 1

1877



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

A9 !

Spray Liner !
Tow Hooks !
Class 4 !
Winch !
Class 3 !

Ko1 !

Skid Plates |
Fiberglas lid !

Fiberglas
1
Topper

Nitro Fill !

Metal Topper !

Cab Guard !
Pipe Rack !

Ladder Rack '

Backup
Alarm !

Titan S (38018)

Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
Western Northern Central Southern
$29,429.00 $29,299.00 $29,319.00 $29,349.00
Bedliner $545.00"
DROP-IN BED LINER; NOT AVAILABLE ON S Model with KO1/UTI or SV with K02/UT2 1
Spray-on bedliner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) $675.001
Dealer Installed 6 ft bed; Included in UT1 and UT2 Utility option packages; 1
Tow hooks $265.00"
Dealer installed Factory Kit; Included on SV Model Upgrade 1
Class IV hitch and ball $575.00"
Dealer installed hitch with 2" ball mount with 2" ball or 2 5/16" and pin and clip 1
8,000 Ib. winch with remote $1,180.001
Requires Grill guard (WGG) and mounting plate 1
Heavy duty towing package up to 5,000 lbs. with appropriate hitch $535.00"
Dealer Installed 1
Heavy duty towing package up to 7,200 Ibs. with appropriate hitch $894.00'

[KO01] S Convenience & Utility Package -inc: Front Overhead Console, map lamp, sunglass and storage, Spray-In
Bedliner, 4-Pin/7-Pin Wiring Harness Connector (Rear Bumper), Receiver Hitch, 4/7-pin wiring harness with Dealer
installed 2" ball mount with 2" ball or 2 5/16" and pin and clip; DEALER INSTALLED HITCH with 2" ball mount with 2"
ball or 2 5/16" and pin and clip Price - $575.00 1

Skid plates
Included with Pro-4X Upgrade Option Package |

Fiberglass tonneau cover (painted to match)
Add $300.00 for ROLL-N-LOCK or ROLLBAK IN LIEU OF Fibeglass Tonneau Cover 1

Fiberglass cab high topper with front, side and rear windows (painted to match)
Swing out side windows additional $380.00; Topper with no side windows - additional $328.00 1

Daytime running lights

Immobilize daytime running lights

All terrain tires in lieu of all season tires
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire
Full size spare tire and rim

Midbox body option

Steel truck cap
Aluminum or Steel toppers same price; ARE 23" DCU Aluminum Ca{a with inside Aluminum skin, Additional $1100.00;
Cargo Glide 1000 # capacity installed in bed Additional $1640.00;

Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab)

Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup bed)
Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for utility body)
Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or curbside)
Front license bracket

Backup alarm, factory installed

Backup alarm, dealer installed
92db 1

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle) - factory installed

NA!

$1,495.00"

$1,710.00"

NA
NA

NA
$147.00"
Std

NA
$1,390.00'

$535.00"
$1,375.00"
NA
$755.00"
Std

NA
$149.00"

Std
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

BUC !

Safety Kit !
Strobes |

Computer
Stand !

BY3 !

B92 !

Labor Rate !
New Tag !

Transfer Tag :

Temp Tag !

5 yr/100,000
mile

Titan S (38018)

Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand

Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
Western Northern
$29,429.00 $29,299.00

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear

of vehicle) - dealer installed

Optional equipment - specify

Includes Fire extinguisher and Triangle Flare 1

Optional equipment - specify

4 corner LED Strobes surface mounted 1

Optional equipment - specif]y

Dealer installed Computer stand

Optional equipment - specify
Running Boards 1

Optional equipment - specify
ELECTRONIC TAILGATE LOCK - Req. SV Up Grade PKg |

Labor rate per hour

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Includes secure overnight delivery

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
Includes secure overnight delivery

Temporary tag

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

Bumper to Bumper 5 Yr/100,000 Mile Warranty; Contact dealer for Complete details 1

Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify

Terry Taylor's DeLand

Terry Taylor's DeLand

NA!

$88.00"

$590.00"

$525.00"

$235.00"

$385.00"

$99.00"

$146.00"

$120.00"

$20.00"

NA
NA
NA
Std'

NA
NA
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1/2 TON 4-DOOR CREW CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #51

2018 Nissan Titan S (38018)

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Nissan Titan S (38018) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE: Titan S (38018) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
Order Code Delete Options All Zones
AM/FM stereo radio
Air conditioning
Full size spare tire and rim
Limited slip differential on 4-wheel drive
Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Engine upgrade - specify

Engine upgrade - specify

Bi-fuel model - specify

CNG model - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)
Battery, 650 cca or greater

Dual batteries

7,700 1bs. GVWR

Electric brake controller

Traction control

Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid)
Seat trim upgrade - specify

Power windows/door locks

Speed control

Tilt steering wheel

Passenger dome lamp

Bucket seats in lieu of bench seat
Carpet in lieu of rubber floor covering
Floor mats

Deep tinted glass

Sliding rear window
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VEHICLE: Titan S (38018) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern

BASE PRICE: —No bid -- —-No bid -- ~-No bid -- —- No bid --

AM/FM radio with single CD
On-Star
Satellite radio
Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable
Side air bags
Cab Steps
Long bed in lieu of short bed
Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed
Vent visors - stick-on style
Rainshields - flange style
Bug shield
Trailer tow mirrors
WGG ! Wrap-around grille guard
Aluminum tool box
Bedliner
Spray-on bedliner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent)
Tow hooks
Class IV hitch and ball
8,000 Ib. winch with remote
Heavy duty towing package up to 5,000 lbs. with appropriate hitch
Heavy duty towing package up to 7,200 Ibs. with appropriate hitch
Skid plates
Fiberglass tonneau cover (painted to match)
Fiberglass cab high topper with front, side and rear windows (painted to match)
Daytime running lights
Immobilize daytime running lights
All terrain tires in lieu of all season tires
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire
Full size spare tire and rim
Midbox body option
Steel truck cap
Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab)
Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup bed)
Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for utility body)
Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or curbside)

Front license bracket
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VEHICLE: Titan S (38018) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
Backup alarm, factory installed
Backup alarm, dealer installed
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle) - factory installed
BUC ! Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear

of vehicle) - dealer installed

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Labor rate per hour

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
Temporary tag

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

Warranty - specify

Warranty - specify
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