
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

COMPACT 4-DOOR CREW CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4 (Specification #45)
 
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) Western $28,317.00
 2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) Western -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) Northern $28,117.00
 2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) Northern -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) Central $28,117.00
ALT - Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines 2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) Central $28,148.00
Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines 2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) Southern $27,948.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) Southern $28,217.00
 
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) Western $31,384.00
 2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) Western -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) Northern $31,184.00
 2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) Northern -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) Central $31,184.00
 2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) Central -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) Southern $31,284.00
 2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) Southern -- NB --
 
Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc 2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) Western $22,245.00
ALT - ALAN JAY NISSAN, INC. 2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) Western $22,298.00
ALAN JAY NISSAN, INC. 2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) Northern $22,098.00
ALT - Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc 2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) Northern $22,185.00
ALAN JAY NISSAN, INC. 2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) Central $22,098.00
ALT - Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc 2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) Central $22,225.00
ALAN JAY NISSAN, INC. 2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) Southern $22,198.00
ALT - Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc 2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) Southern $22,245.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

COMPACT 4-DOOR CREW CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #45

2018 Chevrolet Colorado 4WD (12M43) 
2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) 
2018 Nissan Frontier (32018) 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE TO
MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE
REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND SIRENS SECTION WITHIN
THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARDED VENDOR
PRICING.

ENGINE:1.

Manufacturer's minimum 4 cylinder gasoline engine, alternator, battery and cooling package.a.

TRANSMISSION/AXLE:2.

Manufacturer's standard automatic transmission.a.
Manufacturer's standard axle.b.
Limited slip differential if availablec.

PERFORMANCE ITEMS:3.

Manufacturer's standard gauges.a.
Manufacturer's standard power steering.b.

COMFORT ITEMS:4.

Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).a.
Manufacturer's standard production seats. Purchaser will select color at time of order.b.
Manufacturer's standard floor covering.c.
Manufacturer's standard AM/FM stereo.d.
Manufacturer's standard tinted glass all around.e.
Manufacturer's standard air conditioning with 134A system.f.

SAFETY ITEMS:5.

Manufacturer's standard air bags.a.
Interior dome lights with left and right door activated switches.b.
Dual outside mirrors and inside rearview mirror.c.
Rear view back-up camerad.

BRAKES:6.

Four wheel anti-lock brake ABS system.a.

TIRES AND WHEELS:7.
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Full size spare tire and rim, if available.a.
Manufacturer's standard tires and wheels.b.

CHASSIS, FRAME, CAB:8.

Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agencies.a.
Manufacturer's standard fuel tank.b.
Manufacturer's standard front and rear bumpers.c.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

COMPACT 4-DOOR CREW CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #45

2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43)
The GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $31,384.00 $31,184.00 $31,184.00 $31,284.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Manual transmission in lieu of automatic transmission NA 
AM/FM stereo radio NA 
Air conditioning NA 
On-Star NA 
Limited slip differential on 4-wheel drive or equivalent NA 

Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

LGZ M5T 1 Engine upgrade - specify 
Engine, 3.6L DI DOHC V6 VVT (308 hp [230.0 kW] @ 6800 rpm, 275 lb-ft of torque [373 N-m] @ 4000 rpm) engine
with 8-speed automatic transmission, includes full size spare tire with 5,700lb GVWR.  1 

Std1

Bi-fuel model - specify 
Bi-Fuel is not available. - (Colors - Standard colors available on this mode are Summit white, Onyx black, and Cardinal
red. Other color choices available in metallic paint for additional charge of $394, contract dealer for availability.)  1 

NA1

LWN MYB 1 Diesel Engine 
2.8L Duramax I4 turbo-diesel engine with 6-speed automatic transmission, includes: Wheels, 17" x 8" (43.2 cm x 20.3
cm) Blade Silver Metallic cast aluminum, Tire, spare P265/70R16 all-season, blackwall, WT Convenience Package
includes (ATG) Remote Keyless Entry, (UTJ) theft-deterrent system, (K34) electronic cruise control and (PPA) EZ-Lift
tailgate, Exhaust brake, Theft-deterrent system, unauthorized entry, Differential, automatic locking rear, Remote Keyless
Entry, extended range, GVWR, 5900 lbs, Rear axle, 3.42 ratio, Tow/Haul Mode.  1 

$5,500.001

DRYCELL 1 Battery, 650 cca or greater 
Dealer provided Optima RED TOP drycell battery replaces factory lead acid battery  1 

$379.001

T2N43 1 Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) 
SLE Model Upgrade Includes: 17" Aluminum wheels, P255/65R17 all season tires, body colored rear bumper, chrome
beltline moldings, fog lamps, body colored-power adjustable mirrors with convex spotter, body colored door handles,
MyLink 8" audio AM/FM/SAT/USB with streaming bluetooth & Onstar with 4G hotspot, dual rear seats, carpet flooring,
front/rear carpet floor mats, leather wrapped steering wheel, cruise control, Multi Colored DIC, remote keyless entry,
theft deterrent system, overhead console, upgraded visors, dual reading and center dome light, and 5yrs Onstar.  1 

Incl.1

H0U 1 Seat trim upgrade - specify 
Jet black cloth seat trim.  1 

Std1

Power windows/door locks Std 
Speed control/tilt steering wheel Std 

PCN 1 Sliding rear window 
SLE Convenience Package includes (C68) single-zone automatic climate control, (A28) rear-sliding window and (BTV)
remote vehicle starter system.  1 

$574.001

AM/FM radio with single CD NA 

VEHICLE: Canyon 4WD (T2M43)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $31,384.00 $31,184.00 $31,184.00 $31,284.00
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5H1 1 Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable 
Factory Ordered, dealer programmed 2 additional keys, not available with convenience package or manufacturers
upgrade. - or - (3K - dealer provided third key $149) - or - (3KR - dealer provided third key and remote $373)  1 

$149.001

Floor mats 
Carpet flooring with carpet mats standard. - or - (VAV - All weather floor mats $159.) - or - (WTF CRW - WeatherTech
HD molded floor liner system for crew cab configuration, includes freight and installation $329)  1 

Std1

Side air bags Std 
Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed NA 
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed NA 

RS 4 1 Vent visors - stick-on style 
Weather Tech stick on vent visors, four doors. ($145 for front driver/passenger door glass only)  1 

$189.001

RSF 4 1 Rainshields - flange style 
Weather Tech flange style rainshields, four doors. ($145 for front driver/passenger door glass only)  1 

$189.001

T2U43 1 Long bed model, minimum 83.4" inside box length, with minimum 113.5" and maximum 118.0"
WB 
Crew cab with 140.5" wheel base, 74" bed length.  1 

$950.001

FTC 1 Fiberglass tonneau cover (painted to match) 
Dealer provided Ranch Sport Wrap fiberglass tonneau cover. - add - (BSL1200 - 1,200lb capacity Cargo Ease bed slide
with rubber mat and 4" Sides $1338) - or - (BSL1500 - 1,500lb capacity Cargo Ease bed slide with rubber mat and 4"
Sides $1776) - or - ( R-N-L - Roll~N~Lock vehicle specific lockable cover $1795.)  1 

$1,695.001

ECHO 1 Fiberglass cab high topper with front, side and rear windows (painted to match) 
Ranch Echo topper with fixed framed picture windows. - or - (ECHO-WD - Ranch Echo topper with side access
windoors $2070.) - or - (SIERRA-SS - Ranch Sierra topper with solid sides $2180.) - add - (FCH-LR - TracRac
aluminum roof rack system with two cross bars & 4 adjustable load stops $995.)  1 

$1,965.001

ATB-LP-18 1 Heavy duty aluminum tool box 
Dealer provided HD American Aluminum diamond plate low pro tool box 18" Depth.- OR - (FNT85 - 85 gallon UWS
fuel n tool combo with L-shaped fuel tank, tool box, 13GPM Fill-Rite fuel transfer pump, hose, nozzle, and GPI inline
digital flow meter for use in short bed PU or Utility body $1887.) - and - (SAFE-T - Amerex 5lb Fire extinguisher, First
Aide Only first aid kit, and King James & Co road triangles $329) - or - (3BOX SWB - Includes UWS standard height
18" depth saddle box with single lid and (2) bed rail mounted UWS standard height side tool boxes $ 1154).  1 

$469.001

VZX 1 Bedliner 
Factory ordered, dealer installed (DBL - Dealer provided plastic GM drop in bed liner $325)  1 

$354.001

CGN 1 Spray-on bedliner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
Factory ordered only thin spray liner. -or- (SOB - Scorpion HD dealer installed spray on bedliner $579) - add - (UBC -
TiteSeal autobody rubberized underbody coating $650)  1 

$474.001

Z82 G80 DB2 1 Heavy duty towing package up to 3,500 lbs. 
HD trailer tow package includes: locking rear differential factory reciever hitch, 7-pin connector, Rigid draw bar, 2"
ball, pin, and clip. - add - (JL1 - Electric trailer brake controller $229).  1 

$673.001

Manufacturer's certified factory utility body - specify NA 
Chassis with Knapheide, or approved equivalent utility body NA 
Powder coating NA 
Daytime running lights Std 
Immobilize daytime running lights NA 

N2 1 Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire $169.001

Full size spare tire and rim Std 

VEHICLE: Canyon 4WD (T2M43)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $31,384.00 $31,184.00 $31,184.00 $31,284.00
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VK3 1 Front license bracket 
Factory Ordered (Dealer provided $79)  1 

$39.001

HAR 1 Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab) 
Back Rack Original vehicle specific no-drill cab shield, installed.  1 

$497.001

SFB ####.### 1 Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup bed) 
Rack-it Sure Fit streamline 1000 series modular powder coated truck rack, does not include expanded metal basket over
cab - add - (9115 - Beacon mount for Rack-it rack $65 each, plus beacon) - add - (RS-2BK - Rack-it rack strap (pair) for
load securement $150) - or - (1200ATR - Weather Guard aluminum material rack $1087, does not include expanded
metal basket over cab) - add - (RAILS - Add side rails to the 1200ATR , add $882) - add - (CROSS - Add one additional
cross member to the 1200ATR add $199 ).  1 

$1,255.001

Pipe rack w/expended metal basket over cab (for utility body) NA 
WG1450 1 Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or curbside) 

Weather Guard 1450 single side mounted ladder rack for pickup.  1 
$775.001

8S3 1 Backup alarm, factory installed $119.001

BUA 1 Backup alarm, dealer installed 
Dealer installed STAR 90db back up alarm.  1 

$179.001

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at
rear of vehicle)- factory installed 

Std 

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at
rear of vehicle) - dealer installed 

NA 

WGG  1 Optional equipment - specify 
Westin Sportsman / Sterling vehicle specific wrap around grille guard, add $300 for Winch Mount Plate. - add - (8KW -
VR8000 Warn 8,000lb recovery winch with remote $1195).  1 

$995.001

RSL TRK 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Roadside lighting truck package incudes: Whelen four corner hide away LED kit, STAR 8-LED traffic advisor mounted
in rear window glass dual color (AMBER/CLEAR), STAR D-LITE grille lights (AMBER), STAR D-LITE rear lights
(AMBER) installed in gap between bottom of tail gate and bumper, all wired to factory upfitter switches or 6-switch
controller. - or - (ALB-TA - STAR dual color (Amber/White) LED Light Bar with Front Takedowns, Side Alley lights,
and Rear Arrow Stick Traffic Advisor $1895) - add - (20074- LED Go Light with dash and wireless remote, installed
$696.)  1 

$1,895.001

RAM-VB-###-SW1 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Ram vehicle specific no-drill laptop mount, includes freight and installation. - add - (806-1206 - 600w Xantrex pure sine
wave inverter, installed $429.) - add - (806-1210-PU - Xantrex 1000w Pure Sine wave Power Inverter mounted behind
passenger seat or under rear seat curbside, includes 808-9001 Xantrex user control / ignition control switch mounted to
dash. $798) - add - (806-1220-PU - Xantrex 2000w Pure Sine wave Power Inverter mounted behind passenger seat or
under rear seat curbside, includes 808-9001 Xantrex user control / ignition control switch mounted to dash. $1220).  1 

$519.001

DTF 4 TRK 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Dealer installed SolarGuard deep tint film on all door glass and rear window, add $49 for front windshield strip.  1 

$279.001

LABOR 1 Optional equipment - specify 
(Labor Rates Based on Single Vehicle Build)  1 

$110.001

NEW-TAG 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Includes temp tag & two way overnight shipping for signature.  1 

$248.331

TRANS-TAG 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
Includes temp tag & two way overnight shipping for signature.  1 

$198.851

TEMP-TAG 1 Temporary tag $45.251

VEHICLE: Canyon 4WD (T2M43)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $31,384.00 $31,184.00 $31,184.00 $31,284.00
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D-R9Y 1 Maintenance Plan - specify 
24mo / 24k mile scheduled maintenance program to include oil / filter change, 4-wheel tire rotation, and conduct a
27-point vehicle inspection. The plan covers up to (4) service visits within the 24 month period.  1 

$67.001

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

AMW 1 Warranty - specify 
All VENDOR INSTALLED aftermarket equipment subject to 1 year parts only warranty FOB Alan Jay Fleet Processing
Center, Sebring FL. Reference FSA Contract Terms and Conditions 3.21 - Vendor Installed.  1 

Incl.1

APPMG575 1 Warranty - specify 
Ally Protection Plan Major Guard 5 years or 75,000 mile Extended Warranty for Commercial Use with $0 Deductible.
(Emergency Use Surcharge Add $1775.)  1 

$2,995.001

APPMG6100 1 Warranty - specify 
Ally Protection Plan Major Guard 6 years or 100,000 mile Extended Warranty for Commercial Use with $0 Deductible.
(Emergency Use Surcharge Add $1775.)  1 

$3,477.001

VEHICLE: Canyon 4WD (T2M43)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $31,384.00 $31,184.00 $31,184.00 $31,284.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

COMPACT 4-DOOR CREW CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #45

2018 GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43)

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The GMC Canyon 4WD (T2M43) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Manual transmission in lieu of automatic transmission 
AM/FM stereo radio 
Air conditioning 
On-Star 
Limited slip differential on 4-wheel drive or equivalent 

Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Engine upgrade - specify 
Bi-fuel model - specify 
Diesel Engine 
Battery, 650 cca or greater 
Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) 
Seat trim upgrade - specify 
Power windows/door locks 
Speed control/tilt steering wheel 
Sliding rear window 
AM/FM radio with single CD 
Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable 
Floor mats 
Side air bags 
Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Vent visors - stick-on style 
Rainshields - flange style 
Long bed model, minimum 83.4" inside box length, with minimum 113.5" and maximum 118.0"
WB 
Fiberglass tonneau cover (painted to match) 
Fiberglass cab high topper with front, side and rear windows (painted to match) 

VEHICLE: Canyon 4WD (T2M43) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

1450



Heavy duty aluminum tool box 
Bedliner 
Spray-on bedliner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
Heavy duty towing package up to 3,500 lbs. 
Manufacturer's certified factory utility body - specify 
Chassis with Knapheide, or approved equivalent utility body 
Powder coating 
Daytime running lights 
Immobilize daytime running lights 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire 
Full size spare tire and rim 
Front license bracket 
Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab) 
Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup bed) 
Pipe rack w/expended metal basket over cab (for utility body) 
Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or curbside) 
Backup alarm, factory installed 
Backup alarm, dealer installed 
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle)- factory installed 

BUC 1 Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle) - dealer installed 

1

Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
Temporary tag 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: Canyon 4WD (T2M43) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
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