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Name of Dealership

12 PASSENGER VAN (Specification #37)

Duval Ford

Duval Ford

Prestige Ford

ALT - Duval Ford
Prestige Ford

ALT - Duval Ford
Tampa Truck Center LLC
Tampa Truck Center LLC

Tampa Truck Center LLC

Tampa Truck Center LLC

Type of Vehicle

2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG234006)
2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG234006)
2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG23406)
2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG234006)
2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG234006)
2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG23406)
2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG234006)
2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG234006)

2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z7)
2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z)
2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z)
2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z7)
2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z)
2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z)
2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z7)
2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z)

2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)
2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)
2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)
2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)
2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)
2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)
2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)
2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)

2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)
2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)
2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --

$27,052.00

--NB --
$27,255.00

--NB --
$26,949.00
$27,304.00
$27,079.00
$27,329.00

$42,567.00
- NB --
$42,567.00
- NB --
$42,567.00
—-NB --
$42,567.00
- NB --

--NB --

—-NB --
- NB --
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Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)
2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)
2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)
2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)
2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)

2018 Nissan NVP (65118)
2018 Nissan NVP (65118)
2018 Nissan NVP (65118)
2018 Nissan NVP (65118)
2018 Nissan NVP (65118)
2018 Nissan NVP (65118)
2018 Nissan NVP (65118)
2018 Nissan NVP (65118)

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --

$28,937.00
--NB --
$28,891.00
--NB --
$28,854.00
--NB --
$28,925.00
--NB --
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12 PASSENGER VAN
SPECIFICATION #37

2018 Chevrolet Express 2500 (CG23406)
2018 Ford T-350 Transit Wagon (X2Z)
2018 Freightliner Sprinter (F2PV76)
2018 GMC Savana 2500 (TG23406)
2018 Nissan NVP (65118)

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE TO
MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE
REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND SIRENS SECTION WITHIN
THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARDED VENDOR
PRICING.

1. ENGINE:
a. Manufacturer's standard engine, alternator, battery and cooling package.
2. TRANSMISSION/AXLE:

a. Manufacturer's standard automatic transmission.
b. Manufacturer's standard axle.
¢. Manufacturer's standard suspension system.

3. PERFORMANCE ITEMS:

a. Manufacturer's standard power steering.
b. Manufacturer's standard gauges.

4. COMFORT ITEMS:

a. Manufacturer's standard air conditioning with 134A system, front and rear.

b. Manufacturer's standard tinted glass all around.

c. Manufacturer's standard AM/FM stereo.

d. Power windows, power door locks, cruise control and tilt steering wheel, if available.
e. Manufacturer's standard floor covering.

f. Manufacturer's standard production seats. Purchaser will select color at time of order.
g. Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).

5. SAFETY ITEMS:

a. Dual outside mirrors and inside rearview mirror.
b. Interior dome lights with left and right door activated switches.
c. Manufacturer's standard air bags.

6. BRAKES:

a. Four wheel anti-lock brake ABS system.
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7. TIRES AND WHEELS:

a. Manufacturer's standard tires and wheels.
b. Manufacturer's spare tire and rim, if available.

8. CHASSIS. FRAME, CAB:

a. Manufacturer's standard door arrangements with standard glass placement.

b. Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agencies.
c. Manufacturer's standard fuel tank.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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2018 Nissan NVP (65118)

The Nissan NVP (65118) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $28,937.00 $28,891.00 $28,854.00 $28,925.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE: NVP (65118)

DEALER: Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $28,937.00 $28,891.00 $28,854.00 $28,925.00
Order Code Delete Options All Zones
8 passenger seating in lieu of 12 passenger seating NA
Delete to 5 passenger crew van NA
Power windows/door locks NA
Cruise control/tilt steering wheel NA
Air conditioning - rear NA
On-Star NA
Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

65518 ! Engine upgrade - specify $6,081.00"
5.6-Liter DOHC V8 Engine; 317 Horsepower & 385 Ib-ft Torque, 5-Speed Automatic Transmission w/ Tow Mode Heavy
Duty Battery,; Extendable Tow Mirrors; Front (2) Tow Hooks, Class-1V Receiver Hitch; 7-Pin Connector Pre-Wiring; Brake
Controller Pre-Wiring; Includes SL Model Upgrade; 1

Engine upgrade - specify NA
CNG model - specify NA
Bi-fuel model - specify NA
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA
Deluxe engine cover NA
Battery - 770 cca NA
Alternator - 130-Amp NA
Electric Brk Electric brake controller $379.00'
Control !
Traction control Std
Limited slip differential NA
65218 ! Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) $1,630.001

SV Model including; Chrome Exterior Accents; Vehicle Security System - Alarm & Immobilizer; 8-Way Power Driver's Seat
with Manual Lumbar; Power Driver's and Front Passenger's Windows,; Power Outlet 12V (x2) - Center Console and 3rd
Row,; Power Outlet 120V (x2) - Center Console and Rear Luggage Area; Rear Overhead Personal Lamps for 2nd, 3rd, & 4th
Rows,; Power Door Locks with Auto Locking Function, Cruise Control with Steering Wheel Switches; Remote Keyless Entry;
Steering Wheel Audio Switches; Rear Parking Sonar Center Console; AM/FM Radio, 1CD with MP3, RDS and Auxiliary
Input; 6 Speakers; Steering Wheel Audio Controls,1
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

65518 !

deep tint !

3rd key !

B92 & B93 !
Vent visors !

Rainshields !

Class 4 Hitch |

Ball Mount !

NVP (65118)

Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand

Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
Western Northern
$28,937.00 $28,891.00

Interior upgrade - specify

SL Model Upgrade; Includes V-8 engine Upgrade; SV features plus: Fog Lights, Leather-Appointed Seats (All Rows),; Heated
Driver and Front Passenger Seats; Dual Zone Auto Front Climate Control; Front Parking Sonar; Auto-Dimming Rear View
Mirror with Compass; Leather Wrapped Steering Wheel; Bluetooth® Hands-Free Phone with Steering Wheel Controls;
NissanConnectTM with Navigation and Mobile Apps; 5.8-inch color touch-screen display Enhanced Voice Recognition for
navigation and audio; USB connection port for iPod® interface and other compatible devices; Streaming audio via
Bluetooth®,; Hands-firee text messaging assistant NissanConnectTM Apps, SiriusXM Satellite Radio; SiriusXM Traffic,
SiriusXM Travel LinkTM (Fuel prices, Weather, Movie listings, and Stock info) Rear View Camera |

Seat trim upgrade - specify
Included in SL Model upgrade as listed above; 1

Power mirrors

Recreational mirrors
Included in SV and SL Packages 1

Power driver's seat
Included in SV and SL Packages 1

Cloth seats

Full carpet

Legal deep tinted film, dealer installed

Rear window defogger

Privacy glass

AM/FM radio with single CD

Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable

Includes dealer programmmg

Remote keyless entry
Side air bags

Exterior upgrade - specify
Splash guards and Body side moldmgs

Vent visors - stick-on style
Front doors only

Rainshields - flange style

Front doors only

Running boards

Rear step bumper

Sliding side door

Sliding side cargo doors on driver's side
Daytime running lights

Immobilize daytime running lights
Class IV hitch, only

Class III hitch, includes bar and ball

Class 3 Hitch and 2" Class 3 ball mount with 2" ball and pin and clip '

Terry Taylor's DeLand

Terry Taylor's DeLand

$6,080.00"

NA!

Std
NA!

Na!
Std
Std
$635.00"
Std
NA
Std
$347.00"

Std
Std
$298.00"

$135.00"
$145.00"

NA

Std

Std

NA
Incl.
NA
$390.00"
$448.00"
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Havy Towing !

Nitrogen Fill !

Back up alarm !

BUC

FCD-IPK-12 !

FCD-FP-12 !
FCD-CP-12 !
FCD-RP-12 !
FCD-FANS !
FCD-RDP-12!

FCD-RSTEP-12 !

FCD-SSTEP-12 !
FCD-WGS-12 !
vo1 !

L92 !
L93 & L94 !
Safety Kit !

1

B93

Labor rate !

NVP (65118)

Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand

Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc

Western Northern Central Southern

$28,937.00 $28,891.00 $28,854.00 $28,925.00
Heavy-duty towing package up to 6,500 Ibs. $48.00"
Included with V-8 Engine upgrade: Dealer supplied 2" Class 4 Ball mount with choice of 2" or 2 5/16" ball and pin and clip
Please note size on Order;
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire $149.00'
Full size spare tire and rim Std
Front license bracket NA
Backup alarm, factory installed NA
Backqu alarm, dealer installed $ 149.001
92 db
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear of Std
vehicle)- factory installed
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear of Na!
vehicle) - dealer installed
Go Rhino 5000 Series Push Bumpers NA
Optional Equipment - specify NA
Optional Equipment - specify NA
Optional Equipment - specify NA
American Aluminum Inmate Transport Package for a 12-Passenger Van, or approved equivalent. Na!
Kit includes complete window guards set and replacement door trim panels set, and one front
security partition. Please specify year, make and model. *Other options and combinations available,
but not included.
*Front partition Na!
*Center partition Na!
*Rear partition Na!
*Dual forced air circulation fans Na!
*Replacement door panels (set) Na!
*Rear step Na!
*Side slide-out step Na!
*Complete window guard set Na!
Optional equipment - specify $498.00"
SV Technology Package Content not published at time of bid; Call dealer, 1
Optional equipment - specify $98.00'
all season floor mats (Factory)
Optional equipment - specify $245.00"
Front and rear carpeted floor mats 1
Optional equipment - specify $88.00'
Fire extinguisher and triangle Flare Kit 1
Optional equipment - specify $148.00"
Body side moldings 1
Labor rate per hour $99.00"

1225



VEHICLE: NVP (65118)

DEALER: Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern

BASE PRICE: $28,937.00 $28,891.00 $28,854.00 $28,925.00

Temp Tag ! Temporary tag $20.00"

Transfer Tag ! Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $120.00"
Includes secure overnight deivery

New Tag ! New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) $146.00'
Includes secure overnight deivery
Maintenance Plan - specify NA
Maintenance Plan - specify NA
Maintenance Plan - specify NA

5 yr/100,000 Warranty - specify Std'

mile 1 Bumper to Bumper 5 Yr/100,000 Mile Warranty; 1
Warranty - specify NA
Warranty - specify NA
Diesel Warranty - specify NA
Diesel Warranty - specify NA
Diesel Warranty - specify NA
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2018 Nissan NVP (65118)

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Nissan NVP (65118) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

1227





