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Name of Dealership

UTILITY CARGO VAN (Specification #34)

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Stingray Chevrolet, LLC

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Stingray Chevrolet, LLC

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines

Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines

ALT - Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln
ALT - Duval Ford
Duval Ford

ALT - Coggin Ford
Duval Ford

ALT - Coggin Ford
Duval Ford

ALT - Coggin Ford

Kelley Buick GMC, Inc

ALT - Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac
Kelley Buick GMC, Inc

ALT - Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

ALT - Kelley Buick GMC, Inc

Type of Vehicle

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van
(CG23405)

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van
(CG23405)

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van
(CG23405)

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van
(CG23405)

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van
(CG23405)

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van
(CG23405)

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van
(CG23405)

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van
(CG23405)

2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)
2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)
2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)
2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)
2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)
2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)
2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)
2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)

2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)
2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)
2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)
2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)
2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)
2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)

Zone

Western

Western

* Northern

Northern

* Central

Central

Southern

Southern

* Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central

Central

Base Unit
Price

$20,525.00

$22,135.00

$20,275.00

$22,135.00

$20,225.00

$21,307.00

$21,007.00

$21,125.00

$20,273.00
$20,309.00
$20,313.00
$20,479.00
$20,377.00
$20,579.00
$20,377.00
$20,795.00

$20,996.00
$21,235.00
$20,996.00
$21,035.00
$20,935.00
$20,996.00
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Kelley Buick GMC, Inc
ALT - Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan, Inc

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines

ALT - Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines

2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)
2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)

2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)
2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)
2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)
2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)
2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)
2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)
2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)
2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)

2018 Ram Promaster Van (VF1L11)
2018 Ram Promaster Van (VF1L11)
2018 Ram Promaster Van (VFIL11)
2018 Ram Promaster Van (VF1L11)
2018 Ram Promaster Van (VF1L11)
2018 Ram Promaster Van (VFIL11)
2018 Ram Promaster Van (VF1L11)
2018 Ram Promaster Van (VF1L11)

Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

$20,996.00
$21,335.00

$24,056.00
--NB --
$23,947.00
--NB --
$23,907.00
--NB --
$23,997.00
--NB --

$20,607.00
$21,544.00
$20,457.00
--NB --
$20,457.00
--NB --
$20,382.00
--NB --
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UTILITY CARGO VAN
SPECIFICATION #34

2018 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van (CG23405)
2018 Ford Transit T-150 Cargo Van (E1Z)
2018 GMC Savana Cargo Van (TG23405)
2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)

2018 Ram Promaster Van (VFILI11)

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE TO
MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE
REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND SIRENS SECTION WITHIN
THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARDED VENDOR
PRICING.

1. ENGINE:
a. Manufacturer's standard engine, alternator, battery and cooling package.
2. TRANSMISSION/AXLE:

a. Manufacturer's standard automatic transmission.
b. Manufacturer's standard axle.
¢. Manufacturer's standard suspension system.

3. PERFORMANCE ITEMS:

a. Manufacturer's standard power steering.
b. Manufacturer's standard gauges.

4. COMFORT ITEMS:

a. Console engine cover.

b. Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).
c. Manufacturer's standard air conditioning with 134A system.

d. Manufacturer's standard tinted glass

e. Manufacturer's standard AM/FM stereo.

f. Manufacturer's standard floor covering.

g. Manufacturer's standard production seats. Purchaser will select color at time of order.

5. SAFETY ITEMS:

a. Dual outside mirrors and inside rearview mirror.
b. Interior dome lights with left and right door activated switches.
c. Manufacturer's standard air bags.

6. BRAKES:

a. Four wheel anti-lock brake ABS system.
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7. TIRES AND WHEELS:

a. Manufacturer's standard tires and wheels.
b. Manufacturer's spare tire and rim, if available.

8. CHASSIS. FRAME, CAB:

. 8,500 LBS. GVWR, minimum to title

. Manufacturer's standard front and rear bumpers.

. Manufacturer's standard door arrangements with side and rear glass placement.

. Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agencies.
. Manufacturer's standard fuel tank.

o o O

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.

1029




FLORIDA

ASSOCIATION OF

COUNTIES
—_—
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

UTILITY CARGO VAN
SPECIFICATION #34

2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)

The Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $24,056.00 $23,947.00 $23,907.00 $23,997.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Order Code

60118 !

Delete FO1 !

Order Code

NV Cargo Van (61118)

Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc

Western Northern Central Southern

$24,056.00 $23,947.00 $23,907.00 $23,997.00

Delete Options
AM/FM stereo radio

Air conditioning
1/2 ton cargo van
Console engine cover

Delete side glass only

Side door glass option is discontinued by Nissan 1

Delete side & rear glass
This deletes only the rear cargo door glasses; Side cargo door glass has been discontinued. 1

Engine downgrade - specify
On-Star

Add Options

All Zones
NA

NA
$717.00"
NA
Na!

$110.00"

NA
NA

All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Elect Trailer brake !

61818 !

Alternator - 130-Amp

Battery - HD auxiliary

Bi-fuel model - specify

CNG model - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
Deluxe engine cover

Diesel engine upgrade - specify

Electric brake controller
Requires V-8 Engine upgrade package which includes towing package; Dealer installed Brake controller; 1

Engine upgrade - specify

317 HP 5.6 L DOHC 32-valve 8-cylinder, 5-Speed Automatic Transmission w/ Tow Mode, Heavy Duty Battery, Chrome
Extendable Tow Mirrors, Front (2) Tow Hooks; Class-1V Receiver Hitch; 7-Pin Connector Pre-Wiring, Includes 9900
GVWR 3500 Model; |

Engine upgrade - specify
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Limited slip differential
Included in Base vehicle Electronic Brake force Distribution (EBD) Traction Control System (TCS) 1

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
$379.00'

$4.040.00"

NA

NA
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

62118 !

61818 !

62818 !

3rd key !

B92 & B93 !

Deep Tint :

Backup Alarm !

BUC !

N92 !

NV Cargo Van (61118)
Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
Western Northern Central Southern
$24,056.00 $23,947.00 $23,907.00 $23,997.00
Model upgrade - specify $2,150.001

2500 High Roof including SV Package; 1

Model upgrade - specify $4,040.00"
3500 Standard Roof including 317 HP 5.6 L DOHC 32-valve 8-cylinder, 5-Speed Automatic Transmission w/ Tow Mode,

Heavy Duty Battery; Chrome Extendable Tow Mirrors; Front (2) Tow Hooks; Class-1V Receiver Hitch; 7-Pin Connector

Pre-Wiring; 9900 GVWR 1

Model upgrade - specify $6,190.00"
3500 High Roof including 317 HP 5.6 L DOHC 32-valve 8-cylinder, 5-Speed Automatic Transmission w/ Tow Mode,

Heavy Duty Battery; Chrome Extendable Tow Mirrors; Front (2) Tow Hooks; Class-IV Receiver Hitch; 7-Pin Connector

Pre-Wiring; 9900 GVWR 1

Traction control Std!
Included in Electronic Brake force Distribution (EBD) 1

Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable $347.001
Includes dealer programming

Air conditioning - rear NA
AM/FM radio with single CD Std
Appearance package - specify $295.001
Body side moldings and splash guards 1

Crew van package - specify NA
Cloth seat upgrade Na!
Vinyl seats available in Base Model at no charge order code X01 1

Keyless entry Na!
Included with upgrade packages 1

Legal deep tinted film, dealer installed $379.00'
Power windows/door locks Std
Privacy glass NA
Rear heater NA
Recreational mirrors NA!

Included in V-8 engine Upgrade Packages |
1

Remote power mirrors NA
Included in SV Model Upgrade Packages 1

Seat trim upgrade - specify NA
Speed control/tilt steering wheel Std
Side air bags Std
Backup alarm, factory installed NA
Backup alarm, dealer installed $149.00'
92db 1

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear Na!

of vehicle) - dealer installed

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear std!
of vehicle)- factory installed
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Class 3 Hitch !

62118 !

Nitro fill !

Vent Visors |

61818 !

FPLR !

FPCC !

NV Cargo Van (61118)
Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
Western Northern
$24,056.00 $23,947.00
Class IIT hitch

Dealer installed 1

Daytime running lights
Dual rear wheels

Exterior upgrade - specify
Front license bracket

Full size spare tire and rim
Full body glass

Heavy-duty towing package up to 6,500 Ibs.
Included with V-8 Engine Packages

High roof option
V-6 Model High roof 9100 GVWR 1

Immobilize daytime running lights

Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc

Central
$23,907.00

Terry Taylor's DeLand

Nissan, Inc
Southern
$23,997.00

$370.00"

Std
NA
NA
NA
Std
NA
Na!

$2,150.00"

KUYV, Reading van utility body, or approved equivalent with single rear wheels (requires 1 ton

cutaway)

KUYV, Reading van utility body, or approved equivalent with dual rear wheels (requires 1 ton

cutaway)

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire
Optional body - specify

Optional body - specify

Powder coating

Rainshields - flange style

Running boards

Sliding side door

Sliding side doors on driver's side

Vent visors - stick-on style

8,550 GVWR rated cargo van with 158" WB
8,550 GVWR rated cargo van, extended body length

9,000 GVWR package, minimum
Base Model is 9100 GVWR |

9,200 GVWR rated cargo van, standard body length
9900 GVWR 5.6 V-8 Engine

9,200 GVWR rated cargo van, extended body length

Full partition & industrial ladder rack for 135" WB
EZ Load ladder rack; Dual ladder rack add $792.00 1

Full partition & industrial ladder rack for 155" WB

Full partition & commercial customer bin system

NA
NA

NA

$149.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
Std
NA

$148.00"

NA
NA
Std!

$4,140.00"

NA

$1,697.00"

NA

$1,997.00"

Partition W/3 Shelving units and hook bar and rail kit, HVAC Pkg extra 31680.00; Electricians Pkg extra $1590.00; Add

$148.00 Extra per Pkg for High Top Model; 1
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

FPGS !

FCD-MT-X2CILR !

FCD-MT-X2C/FB '

FCD-MT-X1C !

FCD-MT-X3C !

Safety Kit !
Computer Stand !

Strobes !

92 !

vor !

Labor rate !

NV Cargo Van (61118)
Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc
Western Northern Central Southern
$24,056.00 $23,947.00 $23,907.00 $23,997.00
Full partition & fiberboard van liner for 135" WB NA
Full partition & fiberboard van liner for 155" WB NA
Full partition & general service interior bins 952,990.001
Includes Partition, 3 Drawer units; 3 Shelf units, 2 Parts Bin systems, 1 Literature Rack and other Components; 1
Dual rear wheel cutaway with 16' box (contact awarded vendor) NA
Dual rear wheel cutaway with 14' box (contact awarded vendor) NA
Dual rear wheel cutaway with 12' box (contact awarded vendor) NA
Equipment option - specify NA
Equipment option - specify NA
Equipment option - specify NA
American Aluminum Modular Inmate Transport Unit or approved equivalent. Two (2) Na!
compartment system for extended length cargo van includes: One (1) rear door (key lockable),
one (1) side door (key lockable), four (4) 6,000 lb. strength locks, one (1) rear step, one (1) side
step, interior and exterior lights, dual high speed ventilation fans, control panel, and auxiliary
(rear) AC/heat. Must be ordered with rear AC.
New Packages; Contact dealer 1
American Aluminum Modular Inmate Transport Unit or approved equivalent. Two (2) Na!
compartment system for extended length cargo van includes: Two (2) rear door (key lockable,
with four (4) 6,000 Ib. strength locks, one (1) rear step, interior and exterior lights, dual high
speed ventilation fans, control panel, and auxiliary (rear) AC/heat. Must be ordered with rear AC.
New Packages, Contact dealer 1
American Aluminum Modular Inmate Transport Unit or approved equivalent. One (1) NA!
compartment system for extended length cargo van includes: One (1) rear door (key lockable,
with two (2) 6,000 1b. strength locks, one (1) rear step, interior and exterior lights, dual high speed
ventilation fans, control panel, and auxiliary (rear) AC/heat. Must be ordered with rear AC.
New Packages; Contact dealer 1
American Aluminum Modular Inmate Transport Unit or approved equivalent. Three (3) Na!
compartment system for extended length cargo van includes: Two (2) rear doors (key lockable),
one (1) side door (key lockable), and six (6) 6,000 lb. strength locks, one (1) rear step, one (1)
side step, interior and exterior lights, dual high speed ventilation fans, control panel, and auxiliary
(rear) AC/heat. Must be ordered with rear AC.
New Packages; Contact dealer 1
Optional equipment - specify 3388.001
Fire Extinguisher and Triangle Flare kit 1
Optional equipment - specify $525.00!
Dealer Installed Computer Stand 1
Optional equipment - specify $590.00"
4 Corner LED Surface mounted Strobes 1
Optional equipment - specify $96.001
All Season Floor Mats 1
Optional equipment - specify $495.00"
Technology Package
Labor rate per hour $99.00"
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

New Tag !
Transfer Tag !

Temp Tag !

5 y1/100,000 '

NV Cargo Van (61118)

Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand Terry Taylor's DeLand
Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc Nissan, Inc

Western Northern Central

$24,056.00 $23,947.00 $23,907.00

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Includes secure overnight delivery

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
Includes secure overnight delivery 1

Temporary tag

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify
Bumper to Bumper 5 Yr/100,000 Mile Warranty; Contact dealer for Complete details 1

Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify

Terry Taylor's DeLand

Nissan, Inc
Southern
$23,997.00

$146.00"
$120.00"

$20.00"
NA
NA
NA

Incl. !

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
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2018 Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118)

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Nissan NV Cargo Van (61118) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

Order Code

NV Cargo Van (61118) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western Northern
-- No bid -- -- No bid --
Delete Options

AM/FM stereo radio

Air conditioning

1/2 ton cargo van

Console engine cover
Delete side glass only
Delete side & rear glass
Engine downgrade - specify
On-Star

Add Options

Central
-- No bid --

Southern

-- No bid --
All
Zones
All
Zones

add options.

the Vendor.

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Alternator - 130-Amp

Battery - HD auxiliary

Bi-fuel model - specify

CNG model - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
Deluxe engine cover

Diesel engine upgrade - specify
Electric brake controller

Engine upgrade - specify

Engine upgrade - specify

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)
Limited slip differential

Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Traction control

Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable
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VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

BUC

NV Cargo Van (61118) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western Northern Central Southern
-- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Air conditioning - rear

AM/FM radio with single CD
Appearance package - specify
Crew van package - specify
Cloth seat upgrade

Keyless entry

Legal deep tinted film, dealer installed
Power windows/door locks
Privacy glass

Rear heater

Recreational mirrors

Remote power mirrors

Seat trim upgrade - specify
Speed control/tilt steering wheel
Side air bags

Backup alarm, factory installed
Backup alarm, dealer installed

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear of
vehicle) - dealer installed

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear of
vehicle)- factory installed

Class III hitch

Daytime running lights

Dual rear wheels

Exterior upgrade - specify

Front license bracket

Full size spare tire and rim

Full body glass

Heavy-duty towing package up to 6,500 Ibs.
High roof option

Immobilize daytime running lights

KUYV, Reading van utility body, or approved equivalent with single rear wheels (requires 1 ton
cutaway)

KUYV, Reading van utility body, or approved equivalent with dual rear wheels (requires 1 ton cutaway)
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Optional body - specify

Optional body - specify

1109



VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

FCD-MT-X2CILR !

FCD-MT-X2C/FB !

FCD-MT-XIC '

NV Cargo Van (61118) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western Northern Central Southern
-- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Powder coating

Rainshields - flange style

Running boards

Sliding side door

Sliding side doors on driver's side

Vent visors - stick-on style

8,550 GVWR rated cargo van with 158" WB

8,550 GVWR rated cargo van, extended body length

9,000 GVWR package, minimum

9,200 GVWR rated cargo van, standard body length

9,200 GVWR rated cargo van, extended body length

Full partition & industrial ladder rack for 135" WB

Full partition & industrial ladder rack for 155" WB

Full partition & commercial customer bin system

Full partition & fiberboard van liner for 135" WB

Full partition & fiberboard van liner for 155" WB

Full partition & general service interior bins

Dual rear wheel cutaway with 16' box (contact awarded vendor)
Dual rear wheel cutaway with 14' box (contact awarded vendor)
Dual rear wheel cutaway with 12' box (contact awarded vendor)
Equipment option - specify

Equipment option - specify

Equipment option - specify

American Aluminum Modular Inmate Transport Unit or approved equivalent. Two (2) compartment
system for extended length cargo van includes: One (1) rear door (key lockable), one (1) side door (key
lockable), four (4) 6,000 Ib. strength locks, one (1) rear step, one (1) side step, interior and exterior
lights, dual high speed ventilation fans, control panel, and auxiliary (rear) AC/heat. Must be ordered
with rear AC.

American Aluminum Modular Inmate Transport Unit or approved equivalent. Two (2) compartment
system for extended length cargo van includes: Two (2) rear door (key lockable, with four (4) 6,000 Ib.
strength locks, one (1) rear step, interior and exterior lights, dual high speed ventilation fans, control
panel, and auxiliary (rear) AC/heat. Must be ordered with rear AC.

American Aluminum Modular Inmate Transport Unit or approved equivalent. One (1) compartment
system for extended length cargo van includes: One (1) rear door (key lockable, with two (2) 6,000 Ib.
strength locks, one (1) rear step, interior and exterior lights, dual high speed ventilation fans, control
panel, and auxiliary (rear) AC/heat. Must be ordered with rear AC.
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VEHICLE: NV Cargo Van (61118) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern

BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
FCD-MT-X3C ' American Aluminum Modular Inmate Transport Unit or approved equivalent. Three (3) compartment

system for extended length cargo van includes: Two (2) rear doors (key lockable), one (1) side door
(key lockable), and six (6) 6,000 Ib. strength locks, one (1) rear step, one (1) side step, interior and
exterior lights, dual high speed ventilation fans, control panel, and auxiliary (rear) AC/heat. Must be
ordered with rear AC.

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Labor rate per hour

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
Temporary tag

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

Warranty - specify

Warranty - specify

Diesel Warranty - specify

Diesel Warranty - specify

Diesel Warranty - specify
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