
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

14,500 LB. GVWR WALK-IN VAN (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2 (Specification #41)

Duval Ford 2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) Western $43,350.00
2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) Western -- NB --

Duval Ford 2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) Northern $43,600.00
2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) Northern -- NB --

Duval Ford 2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) Central $43,600.00
ALT - Prestige Ford 2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) Central $44,000.00
Duval Ford 2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) Southern $43,600.00
ALT - Prestige Ford 2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) Southern $44,199.00

Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Freightliner MT45G Western $55,951.00
2018 Freightliner MT45G Western -- NB --

Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Freightliner MT45G Northern $55,951.00
2018 Freightliner MT45G Northern -- NB --

Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Freightliner MT45G Central $55,951.00
2018 Freightliner MT45G Central -- NB --

Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Freightliner MT45G Southern $55,951.00
2018 Freightliner MT45G Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

14,500 LB. GVWR WALK-IN VAN (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #41

2018 Ford F-550 (F5K) 
2018 Freightliner MT45G 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE TO
MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE
REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND SIRENS SECTION WITHIN
THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARDED VENDOR
PRICING.

ENGINE:1.

Gasoline, V8 4.8 Liter minimum.a.

TRANSMISSION/AXLES:2.

Manufacturer's standard automatic transmission.a.
Manufacturer's standard drive axle ratio for engine and transmission combination.b.

PERFORMANCE ITEMS:3.

Manufacturer's standard power steering.a.
Manufacturer's standard gauges.b.

COMFORT ITEMS:4.

Manufacturer's standard air conditioning with 134A system.a.
Manufacturer's standard tinted glass all around.b.
Manufacturer's standard AM/FM radio.c.
Heavy duty rubber floor mats instead of carpet.d.
Manufacturer's standard production individual driver & passenger seats.e.
Keys: four (4) per vehicle, two (2) ignition and two (2) door. (each vehicle keyed differently).f.

SAFETY ITEMS:5.

Dual mounted outside mirrors to provide field of vision for vehicles to 96" wide.a.
Convex mirrors mounted below standard mirrors.b.
Interior dome light with dash mounted activation switch.c.
Manufacturer's standard air bags, if available.d.
Minimum 2 speed electric wipers with wet arms.e.
Collapsible steering column, if available.f.

BRAKES:6.

Four wheel anti-lock brake ABS system.a.

TIRES AND WHEELS:7.
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BSW steel belted radials, 225/70R19.5F minimum.a.
19.5 x 6 steel disc wheels.b.

CHASSIS, FRAME, BODY:8.

14,500 lbs. GVWR minimum.a.
Manufacturer's standard colors paint.b.
12' aluminum walk-in body.c.
Manufacturer's standard fuel tank.d.
Manufacturer's standard front bumper, painted.e.
Bulkhead, wire mesh, between cargo area and driver/passenger area.f.
Manufacturer's standard sliding front doors and two panel swing type rear door.g.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

14,500 LB. GVWR WALK-IN VAN (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #41

2018 Freightliner MT45G
The Freightliner MT45G purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $55,951.00 $55,951.00 $55,951.00 $55,951.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Single rear wheels - 12,000 GVWR NA 
Air conditioning NA 
AM/FM radio Std 
Bulkhead (between cargo area and passenger compartment) Std 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

101-21T 1 Engine upgrade - specify 
240HP Diesel Cummins W/Allsion Auto 1000HS 1 

$20,526.001

101-21V 1 Engine upgrade - specify 
260hp Diesel Cummins W/Allison Auto 1000HS 1 

$21,526.001

Diesel engine upgrade - specify NA 
CNG model - specify NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 

124-1E0 1 Alternator, extra HD 
200AMP 1 

$170.001

17,000 GVWR package NA 
MT5520 1 19,500 GVWR package 

20500 GVWR W/Cummins 240HP and Allsion Auto 1000HS 1 
$23,885.001

MT5523 1 22,000 GVWR package 
23500 GVWR W/Cummins 240HP and Allsion Auto 1000HS 1 

$24,097.001

MT5525 1 23,500 GVWR package 
25500 GVWR W/Cummins 260HP and Allsion Auto 1000HS 1 

$25,887.001

452-007 1 Limited slip differential $970.001

149-007 1 Cruise control $65.001

532-012 1 Tilt steering wheel $383.001

Seat trim upgrade - specify NA 
AM/FM with single CD NA 
Additional Key(s) or Key Fob(s) when applicable Std 

VEHICLE: MT45G
DEALER: Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $55,951.00 $55,951.00 $55,951.00 $55,951.00
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311-011 1 Daytime running lights $66.001

Immobilize daytime running lights NA 
Bug screen NA 
Jump seat - passenger, bulkhead mounted (requires solid bulkhead) NA 
Solid bulkhead with center door Std 
Solid bulkhead NA 

UT14 1 14' length body Incl.1

UT16 1 16' length body 
Includes 20500 Package 1 

$26,885.001

UT18 1 18' length body 
Includes 23500 Package 1 

$27,797.001

UT20 1 20' length body 
Includes 25500 Package 1 

$30,387.001

UT22 1 22' length body 
Includes 25500 Package 1 

$31,887.001

W00412 1 Painted body - one color (other than standard white) $1,250.001

W00638 1 Unpaid body - mil finish aluminum Std1

W00094-CF 1 Roll-up rear door, full width $815.001

W0095-CF 1 Roll-up door, 60" width $815.001

W00057-CF 1 Bi-fold rear swing doors $1,456.001

W001941 1 1,500 lb. lift gate $6,337.001

W00368 1 Class III hitch 
Up to 5000#'s 1 

$1,425.001

Front license bracket Std 
721-001 1 Backup alarm, factory installed $65.001

W00476 1 Backup alarm, dealer installed $155.001

W002112 1 Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle)- factory installed 

$1,425.001

BUC 1 Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle) 

NA1

Optional body - specify NA 
Optional body - specify NA 
Optional body - specify NA 
Optional body - specify NA 
Optional body - specify NA 
Optional body - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 

VEHICLE: MT45G
DEALER: Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $55,951.00 $55,951.00 $55,951.00 $55,951.00
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Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 

Labor 1 Labor rate per hour $135.001

TT 1 Temporary tag NC1

TRT 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NC1

NT 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NC1

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Warranty - specify NA 
Warranty - specify NA 
Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: MT45G
DEALER: Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC Tampa Truck Center LLC
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $55,951.00 $55,951.00 $55,951.00 $55,951.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

14,500 LB. GVWR WALK-IN VAN (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #41

2018 Freightliner MT45G

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Freightliner MT45G purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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