
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

8'6 X 25' DECK OVER FLATBED TRAILER- 16,000 LB GVWR (Specification #57)
 
General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc. 2018 All Steel TA8258T Western $7,770.00
 2018 All Steel TA8258T Western -- NB --
General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc. 2018 All Steel TA8258T Northern $7,400.00
 2018 All Steel TA8258T Northern -- NB --
General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc. 2018 All Steel TA8258T Central $7,690.00
 2018 All Steel TA8258T Central -- NB --
General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc. 2018 All Steel TA8258T Southern $8,090.00
 2018 All Steel TA8258T Southern -- NB --
 
Texas Trailers Sales and Service 2018 Big Tex 22PH255 Western $9,600.00
 2018 Big Tex 22PH255 Western -- NB --
Texas Trailers Sales and Service 2018 Big Tex 22PH255 Northern $9,240.00
 2018 Big Tex 22PH255 Northern -- NB --
Texas Trailers Sales and Service 2018 Big Tex 22PH255 Central $9,370.00
 2018 Big Tex 22PH255 Central -- NB --
Texas Trailers Sales and Service 2018 Big Tex 22PH255 Southern $9,630.00
 2018 Big Tex 22PH255 Southern -- NB --
 
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW Western $11,465.00
 2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW Western -- NB --
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW Northern $11,465.00
 2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW Northern -- NB --
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW Central $11,150.00
 2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW Central -- NB --
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW Southern $11,150.00
 2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW Southern -- NB --
 

DeLand Truck Center Inc 2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail Western $7,735.00

 2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail Western -- NB --
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DeLand Truck Center Inc 2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail Northern $7,385.00

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail Northern -- NB --

DeLand Truck Center Inc 2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail Central $7,565.00

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail Central -- NB --

DeLand Truck Center Inc 2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail Southern $7,635.00

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail Southern -- NB --

2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2 Western -- NB --
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2 Western -- NB --

Federal Contracts Corp 2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2 Northern $11,979.00
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2 Northern -- NB --

Federal Contracts Corp 2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2 Central $11,979.00
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2 Central -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2 Southern $11,500.00
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2 Southern -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Interstate 16BST Western $11,325.00
2018 Interstate 16BST Western -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Interstate 16BST Northern $11,325.00
2018 Interstate 16BST Northern -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Interstate 16BST Central $10,990.00
ALT - Kelly Tractor 2018 Interstate 16BST Central $10,995.00
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Interstate 16BST Southern $10,990.00
ALT - Kelly Tractor 2018 Interstate 16BST Southern $10,995.00

Texas Trailers Sales and Service 2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T Western $7,790.00
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T Western -- NB --

Texas Trailers Sales and Service 2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T Northern $7,440.00
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T Northern -- NB --

Texas Trailers Sales and Service 2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T Central $7,620.00
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T Central -- NB --

Texas Trailers Sales and Service 2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T Southern $7,860.00
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T Southern -- NB --

2018 Towmaster TC-16 Western -- NB --
2018 Towmaster TC-16 Western -- NB --
2018 Towmaster TC-16 Northern -- NB --
2018 Towmaster TC-16 Northern -- NB --

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover
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2018 Towmaster TC-16 Central -- NB --
2018 Towmaster TC-16 Central -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 Towmaster TC-16 Southern $12,950.00
2018 Towmaster TC-16 Southern -- NB --

2018 Trail King TK20 Western -- NB --
2018 Trail King TK20 Western -- NB --

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Trail King TK20 Northern $14,850.00
2018 Trail King TK20 Northern -- NB --

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Trail King TK20 Central $14,850.00
2018 Trail King TK20 Central -- NB --

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Trail King TK20 Southern $14,850.00
2018 Trail King TK20 Southern -- NB --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T Western $18,650.00
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T Western -- NB --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T Northern $18,650.00
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T Northern -- NB --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T Central $18,650.00
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T Central -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T Southern $18,850.00
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T Southern -- NB --

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

8'6 X 25' DECK OVER FLATBED TRAILER- 16,000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #57

2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T
The Texas Trailer TX85258T purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $7,790.00 $7,440.00 $7,620.00 $7,860.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
EQ2012GV 1 Downgrade to 7' x 20' equipment, 2" dovetail tandem axle tag type trailer, 12,000 lb. GVWR 

7' x 20' Equipment Trailer - Tandem Axle Tag Trailer (18' Flat Deck w/ 2' Dove Tail) 12,000# GVWR,2) 6000# EZ Lube Axles
With Brakes On Both Axles,Full Wrap A Frame,7000# Set Back Drop Leg Tongue Jack,Adjustable Pintle Eye Or 2 5/16"
Coupler,6" Channel Frame,Rub Rail With Stake Pockets and Tie Downs,3" Channel Cross Supports On 16" Centers, LED
Lighting, 5' Spring Loaded Ramps, Spare Tire 1 

$2,895.001

EQ2214GV 1 Downgrade to 7' x 22' equipment, 2' dovetail tandem axle tag type trailer, 14,000 lb. GVWR 
7' x 22' Equipment Trailer - Tandem Axle Tag Trailer (20' Flat Deck w/ 2' Dove Tail) 14,000# GVWR, 2) 7000# EZ Lube
Axles With Brakes On Both Axles, Full Wrap A Frame, 7000# Set Back Drop Leg Tongue Jack, Adjustable Pintle Eye Or 2
5/16" Coupler, 6" Channel Frame, Full wrap A-Frame, Rub Rail W/ Stake Pockets and Tie Downs, 3" Channel Cross Supports
On 16" Centers 5' Stand Up Ramps w/ Stands, ST235/80R16 Radial LRE Tires On 8 Lug Wheels, 2" x 8" PT Pine Deck w/
Galvanized Deck Screws, Protected Wiring, DOT Conspicuity Package, 7 Way RV Plug, Prep., prime and paint with high
solids enamel paint, Painted Black, Spare Tire  1 

$2,295.001

EQ2010GV 1 Downgrade model - specify 
EQ2010GV - 7' x 20' Equipment Trailer - Tandem Axle Tag Trailer (18' Flat Deck w/ 2' Dove Tail) 7,000# GVWR, 2) 5200#
EZ Lube Axles With Brakes On Both Axles, Full Wrap A Frame, 7000# Set Back Drop Leg Tongue Jack, Adjustable Pintle Eye
Or 2-5/16" Coupler, 5" Channel Frame, Rub Rail With Stake Pockets and Tie Downs, 3" X 2" Angle Cross Supports On 16"
Centers, 5' Stand Up Ramps w/ Stands, ST225/75/R15 Radial LRD Tires On 6 Lug Wheels, 2" x 8" PT Pine Deck w/
Galvanized Deck Screws, Protected Wiring, LED Lighting, DOT Conspicuity Package, 7 Way RV Plug, Prep., prime and paint
with high solids enamel paint. Painted Black, Spare Tire  1 

$3,620.001

FB2514GVB 1 Downgrade model - specify 
8.5' x 25' Deck Over Bumper Pull Flat Bed Trailer (20' Flat Deck w/ 5' Dove Tail), 14,000# GVWR, 2) 7,000# EZ Lube Axles,
5' dovetail, 5" Channel Outer Frame, 3" Channel cross members on 16" centers, 2" x 3/8" Rub Rail with stake pockets, 2-5/16"
adjustable coupler, Pressure treated deck, 2) Spring assisted deck level ramps, Electric brakes on both axles, Wiring in
conduit, Lockable toolbox, Primed and painted black with acrylic enamel paint, (2) 12K Spring loaded drop leg jacks, DOT
Conspicuity Package, Spare Tire  1 

$895.001

UT62010GV 1 Downgrade model - specify 
6'10" x 20' Heavy Duty Utility Trailer, 10,000# GVWR, 2) 5,200# EZ lube cambered axles with brakes on both axles,
Emergency Break Away Kit, Heavy Duty Bottom Frame, 2" X 2" Tubing top rail and uprights, 4) ST225/75/R15 Tires on 6 lug
silver spoke wheels, 15" metal sides, Tandem Teardrop Fenders With Inner Skirts, Full Wrap A-Frame, 2-5/16" Coupler, 4'
Removable Ramp Gate, DOT Conspicuity pkg., Federal DOT and State of Florida Compliant Light Package, Light Guards,
2000 lb Bulldog Jack, 2" X 8" Pressure treated wood decking, Galvanized deck screws, Safety chains with keepers, 7 way plug,
Prep, primed and painted with 2 coats acrylic enamel black paint, Spare Tire 1 

$3,295.001

UT61610GV 1 Downgrade model - specify 
6'10" x 16' Heavy Duty Utility Trailer, 10,000# GVWR, 2) 5,200# EZ lube cambered axles with electric brakes on both axles,
Emergency Break Away Kit, Heavy Duty Bottom Frame, 2" X 2" Tubing top rail and uprights, 4) ST225/75/R15 Tires on 6 lug
white spoke wheels, 15" Sides, Tandem Teardrop Fenders With Inner Skirts, Full Wrap A-Frame, 2-5/16" Coupler, 4'
Removable Ramp Gate, DOT Conspicuity pkg., Federal DOT and State of Florida Compliant Light Package, Light Guards,
2000 lb Bulldog Jack, 2" X 8" Pressure treated wood decking, Galvanized deck screws, Safety chains with keepers, 7 way plug,
Primed and Painted With 2 coats acrylic enamel black paint, Spare Tire  1 

$3,680.001

UT61670GV 1 Delete option - specify 
6'10" x 16' Heavy Duty Utility Trailer, 7,000# GVWR, 2) 3,500# EZ lube cambered axles, electric brakes on both axles,
Emergency Break Away Kit, Heavy Duty Bottom Frame, 2" X 2" Tubing top rail and uprights, 4) ST205/75/R15 Tires on 5 lug
white spoke wheels, 15" Sides, Tandem Teardrop Fenders With Inner Skirts, Full Wrap A-Frame, 2-5/16" Coupler, 4'
Removable Ramp Gate, DOT Conspicuity pkg., Federal DOT and State of Florida Compliant Light Package, Light Guards
2000 lb Bulldog Jack, 2" X 8" Pressure treated wood decking, Galvanized deck screws, Safety chains with keepers, 7 way plug,
Primed and Painted With 2 coats acrylic enamel black paint, Spare Tire  1 

$4,635.001

UT61235GV 1 Delete option - specify 
6'4" x 12' Heavy Duty Utility Trailer (Single Axle), 2,990# GVWR, 3500# EZ lube cambered axle, ST205/75/R15 Tires on 5
lug white spoke wheels, 15" Sides, Fender With Inner Skirts, Full Wrap A-Frame, 2" Coupler, 4' Removable Ramp Gate, DOT
Conspicuity Tape pkg, Protected wiring, Federal DOT and State of Florida Compliant Light Package, Light Guards, 2000 lb
Bulldog Jack, 2" X 8" Pressure treated wood decking, Galvanized deck screws, 2" X 2" Tubing top rail and uprights, Safety
chains with keepers, 4 way plug, Primed and painted with 2 coats acrylic enamel black paint, Spare Tire 1 

$5,345.001

VEHICLE: TX85258T
DEALER: Texas Trailers Sales and

Service
Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $7,790.00 $7,440.00 $7,620.00 $7,860.00
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UT61035GV 1 Delete option - specify 
6'4" x 12' Heavy Duty Utility Trailer (Single Axle), 2,990# GVWR, 3500# EZ lube cambered axle, ST205/75/R15 Tires on 5
lug white spoke wheels, 15" Sides, Fender With Inner Skirts, Full Wrap A-Frame, 2" Coupler, 4' Removable Ramp Gate, DOT
Conspicuity Tape pkg, Protected wiring, Federal DOT and State of Florida Compliant Light Package, Light Guards, 2000 lb
Bulldog Jack, 2" X 8" Pressure treated wood decking, Galvanized deck screws, 2" X 2" Tubing top rail and uprights, Safety
chains with keepers, 4 way plug, Primed and painted with 2 coats acrylic enamel black paint, Spare Tire 1 

$5,445.001

UT50135GV 1 Delete option - specify 
5' x 10' Heavy Duty Utility Trailer (Single Axle), 2,990# GVWR, 3500# EZ lube cambered axle, ST205/75/R15 Tires on 5 lug
white spoke wheels, 15" Heavy Duty Tubing Sides, Fender With Inner Skirts, Full Wrap A-Frame, 2" Coupler, 4' Removable
Ramp Gate, DOT Conspicuity Tape pkg, Protected wiring, Federal DOT and State of Florida Compliant Light Package, Light
Guards, 2000 lb Bulldog Jack, 2" X 8" Pressure treated wood decking, Galvanized deck screws, 2" X 2" Tubing top rail and
uprights, Safety chains with keepers, 4 way plug, Primed and painted with 2 coats acrylic enamel black paint, Spare Tire 1 

$5,545.001

TXDELLN 1 Delete option - specify 
Deduct for shorter trailer - priced per linear foot 1 

$100.001

NOSPARE 1 Delete option - specify 
Deduct For No Spare Tire 1 

$70.001

NO LISTING 1 Delete option - specify 
If You Don't See What You Need. You May Take 5% Off Of The Current MSRP On Any Model Or Non-Custom Option Not
Listed.  1 

Incl.1

Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

FB2520GVB 1 8'6" x 25' deck over flatbed trailer tandem axle with 20,000 lb. GVWR 
102" X 25' Deck Over Flatbed Trailer (20' deck w/ 5' dove tail), 23,900# GVWR, 4" Adjustable Pintle Hitch, 14# 12" I beam
frame, Pierced Frame, 2) 10,000# Dexter Oil Bath axles, 2) 12K Spring Loaded Jacks, Electric Brakes on Both Axles, Break
Away Safety System, 5" Channel Side Rails, 3" Channel cross members on 24" centers, 2) Deck level ramps with spring assist,
4) ST235/80R16 radial tires load range E tires on dual wheels, 2" x 8" Pressure treated deck, Galvanized deck screws, 3/8"
rub rail with stake pockets, Protected wiring, Lockable tool box, Prep., prime and painted Black, DOT light package, Heavy
Duty 7 Way Trailer Plug, Spare Tire 1 

$1,505.001

TXGN 1 Gooseneck type hitch 
Add Gooseneck Hitch In Flatbed Trailers 30,000# and Under 1 

$650.001

VEHICLE: TX85258T
DEALER: Texas Trailers Sales and

Service
Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $7,790.00 $7,440.00 $7,620.00 $7,860.00
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FB3024GVB 1 Upgrade model - specify 
102" X 30' Deck Over Flatbed Trailer (25' deck w/ 5' dove tail), 25,900# GVWR, 4" Adjustable Pintle Hitch, 22 # 12" I beam
frame, Pierced Frame, 2) 12,000# Dexter Oil Bath axles, 2) 12K Spring Loaded 2 Speed Jacks, Electric Brakes on Both Axles,
Break Away Safety System, 6" Channel Side Rails, 3" Channel cross members on 16" centers, 2) Deck level ramps with spring
assist, 4) ST235/80R16 radial tires load range E tires on dual wheels, 2" x 8" Pressure treated deck, Galvanized deck screws,
3/8" rub rail with stake pockets, Protected wiring, Lockable tool box, Prep., prime and paint black, DOT light package, Heavy
Duty 7 Way Trailer Plug, Spare Tire  1 

$3,905.001

FB3030GVB 1 Upgrade model - specify 
102" X 30' Heavy Duty Deck Over Flatbed Trailer (25' deck w/ 5' dove tail), 30,000# GVWR, 4" Adjustable Pintle Hitch, 22 #
12" I beam frame, Pierced Frame, 2) 15,000# Dexter Oil Bath axles, 2) 12K Spring Loaded 2 Speed Jacks, Electric Brakes on
Both Axles, Break Away Safety System, 6" Channel Side Rails, 3" Channel cross members on 16" centers, 2) Deck level ramps
with spring assist, 4) ST215/75R17.5 radial tires load range H tires on dual wheels, 2" x 8" Pressure treated deck, Galvanized
deck screws, 3/8" rub rail, Protected wiring, Lockable tool box, Prep., prime and paint black, DOT light package, Heavy Duty
7 Way Trailer Plug, Spare Tire  1 

$10,700.001

FB3040GVB 1 Upgrade model - specify 
Model FB3040GVB - 40,000# GVWR 102" x 30' Flatbed Trailer (25' +5') 18,000# GAWR 26# 14" I beam frame, Pierced
Frame, 2) 22,500 lb Dexter Oil Bath axles Air Brakes 8" Channel Side Rails 4" Channel cross members on 16" centers 2)
Ramps with spring assist 8) ST215/17.5 load range H tires on solid wheels 1 1/2" Apitong Hardwood Deck Galvanized deck
screws 3/8" rub rail with stake pockets 2) 12,000# 2 Speed Jacks Protected wiring Lockable tool box Prep., prime and paint
black LED Lighting DOT light package Spare tire and wheel assembly ***This Item Is FOB Gainesville FL., Due To Air
Brakes***  1 

$11,715.001

TXADDLN 1 Upgrade model - specify 
Add length - priced per linear foot.  1 

$150.001

TXMR01 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Mega Ramps - (2) Ultra Wide Heavy Duty ramps that span full width on all flatbed trailers 1 

$790.001

LMSIDE 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Heavy Duty Sides - adds 18" or 24" x 2" square tubing top rail and uprights with optional expanded metal inserts - priced per
linear foot 1 

$20.001

TTSG1 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Add Heavy Duty spring loaded tailgate ILO standard ramp or gate - Please specify split or one piece 1 

$340.001

TTFP 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Adds 1/8" Steel Floor Plate In Place Of Wood Deck. Decreases Cross Member Spacing To 12" On Center 1 

$30.001

EHR01 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Install Electric - Add Hydraulic Assist to Rear Heavy Duty Ramps. Includes battery, pump, hydraulics and installation. 1 

$2,290.001

ADJC01 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Substitute adjustable 2-5/16" coupler or adjustable pintle. Must upgrade to 7K Set Back Jack With This Option. (Maximum
14K GVWR on 2-5/16" coupler)  1 

$125.001

SBJ7K 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Heavy Duty 7K Drop Leg Set Back Jack - installed behind coupler to allow pick up truck tailgate to open without hitting the
jack. 1 

$95.001

RF01 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Rumber Rubber Heavy Duty Flooring on Ramps and Dovetail - Available On 102" Deck Over Trailers 1 

$1,980.001

WW01 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Install 8,000# Warn Electric Winch - Includes Battery, Winch and Installation 1 

$1,180.001

ADDEB 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Add brakes, 7 way plug and break away kit to single axle trailer. Makes single axle trailer 3500# GVWR. 1 

$225.001

SPAREMT 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Spare tire mounted on trailer ILO left loose. 1 

$95.001

VEHICLE: TX85258T
DEALER: Texas Trailers Sales and

Service
Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $7,790.00 $7,440.00 $7,620.00 $7,860.00
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TTCOLOR 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Upgrade to a color - without upgrade standard color is black on all trailers 1 

$245.001

TT3 1 Optional equipment - specify 
3 place trimmer rack for lawn or utility trailers 1 

$345.001

TT4 1 Optional equipment - specify 
4 place trimmer rack for lawn or utility trailers 1 

$385.001

TTBR 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Blower rack for lawn or utility trailers 1 

$160.001

CCCR 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Cone holder custom fabricated and installed in tongue 1 

$140.001

TTWC 1 Optional equipment - specify 
5 gallon water cooler rack mounted on all trailers 1 

$125.001

UB1703360 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Add Steel Under Body or Top Side Box 36" x 16" x 14" 1 

$520.001

TBV34 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Locking aluminum A-Frame mounted tongue box 34" 1 

$325.001

TBV49 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Locking aluminum A-Frame mounted tongue box 49" 1 

$360.001

RDR801 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Heavy Duty D-ring or flush mount tie ring installed. Please specify location. 1 

$39.001

STK01 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Install (2) clear strobes on rear wired through switch on the front of the trailer. Choose front or rear  1 

$340.001

TT2BX 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Landscape Box - Adds 2' x 2' x width of trailer expanded metal toolbox on any lawn, utility or equipment trailer. 1 

$450.001

TTSBX2 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Enclosed Landscape/ Storage Box - Adds 2' x 2' x width of trailer solid metal toolbox on any lawn or utility trailer 1 

$525.001

TTLRG 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Upgrades 10 Ply 16" Tire To 14 Ply Extra Heavy Duty - Priced Per. Tire 1 

$98.001

TXTEMP 1 Temporary tag 
30 Day Temporary Paper Tag. Includes $11.00 Convenience Fee 1 

$15.001

TXTRANS 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
Transfer existing tag. Includes $32.45 Convenience Fee. 1 

$150.001

TXNEWT 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Transfer existing tag. Includes $32.45 Convenience Fee. (Specify Tag Type) 1 

$150.001

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

WARRANTY 1 Warranty - specify 
Standard 5 Year Structural Warranty On Materials and Workmanship. 1 Year On Components. 1 

Incl.1

Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: TX85258T
DEALER: Texas Trailers Sales and

Service
Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

Texas Trailers Sales and
Service

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $7,790.00 $7,440.00 $7,620.00 $7,860.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

8'6 X 25' DECK OVER FLATBED TRAILER- 16,000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #57

2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Texas Trailer TX85258T purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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