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Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

8'6 X 25' DECK OVER FI ATBED TRAILER- 16.000 LB GVWR (Specification #57)

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc.

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc.

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc.

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc.

Texas Trailers Sales and Service

Texas Trailers Sales and Service

Texas Trailers Sales and Service

Texas Trailers Sales and Service

Nortrax, Inc.

Nortrax, Inc.

Nortrax, Inc.

Nortrax, Inc.

DeLand Truck Center Inc

2018 All Steel TA8258T
2018 All Steel TA8258T
2018 All Steel TA8258T
2018 All Steel TA8258T
2018 All Steel TA8258T
2018 All Steel TA8258T
2018 All Steel TA8258T
2018 All Steel TA8258T

2018 Big Tex 22PH255
2018 Big Tex 22PH255
2018 Big Tex 22PH255
2018 Big Tex 22PH255
2018 Big Tex 22PH255
2018 Big Tex 22PH255
2018 Big Tex 22PH255
2018 Big Tex 22PH255

2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW
2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW
2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW
2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW
2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW
2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW
2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW
2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western

Western

Base Unit
Price

$7,770.00
- NB --
$7,400.00
- NB --
$7,690.00
—-NB --
$8,090.00
- NB --

$9,600.00
- NB --
$9,240.00
- NB --
$9,370.00
—-NB --
$9,630.00
- NB --

$11,465.00
- NB --
$11,465.00
- NB --
$11,150.00
—-NB --
$11,150.00
- NB --

$7,735.00

—-NB --
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 57.pdf

DeLand Truck Center Inc

DeLand Truck Center Inc

DeLand Truck Center Inc

Federal Contracts Corp

Federal Contracts Corp

Kelly Tractor

Nortrax, Inc.

Nortrax, Inc.

Nortrax, Inc.

ALT - Kelly Tractor

Nortrax, Inc.

ALT - Kelly Tractor

Texas Trailers Sales and Service
Texas Trailers Sales and Service

Texas Trailers Sales and Service

Texas Trailers Sales and Service

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover
Dovetail

2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2

2018 Interstate 16BST
2018 Interstate 16BST
2018 Interstate 16BST
2018 Interstate 16BST
2018 Interstate 16BST
2018 Interstate 16BST
2018 Interstate 16BST
2018 Interstate 16BST

2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T
2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T

2018 Towmaster TC-16
2018 Towmaster TC-16
2018 Towmaster TC-16
2018 Towmaster TC-16

* Northern

Northern

* Central

Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern

$7,385.00

- NB --

$7,565.00

—-NB --

$7,635.00

--NB --

- NB --
--NB --
$11,979.00
- NB --
$11,979.00
—-NB --
$11,500.00
--NB --

$11,325.00

--NB --
$11,325.00

--NB --
$10,990.00
$10,995.00
$10,990.00
$10,995.00

$7,790.00
--NB --
$7,440.00
- NB --
$7,620.00
—-NB --
$7,860.00
--NB --

- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
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Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Towmaster TC-16

Kelly Tractor

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS

Kelly Tractor

2018 Towmaster TC-16
2018 Towmaster TC-16
2018 Towmaster TC-16

2018 Trail King TK20
2018 Trail King TK20
2018 Trail King TK20
2018 Trail King TK20
2018 Trail King TK20
2018 Trail King TK20
2018 Trail King TK20
2018 Trail King TK20

2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T
2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T

Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

—-NB --
- NB --
$12,950.00
—-NB --

--NB --
—-NB --
$14,850.00
--NB --
$14,850.00
- NB --
$14,850.00
—-NB --

$18,650.00
- NB --
$18,650.00
- NB --
$18,650.00
—-NB --
$18,850.00
- NB --
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8'6 X 25' DECK OVER FLATBED TRAILER-16.000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #57

2018 All Steel TA8258T

2018 Big Tex 22PH255

2018 Eager Beaver B8-DOW

2018 Econoline BP0821DE Deckover Dovetail
2018 Felling Trailers FT-16-2

2018 Interstate 16BST

2018 Texas Trailer TX85258T

2018 Towmaster TC-16

2018 Trail King TK20

2018 XL Specialized Trailers XL 24 T

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. DIMENSIONS:

a. Deck width - 8'6"

b. Overall deck length - 25'
c. Dovetail length - 5'

d. GVWR - 16,000 Ib.

2. FRAME:

. 5" channel side rails

. 3" channel cross members on 16" centers
. 4" channel undercarriage

. 2" x 3/8" rub rail with stake pockets

. Pintle hitch

o o O

3. DECK.:

a. 2 x 8 pressure treated deck
b. Galvanized deck screws

c. 5' dovetail

d. Spring assist stand up ramps

4. AXLES:

a. Tandem 8,000 1b. Dexter oil bath axles (2)
b. Electric brakes
c. Breakaway brake system with well cell battery

5. LIGHTING SYSTEM:

a. Protected turn/stop/tail lights

2437



b. Wiring run in conduit
c. Heavy duty trailer plug

6. MISCELL ANEOUS:

a. Spare tire and rack

b. Lockable tool box

c. Primed and painted - choice of color

d. Tongue jack rated for GVWR of trailer

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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8'6 X 25' DECK OVER FLATBED TRAILER- 16,000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #57

2018 All Steel TA8258T

The All Steel TA8258T purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $7,770.00 $7,400.00 $7,690.00 $8,090.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE: TA8258T

DEALER: General Truck Equipment ~ General Truck Equipment ~ General Truck Equipment ~ General Truck Equipment
& Trailer Sales, Inc. & Trailer Sales, Inc. & Trailer Sales, Inc. & Trailer Sales, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $7,770.00 $7,400.00 $7,690.00 $8,090.00
Order Code Delete Options All Zones
EQ7206T ! Downgrade to 7' x 20' equipment, 2" dovetail tandem axle tag type trailer, 12,000 Ib. GVWR (5152,700.00)1
EQ7227T ! Downgrade to 7' x 22' equipment, 2' dovetail tandem axle tag type trailer, 14,000 Ib. GVWR ($1,3OO.OO)1
Downgrade model - specify NA
Downgrade model - specify NA
Downgrade model - specify NA
Downgrade model - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Delete option - specify NA
Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

TA82510TR ' 8'6" x 25' deck over flatbed trailer tandem axle with 20,000 Ib. GVWR $2,200.001
GTES801 ' | Gooseneck type hitch $500.00'
Upgrade model - specify NA
Upgrade model - specify NA
Upgrade model - specify NA
Upgrade model - specify NA
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

GTE5802 !

GTE5803 !

TA8258T

General Truck Equipment ~ General Truck Equipment ~ General Truck Equipment ~ General Truck Equipment

& Trailer Sales, Inc. & Trailer Sales, Inc. & Trailer Sales, Inc. & Trailer Sales, Inc.

Western Northern Central Southern

$7,770.00 $7,400.00 $7,690.00 $8,090.00
Optional equipment - specify $150.00"
ADDITIONAL LENGTH PER FOOT 1
Optional equipment - specify $300.001
DUAL JACKS |
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Temporary tag NC
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA
Maintenance Plan - specify NA
Maintenance Plan - specify NA
Warranty - specify Nc!

STANDARD - ONE YEAR 1

Warranty - specify NA
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8'6 X 25' DECK OVER FLATBED TRAILER- 16,000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #57

2018 All Steel TA8258T

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The All Steel TA8258T purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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