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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14,000 LB GVWR (Specification #49)

Environmental Products Group, Inc 2018 PacificTek PV800 Western
2018 PacificTek PV800 Western
Environmental Products Group, Inc 2018 PacificTek PV800 Northern
2018 PacificTek PV800 Northern
Environmental Products Group, Inc 2018 PacificTek PV800 Central
2018 PacificTek PV800 Central
Environmental Products Group, Inc 2018 PacificTek PV800 Southern
2018 PacificTek PV800 Southern
2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) Western
2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) Western
2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) Northern
2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) Northern
2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) Central
2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) Central
2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) Southern
2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) Southern
Vermeer Southeast Sales & Service, Inc 2018 Vermeer LP873SDT * Western
2018 Vermeer LP873SDT Western
Vermeer Southeast Sales & Service, Inc 2018 Vermeer LP873SDT * Northern
2018 Vermeer LP873SDT Northern
Vermeer Southeast Sales & Service, Inc 2018 Vermeer LP873SDT * Central
2018 Vermeer LP§73SDT Central
Vermeer Southeast Sales & Service, Inc 2018 Vermeer LP873SDT * Southern
2018 Vermeer LP873SDT Southern
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 X-Vac X800 Western
2018 X-Vac X800 Western
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 X-Vac X800 Northern

Base Unit
Price

$111,036.00
—-NB --
$111,036.00
--NB --
$111,036.00
- NB --
$111,036.00
—-NB --

--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --

$75,008.00
- NB --
$75,008.00
- NB --
$75,008.00
—-NB --
$75,008.00
- NB --

$105,200.00

—-NB --
$105,200.00
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 49.pdf

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

2018 X-Vac X800
2018 X-Vac X800
2018 X-Vac X800
2018 X-Vac X800
2018 X-Vac X800

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

—-NB --
$105,200.00
--NB --
$105,200.00
- NB --
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FAC

FLORIDA
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14.000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #49

2018 PacificTek PV800

2018 Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter)
2018 Vermeer LP873SDT
2018 X-Vac X800

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. WEIGHT:
a. 6,190 Ibs. (without trailer)
2. ENGINE:

a. 36 hp diesel engine

b. Water cooled

c. Fully enclosed sound attenuated engine enclosure (including vacuum pump and high pressure water pump)
d. 15 gallon fuel tank

3. VACUUM PUMP:

a. 580 CFM at 15 inches of mercury

b. Mounted inside engine enclosure

c. Washable filtration cylinders

d. Reverse pressure (to clear hose and offload liquids)

4. HIGH PRESSURE WATER SYSTEM:

a. 400 PSI at 4 GPM water pump

b. Low water automatic shutdown

c. Two 100 gallon poly water tanks

d. 50" high pressure water hose on hose reel
e. 5'and 3' wand and control handle

5. CONTROLS:

a. Lockable and waterproof

b. Curbside located

c. Oil pressure, water temperature, fuel and vacuum gauge
d. Electronic throttle

6. TANK:

a. Full open rear door
b. Door hydraulically opened
¢. Twin dump cylinders
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d. 6" stainless steel portal shutoff
e. 800 gallon debris tank capacity

7. BOOM:

a. 4" pickup hose

b. Hydraulically powered in/out and up/down
¢. Boom cradle

d. 360 degree movement

e. 2 dielictric 3" suction wands

f. 33' rubber suction hose

8. TRAILER:

. 7,000 1b. dexter torsion anxles

. 14,000 Ib. GVWR

. 10,000 Ib. jack stand

. I beam construction

. Pintle hitch

f. Electric brakes with safety breakaway
. LT235/85R 16 tires

. Stop/tail/turn lights

o o Ow

j=nlije]

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14,000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #49

2018 X-Vac X800

The X-Vac X800 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $105,200.00 $105,200.00 $105,200.00 $105,200.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

2253



VEHICLE: X800

DEALER: Pat's Pump & Blower ~ Pat's Pump & Blower ~ Pat's Pump & Blower  Pat's Pump & Blower
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $105,200.00 $105,200.00 $105,200.00 $105,200.00

Order Code Delete Options All Zones

Downgrade to small excavator - specify
Downgrade to small excavator - specify
Downgrade to small excavator - specify
Downgrade to small excavator - specify
Downgrade to small excavator - specify
Downgrade to small excavator - specify
Downgrade to small excavator - specify
Downgrade to small excavator - specify
Delete hydraulic boom to manual
Optional equipment delete - specify
Optional equipment delete - specify
Optional equipment delete - specify

Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Model upgrade - specify $136,195.00'
6 Yard Debris, 570 Gallons Water, Roots 624 PD Blower,-Truck Mounted-Customer Supplied Chassis, 10@2500 High
Pressure Water Pump, 19' Extendable Boom 1

X-6

. 1
Model upgrade - specify $151,195.00
8 Yard Debris, 570 Gallons Water, Roots 624 PD Blower-Truck Mounted-Customer Supplied Chassis, 10@2500 High
Pressure Water Pump, 19' Extendable Boom 1

Model upgrade - specify $172,800.001
12 Yard Debris, 1140 Gallons Water, Hibon 8702 PD Blower, Truck Mounted-Customer Supplied Chassis, 10@2500 High
Pressure Water Pump, 23’ Extendible Boom |

Model upgrade - specify
Model upgrade - specify
Model upgrade - specify
Model upgrade - specify
Model upgrade - specify
Emulsifier gun

NPN Electric tongue jack $3,647.00"
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

NPN !

NPN
120395-5 !

1

130635 !

A304529-1 !

NPN !
A121704 !

A387082 !

pisc!

X800
Pat's Pump & Blower Pat's Pump & Blower
Western Northern
$105,200.00 $105,200.00
Auxiliary hydraulics
Spare tire

Arrow board
Air brakes
Gooseneck hitch

Optional equipment - specify
Internal Tank Flusher 1

Optional equipment - specify
Sludge Pump Off Load System 1

Optional equipment - specifry
Tank Up Warning Light & Alarm

Optional equipment - specify
Boom Up Warning Light & Alarm 1

Optional equipment - specify

Wireless Boom Control

Optional equipment - specify
1% Discount from MSRP on all Unscheduled Items 1

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

Temporary tag
Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify

Pat's Pump & Blower Pat's Pump & Blower
Southern

$105,200.00

Central
$105,200.00

$3,294.00"
$305.00"
$2,305.00"
NA

NA
$2,794.00"

$10,285.00"
$810.00"

$1,100.00"

$5,200.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
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VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14,000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #49

2018 X-Vac X800

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The X-Vac X800 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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