



## FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership	Type of Vehicle	Zone	Base Unit Price
<u><a href="#">10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE (Specification #50)</a></u>			
Pat's Pump & Blower	2018 Aquatech B-10	Western	\$208,020.00
	2018 Aquatech B-10	Western	-- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower	2018 Aquatech B-10	Northern	\$208,020.00
	2018 Aquatech B-10	Northern	-- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower	2018 Aquatech B-10	Central	\$208,020.00
	2018 Aquatech B-10	Central	-- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower	2018 Aquatech B-10	Southern	\$208,020.00
	2018 Aquatech B-10	Southern	-- NB --
Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc.	2018 Super Products Camel 1200	Western	\$208,000.00
	2018 Super Products Camel 1200	Western	-- NB --
Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc.	2018 Super Products Camel 1200	Northern	\$208,000.00
	2018 Super Products Camel 1200	Northern	-- NB --
Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc.	2018 Super Products Camel 1200	Central	\$208,000.00
	2018 Super Products Camel 1200	Central	-- NB --
Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc.	2018 Super Products Camel 1200	Southern	\$208,000.00
	2018 Super Products Camel 1200	Southern	-- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc.	2018 Vacall AJV 1010	Western	\$184,579.00
	2018 Vacall AJV 1010	Western	-- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc.	2018 Vacall AJV 1010	Northern	\$184,579.00
	2018 Vacall AJV 1010	Northern	-- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc.	2018 Vacall AJV 1010	Central	\$184,579.00
	2018 Vacall AJV 1010	Central	-- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc.	2018 Vacall AJV 1010	Southern	\$184,579.00
	2018 Vacall AJV 1010	Southern	-- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales	2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard	★ Western	\$176,562.00
	2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard	Western	-- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales	2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard	★ Northern	\$176,562.00

	2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard	Northern	-- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales	2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard	★Central	\$176,562.00
	2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard	Central	-- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales	2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard	★Southern	\$176,562.00
	2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard	Southern	-- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc	2018 Vactor 2100 Plus	Western	\$236,588.00
	2018 Vactor 2100 Plus	Western	-- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc	2018 Vactor 2100 Plus	Northern	\$236,588.00
	2018 Vactor 2100 Plus	Northern	-- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc	2018 Vactor 2100 Plus	Central	\$236,588.00
	2018 Vactor 2100 Plus	Central	-- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc	2018 Vactor 2100 Plus	Southern	\$236,588.00
	2018 Vactor 2100 Plus	Southern	-- NB --



## FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

### 10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE SPECIFICATION #50

2018 Aquatech B-10  
2018 Super Products Camel 1200  
2018 Vacall AJV 1010  
2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard  
2018 Vactor 2100 Plus

**NOTE TO PURCHASERS: This is an INCOMPLETE UNIT. This is a bid award on a combination Sewer Cleaning/Vacuum Unit to be mounted on an appropriate sized cab & chassis truck. Agencies purchasing this unit will need to provide a cab & chassis truck of appropriate size, GVW, and, options necessary to have the selected combination Sewer Cleaner/Vacuuming Unit to be mounted on, or have the truck provider assist in ordering the correctly outfitted truck. Listed above you will find the model numbers of the units that will be included in the years contract. All items factory installed unless otherwise noted.**

#### 1. AIR/VACUUM SYSTEM:

- a. Positive displacement vacuum pump or centrifugal compressor
- b. 3500 CFM @ 14.5 inches of mercury, minimum
- c. Muffler
- d. Vacuum relief valves
- e. Centrifugal separator with clean out
- f. PTO or hydrostatic drive

#### 2. DEBRIS TANK:

- a. 10 cu. yard capacity
- b. 45 degree hydraulic dump
- c. Top hinged
- d. Hydraulic door locks
- e. Sight glass or indicator
- f. Drain valve with hose
- g. Check ball system or vacuum breaker

#### 3. BOOM ASSEMBLY:

- a. 270 degree boom working area
- b. Hydraulic up/down
- c. Clean out port
- d. Transport cradle
- e. 8" boom hose
- f. Pendant control

4. WATER PUMP:

- a. 2500 PSI, 80 GPM
- b. Pressure relief valve
- c. Wash down gun with relief valve

5. WATER TANK:

- a. 1000 gallon capacity
- b. Curb side fill
- c. Level indicators

6. HOSE REEL:

- a. 800' of 1" hose capacity
- b. 400' of 1", 2500 PSI hose supplied
- c. Power in/out
- d. Reel speed control system
- e. Position lock system
- f. Engine and hose reel controls
- g. Level wind

7. DRIVE SYSTEM:

- a. Hydrostatic transfer case, split PTO, or auxiliary engine or transfer case

8. MISCELLANEOUS:

- a. Nozzles 15 degree and 30 degree for jet
- b. Wash down gun
- c. 8" intake tube 20' minimum
- d. Flexible hose guide
- e. Hose storage rack

**DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A CONFIRMING QUOTE.**



# FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

## 10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE SPECIFICATION #50

### 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus

The Vactor 2100 Plus purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

<b>VEHICLE:</b>	2100 Plus			
<b>DEALER:</b>	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc
<b>ZONE:</b>	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
<b>BASE PRICE:</b>	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00

Order Code	Delete Options	All Zones
2103-16 <sup>1</sup>	Downgrade to smaller unit - specify <i>2103 3 YD Body</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$55,541.00 <sup>1</sup>
2110-SEI Plus <sup>1</sup>	Downgrade to smaller unit - specify <i>Single Stage Fan</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$7,857.00 <sup>1</sup>
HXX2106 <sup>1</sup>	Downgrade to smaller unit - specify <i>Prodigy Hydro X</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$21,707.00 <sup>1</sup>
HXX Paradigm <sup>1</sup>	Delete option - specify <i>Paradigm Hydro X</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$65,979.00 <sup>1</sup>
	Delete option - specify	NA
	Delete option - specify	NA
	Delete option - specify	NA
	Delete option - specify	NA

**Order Code      Add Options      All Zones**

**Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer's Standard Retail Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions, Section 2.14 Option Pricing.**

2112P <sup>1</sup>	Upgrade to larger unit - specify <i>12 YD Body</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$7,211.00 <sup>1</sup>
2115P <sup>1</sup>	Upgrade to larger unit - specify <i>15 YD Body</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$13,465.00 <sup>1</sup>
21HXXPD12 <sup>1</sup>	Upgrade to larger unit - specify <i>HXX</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$66,409.00 <sup>1</sup>
	Articulating hose reel	Std
	Hi-dump	Std
4011PB <sup>1</sup>	Wireless remote <i>T300</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$2,857.00 <sup>1</sup>
	Variable flow water system	Std
1009PA <sup>1</sup>	Hydraulic pump-off system	\$10,799.00 <sup>1</sup>
2110P-18 <sup>1</sup>	Positive displacement blowers <i>18"</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$5,949.00 <sup>1</sup>
2110-SE2 Plus <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>2 Stage Fan</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$7,374.00 <sup>1</sup>

<b>VEHICLE:</b>	2100 Plus			
<b>DEALER:</b>	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc
<b>ZONE:</b>	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
<b>BASE PRICE:</b>	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00

2018 <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>1300-1500 Water<sup>1</sup></i>	\$3,761.00 <sup>1</sup>
1003 <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Pkg 1: Debris Washout, 6" Rear Butterfly, Lube Manifold, Low Water Light and Flow Indicator, Side Decant, Rear Splash Shield, Anti-Splash Valve and Rodder Pump Drain Valves<sup>1</sup></i>	\$14,011.00 <sup>1</sup>
4015P <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>10' Boom and Front Joystick<sup>1</sup></i>	\$14,912.00 <sup>1</sup>
1024-12 <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Pkg 2: 1024, 12YD, SS CYC &amp; Floats, Up Alarm, 3" Y, Auto Wind Index Dbl Roller, DOT 3, Rear Bumper Strobes, Camera All Sides, Cone &amp; Water Rack, Ser Man, 3 5' Tubes, Leader Hose, Drain Flat 25, 2nd Accumulator, Work Zone-Ground-Tool Box Lights, Storage Tray, Meter Install, Body Vibrator, 100' Hose Gun, Addl Wash Nozzle, Arrow Stick Diamond Plate Mount, Fresh Washout, GPS, 600' Cobra, Street Flush, Chevron, Justice Bar, Laptop Stand<sup>1</sup></i>	\$80,283.00 <sup>1</sup>
GREL <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Grease Release System<sup>1</sup></i>	\$2,445.00 <sup>1</sup>
6005 <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Digital Hose Footage Counter<sup>1</sup></i>	\$1,590.00 <sup>1</sup>
1015 <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Folding Pipe Rack Per Side<sup>1</sup></i>	\$962.00 <sup>1</sup>
3017P <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Blower &amp; Hydraulic Temp indicator<sup>1</sup></i>	\$835.00 <sup>1</sup>
8028P <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Worklights per location<sup>1</sup></i>	\$722.00 <sup>1</sup>
6004P <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Pinch Roller<sup>1</sup></i>	\$1,314.00 <sup>1</sup>
6004P <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Auto Wind Guide Non-Indexing<sup>1</sup></i>	\$4,411.00 <sup>1</sup>
8007P <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>LED Strobe per Location<sup>1</sup></i>	\$1,010.00 <sup>1</sup>
5030P <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Water Recycler System<sup>1</sup></i>	\$112,500.00 <sup>1</sup>
9070 <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Front Bumper Toolboxes<sup>1</sup></i>	\$1,826.00 <sup>1</sup>
5021P <sup>1</sup>	Optional equipment - specify <i>Hydro Excavation Kit<sup>1</sup></i>	\$4,470.00 <sup>1</sup>
NTAG <sup>1</sup>	New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)	\$150.00 <sup>1</sup>
TRAN <sup>1</sup>	Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)	\$100.00 <sup>1</sup>
Temp <sup>1</sup>	Temporary tag	NC <sup>1</sup>
Main PL <sup>1</sup>	Maintenance Plan - specify <i>Full Maintenance for Body and Chassis per Year up to 5 years w/ substitute Vehicles<sup>1</sup></i>	\$13,200.00 <sup>1</sup>
Main Body <sup>1</sup>	Maintenance Plan - specify <i>Full Maintenance for Body Only per Year up to 5 Years w/ Substitute Vehicles<sup>1</sup></i>	\$9,600.00 <sup>1</sup>
Warr M <sup>1</sup>	Warranty - specify <i>Module Warranty including Water Pump per Year up to an Additional 4 Years<sup>1</sup></i>	\$3,500.00 <sup>1</sup>

<b>VEHICLE:</b>	2100 Plus			
<b>DEALER:</b>	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc
<b>ZONE:</b>	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
<b>BASE PRICE:</b>	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00	\$236,588.00

Warr T <sup>1</sup>	Warranty - specify <i>Freightliner Chassis Towing per Year up to 5 Years</i> <sup>1</sup>	\$300.00 <sup>1</sup>
---------------------	--	-----------------------





# FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

## 10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE SPECIFICATION #50

### 2018 Vector 2100 Plus

### (Alternate Dealer Option)

The Vector 2100 Plus purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.