
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE (Specification #50)
 
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 Aquatech B-10 Western $208,020.00
 2018 Aquatech B-10 Western -- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 Aquatech B-10 Northern $208,020.00
 2018 Aquatech B-10 Northern -- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 Aquatech B-10 Central $208,020.00
 2018 Aquatech B-10 Central -- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 Aquatech B-10 Southern $208,020.00
 2018 Aquatech B-10 Southern -- NB --
 
Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. 2018 Super Products Camel 1200 Western $208,000.00
 2018 Super Products Camel 1200 Western -- NB --
Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. 2018 Super Products Camel 1200 Northern $208,000.00
 2018 Super Products Camel 1200 Northern -- NB --
Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. 2018 Super Products Camel 1200 Central $208,000.00
 2018 Super Products Camel 1200 Central -- NB --
Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. 2018 Super Products Camel 1200 Southern $208,000.00
 2018 Super Products Camel 1200 Southern -- NB --
 
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Vacall AJV 1010 Western $184,579.00
 2018 Vacall AJV 1010 Western -- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Vacall AJV 1010 Northern $184,579.00
 2018 Vacall AJV 1010 Northern -- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Vacall AJV 1010 Central $184,579.00
 2018 Vacall AJV 1010 Central -- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Vacall AJV 1010 Southern $184,579.00
 2018 Vacall AJV 1010 Southern -- NB --
 
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales 2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard Western $176,562.00
 2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard Western -- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales 2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard Northern $176,562.00
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 2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard Northern -- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales 2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard Central $176,562.00
 2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard Central -- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales 2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard Southern $176,562.00
 2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard Southern -- NB --
 
Environmental Products Group, Inc 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus Western $236,588.00
 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus Western -- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus Northern $236,588.00
 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus Northern -- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus Central $236,588.00
 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus Central -- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus Southern $236,588.00
 2018 Vactor 2100 Plus Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE
SPECIFICATION #50

2018 Aquatech B-10 
2018 Super Products Camel 1200 
2018 Vacall AJV 1010 
2018 Vac-Con 11 Yard 
2018 Vactor 2100 Plus 

NOTE TO PURCHASERS: This is an INCOMPLETE UNIT. This is a bid award
on a combination Sewer Cleaning/Vacuum Unit to be mounted on an
appropriate sized cab & chassis truck. Agencies purchasing this unit
will need to provide a cab & chassis truck of appropriate size, GVW,
and, options necessary to have the selected combination Sewer
Cleaner/Vacuuming Unit to be mounted on, or have the truck provider
assist in ordering the correctly outfitted truck. Listed above you
will find the model numbers of the units that will be included in the
years contract. All items factory installed unless otherwise noted.

AIR/VACUUM SYSTEM:1.

Positive displacement vacuum pump or centrifugal compressora.
3500 CFM @ 14.5 inches of mercury, minimumb.
Mufflerc.
Vacuum relief valvesd.
Centrifugal separator with clean oute.
PTO or hydrostatic drivef.

DEBRIS TANK:2.

10 cu. yard capacitya.
45 degree hydraulic dumpb.
Top hingedc.
Hydraulic door locksd.
Sight glass or indicatore.
Drain valve with hosef.
Check ball system or vacuum breakerg.

BOOM ASSEMBLY:3.

270 degree boom working areaa.
Hydraulic up/downb.
Clean out portc.
Transport cradled.
8" boom hosee.
Pendant controlf.

WATER PUMP:4.
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WATER PUMP:4.

2500 PSI, 80 GPMa.
Pressure relief valveb.
Wash down gun with relief valvec.

WATER TANK:5.

1000 gallon capacitya.
Curb side fillb.
Level indicatorsc.

HOSE REEL:6.

800' of 1" hose capacitya.
400' of 1", 2500 PSI hose suppliedb.
Power in/outc.
Reel speed control systemd.
Position lock systeme.
Engine and hose reel controlsf.
Level windg.

DRIVE SYSTEM:7.

Hydrostatic transfer case, split PTO, or auxiliary engine or transfer casea.

MISCELLANEOUS:8.

Nozzles 15 degree and 30 degree for jeta.
Wash down gunb.
8" intake tube 20' minimumc.
Flexible hose guided.
Hose storage racke.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE
SPECIFICATION #50

2018 Vacall AJV 1010
The Vacall AJV 1010 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $184,579.00 $184,579.00 $184,579.00 $184,579.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
AJV610 1 Downgrade to smaller unit - specify 

6 YD / 1000 GALLON 1 
$7,296.001

AJV810 1 Downgrade to smaller unit - specify 
8 YD / 1000 GALLON 1 

$6,332.001

AS-10 1 Downgrade to smaller unit - specify 
10 YD CATCH BASIN 1 

$30,897.001

AS-10D 1 Delete option - specify 
10 YD CATCH BASIN 1 

$18,224.001

AS-13 1 Delete option - specify 
13 YD CATCH BASIN 1 

$29,629.001

AS-13D 1 Delete option - specify 
13 YD CATCH BASIN 1 

$17,278.001

AS-16 1 Delete option - specify 
16 YD CATCH BASIN 1 

$27,064.001

AS-16D 1 Delete option - specify 
16 YD CATCH BASIN 1 

$14,760.001

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

AJV1015 1 Upgrade to larger unit - specify 
10 YD / 1500 GALLON 1 

$3,374.001

AJV1215 1 Upgrade to larger unit - specify 
12 YD / 1500 GALLON 1 

$5,216.001

AJVR610 1 Upgrade to larger unit - specify 
6 YD / 1000 GALLON REAR REEL 1 

$8,048.001

Articulating hose reel Incl. 
HI-DUMP 1 Hi-dump $37,995.001

WIRELESSREM 1 Wireless remote $2,919.001

Variable flow water system Incl. 
HYDPUMPOFF 1 Hydraulic pump-off system $4,932.001

Positive displacement blowers Incl. 

VEHICLE: AJV 1010
DEALER: GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $184,579.00 $184,579.00 $184,579.00 $184,579.00
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AJVR810 1 Optional equipment - specify 
8 YD 1000 GALLON REAR REEL 1 

$10,067.001

AJVR1010 1 Optional equipment - specify 
10 YD 1000 GALLON REAR REEL 1 

$18,963.001

AJVR1015 1 Optional equipment - specify 
10 YD 1500 GALLON REAR REEL 1 

$19,931.001

AJVR1215 1 Optional equipment - specify 
12 YD 1500 GALLON REAR REEL 1 

$21,895.001

RECYCLER 1 Optional equipment - specify 
WATER RECYCLING 1 

$99,875.001

DBRTNKGAL 1 Optional equipment - specify 
GALVANIZED DEBRIS TANK 1 

$4,583.001

AV-18 1 Optional equipment - specify $3,621.001

Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA 
Temporary tag NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

BASE 1 Warranty - specify 
1 YR / 1500 HR FULL MACHINE 1 

Std1

24/2000 1 Warranty - specify 
2 YR / 2000 HR EXTENDED WARRANTY ON MODULE ONLY 1 

$2,500.001

VEHICLE: AJV 1010
DEALER: GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $184,579.00 $184,579.00 $184,579.00 $184,579.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE
SPECIFICATION #50

2018 Vacall AJV 1010

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Vacall AJV 1010 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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