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Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

TRAILER MOUNTED SEWER CLEANER (Specification #48)

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Environmental Products Group, Inc

Environmental Products Group, Inc

Environmental Products Group, Inc

Environmental Products Group, Inc

2018 Obrien 7018-SC
2018 Obrien 7018-SC
2018 Obrien 7018-SC
2018 Obrien 7018-SC
2018 Obrien 7018-SC
2018 Obrien 7018-SC
2018 Obrien 7018-SC
2018 Obrien 7018-SC

2018 Pipe Hunter 76418
2018 Pipe Hunter 76418
2018 Pipe Hunter 76418
2018 Pipe Hunter 76418
2018 Pipe Hunter 76418
2018 Pipe Hunter 76418
2018 Pipe Hunter 76418
2018 Pipe Hunter 76418

2018 Vactor RamJet 4018
2018 Vactor RamJet 4018
2018 Vactor RamJet 4018
2018 Vactor RamJet 4018
2018 Vactor RamJet 4018
2018 Vactor RamJet 4018
2018 Vactor RamJet 4018
2018 Vactor RamJet 4018

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Base Unit
Price

$64,645.00
- NB --
$64,645.00
- NB --
$64,645.00
—-NB --
$64,645.00
- NB --

--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --

$64,514.00
- NB --
$64,514.00
- NB --
$64,514.00
—-NB --
$64,514.00
- NB --
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 48.pdf

FAC

FLORIDA
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

TRAILER MOUNTED SEWER CLEANER
SPECIFICATION #48

2018 Obrien 7018-SC
2018 Pipe Hunter 76418
2018 Vactor RamJet 4018

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE

a. 60 h.p. diesel engine
b. Water cooled

c. Engine enclosure

d. 15 gal. fuel tank

2. HIGH PRESSURE WATER PUMP

a. 4000 psi at 18 gpm

b. Pressure relief valve

c. Triplex type pump

d. Low water shutdown

e. Multi-flow type system [ pressure change without changes to engine rpm |

3. CONTROLS

. Located next to hose reel

. Ignition

. Throttle

. Gauge package [tachometer, hourmeter, oil pressure, volts, and low oil / high temp shutdown]
. Water control valve

o o O

4. WATER TANK

. 700 gal capacity

. High density polyethylene with baffles

. Sight gauge

. 2 1/2" overhead tank fill , anti siphon , air gap type
e. Strainer

f. Tank drain

o O

5. HOSE REEL

a. 800 ' capacity of 1/2" high pressure sewer hose
b. Hydraulic power in and out

6. HOSE REEL DRIVE HYDRAULIC SYSTEM
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a. Hydraulic pump 8 gpm
b. 15 gal hydraulic reservoir
¢. Spin on type hydraulic filter

7. TRAILER

a. 12000 1b gvw
b. 6" x 3/16" frame
c¢. Tandem axle
d. 2 5/16" hitch
e. Tongue jack
f.235/80r 16" tires
g. Fenders
h. Breakaway switch
i. Lighting as required by Federal and State laws
J- Reflective striping
k. Toolbox with locking system
1. LED directional arrowstick
m. Warning beacon [tank mounted]

8. EQUIPMENT FURNISHED

a. 500" of 1/2 " high pressure sewer hose

b. 100" of 1/4" hose and nozzle for small pipe

c. Washdown gun and 25 ' of hose with quick dissconnects

d. Tiger tail hose protecter

e. Nozzles to be furnished, 15 degree, 35 degree, chisel point, grenade flushing type, skid assembly, and rotater nozzle

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA

ASSOCIATION OF
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All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

TRAILER MOUNTED SEWER CLEANER
SPECIFICATION #48

2018 Obrien 7018-SC

The Obrien 7018-SC purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $64,645.00 $64,645.00 $64,645.00 $64,645.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

Order Code

7018-SC

Pat's Pump & Blower
Western

$64,645.00

Delete Options

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Add Options

Pat's Pump & Blower
Northern
$64,645.00

Pat's Pump & Blower
Central
$64,645.00

Pat's Pump & Blower
Southern
$64,645.00
All Zones
All Zones

add options.

the Vendor.

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

704030-SC !
0BJ-29-72 !
7000 SB '
OBJ-2430A !
OBJ-415 !
A387564-INSTL
RL650A !

SL650A !

1

Optional equipment - specify

Upgrade to 85HP Diesel, 40 GPM @ 3000 PSI, 750 Gallons of Water 1

Optional equipment - specify

Aluminum Tool Box V Style Mounted on Trailer Tongue 1

Optional equipment - specify
Hydraulic Surge Brakes 1

Optional equipment - specify
Level Wind Guide with Counter 1

Optional equipment - specify
Lateral Cleaning Kit 1/2" x 100’ 1

Optional equipment - specify
Wireless Remote Option

Optional equipment - specify
Magnetic Rotating Beacon Light 1

Optional equipment - specify
Magnetic Strobe Light 1

Optional equipment - specify

$21,000.00'
$1,250.00"
$1,347.00"
$900.00"
$2,000.00"
$2,025.00'
$155.00"

$175.00"
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

A338664-7-OBM |
3-2203 !
7065-SC !

pisc !

WARRANTY-1 !

WARRANTY-2 !

7018-SC

Pat's Pump & Blower Pat's Pump & Blower Pat's Pump & Blower
Western Northern Central

$64,645.00 $64,645.00 $64,645.00

Optional equipment - specify
IntelACount 1

Optional equipment - specify
3"x 36" Tiger Tail 1

Optional equipment - specify
110 HP, 65 GPM @ 2000 PSI with 750 Gallons of Water 1

Optional equipment - specify
1% Discount Off MSRP for Non-Scheduled Items 1

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Maintenance Plan — specify

Maintenance Plan — specify

Warranty - specify
One (1) Year Additional Warranty 1

Warranty - specify
Warranty for each Additional Year Past Year 2 1

Pat's Pump & Blower

Southern
$64,645.00

$4,

$35,

560.00"

$95.00"

000.00'

1

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

$2.500.00"

$2.500.00"
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

TRAILER MOUNTED SEWER CLEANER
SPECIFICATION #48

2018 Obrien 7018-SC

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Obrien 7018-SC purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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