FLORIDA

ASSOCIATION OF

COUNTIES
—_—
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
COMPACT SWEEPER - 2.3 CU YD AIR SWEEPER (Specification #53)

Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 Johnston C201 * Western
2018 Johnston C201 Western
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 Johnston C201 * Northern
2018 Johnston C201 Northern
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 Johnston C201 * Central
2018 Johnston C201 Central
Pat's Pump & Blower 2018 Johnston C201 * Southern
2018 Johnston C201 Southern

Base Unit
Price

$144,950.00
—-NB --
$144,950.00
--NB --
$144,950.00
- NB --
$144,950.00
—-NB --
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 53.pdf
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FLORIDA
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

COMPACT SWEEPER -2.3 CUYD AIR SWEEPER
SPECIFICATION #53

2018 Johnston C201

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. OPERATING WEIGHT:

a. 8800 LBS. GVWR
b. Empty weight-5900 LBS

2. ENGINE/TRANSMISSION:

a. 78 hp
b. Hydrostatic drive

3. BRAKES/TIRES

a. Drum type brakes [ power assist]
b. Front tire size 6.50 R10 Radial
c. Rear tire size 225/75 R10 Radial

4. SWEEPER DIMENSIONS:

a. Height: 72"
b. Width: 52"
c. Length: 162"

5. HOPPER:
a. 2.3 cubic yard capacity
6. GUTTER BROOMS.:

a. Equipped with left and right side gutter brooms
b. Front mounted 33.5" diameter
c. Overall sweeping width 122"

7. WATER SYSTEM

a. 66 gal recirculation water system capacity
b. 40 gal clean water system capacity

8. LIGHTING / SAFETY

a. Lighting package to enable vehicle to operate on the road
b. Work lights for operation of vehicle at night
c. Amber warning beacon
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d. Intermittent wipers
9. COMFORT ITEMS:

a. Cab to be air conditioned and heated
b. Suspension type operator seat

10. INSTRUMENTATION:
a. Full instrumentation to monitor operation of vehicle
11. EAN UNIT:

a. Centrifugal type fan
b. Wear resistant blades

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.

2349




FLORIDA

ASSOCIATION OF

COUNTIES
—_—
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

COMPACT SWEEPER - 2.3 CU YD AIR SWEEPER
SPECIFICATION #53

2018 Johnston C201

The Johnston C201 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: * Western * Northern * Central * Southern
BASE PRICE: $144,950.00 $144,950.00 $144,950.00 $144,950.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

2350



VEHICLE: C201

DEALER: Pat's Pump & Blower ~ Pat's Pump & Blower ~ Pat's Pump & Blower  Pat's Pump & Blower
ZONE: * Western % Northern % Central * Southern
BASE PRICE: $144,950.00 $144,950.00 $144,950.00 $144,950.00

Order Code Delete Options All Zones

Downgrade option — specify
Downgrade option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify

Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

201020 ! Upgrade — specify $9,485.00"
Front Mounted 3rd Brush, Dual Rotation, Demountable complete with Poly Brush 1

201002 ' Upgrade — specify $1,855.00"
Add Camera Single Rear, Displaying on JVM 1

c201011 ! Optional Equipment — specify $2,5 80.00'
Wanderhose-Top Turn-table Mounted, Spring Balanced with 4" Diameter & 14’ Long Hose 1

201014 ! Optional Equipment — specify $6,185.00"
High Pressure "SupaWash" Hand Lance with 33' Hose & Reel 1

pisc ! Optional Equipment — specify !
1% Discount from MSRP on all Unscheduled Options 1
Temporary Tag NA
Transfer existing registration NA
New state tag NA

MAINT ! Maintenance plan — specify $9,000.001

Annual Maintenance per Year 1

Maintenance plan — specify

WARRANTY3 ! Warranty — specify $7,260.00"
Three (3) Years or 4500 Hours Parts & Labor 1

WARRANTY4 ! Warranty — specify $10,500.00"
Four (4) Years or 6000 Hours Parts & Labor 1
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COMPACT SWEEPER - 2.3 CU YD AIR SWEEPER
SPECIFICATION #53

2018 Johnston C201

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Johnston C201 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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