



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership	Type of Vehicle	Zone	Base Unit Price
<u>3 WHEEL MECHANICAL BROOM STREET SWEEPER (Specification #51)</u>			
Environmental Products Group, Inc	2018 Elgin Pelican	Western	\$204,141.00
	2018 Elgin Pelican	Western	-- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc	2018 Elgin Pelican	Northern	\$204,141.00
	2018 Elgin Pelican	Northern	-- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc	2018 Elgin Pelican	Central	\$204,141.00
	2018 Elgin Pelican	Central	-- NB --
Environmental Products Group, Inc	2018 Elgin Pelican	Southern	\$204,141.00
	2018 Elgin Pelican	Southern	-- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales	2018 Global M3	★ Western	\$179,169.00
	2018 Global M3	Western	-- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales	2018 Global M3	★ Northern	\$179,169.00
	2018 Global M3	Northern	-- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales	2018 Global M3	★ Central	\$179,169.00
	2018 Global M3	Central	-- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales	2018 Global M3	★ Southern	\$179,169.00
	2018 Global M3	Southern	-- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

3 WHEEL MECHANICAL BROOM STREET SWEEPER SPECIFICATION #51

2018 Elgin Pelican
2018 Global M3

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:

- a. 4 cylinder diesel engine 74 HP minimum.
- b. 120 AMP alternator
- c. Fuel water separator
- d. 35 gallon fuel tank capacity

2. TRANSMISSION:

- a. Hydrostatic drive type
- b. 35 gallon reservoir
- c. Capable of 20 MPH minimum

3. CAB:

- a. Sealed type cab with filtered intake.
- b. Tilt and telescoping steering column
- c. Tinted glass
- d. Sound suppressed
- e. Intermittent windshield wipers with washer
- f. Full gauge and warning lights for engine monitoring
- g. Climate controlled cab, heater, defroster and air conditioned
- h. If cab is not center mounted, it must have dual controls for operating on either right or left hand side.

4. FRAME:

- a. 116" wheelbase
- b. Rail type channel frame

5. SAFETY ITEMS:

- a. Rearview backup camera
- b. Backup alarm
- c. Cab mounted warning strobe light with protective cage
- d. Worklights for gutter brooms
- e. Headlights, turn, brake and hazard lights
- f. Dual west coast mirrors with spot mirrors

6. BRAKES/STEERING:

- a. Turning radius 15' maximum
- b. Parking brake
- c. Hydraulic power assisted service bakes

7. DEBRIS HOPPER:

- a. 9'6" minimum dump height
- b. 3.5 yard capacity minimum

8. CONVEYOR:

- a. Hydraulic drive
- b. Rubber belt type with flights

9. MAIN BROOM:

- a. Hydraulic drive
- b. 56" width tube type
- c. 32" diameter minimum

10. GUTTER BROOMS:

- a. Hydraulic drive
- b. Segmented type broom
- c. 36" diameter minimum
- d. Right & left side brooms to have adjustable down pressure located in cab.

11. WATER SPRAY SYSTEM:

- a. Water spray jets adjacent to all brooms
- b. Water filter
- c. 15' hydrant fill hose
- d. Run dry type water pump
- e. 220 gallon water tank

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A CONFIRMING QUOTE.



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

3 WHEEL MECHANICAL BROOM STREET SWEEPER SPECIFICATION #51

2018 Elgin Pelican

The Elgin Pelican purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

VEHICLE:	Pelican			
DEALER:	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc
ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00

Order Code	Delete Options	All Zones
	Single Left Hand Steering in lieu of Dual Steering	NA
	Single Gutter Broom in lieu of Dual Gutter Brooms <i>Includes RH Single Steer</i> ¹	\$8,400.00 ¹
	Downgrade - specify	NA
	Downgrade - specify	NA
	Downgrade - specify	NA
	Downgrade - specify	NA
	Downgrade - specify	NA
	Downgrade - specify	NA

Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer's Standard Retail Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions, Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

1121610 ¹	Upgrade option - specify <i>Waterless Pelican</i> ¹	\$44,521.00 ¹
1089429 ¹	Upgrade option - specify <i>Hydraulic Level & Temp Shutdown</i> ¹	\$350.00 ¹
1091361 ¹	Upgrade option - specify <i>Strip Broom - Center Sweep</i> ¹	\$885.00 ¹
1120820 ¹	Upgrade option - specify <i>Conveyor Cleanout</i> ¹	\$495.00 ¹
1120827 ¹	Upgrade option - specify <i>In Cab Air Restriction Gauge</i> ¹	\$365.00 ¹
1101017 ¹	Remote adjustment heated mirrors <i>Heated and Motorized</i> ¹	\$1,240.00 ¹
1089502 ¹	Side broom tilt <i>Per Side</i> ¹	\$1,875.00 ¹
1087668 ¹	Automatic lubrication system	\$6,180.00 ¹
1092236 ¹	Lifeline hopper liner	\$3,930.00 ¹
1101318 ¹	Beacon light with protector	\$945.00 ¹
	Electric side broom tilt indicator <i>Included with Broom Tilt</i> ¹	Incl. ¹

VEHICLE:	Pelican			
DEALER:	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc	Environmental Products Group, Inc
ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00	\$204,141.00

1087539 ¹	Broom hours and mileage recorder <i>Main Broom</i> ¹	\$375.00 ¹
1120656 ¹	Diesel cold weather start aid	\$550.00 ¹
1124183 ¹	Limb guards <i>Dual</i> ¹	\$2,815.00 ¹
1123319 ¹	Sliding rear window	\$880.00 ¹
	Litter hose	NA
	Front broom	NA
	Powder coating - specify	Std
1087545 ¹	Optional equipment - specify <i>Conveyor Stall Alarm</i> ¹	\$705.00 ¹
1120744 ¹	Optional equipment - specify <i>2 LED Rear Flood and Back-up Lights</i> ¹	\$765.00 ¹
1101326 ¹	Optional equipment - specify <i>LED Arrowstick</i> ¹	\$1,610.00 ¹
1106698 ¹	Optional equipment - specify <i>Greasable Carbide Dirt Shoes</i> ¹	\$1,310.00 ¹
1101244 ¹	Optional equipment - specify <i>AM/FM CD with Map Lights</i> ¹	\$575.00 ¹
TEMP ¹	Temporary tag	NC ¹
TRAN ¹	Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)	\$100.00 ¹
NTAG ¹	New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)	\$150.00 ¹
MAIN PL ¹	Maintenance Plan - specify <i>Full Maintenance Plan with Substitute Vehicle Per Year Up To 5 Years</i> ¹	\$14,400.00 ¹
	Maintenance Plan - specify	NA
WARR ¹	Warranty - specify <i>Additional Parts and Labor Warranty per Year up to 4 Additional Years</i> ¹	\$3,230.00 ¹
	Warranty - specify	NA



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

3 WHEEL MECHANICAL BROOM STREET SWEEPER SPECIFICATION #51

2018 Elgin Pelican

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Elgin Pelican purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.