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Name of Dealership

SMALL AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR (4 WHEEL DRIVE) (Specification #21)

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC

Everglades Farm Equipment

Everglades Farm Equipment

Futch's Tractor Depot

ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Futch's Tractor Depot

ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Futch's Tractor Depot

ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Futch's Tractor Depot

ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Federal Contracts Corp

Federal Contracts Corp

Type of Vehicle

2018 Case IH Farmall 35C
2018 Case IH Farmall 35C
2018 Case IH Farmall 35C
2018 Case IH Farmall 35C
2018 Case IH Farmall 35C
2018 Case IH Farmall 35C
2018 Case IH Farmall 35C
2018 Case IH Farmall 35C

2018 John Deere 3039R
2018 John Deere 3039R
2018 John Deere 3039R
2018 John Deere 3039R
2018 John Deere 3039R
2018 John Deere 3039R
2018 John Deere 3039R
2018 John Deere 3039R

2018 Kubota L3901 DT
2018 Kubota L3901 DT
2018 Kubota L3901 DT
2018 Kubota L3901 DT
2018 Kubota L3901 DT
2018 Kubota L3901 DT
2018 Kubota L3901 DT
2018 Kubota L3901 DT

2018 Mahindra 1538
2018 Mahindra 1538
2018 Mahindra 1538

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

$18,038.00
- NB --
$17,738.00
- NB --
$17,488.00
—-NB --
$17,488.00
- NB --

$22,600.00
- NB --
$22,600.00
- NB --
$21,800.00
—-NB --
$21,800.00
- NB --

$15,250.00
$15,550.00
$14,998.00
$15,170.00
$14,998.00
$15,170.00
$14,998.00
$15,650.00

$23,751.00

—-NB --
$23,751.00
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 21.pdf

Federal Contracts Corp

Federal Contracts Corp

Kelly Tractor

Kelly Tractor

Creel Tractor Company

Creel Tractor Company

Creel Tractor Company

Creel Tractor Company

2018 Mahindra 1538
2018 Mahindra 1538
2018 Mahindra 1538
2018 Mahindra 1538
2018 Mahindra 1538

2018 Massey Ferguson 1742
2018 Massey Ferguson 1742
2018 Massey Ferguson 1742
2018 Massey Ferguson 1742
2018 Massey Ferguson 1742
2018 Massey Ferguson 1742
2018 Massey Ferguson 1742
2018 Massey Ferguson 1742

2018 New Holland Boomer 37
2018 New Holland Boomer 37
2018 New Holland Boomer 37
2018 New Holland Boomer 37
2018 New Holland Boomer 37
2018 New Holland Boomer 37
2018 New Holland Boomer 37
2018 New Holland Boomer 37

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

- NB --
$23,751.00
- NB --
$23,751.00
—-NB --

- NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
- NB --
$23,380.00
- NB --
$23,380.00
—-NB --

$18,555.00
--NB --
$18,355.00
--NB --
$18,155.00
--NB --
$17,955.00
--NB --

1178



. FAG

FLORIDA
SEM

SOC

\ \TTON O
COUNTIES

—_—
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

SMALL AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR (4 WHEEL DRIVE)

SPECIFICATION #21

2018 Case IH Farmall 35C
2018 John Deere 3039R

2018 Kubota L3901 DT

2018 Mahindra 1538

2018 Massey Ferguson 1742
2018 New Holland Boomer 37

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:

a. Liquid cooled diesel with minimum of 29 PTO hp @ 2200 rpm.
2. TRANSMISSION:

a. Hydrostatic drive or mechanical type transmission.
3. FUEL TANK:

a. Minimum 7 gallon capacity.
4. BRAKES:

a. Oil cooled hydraulic wet disc.
5. POWER TAKE OFF:

a. Speeds RPM - 540
6. HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:

a. Open center system with standard remotes.
b. Maximum main pump flow - 6.3 gpm

7. 3 POINT HITCH:

a. Category |
b. SAE lift capacity @ 24" standard Ibs. - 1,435

8. TIRES:

a. Not less than 11.2 x 24 rear
b. Not less than 5-15 6 ply front

IDISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
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WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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SMALL AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR (4 WHEEL DRIVE)
SPECIFICATION #21

2018 Massey Ferguson 1742

The Massey Ferguson 1742 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $23,380.00 $23,380.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE: 1742

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Order Code Delete Options

1726E 2 Downgrade - specify
MF1726E 4 WD PLATFORM 21 PTO HP 2

1734E 2 Downgrade - specify
MF1734E 4 WD PLATFORM 29 PTO HP 2

1739E 2 Downgrade to 2 wheel drive
MF1739E 4 WD PLATFORM 32.7 PTO HP 2

1736 2 Delete remotes
MF1736 4 WD PLATFORM 27.5 PTO HP 2

Order Code Add Options

Kelly Tractor
Central
$23,380.00

Kelly Tractor
Southern
$23,380.00
Western
& Central
Northern& Southern
($8,417.00)>
($6,470.00)°
($4,710.00)°
($1,107.00)>
Western
& Central

Northern& Southern

Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,

1749 2 Model upgrade - specify

MF1749 4WD PLATFORM 12X12 POWER SHUTTLE TRANSMISSION 39.0 PTO HP 2

1754 Model upgrade - specify

MF1754 4WD PLATFORM 12X12 POWER SHUTTLE TRANSMISSION 39.0 PTO HP 2

1758 2 Model upgrade - specify

MF1758 4WD PLATFORM 12X12 POWER SHUTTLE TRANSMISSION 39.0 PTO HP 2

1759 2 Canopy

MF1759 4WD PLATFORM 12X12 POWER SHUTTLE TRANSMISSION 45.6 PTO HP 2

Wheel weights
Bumper weights
4239020M 2 Grille guard

7496723M 2 Optional rear tires - state size and type
TURF TIRES FRONT & REAR 2

7496747M 2 Optional front tires - state size and type
INDUSTRIAL TIRES FRONT AND REAR 2

DLI125PKG > Quick attach front end loader
DLP1250 LOADER PKG W 66" BUCKET 2

Quick attach backhoe

$5.903.00>
$6,970.00°
$8,977.00°

$9.365.00°

$300.00°
($379.00)

($214.00)

$6.195.00>
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

72530292 2

72530291 2

12%
DISCOUNT 2

1742

Western
-- No bid --

Rear remote hydraulics

Optional equipment - specify
UPGRADE TO CAB/AC 2

Optional equipment - specify

Northern
-- No bid --

UPGRADE TO HYDROSTATIC TRANSMISSION 2

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

12% DISCOUNT ON ALL MASSEY FERGUSON TRACTORS AND FACTORY INSTALLED OPTIONS 2

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify

Kelly Tractor
Central
$23,380.00

Kelly Tractor
Southern
$23,380.00
$7,700.00°
$670.00°
2
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SMALL AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR (4 WHEEL DRIVE)
SPECIFICATION #21

2018 Massey Ferguson 1742

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Massey Ferguson 1742 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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