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Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER (Specification #18)

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

GHC Motorsports

GHC Motorsports

GHC Motorsports

GHC Motorsports

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC

Everglades Farm Equipment

Everglades Farm Equipment

Futch's Tractor Depot

Futch's Tractor Depot

2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100

2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR

2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M

2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

$7,873.00
- NB --
$7,873.00
- NB --
$7,873.00
—-NB --
$7,873.00
- NB --

$6,855.00
- NB --
$6,802.00
- NB --
$6,747.00
—-NB --
$6,747.00
- NB --

$8,925.00
- NB --
$8,925.00
- NB --
$8,550.00
—-NB --
$8,550.00
- NB --

$7,819.00

—-NB --
$7,819.00
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 18.pdf

Futch's Tractor Depot

Futch's Tractor Depot

Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Futch's Tractor Depot

ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Futch's Tractor Depot

ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.
ALT - Creel Tractor Company

2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260

2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central
Southern

Southern

- NB --
$7,819.00
- NB --
$7,819.00
—-NB --

$6,836.00

--NB --
$6,500.00
$6,736.00
$6,500.00
$6,736.00
$6,836.00
$6,850.00
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ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER
SPECIFICATION #18

2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:

a. 25 horsepower gas engine

b. 7 gallon fuel tank

c. Positive feed oil system with spin on filter.
d. Heavy duty air cleaner

e. Electric start

2. DRIVE TRAIN/AXLES:

a. Hydraulic gear pumps
b. High torque wheel motors
c. Spin on hydraulic filters

3. DECK.:

. 60" heavy duty mower deck

. 3 blade spindles

. Belt driven

. Manual deck lift

e. 1" to 5" cutting height

f. Deck engagement electric clutch

o O

4. WHEELS:

a. Front wheels - 13x6-6 ribbed, minimum
b. Rear wheels - 24x11.5-12 turf

5. COMFORT & CONVENIENCE:

a. High back full suspension seat

. Adjustable steering/motion control levers
. Flip up hood

. Easy access operator controls

. ROPS bar

o o o

6. APPROXIMATE MACHINE DIMENSIONS:
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a. Length - 82"
b. Height - 72" with ROPS
¢. Width - 63" without chute

7. CONDITIONS:

a. In addition to equipment specified, mower will be equipped with all standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and shall comply with all EPA emission standards and all motor vehicle standards as

established by the U.S. Department of Transportation regarding the manufacture of motor vehicles.

. The successful bidder shall be responsible for delivering the unit properly serviced, clean and in first class operating
condition. Pre-delivery service at a minimum shall include the following:

c. Complete lubrication

d. Check all fluid levels

e. Adjustment of engine to proper operating condition

f. Inflate tires to proper pressure

g. Proper operation of all accessories.

o

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER
SPECIFICATION #18

2018 John Deere Z930M

The John Deere Z930M purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $8,925.00 $8,925.00 $8,550.00 $8,550.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

7920M !
7915E-48

7920M !
7915E-54 2

7915E !
7920M-48 2

7915E !
7920M-54 2

SUS. SEAT !
7930M-54 >

DECK !
661R-61 2

7915E !
652R-52 2

Order Code

Z930M
AG PRO COMPANIES LLC AG PRO COMPANIES LLC  Everglades Farm
Equipment
Western Northern Central
$8,925.00 $8,925.00 $8,550.00
Delete Options

Downgrade option - specify
23.5 KAWASAKI ENGINE. 60IN 7GUAGE STAMPED DECK. SUSPENSION SEAT. 1
Z915E 25HP KOHLER 48" 7 IRON DECK 2

Downgrade option - specify
23.5 KAWASAKI ENGINE. 54IN 7GUAGE STAMPED DECK. SUSPENSION SEAT. 1

Z915E 25HP KOHLER 54" 7 IRON DECK 2

Downgrade option - specify
25HP KOEHLER ENGINE. 60IN 7 GAUGE STAMPED DECK.
7920M 23.5 KAW, 48" 7 IRON DECK 2

Downgrade option - specify
25HP KOEHLER ENGINE. 54IN 7 GAUGE STAMPED DECK. |
7920M 23.5 KAW, 54" 7 IRON DECK 2

Delete option - specify
DELETE SUSPENSION SEAT 1

Z930M 23.5 HP KAW, 54" 7 IRON DECK 2

Delete option - specify
DOWNGRADE FROM 60IN TO 54IN DECK ON Z930M 1
661R 23.5 KAW STAND ON MODEL, 61" 7 GAUGE DECK 2

Delete option - specify
25HP KOEHLER ENGINE. 48IN 7 GAUGE STAMPED DECK. |
652R 23.5 KAW STAND ON MODEL, 52" 7 GAUGE IRON 2

Add Options

Everglades Farm
Equipment

Southern
$8,550.00

Western Central
& Northern & Southern

$175.00"  ($1,900.00)°

$375.00' | ($1,650.00)

$1,425.00'  ($900.00)*
$1,525.00' = ($700.00)°
$475.00'  ($400.00)*
$250.00'  ($400.00)*
$1,625.00'  ($900.00)°
Western Central

& Northern & Southern

add options.

the Vendor.

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

7950M !
7925M-54 2

7950M !
7950M-60 >

Upgrade - specify
27HP KAWASAKI ENGINE. 60IN 7 GUAGE STEEL STAMPED DECK. SUSPENSION SEAT. |
7925M 25HP KAW FLEX FUEL, 54" 7 IRON DECK 2

Upgrade - specify
27HP KAWASAKI ENGINE. 60IN 7 GUAGE STEEL STAMPED DECK. SUSPENSION SEAT. 1

Z950M 27HP KAW, 60" 7 IRON DECK 2

$9.325.00" $25.007

$9,825.00'  $150.00°
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Z997R !
7950M-72 2

Z997R !
Z960M-72 2

Z950R !
Z970R-72 2

MULCH ON
DEMAND '
7997R-60SD 2

TWEEL

Z997R-60RD 2

CANOPY !
7997R-72SD 2

WORK
LIGHTS '
1570 2

TRACH
BUCKET
HOLDER '
D722

HITCH KIT !
MULCH ON
DEMAND 2

JACK KIT !
BEACON 2

BUMPER !
SUSPENSION
SEAT 2

MULCH KIT !
PRO SEAT 2

MULCH KIT !
4WD 2

Z930M

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC AG PRO COMPANIES LLC  Everglades Farm
Equipment

Western Northern Central

$8,925.00 $8,925.00 $8,550.00

Upgrade - specify
37HP YANMAR DIESEL ENGINE. 60IN 7 GUAGE STEEL STAMPED DECK. SUSPENSION SEAT.
HYD DECK LIFT. ELECTRIC PTO SHUT OFF. 1

Z950M 27HP KAW, 72" 7 IRON DECK 2

Upgrade - specify
37HP YANMAR DIESEL ENGINE. 72IN 7 GUAGE STEEL STAMPED DECK. SUSPENSION SEAT.
HYD DECK LIFT. ELECTRIC PTO SHUT OFF. |

Z960M 31HP KAW, 72" 7 IRON DECK 2

Upgrade - specify
27HP KAWASAKI ENGINE. 60IN 7 GUAGE STEEL STAMPED DECK. SUSPENSION SEAT. HYD
DECK LIFT. ELECTRIC PTO SHUT OFF. 1

Z970R 35HP KAW, 72" 7 IRON DECK 2

Optional equipment - specify
UPGRADE TO MULCH ON DEMAND DECK 1

Z997R 37HP DIESEL 60" SIDE DISCHARGE 7 IRON DECK (THIS IS A TOTAL PRICE) 2

Optional equipment - specify
UPGRADE TO MICHELIN TWEEL TIRES |

Z997R 37HP DIESEL, 60" REAR DISCHARGE 7 GAUGE (THIS IS A TOTAL PRICE) 2

Optional equipment - specify
ADD CANOPY 1
Z997R 37HP DIESEL, 72" SIDE DISHARGE, 7 IRON DECK (THIS IS A TOTAL PRICE) 2

Optional equipment - specify
FRONT WORK LIGHTS 1

1570 TERRAINCUT FRONT MOWER (LESS DECK) (THIS IS A TOTAL PRICE) 2

Optional equipment - specify
TRASH BUCKET HOLDER. 1

72" 7 IRON PRO COMMERCIAL SIDE DISCHARGE MOWER DECK FOR 1500 SERIES MOWER
(THIS IS A TOTAL PRICE) 2

Optional equipment - specify
HITCHKIT |
MULCH/SIDE DISCHARGE COMBO DECK, 54" & 60" (FACTORY ORDER ONLY) 2

Optional equipment - specify
JACK KIT 1

BEACON LIGHT & BRACKET 2

Optional equipment - specify
CAST IRON REAR BUMPER 1

ISOLATION SUSPENSION SEAT 2

Optional equipment - specify
54IN DECK MULCH KIT 1
PRO ADJUSTABLE FULL SUSPENSION SEAT-STD ON Z930 BASE SPEC 2

Optional equipment - specify
60IN DECK MULCH KIT |

4WD OPTION FOR 1570 FRONT MOWER 2

$17,650.00"

$17,975.00"

$10,750.00"

Everglades Farm
Equipment

Southern
$8,550.00

$825.00" | $17,175.00°

$825.00' | $17,625.00°

$500.00" ' $17,500.00°

$340.00" | $18,900.00°

$130.00"

$70.00"

$230.00"

$400.00"

$435.00"

$455.00"
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$600.00>

$1,100.00°

$3,050.00°

$3,975.00°

$860.00°

$400.00°

$195.00°

$460.00°

$2,900.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

BEACON
LIGHT '
CANOPY 2

DISCOUNT !
1575 2

MULCH
KIT-54/60 >

TWEEL
WHEEL 2

DUAL WHEEL
CONVERSION 2

4 POST
CANOPY 2

WINDSHIELD
FOR 4 POST
ROPS 2

10%
DISCOUNT 2

2
YR/UNLIMITED
HRS?

3 YR/LIMITED 2

Z930M

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC AG PRO COMPANIES LLC

Western
$8,925.00

Optional equipment - specify
AMBER BEACON LIGHT 1
CANOPY WITH MOUNTING BRACKET-Z900 SERIES ONLY-INSTALLED 2

Optional equipment - specify
10% DISCOUNT OFF MSRP OF JOHN DEERE MOWERS AND ATTACHMENTS NOT LISTED ON

CONTRACT. 1

Northern
$8,925.00

Everglades Farm
Equipment

Central
$8,550.00

1575 TERRAINCUT FRONT MOWER CAB & AIR (LESS DECK) (THIS IS A TOTAL PRICE) 2

Optional equipment - specify
MUCLH KIT FOR 54"-60" 7 IRON DECK 2

Optional equipment - specify

TWEEL WHEEL FOR 7900 FACTORY ORDER 2

Optional equipment - specify

DUAL WHEELS FOR 1500 FRONT MOWER 2

Optional equipment - specify

4 POST CANOPY FOR 1500 SERIES MOWERS 2

Optional equipment - specify

WINDSHIELD FOR 4 POST ROPS ON 1500 SERIES 2

Optional equipment - specify

DISCOUNT OFF MSRP ON OPTIONS & OPTIONAL NON-SPECIFIED MODELS PER SPEC# 18.

INCLUDES ANY FREIGHT AND REQUIRED INSTALLATION COSTS 2

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify
3 YEAR 1200 WARRANTY ON ALL E AND M MODELS. NO HOUR LIMIT FOR FIRST 24 MONTHS. 1

7900 SERIES ONLY-TRANSPORTATION NOT INCLUDED 2

Warranty - specify

3 YEAR 1500 HOUR WARRANTY ON R MODEL MOWERS. NO HOUR LIMIT FOR FIRST 24

MONTHS. 1

3YR OR 1200-1500 HRS BASED ON Z900 SERIES ONLY -TRANSPORTATION NOT INLUDED 2

Everglades Farm

Equipment

Southern
$8,550.00

$300.00"

Incl.1

NA
NA
NA
NA

NA

NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

Std'

Std!

$550.00°

$28,000.00°

$450.00°

$800.00°

$800.00°

$1,900.00>

$550.00°
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ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER
SPECIFICATION #18

2018 John Deere Z930M

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The John Deere Z930M purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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