
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 WHEEL DRIVE) (Specification #23)

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC 2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim
Boom Mower Western $112,900.00

2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim
Boom Mower Western -- NB --

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC 2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim
Boom Mower Northern $112,700.00

2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim
Boom Mower Northern -- NB --

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC 2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim
Boom Mower Central $112,400.00

2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim
Boom Mower Central -- NB --

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC 2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim
Boom Mower Southern $112,400.00

2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim
Boom Mower Southern -- NB --

2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond
Boom Mower Western -- NB --

2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond
Boom Mower Western -- NB --

2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond
Boom Mower Northern -- NB --

2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond
Boom Mower Northern -- NB --

2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond
Boom Mower Central -- NB --

2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond
Boom Mower Central -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond
Boom Mower Southern $135,667.00

2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond
Boom Mower Southern -- NB --

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover
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ALAMO INDUSTRIAL 2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower Western $132,599.00

 2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower Western -- NB --

ALAMO INDUSTRIAL 2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower Northern $132,599.00

 2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower Northern -- NB --

ALAMO INDUSTRIAL 2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower Central $132,599.00

 2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower Central -- NB --

ALAMO INDUSTRIAL 2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower Southern $132,599.00

 2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower Southern -- NB --

 

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower Western $138,900.00

 2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower Western -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower Northern $138,900.00

 2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower Northern -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower Central $138,900.00

 2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower Central -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower Southern $138,900.00

 2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower Southern -- NB --

 

Terrain King Corporation 2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower Western $124,544.00

 2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower Western -- NB --

Terrain King Corporation 2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower Northern $124,544.00

 2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower Northern -- NB --

Terrain King Corporation 2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower Central $124,544.00

 2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower Central -- NB --

Terrain King Corporation 2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower Southern $124,544.00
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 2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower Southern -- NB --

 

 2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower Western -- NB --

 2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower Western -- NB --

 2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower Northern -- NB --

 2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower Northern -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower Central $138,354.00

 2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower Central -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower Southern $138,354.00

 2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 WHEEL DRIVE)
SPECIFICATION #23

2018 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Boom Mower 
2018 Challenger MT465 with Diamond Boom Mower 
2018 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial Mower 
2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower 
2018 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King KB2300 Boom Mower 
2018 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with Diamond Boom Mower 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED. 

ENGINE:1.

Liquid cooled diesel with minimum of 95 PTO hp @ 2200 rpm.a.

TRANSMISSION:2.

Synchroshuttle type with a minimum of 16 forward and 16 reverse speeds.a.

FUEL TANK:3.

Minimum 38 gallon capacity.a.

BRAKES:4.

Oil cooled hydraulic.a.

POWER TAKE OFF:5.

Speeds RPM - 540/1000a.

HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:6.

Closed center system with standard remotes.a.
Maximum pressure psi - 2,900b.
Standard output @ remote 17 gpmc.
Total of 29 gpm combined flowd.

POINT HITCH:7.

Category IIa.
Telescopic stabilizersb.
SAE lift capacity @ 24" standard lbs. - 5,000c.
Lower draft arm link ends - extendabled.

TIRES:8.

Not less than 13.6R24 R1 rear radialsa.
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Not less than 18.4R30 6 Ply F2 b.

MOUNTED BOOM MOWER:9.

Minimum 23' boom reach.a.
Forward and reverse swing break away.b.
Integral frame.c.
Separate hydraulic circuit for mower head.d.
5' rotary cutter head.e.
Disc or bar type blade holder.f.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 WHEEL DRIVE)
SPECIFICATION #23

2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower
The John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as
specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part
of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $138,900.00 $138,900.00 $138,900.00 $138,900.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
JD 6110M 1 Downgrade model - specify 

Downgrade to John Deere model 6110M tractor, ILO JD 6120M offered in our base bid 1 
($4,211.00)1

Downgrade model - specify NA 
2-WHEEL 1 Downgrade to 2 wheel drive 

Downgrade to 2-wheel drive, ILO standard 4-wheel drive 1 
($7,965.00)1

BB18 1 Downgrade to a 20' boom reach 
Downgrade to 20' boom reach 1 

($2,000.00)1

JD
6110M/BB18/50 1 

Downgrade - specify 
Downgrade to John Deere model 6110M tractor, equipped with Tiger Bengal BB18 boom, and 50" rotary mower 1 

($12,950.00)1

Downgrade - specify NA 
Optional equipment delete - specify NA 
Optional equipment delete - specify NA 

Non-Specified
Options Discount
15% 1 

Optional equipment delete - specify 
Discount Option: A discount of 15% off manufacturer's current published retail price will be applied to all non-specified
factory options, on base units and any optional models.  1 

NA1

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Saber 25 1 Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere 6145M tractor, equipped with 25' Tiger Saber boom, and 60" rotary head 1 

$37,350.001

Saber 30 1 Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere 6145M tractor, equipped with 30' Tiger Saber boom, and 60" rotary head 1 

$41,650.001

Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Enclosed cab with heating and air conditioning 
Enclose cab with heat and air conditioning 1 

Std1

Air suspension seat cab only 
Standard equipment 1 

Std1

VEHICLE: 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower
DEALER: Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $138,900.00 $138,900.00 $138,900.00 $138,900.00
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AM/FM 1 AM/FM stereo with cassette and quartz clock 
AM/FM radio with speakers 1 

$293.001

W-W BEACON 1 Rear washer/wiper, rotating beacon 
Rear wiper, rear washer, and strobe light 1 

$1,240.001

4-wheel drive 
Four wheel drive is standard (please refer to 2-wheel drive deduct option) 1 

Std1

OHA 1 Oscillating hydraulic assist front axle 
Oscillating hydraulic assist on front axle 1 

$1,147.001

CVT transmission with constant velocity NA 
3 spool valve and selector NA 
Additional fuel tank NA 
Telescopic mirrors NA 

TV TIRES 1 Treleborg 22 ply tires or equivalent 
Treleborg 22 ply tires 1 

$15,976.001

High capacity air cleaner 
High capacity air cleaner 1 

Std1

Saber 25 #1 1 25' boom mower with rotary 5' cutting head 
Upgrade to John Deere 6145M tractor, equipped with 25' Tiger Saber boom, and 60" rotary head 1 

$37,350.001

Saber 25 #2 1 25' boom mower with rotary 5' flail cutting head 
Upgrade to John Deere 6145M tractor, equipped with 25' Tiger Saber boom, and 63" flail mower head 1 

$38,150.001

Additional required wheel weights for boom mower 
Additional wheel weights standard 1 

Std1

Headmount, 15 degree offset NA 
Non-Specified
Options Discount
15% 1 

Electronic 3 point hitch control 
Discount Option: A discount of 15% off manufacturer's current published retail price will be applied to all non-specified
factory options, on base units and any optional models.  1 

NA1

WIPER
WASHER 1 

Optional equipment - specify 
Add rear window wiper and washer 1 

$722.001

STROBE 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Add strobe light, installed 1 

$517.001

FUEL CAP
LOCK 1 

Optional equipment - specify 
Add lockable fuel cap 1 

$49.001

PMP/JD 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Parts manual, paper version, for John Deere tractor 1 

$392.001

CMP/JD 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Service manual, paper version, for John Deere tractor 1 

$280.001

GPG 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Grill and pump guard 1 

$340.001

HLC 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Lockable hydraulic reservoir cap 1 

$53.001

VEHICLE: 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower
DEALER: Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $138,900.00 $138,900.00 $138,900.00 $138,900.00
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R/A 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Reverse alarm 1 

$382.001

JSTK 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Upgrade to joystick electro/hydraulic mower controls 1 

$6,977.001

Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 

Non-Specified
Options Discount
15% 1 

Optional equipment - specify 
Discount Option: A discount of 15% off manufacturer's current published retail price will be applied to all non-specified
factory options, on base units and any optional models.  1 

NA1

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA 
Temporary tag NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Please call for quote. 1 

NA1

Maintenance Plan - specify 
Please call for quote. 1 

NA1

Extended warranty – 3rd & 4th years 
Please call for quote. 1 

NA1

Extended warranty – 3rd year 
Please call for quote. 1 

NA1

VEHICLE: 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower
DEALER: Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $138,900.00 $138,900.00 $138,900.00 $138,900.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 WHEEL DRIVE)
SPECIFICATION #23

2018 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as
specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part
of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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