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Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER (Specification #18)

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

GHC Motorsports

GHC Motorsports

GHC Motorsports

GHC Motorsports

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC

Everglades Farm Equipment

Everglades Farm Equipment

Futch's Tractor Depot

Futch's Tractor Depot

2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100

2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR

2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 John Deere Z930M

2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

$7,873.00
- NB --
$7,873.00
- NB --
$7,873.00
—-NB --
$7,873.00
- NB --

$6,855.00
- NB --
$6,802.00
- NB --
$6,747.00
—-NB --
$6,747.00
- NB --

$8,925.00
- NB --
$8,925.00
- NB --
$8,550.00
—-NB --
$8,550.00
- NB --

$7,819.00

—-NB --
$7,819.00
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 18.pdf

Futch's Tractor Depot

Futch's Tractor Depot

Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Futch's Tractor Depot

ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Futch's Tractor Depot

ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.
ALT - Creel Tractor Company

2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Gravely Proturn 260

2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central
Southern

Southern

- NB --
$7,819.00
- NB --
$7,819.00
—-NB --

$6,836.00

--NB --
$6,500.00
$6,736.00
$6,500.00
$6,736.00
$6,836.00
$6,850.00
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ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER
SPECIFICATION #18

2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100
2018 Dixie Chopper 2560 BR
2018 John Deere Z930M
2018 Gravely Proturn 260
2018 Kubota Z725KH-60

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:

a. 25 horsepower gas engine

b. 7 gallon fuel tank

c. Positive feed oil system with spin on filter.
d. Heavy duty air cleaner

e. Electric start

2. DRIVE TRAIN/AXLES:

a. Hydraulic gear pumps
b. High torque wheel motors
c. Spin on hydraulic filters

3. DECK.:

. 60" heavy duty mower deck

. 3 blade spindles

. Belt driven

. Manual deck lift

e. 1" to 5" cutting height

f. Deck engagement electric clutch

o O

4. WHEELS:

a. Front wheels - 13x6-6 ribbed, minimum
b. Rear wheels - 24x11.5-12 turf

5. COMFORT & CONVENIENCE:

a. High back full suspension seat

. Adjustable steering/motion control levers
. Flip up hood

. Easy access operator controls

. ROPS bar

o o o

6. APPROXIMATE MACHINE DIMENSIONS:
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a. Length - 82"
b. Height - 72" with ROPS
¢. Width - 63" without chute

7. CONDITIONS:

a. In addition to equipment specified, mower will be equipped with all standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and shall comply with all EPA emission standards and all motor vehicle standards as

established by the U.S. Department of Transportation regarding the manufacture of motor vehicles.

. The successful bidder shall be responsible for delivering the unit properly serviced, clean and in first class operating
condition. Pre-delivery service at a minimum shall include the following:

c. Complete lubrication

d. Check all fluid levels

e. Adjustment of engine to proper operating condition

f. Inflate tires to proper pressure

g. Proper operation of all accessories.

o

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER
SPECIFICATION #18

2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100

The Bad Boy Outlaw 6100 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $7,873.00 $7,873.00 $7,873.00 $7,873.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE: Outlaw 6100

DEALER: Sarasota Fun Machines Inc. Sarasota Fun Machines Inc. Sarasota Fun Machines Inc. Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $7,873.00 $7.873.00 $7,873.00 $7,873.00
Order Code Delete Options All Zones
BBE48KT740 ! Downgrade option - specify $1,740.001

25 HP Kohler with a 48" deck. 1

BBEG6025KO ! Downgrade option - specify $1,642.001
25 HP Kohler with 60" deck. |

BBO42FX691 |  Downgrade option - specit;y $761.00"
22 HP Kawasaki with 42" deck.

BBS61FX730 ! Downgrade option - specify $847.00"
24 HP Kawasaki with a 61" deck. 1

Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify

Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

BBOG61FX730 !  Upgrade - specify $392.00"
24 HP Kawasaki 61" deck. |

BBOG61FX850 |  Upgrade - specify $705.00"
27 HP Kawasaki 61" deck. 1

BBX61FX850 ! Upgrade - specify $1,544.001
27 HP Kawasaki with full suspension and a 61" deck. 1

BBX6133YA ! Upgrade - specify $2,130.00"
33 HP Yamaha EFI with full suspension and a 61" deck. 1

BBD61247CA ! Upgrade - specify $5,874.00"
24 HP Cat/Perkins with a 61" deck. 1

BBD7235CA ! Optional equipment - specify $7,734.001
35 HP Cat/Perkins with a 72" deck. 1

022-1050-00 ! Optional equipment - specify $135.00"
no flat front tire (1) dealer installed 1

088-6000-00 ! Optional equipment - specify $250.00"
60-72" Advanced Chute System 1

088-6006-00 | Optional equipment - specify $250.00"
48-54" Advanced Chute System 1
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

210-0061-00 !
210-0061-00 !
088-1025-00 !
088-4050-00 '

088-1007-00 '

Outlaw 6100

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

Western
$7,873.00

Optional equipment - specify
61" Mulch Kit dealer installed. 1

Optional equipment - specify
72" Mulch kit dealer installed. 1

Optional equipment - specify
Hard Top canopy dealer installed. 1

Optional equipment - S}%ecify

work basket dealer installed

Optional equipment - specify
LED light kit dealer installed 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

Sarasota Fun Machines Inc. Sarasota Fun Machines Inc. Sarasota Fun Machines Inc.

Northern
$7,873.00

Central
$7,873.00

Southern
$7,873.00

BBE series mowers Warranty is 2 years or 400 hours. On all other bid models the warranty is 2 year unlimited hours. 1

Warranty - specify

Engine warranties are from 2 to 3 years on available engines. 1

$386.00"

$386.00"

$553.00"

$225.00"

$315.00"
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ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER
SPECIFICATION #18

2018 Bad Boy Outlaw 6100

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Bad Boy Outlaw 6100 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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