
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

MOTORGRADER (Specification #33)

Trekker Group 2018 Case 865B Western $194,674.00
2018 Case 865B Western -- NB --

Trekker Group 2018 Case 865B Northern $185,404.00
2018 Case 865B Northern -- NB --

Trekker Group 2018 Case 865B Central $185,404.00
2018 Case 865B Central -- NB --

Trekker Group 2018 Case 865B Southern $185,404.00
2018 Case 865B Southern -- NB --

2018 Caterpillar 120M Western -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 120M Western -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 120M Northern -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 120M Northern -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 120M Central -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 120M Central -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 Caterpillar 120M Southern $197,156.00
2018 Caterpillar 120M Southern -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 620G Western $181,949.00
2018 John Deere 620G Western -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 620G Northern $181,949.00
2018 John Deere 620G Northern -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 620G Central $181,949.00
2018 John Deere 620G Central -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 620G Southern $181,949.00
2018 John Deere 620G Southern -- NB --

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

MOTORGRADER
SPECIFICATION #33

2018 Case 865B 
2018 Caterpillar 120M 
2018 John Deere 620G 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED. 

ENGINE:1.

Liquid cooled 6 cylinder diesel with minimum of 140 net hp @ 1900 RPM..a.

TRANSMISSION:2.

Power shift with direct drive.a.
Minimum 8 forward and 4 reverse speeds.b.

BRAKES:3.

Wet multiple disc.a.

STEERING & ARTICULATION:4.

Front steer plus articulated.a.
Minimum articulation 20 degrees.b.

MOLDBOARD:5.

Minimum 12 ft. long.a.

OPERATOR ENVIRONMENT:6.

Low profile cab.a.
Cloth adjustable seats.b.
Gauges including hour meter, fuel, articulation, engine coolant temperature.c.

TIRES:7.

Minimum 13.0 – 24 10 PR 9" single piece rim.a.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
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THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

MOTORGRADER
SPECIFICATION #33

2018 John Deere 620G
The John Deere 620G purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $181,949.00 $181,949.00 $181,949.00 $181,949.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Downgrade model - specify NA 
Downgrade model - specify NA 
Downgrade model - specify NA 
Downgrade model - specify NA 
Optional equipment delete - specify NA 
Optional equipment delete - specify NA 

Non-Specified
Options
Discount
25% 1 

Optional equipment delete - specify 
Discount Option: A discount of 25% off manufacturer's current published retail price will be applied to all non-specified
factory options, on base units and any optional models.  1 

NA1

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

JD 670G 1 Upgrade to 155 hp motorgrader 
Upgrade to John Deere model 670G, 6x4 motor grader 1 

$20,401.001

JD 622G 1 Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere model 622G, 6x6 motor grader 1 

$30,951.001

JD 672G 1 Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere model 672G, 6x6 motor grader 1 

$57,401.001

JD 770G 1 Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere model 770G, 6x4 motor grader 1 

$41,351.001

JD 772G 1 Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere model 772G, 6x6 motor grader 1 

$78,951.001

High profile cab NA 
7130 1 Cab mounted lights 

Add ten (10) grading lights. 1 
$753.001

Lower opening windows High profile cab NA 
5030 1 Lower opening windows Low profile cab 

Opening lower front and side windows. 1 
$855.001

8410 1 AM/FM radio with cassette 
AM/FM/WB radio with speakers. 1 

$676.001

VEHICLE: 620G
DEALER: Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $181,949.00 $181,949.00 $181,949.00 $181,949.00
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Air conditioning with 75 amp alternator 
Comes standard with a 130 amp alternator. 1 

Std1

Warning lights - specify 
Comes standard with LED hazard lights. 1 

Std1

Contour suspension seat 
Standard equipment. 1 

Std1

9130 1 Rear sunshade 
Rear retractable sunshade 1 

$153.001

Outside mounted mirrors 
Standard equipment. 1 

Std1

2820 1 Circle drive slip clutch 
Single input gearbox with slip clutch. 1 

$1,892.001

Secondary steering NA 
2050 1 14 foot moldboard 

14' Moldboard, ILO standard 12' moldboard 1 
$931.001

Front Scarifier – straight 
Please refer to option listed below 1 

NA1

6720/6520 1 Front Scarifier – V type 
Front mounted scarifier, and required auxiliary function control 1 

$7,359.001

Tires 15.5 – 25 12 PR single piece rim NA 
4616 1 Tires 17.5 – 25 12 PR single piece rim 

17.5 x 25 L-2 tires mounted on single piece rims. 1 
$6,785.001

1020 1 Multi-purpose attachments - specify 
GP Grade-Pro armrest controls. 1 

$21,202.001

1030 1 Multi-purpose attachments - specify 
Dual joystick controls. 1 

$21,202.001

6010 1 Multi-purpose attachments - specify 
Powered cab air pre-cleaner 1 

$636.001

1910 1 Multi-purpose attachments - specify 
Blade impact absorption system 1 

$2,488.001

5510 1 Multi-purpose attachments - specify 
Auto-Shift transmission 1 

$1,289.001

6730/6525 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Mid-Mounted scarifier 1 

$12,400.001

7160 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Upgrade to deluxe grading light system, includes eighteen (18) lights. 1 

$1,191.001

7180 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Upgrade to premium LED grading light system, includes eighteen (18) LED lights. 1 

$3,360.001

8310 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Lower front window wipers and washers 1 

$460.001

1310 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Quick fluid service drains 1 

$462.001

VEHICLE: 620G
DEALER: Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $181,949.00 $181,949.00 $181,949.00 $181,949.00
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6710 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Front push block for use on JD 670-770, and 672-772 motor graders, weighs 2,950 lbs. 1 

$2,881.001

6715 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Front push block for use on JD 620-622 motor graders, weighs 2,000 lbs. 1 

$1,954.001

6820 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Rear counterweight, with hitch and pin. 1 

$1,823.001

7610 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Reversing fan drive. 1 

$525.001

8810 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Rear view camera. 1 

$1,750.001

9120 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Sun visor, front 1 

$103.001

9273 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Right side engine compartment work light. 1 

$161.001

9298 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Rotating beacon strobe light (right side) 1 

$467.001

9299 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Rotating beacon strobe light (left side) 1 

$467.001

Non-Specified
Options
Discount
25% 1 

Optional equipment - specify 
Discount Option: A discount of 25% off manufacturer's current published retail price will be applied to all non-specified
factory options, on base units and any optional models.  1 

NA1

Temporary tag NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Please call for quote. 1 

NA1

Maintenance Plan - specify 
Please call for quote. 1 

NA1

Warranty - specify 
Please call for quote. 1 

NA1

Warranty - specify 
Please call for quote. 1 

NA1

VEHICLE: 620G
DEALER: Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc. Nortrax, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $181,949.00 $181,949.00 $181,949.00 $181,949.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

MOTORGRADER
SPECIFICATION #33

2018 John Deere 620G

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The John Deere 620G purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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