
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 LB CAPACITY (Specification #66)

2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Western -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Western -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Northern -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Northern -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Central -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Central -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Southern $22,268.00
2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Southern -- NB --

2018 Hyster S40-FT Western -- NB --
2018 Hyster S40-FT Western -- NB --
2018 Hyster S40-FT Northern -- NB --
2018 Hyster S40-FT Northern -- NB --
2018 Hyster S40-FT Central -- NB --
2018 Hyster S40-FT Central -- NB --
2018 Hyster S40-FT Southern -- NB --
2018 Hyster S40-FT Southern -- NB --

2018 Mitsubishi FG25 Western -- NB --
2018 Mitsubishi FG25 Western -- NB --
2018 Mitsubishi FG25 Northern -- NB --
2018 Mitsubishi FG25 Northern -- NB --
2018 Mitsubishi FG25 Central -- NB --
2018 Mitsubishi FG25 Central -- NB --
2018 Mitsubishi FG25 Southern -- NB --
2018 Mitsubishi FG25 Southern -- NB --

Southern States Toyotalift 2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 Western $22,635.00
2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 Western -- NB --

Southern States Toyotalift 2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 Northern $22,635.00

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover
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2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 Northern -- NB --
Southern States Toyotalift 2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 Central $22,635.00

2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 Central -- NB --
Southern States Toyotalift 2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 Southern $22,635.00

2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 LB CAPACITY
SPECIFICATION #66

2018 Caterpillar 2CC4000 
2018 Hyster S40-FT 
2018 Mitsubishi FG25 
2018 Toyota 8FGCU20 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

ENGINE:1.

50 hp LP gas enginea.

TRANSMISSION:2.

Powershift typea.
Inching pedalb.
1 speed forward, 1 speed reversec.

HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:3.

19.0 gpm at 2250 psia.

CHASSIS:4.

Wheelbase - 46"a.
Tread width - 33" (with standard tires)b.
Ground clearance at lowest point - 3"c.
Tire size:d.
Front - 18.0 x 7 x 12 cushion tiree.
Rear - 14.0 x 5 x 10 cushion tiref.
Steering radius - 72"g.
Brakes:h.
Hydraulic service brakesi.
Mechanical parking brakej.

LIFT:5.

Two stage lift masta.
Lift height minimum - 130"b.
Lift capacity - 4000 lbs.c.
Fork spacing - 7" to 32" minimumd.
Tilt - 5 degrees forward/10 degrees backwarde.

MISCELLANEOUS:6.

FOPS protectiona.
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Work lightsb.
Seat beltsc.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 LB CAPACITY
SPECIFICATION #66

2018 Toyota 8FGCU20
The Toyota 8FGCU20 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $22,635.00 $22,635.00 $22,635.00 $22,635.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
8FGCU15 1 Downgrade to 3000 lb. lift truck 

3000 LB Capacity cushion tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$1,617.001

8FGU15 1 Downgrade model - specify 
3000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$1,200.001

8FGCU18 1 Downgrade model - specify 
3000 LB Capacity cushion tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$250.001

8FBCU25 1 Optional equipment delete - specify 
5000 LB Capacity cushion tire four wheel electric forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep only. Does NOT
include battery or charger. All non-specified options will be at Manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$459.001

8FBEU20 1 Optional equipment delete - specify 
4000 LB Capacity cushion tire three wheel electric forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep only. Does NOT
include battery or charger. All non-specified options will be at Manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$943.001

Optional equipment delete - specify NA 
 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

8FGCU25 1 Upgrade to 5000 lb. lift truck 
5000 LB Capacity cushion tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$1,217.001

8FGCU30 1 Upgrade to 6000 lb. lift truck 
6000 LB Capacity cushion tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$4,447.001

8FGU18 1 Model upgrade - specify 
3500 LB Capacity pneumatic tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$923.001

8FGU20 1 Model upgrade - specify 
4000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$2,237.001

8FGU25 1 Optional equipment - specify 
5000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$3,153.001

8FGU30 1 Optional equipment - specify 
6000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$5,948.001

VEHICLE: 8FGCU20
DEALER: Southern States Toyotalift Southern States Toyotalift Southern States Toyotalift Southern States Toyotalift
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $22,635.00 $22,635.00 $22,635.00 $22,635.00
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8FDU25 1 Optional equipment - specify 
5000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire DIESEL forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options
will be manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$9,034.001

8FDU30 1 Optional equipment - specify 
6000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire DIESEL forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options
will be manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$11,384.001

8FG35U 1 Optional equipment - specify 
8000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$17,448.001

8FD35U 1 Optional equipment - specify 
8000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire DIESEL forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options
will be manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$18,469.001

8FG40U 1 Optional equipment - specify 
9000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$19,100.001

8FD40U 1 Optional equipment - specify 
9000 LB Capacity pneumatic tire DIESEL forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options
will be manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$21,647.001

8FG70U 1 Optional equipment - specify 
15,500 LB Capacity pneumatic tire forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options will be
manufacturers net plus 10% 1 

$34,343.001

8FD70U 1 Optional equipment - specify 
15,500 LB Capacity pneumatic tire DIESEL forklift, Includes base chassis with freight and prep. All non-specified options
will be manufacturers net plus 10 1 

$36,400.001

Temporary tag NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Warranty - specify 
12 month or 2,000 hours, whichever occurs first: Basic. 36 months or 6000 hours whichever occurs first: Powertrain 1 

Std1

Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: 8FGCU20
DEALER: Southern States Toyotalift Southern States Toyotalift Southern States Toyotalift Southern States Toyotalift
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $22,635.00 $22,635.00 $22,635.00 $22,635.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 LB CAPACITY
SPECIFICATION #66

2018 Toyota 8FGCU20

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Toyota 8FGCU20 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 

2719




