



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership	Type of Vehicle	Zone	Base Unit Price
<u>RUBBER TIRE MATERIAL HANDLER, 48,000 LB OPERATING WEIGHT (Specification #68)</u>			
Kelly Tractor	2018 Caterpillar MH3022	Western	-- NB --
	2018 Caterpillar MH3022	Western	-- NB --
	2018 Caterpillar MH3022	Northern	-- NB --
	2018 Caterpillar MH3022	Northern	-- NB --
	2018 Caterpillar MH3022	Central	-- NB --
	2018 Caterpillar MH3022	Central	-- NB --
	2018 Caterpillar MH3022	★ Southern	\$258,006.00
	2018 Caterpillar MH3022	Southern	-- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc.	2018 Sennebogen 818E	★ Western	\$267,378.00
	2018 Sennebogen 818E	Western	-- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc.	2018 Sennebogen 818E	★ Northern	\$267,378.00
	2018 Sennebogen 818E	Northern	-- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc.	2018 Sennebogen 818E	★ Central	\$267,378.00
	2018 Sennebogen 818E	Central	-- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc.	2018 Sennebogen 818E	Southern	\$267,378.00
	2018 Sennebogen 818E	Southern	-- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

RUBBER TIRE MATERIAL HANDLER, 48,000 LB OPERATING WEIGHT SPECIFICATION #68

2018 Caterpillar MH3022

2018 Sennebogen 818E

**THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.**

1. ENGINE

- a. Tier IV Final Diesel Engine - 132 hp
- b. Spin on Filters
- c. Two Stage Air Cleaner

2. WEIGHT

- a. Minimum Operating Weight - 48,000 lbs

3. TRAVEL SYSTEM

- a. 2-speed - 0-3.0 mph/0-12.0 mph

4. HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

- a. Main Hydraulic System flow 80 GPM

5. UNDERCARRIAGE

- a. Two axles with all wheel drive
- b. 8 - 10:00X20 Solid Tires

6. OPERATING STATION

- a. Cab to be climate controlled with pressurized filtration
- b. Hydraulic elevating cab
- c. Sliding door window and tilt out front window
- d. Tinted windows with safety glass
- e. Adjustable suspension seat with safety belt and seat heater
- f. Catwalk with handrail
- g. Fire extinguisher
- h. Rear view and right view camera system
- i. Halogen work lights on roof cap

7. WORKING EQUIPMENT

- a. Purpose built material handling boom and stick
- b. Safety check valves on boom and stick cylinders

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A CONFIRMING QUOTE.



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

RUBBER TIRE MATERIAL HANDLER, 48,000 LB OPERATING WEIGHT SPECIFICATION #68

2018 Sennebogen 818E

The Sennebogen 818E purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	★ Western	★ Northern	★ Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	\$267,378.00	\$267,378.00	\$267,378.00	\$267,378.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

VEHICLE:	818E			
DEALER:	GS Equipment, Inc.	GS Equipment, Inc.	GS Equipment, Inc.	GS Equipment, Inc.
ZONE:	★ Western	★ Northern	★ Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	\$267,378.00	\$267,378.00	\$267,378.00	\$267,378.00

Order Code Add Options

All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer's Standard Retail Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions, Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

821M ¹	Add Options - Specify <i>132 HP, 52,800 LBS¹</i>	\$15,332.00 ¹
825M ¹	Add Options - Specify <i>175HP, 61,600 LBS¹</i>	\$68,308.00 ¹
MAGGEN ¹	Add Options - Specify <i>GENERATOR FOR MAGNET¹</i>	\$14,394.00 ¹
	Add Options - Specify	NA
	Add Options - Specify	NA
BASE ¹	Add Options - Specify <i>1 YR/2,000 FULL MACHINE WARRANTY¹</i>	Std ¹
	Delete Options - Specify	NA
	Delete Options - Specify	NA
	Delete Options - Specify	NA



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION & FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

RUBBER TIRE MATERIAL HANDLER, 48,000 LB OPERATING WEIGHT SPECIFICATION #68

2018 Sennebogen 818E

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Sennebogen 818E purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.