
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

TELESCOPIC EXCAVATOR, WHEELED 6X6 - 47,000 LB OPERATING WEIGHT (Specification #44)
 
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Gradall XL4100 Western $404,107.00
 2018 Gradall XL4100 Western -- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Gradall XL4100 Northern $404,107.00
 2018 Gradall XL4100 Northern -- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Gradall XL4100 Central $404,107.00
 2018 Gradall XL4100 Central -- NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Gradall XL4100 Southern $404,107.00
 2018 Gradall XL4100 Southern -- NB --
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 44.pdf


FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

TELESCOPIC EXCAVATOR, WHEELED 6X6 - 47,000 LB OPERATING
WEIGHT 

SPECIFICATION #44
2018 Gradall XL4100 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED. 

WEIGHT:1.

Minimum operating weight 47,000 lbs.a.

CARRIER:2.

Carrier Engine:a.
6 cylinder turbocharged diesel 250 hp at 2200 rpmb.
Spin on type filtersc.
Two stage air cleanerd.
24 volt 70 amp alternatore.
Carrier Transmission & Clutch:f.
6 speed automatic transmissiong.
Carrier Transfer Case:h.
1 to 1 transfer casei.
Front axle disconnectj.
Carrier Cab:k.
One person cabl.
Air ride seatm.
Heater, air condition, and defrostern.
2 speed windshield wiperso.
Tinted glassp.
Isolated and acoustic linedq.
Gauges to monitor engine functionsr.
Frame:s.
Sized for GVW and stress of mounted upper structuret.
Bolt on front bumperu.
Desiccant type, spin on type, air dryerv.
Fuel tank 50 gallon minimumw.
Safety:x.
Electric horny.
West coast mirrors with convex spot mirrorsa`.
Tow hooksaa.
Fire extinguisherab.
Backup alarmac.
Front Axle:ad.
16,000 front drive axleae.
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Leaf spring suspensionaf.
16.5x5 "S" cam brakesag.
Automatic slack adjusterah.
Integral power steeringai.
Hydraulic axle lockoutsaj.
425/65R22.5 on/off road tiresak.
Rear Axle:al.
Tandem axles 40,000 lb. ratedam.
Hendrickson rear suspensionan.
16.5x7 "S" cam brakesao.
Automatic slack adjustersap.
11R 24.5 traction type tiresaq.

UPPER STRUCTURE:3.

Hydraulic System:a.
80 HP drive motorb.
44 HP swing motorc.
Automatic swing park braked.
50 gallon oil reservoire.
Spin on hydraulic filtersf.
Swing speed 8 RPMg.
Hydraulic Remote Control:h.
Travel and steering controls in upper structure cabi.
Automatic brakes and axle lockoutsj.
Movement alarmk.
Upper Structure Cab:l.
Isolated and acoustic linedm.
Tinted safety glassn.
Adjustable operators seato.
Heater, air condition, and defrosterp.
Work lightsq.
Wipers and washersr.
Mirrors on left and rights.
Skylightt.
Upper Structure Control:u.
Electronic joysticks on adjustable pedestalsv.
Engine monitoring lights or gauge with audible warning or automatic shutdownw.
Pedals for steering and travelx.
Low/high travel switchy.
Electric horna`.
Engine speed controlaa.
Bucket:ab.
Quick attach typeac.
60" ditching bucket provided with machinead.
Boom:ae.
Telescopic boomaf.
180 degree boom rotationag.
30' reach at round level from upper structure pivot to bucket cutting edgeah.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

TELESCOPIC EXCAVATOR, WHEELED 6X6 - 47,000 LB OPERATING
WEIGHT 

SPECIFICATION #44

2018 Gradall XL4100 
The Gradall XL4100 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $404,107.00 $404,107.00 $404,107.00 $404,107.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
D152 4X2 1 Downgrade to smaller excavator - specify $157,754.001

D154 4X4 1 Downgrade to smaller excavator - specify $133,900.001

XL3100 4X2 1 Downgrade to smaller excavator - specify $80,228.001

XL3100 4X4 1 Downgrade to smaller excavator - specify $54,612.001

Delete air conditioning NA 
XL4100 6X4 1 Delete from wheel drive $18,635.001

XL3300 1 Optional equipment delete - specify $115,363.001

XL4300 1 Optional equipment delete - specify $87,445.001

XL5300 1 Optional equipment delete - specify $36,226.001

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

XL5100 6X4 1 Model upgrade - specify $30,724.001

XL5100 6X6 1 Model upgrade - specify $48,948.001

Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 

80656093 1 Upgrade to 66" bucket $910.001

Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA 
Temporary tag NA 

BASE 1 Warranty - specify 
1 YR/1,500 HR FULL MACHINE 1 

Std1

2/3000 1 Warranty - specify 
2 YR/3,000 HR EXTENDED POWERTRAIN 1 

$8,500.001

VEHICLE: XL4100 
DEALER: GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc. GS Equipment, Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $404,107.00 $404,107.00 $404,107.00 $404,107.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

TELESCOPIC EXCAVATOR, WHEELED 6X6 - 47,000 LB OPERATING
WEIGHT 

SPECIFICATION #44

2018 Gradall XL4100 

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Gradall XL4100 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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