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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
HYDRAULIC MINT EXCAVATOR - 7.105 LB OPERATING WEIGHT (Specification #38

Bobcat Company 2018 Bobcat E32R Western
2018 Bobcat E32R Western
Bobcat Company 2018 Bobcat E32R Northern
2018 Bobcat E32R Northern
Bobcat Company 2018 Bobcat E32R Central
2018 Bobcat E32R Central
Bobcat Company 2018 Bobcat E32R Southern
2018 Bobcat E32R Southern
Trekker Group 2018 Case CX33C Western
2018 Case CX33C Western
Trekker Group 2018 Case CX33C Northern
2018 Case CX33C Northern
Trekker Group 2018 Case CX33C Central
2018 Case CX33C Central
Trekker Group 2018 Case CX33C Southern
2018 Case CX33C Southern
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 303E CR Western
2018 Caterpillar 303E CR Western
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 303E CR Northern
2018 Caterpillar 303E CR Northern
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 303E CR Central
2018 Caterpillar 303E CR Central
Kelly Tractor 2018 Caterpillar 303E CR Southern
2018 Caterpillar 303E CR Southern
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5 Western
2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5 Western
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5 Northern

Base Unit
Price

$30,719.00
- NB --
$30,719.00
- NB --
$30,719.00
—-NB --
$30,719.00
- NB --

$33,717.00
- NB --
$32,112.00
- NB --
$32,112.00
—-NB --
$32,112.00
- NB --

--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
$34,959.00
—-NB --

$37,225.00

—-NB --
$37,225.00
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 38.pdf

2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5 Northern --NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5 Central $36,055.00
2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5 Central --NB --
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5 Southern $36,055.00
2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5 Southern --NB --
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 35G Western $37,225.00
2018 John Deere 35G Western --NB --
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 35G Northern $37,225.00
2018 John Deere 35G Northern --NB --
Everglades Farm Equipment 2018 John Deere 35G Central $33,976.00
ALT - Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 35G Central $36,055.00
Everglades Farm Equipment 2018 John Deere 35G Southern $33,976.00
ALT - Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 35G Southern $36,055.00
Cowin Equipment Company Inc 2018 Kobelco SK35SR Western $38,724.00
2018 Kobelco SK35SR Western --NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Kobelco SK35SR Northern $34,625.00
2018 Kobelco SK35SR Northern --NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Kobelco SK35SR Central $34,625.00
2018 Kobelco SK35SR Central --NB --
GS Equipment, Inc. 2018 Kobelco SK35SR Southern $34,625.00
2018 Kobelco SK35SR Southern --NB --
Futch's Tractor Depot 2018 Kubota U35-4 * Western $30,500.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc. 2018 Kubota U35-4 Western $31,360.00
Futch's Tractor Depot 2018 Kubota U35-4 * Northern $30,100.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc. 2018 Kubota U35-4 Northern $30,860.00
Futch's Tractor Depot 2018 Kubota U35-4 * Central $30,100.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc. 2018 Kubota U35-4 Central $30,860.00
Futch's Tractor Depot 2018 Kubota U35-4 * Southern $30,250.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc. 2018 Kubota U35-4 Southern $30,860.00
Cowin Equipment Company Inc 2018 Takeuchi TB240 Western $44,703.00
2018 Takeuchi TB240 Western --NB --
Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Takeuchi TB240 Northern $44,950.00
2018 Takeuchi TB240 Northern --NB --
Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Takeuchi TB240 Central $44,950.00
2018 Takeuchi TB240 Central --NB --
Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Takeuchi TB240 Southern $44,950.00
2018 Takeuchi TB240 Southern --NB --
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Cowin Equipment Company Inc

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

2018 Volvo EC 35D
2018 Volvo EC 35D
2018 Volvo EC 35D
2018 Volvo EC 35D
2018 Volvo EC 35D
2018 Volvo EC 35D
2018 Volvo EC 35D
2018 Volvo EC 35D

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

$38,641.00
--NB --
$39,000.00
--NB --
$39,000.00
--NB --
$39,000.00
--NB --
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HYDRAULIC MINI EXCAVATOR -7.105 LB OPERATING WEIGHT
SPECIFICATION #38

2018 Bobcat E32R

2018 Case CX33C

2018 Caterpillar 303E CR
2018 Hitachi ZX35-U-5
2018 John Deere 35G
2018 Kobelco SK35SR
2018 Kubota U35-4

2018 Takeuchi TB240
2018 Volvo EC 35D

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. WEIGHT:

a. 7,105 minimum capacity weight with canopy
2. ENGINE/CAB:

a. Diesel engine, minimum 23 net horse power
b. Rollover and falling object protective structures
c. Gauges or warning indicators for fuel level, engine oil, hydraulic oil and coolant.

3. TRAVEL SYSTEM:

a. Minimum high speed travel 2.3 MPH
b. Minimum gradeability, 20 degrees
c. 11" wide rubber belt tracks

4. HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:

a. Gear type hydraulic pump

b. Digging depth 9' minimum

c. Auxiliary hydraulic circuit and controls plummed to the end of stick with disconnect to allow the use of
hydro-mechanical work tools

. Backfill blade

. Hydraulic motor-driven swing system

o &

5. ELECTRICAL SYSTEM:

a. 12 volt electrical system

b. 40 amp alternator

c. Sealed electrical connector
d. Work lights
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DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

HYDRAULIC MINI EXCAVATOR - 7,105 LB OPERATING WEIGHT
SPECIFICATION #38

2018 Case CX33C

The Case CX33C purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $33,717.00 $32,112.00 $32,112.00 $32,112.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

CX17C
CANOPY !

CX26C
CANOPY !

CX26C CAB'!

Order Code

CX33C

Trekker Group Trekker Group

Western Northern

$33,717.00 $32,112.00
Delete Options

Optional equipment - specify
DOWNGRADE TO CX17C CANOPY 1

Optional equipment - specify
DOWNGRADE TO CX26C CANOPY 1

Optional equipment - specify
DOWNGRADE TO CX26C CAB WITH AC-HEAT 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Add Options

Trekker Group Trekker Group
Central Southern
$32,112.00 $32,112.00

All Zones

($10,121.19)"
($4,117.32)"
($1,168.20)"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

All Zones

Section

add options.

the Vendor.

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,

2.14 Option Pricing.

CX37C
CANOPY !

CX37C CAB'!
ADD CW !

TRAVEL
ALARM !

LONG ARM !

ROTATING
BEACON !

12 IN
BUCKET
cx17!

Optional equipment - specif[y
UPGRADE TO CX37C CANOPY

Optional equipment - specify
UPGRADE TO CX37C CAB AC - HEAT 1

Optional equipment - specify
ADDITIONAL COUNTERWEIGHT 1

Optional equipment - specify
TRAVEL ALARM 1

Optional eqluipment - specify
LONG ARM

Optional equipment - specify
ROTATING BEACON 1

Optional equipment - specify
PIN ON 12 IN HD BUCKET FOR MODEL Cx17 |

$2,486.97"
$8,412.88!
$160.00"
$160.00"
$250.00"
$225.00"

$300.00"

1821



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

18 IN
BUCKET
cx17!

18 IN
BUCKET
CX26'

24 IN
BUCKET
Cx26!

24 IN
BUCKET
CX33-37

36 IN
BUCKET
CX33-37"

HYD
THUMB !

% OFF Case
MSRP !

1

Attachments
Discount !

MAINT !

STD WARR !

EXT WARR !

CX33C

Trekker Group Trekker Group
Western Northern
$33,717.00 $32,112.00

Optional equipment - specify
PIN ON 18 IN HD BUCKET FOR MODEL CX17 |

Optional equipment - specify
PIN ON 18 IN HD BUCKET FOR MODEL CX26 |

Optional equipment - specify
PIN ON 24 IN HD BUCKET FOR MODEL CX26 |

Optional equipment - specify
PIN ON 24 IN HD BUCKET FOR MODEL CX33 -CX37 1

Optional equipment - specify
PIN ON 36 IN DITCH/GRADING BUCKET 1

Optional equipment - specify
HYDRAULIC THUMB FOR CX26 - CX37 1

Optional equipment - specify

Trekker Group
Central
$32,112.00

Trekker Group

Southern
$32,112.00

27% discount off Case MSRP on all models, and all factory Installed options. This applies to Case Factory Installed
non-stated options for these models. Case Construction MSRP options subject to 25% discount 15% off Attachments and

work tools 1

Optional equipment - specify

15% discount off Case MSRP on Dealer Installed Attachments and work tools. 10% discount off from other Manufactures

MSRP on Dealer installed Attachments and Work Tools |

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan — specify
Please call dealer for quote. 1

Maintenance Plan — specify

Warranty - specify
12 MONTHS / 1000 HOURS 1

Warranty - specify
3 YEARS /3000 HOURS POWER TRAIN 1

$390.00"

$475.00"

$610.00"

$755.00"

$800.00"

$2,200.00"

NA!

NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
Na!

NA
Incl.!

$900.00"
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HYDRAULIC MINI EXCAVATOR - 7,105 LB OPERATING WEIGHT
SPECIFICATION #38

2018 Case CX33C

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Case CX33C purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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