
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

ARTICULATED OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK - 50,000 LB PAYLOAD CAPACITY (Specification #61)

2018 Caterpillar 725 Western -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 725 Western -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 725 Northern -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 725 Northern -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 725 Central -- NB --
2018 Caterpillar 725 Central -- NB --

Kelly Tractor 2018 Caterpillar 725 Southern $317,582.00
2018 Caterpillar 725 Southern -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 260E Western $318,750.00
2018 John Deere 260E Western -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 260E Northern $318,750.00
2018 John Deere 260E Northern -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 260E Central $318,750.00
2018 John Deere 260E Central -- NB --

Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 260E Southern $318,750.00
2018 John Deere 260E Southern -- NB --

Trekker Group 2018 Terex TA300 Western $365,133.00
2018 Terex TA300 Western -- NB --

Trekker Group 2018 Terex TA300 Northern $347,745.00
2018 Terex TA300 Northern -- NB --

Trekker Group 2018 Terex TA300 Central $347,745.00
2018 Terex TA300 Central -- NB --

Trekker Group 2018 Terex TA300 Southern $347,745.00
2018 Terex TA300 Southern -- NB --

Cowin Equipment Company Inc 2018 Volvo A25G Western $331,698.00
2018 Volvo A25G Western -- NB --

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Volvo A25G Northern $332,000.00

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover

Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover
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 2018 Volvo A25G Northern -- NB --
Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Volvo A25G Central $332,000.00
 2018 Volvo A25G Central -- NB --
Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 2018 Volvo A25G Southern $332,000.00
 2018 Volvo A25G Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

ARTICULATED OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK - 50,000 LB PAYLOAD CAPACITY
SPECIFICATION #61

2018 Caterpillar 725 
2018 John Deere 260E 
2018 Terex TA300 
2018 Volvo A25G 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED. 

WEIGHT:1.

Minimum operating weight - 40,000 lbs.a.
Minimum gross weight (with payload) - 91,000 lbs.b.

ENGINE:2.

Turbocharged diesel engine, 265 hp 6 cylinder, 549 cubic inch minimum.a.
Spin on type filters.b.
Two stage air cleaner.c.

TRANSMISSION:3.

6 speeds forward, 1 speed reverse.a.
Top speed of 31 mphb.
Hydraulic retarderc.

BRAKES:4.

Disc type service brakes.a.
Disc type parking brake.b.

AXLES & DIFFERENTIALS:5.

Differential locksa.
Planetary gear reduction final drives.b.
Inter axle differential lock.c.

TIRES:6.

Tubeless, radial off road hauler tires.a.
23.5 R 25 tire sizeb.

STEERING:7.

45 degree left or right articulation angle.a.
Secondary electric steering system for emergency steering.b.
Double acting steering cylinders.c.
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OPERATING STATION:8.

Cab to be pressurized, heated, air conditioned and filtered.a.
Built in ROPS/FOPS protection.b.
Suspension type operators seat with seat belt.c.
Cab instrumentation or engine monitoring system with audible alarms.d.
Tinted glass windows.e.
Sun visorf.
Front and rear intermittent windshield wipers.g.
Work lights, headlights, stop, tail and turn signal lights.h.
Left and right mirrors.i.

BODY:9.

Dump body tipping angle 70 degrees.a.
Mud flapsb.
Two single stage double acting body hoist cylinders.c.
18 yd. heaped capacityd.
Body rise time maximum 12 seconds.e.

MISCELLANEOUS:10.

95 gallon fuel tank minimum.a.
Guard or shielding package.b.

Disclosure: The Florida Sheriffs Association working in conjunction
with manufacturers, dealers and distributors of vehicles/equipment
does their best to ensure Model names, numbers and codes represent
the latest information available at the time the bid documents are
prepared. However, do to the nature of the business, it is
recommended that you confirm this information with your dealer
representative at the time you are requesting a confirming quote.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

ARTICULATED OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK - 50,000 LB PAYLOAD CAPACITY
SPECIFICATION #61

2018 Caterpillar 725
The Caterpillar 725 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $317,582.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options

Western
&
Northern
&
Central Southern

Downgrade model - specify 
Downgrade model - specify 
Downgrade model - specify 
Downgrade model - specify 
Downgrade model - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 

 

Order Code Add Options

Western
&
Northern
&
Central Southern

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

730C2 2 Model upgrade - specify 
BASE 730C2 W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2 

$54,199.002

735C 2 Model upgrade - specify 
BASE 735C W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2 

$161,314.002

745C 2 Model upgrade - specify 
BASE 745C W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2 

$229,885.002

Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 

397-2858 2 Optional equipment - specify 
TAILGATE, SCISSOR 2 

$9,801.002

VEHICLE: 725
DEALER: Kelly Tractor
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $317,582.00
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380-2081 2 Optional equipment - specify 
LINER, DUMP BODY 2 

$10,391.002

373-3663 2 Optional equipment - specify 
LIGHTS, ROOF MOUNTED WORK 2 

$774.002

381-0063 2 Optional equipment - specify 
LUBRICATION, AUTOMATIC 2 

$4,382.002

363-7685 2 Optional equipment - specify 
BEACON, LED 2 

$288.002

383-6698 2 Optional equipment - specify 
WIPER, REAR 2 

$405.002

MAC5 2 Optional equipment - specify 
MEGA 5000 GAL TANK w/M3B PUMP 2 

$89,845.002

Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 

26%
DISCOUNT
 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
26% DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE ON CAT MODELS 725 & 745 ARTICULATED TRUCKS. 25% ON MODELS
730 & 735. 2 

2

Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 

3YR/3000HR
PM PKG 2 

Maintenance Plan - specify 
PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 3 YRS OR 3000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS. PKG
INCLUDES 6 TOTAL PM'S 2 

$10,508.002

5YR/5000HR
PM PKG 2 

Maintenance Plan - specify 
PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 5 YRS OR 5000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS. PKG
INCLUDES 10 TOTAL PM'S 2 

$21,817.002

Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: 725
DEALER: Kelly Tractor
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $317,582.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

ARTICULATED OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK - 50,000 LB PAYLOAD CAPACITY
SPECIFICATION #61

2018 Caterpillar 725

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Caterpillar 725 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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