FLORIDA

ASSOCIATION OF

COUNTIES
—_—
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

BRUSH CHIPPER - TRAILER MOUNTED (Specification #63)

Bandit Industries, Inc.

Bandit Industries, Inc.

Bandit Industries, Inc.

Bandit Industries, Inc.

Environmental Products Group, Inc

Environmental Products Group, Inc

Environmental Products Group, Inc

Environmental Products Group, Inc

Morbark, LLC

Morbark, LLC

Morbark, LLC

Morbark, LLC

Vermeer Southeast Sales & Service, Inc

Vermeer Southeast Sales & Service, Inc

2018 Bandit 15XP
2018 Bandit 15XP
2018 Bandit 15XP
2018 Bandit 15XP
2018 Bandit 15XP
2018 Bandit 15XP
2018 Bandit 15XP
2018 Bandit 15XP

2018 DuraTech TC-15
2018 DuraTech TC-15
2018 DuraTech TC-15
2018 DuraTech TC-15
2018 DuraTech TC-15
2018 DuraTech TC-15
2018 DuraTech TC-15
2018 DuraTech TC-15

2018 Morbark M15R
2018 Morbark M15R
2018 Morbark M15R
2018 Morbark M15R
2018 Morbark M15R
2018 Morbark M15R
2018 Morbark M15R
2018 Morbark M15R

2018 Vermeer BC1500
2018 Vermeer BC1500
2018 Vermeer BC1500

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

$53,030.00
- NB --
$53,030.00
- NB --
$53,030.00
—-NB --
$53,030.00
- NB --

$43,470.00
- NB --
$43,470.00
- NB --
$43,470.00
—-NB --
$43,470.00
- NB --

$58,750.00
- NB --
$58,750.00
- NB --
$58,750.00
—-NB --
$58,750.00
- NB --

$61,250.00

—-NB --
$61,250.00
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 63.pdf

Vermeer Southeast Sales & Service, Inc

Vermeer Southeast Sales & Service, Inc

2018 Vermeer BC1500
2018 Vermeer BC1500
2018 Vermeer BC1500
2018 Vermeer BC1500
2018 Vermeer BC1500

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

- NB --
$61,250.00
- NB --
$61,250.00
—-NB --
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BRUSH CHIPPER - TRAILER MOUNTED

SPECIFICATION #63

2018 Bandit 15XP
2018 DuraTech TC-15
2018 Morbark M15R
2018 Vermeer BC1500

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE

VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE

VEHICLE LISTED.

1. DIMENSIONS:

a. Weight - 6800 Ibs.

b. Width - 72"

c. Height - 100"

d. Length - 176"

e. 15" chipping capacity

2. ENGINE:

a. 122 hp diesel engine

b. Over center type clutch
c. Heavy duty air cleaner
d. Spin on type filters

3. CHASSIS:

n_n

a. Main frame constructed of rectangular tubing or "z
b. 7000 Ib. axle torsion type

c. Electric brakes with breakaway switch
d. ST 235/80R16 tires load range E

e. Steel wheels

f. Drop leg jack

g. 2 1/2" diameter lunette or 2 5/16" ball hitch
h. Adjustable height hitch

1. Safety chains

j- 6 way light connector

k. All wiring in conduit to lights

1. Four function rear lights

4. FEED SYSTEM:

. Infeed throat opening - 20" x 15"
. Serrated infeed rollers

. Feed rollers hydraulically driven
. Feed table height - 27"

. Feed table length - 30"

o o O
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f. Safety control bar a round infeed opening for emergency stop.
5. CHIPPER DRUM OR DISC

a. Drum type:
b. Size - 22" diameter x 22" width
c. 2 knife pockets 180 degrees apart
d. Dual edge reversible knives

e. Extreme duty bearings

f. Adjustable bedknife (reversible)
g. Disc type:

h. 37" x 2" diameter disc

i. 4 knives reversible

6. CHIPPER HOUSING:

a. Easy access door for knife changes
b. Drop down door for anvil adjustment or clean out
c. Chipper housing to be constructed for maximum safety and operator protection

7. DISCHARGE CHUTE:

a. Rotation of 360 degrees
b. Adjustable chip deflector
c¢. Locking pin for chute rotation

8. MISCELLANEOQOUS:

a. 26 gallon fuel tank

b. Engine shutdown system
c¢. Locking tool box

d. Vandalism protection

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.

2639




FLORIDA

ASSOCIATION OF

COUNTIES
—_—
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

BRUSH CHIPPER - TRAILER MOUNTED
SPECIFICATION #63

2018 Vermeer BC1500

The Vermeer BC1500 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $61,250.00 $61,250.00 $61,250.00 $61,250.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Order Code
BC700XL !

BC900XL !

BC1000XL-G '

BC1000XL-74D !

Order Code

BC1500

Vermeer Southeast Sales & Vermeer Southeast Sales & Vermeer Southeast Sales & Vermeer Southeast Sales &

Service, Inc Service, Inc Service, Inc Service, Inc

Western Northern Central Southern

$61,250.00 $61,250.00 $61,250.00 $61,250.00
Delete Options All Zones
Downgrade model - specify $45,148.001
BC700XL 7" Capacity, Kohler EFI Gas Engine 1
Downgrade model - specify $36,703.001
BC900XL Brush Chipper 9" Capacity, 35HP Vanguard Gas Engine 1
Downgrade model - specify 5527,527.001
BCI1000XL Brush Chipper 12" Capacity 3.0L GM Gas Engine 1
Downgrade model - specify $22,262.001
BC1000XL Brush Chipper 12" Capacity 74Hp Deutz Diesel Engine 1
Optional equipment delete - specify NA
Optional equipment delete - specify NA
Optional equipment delete - specify NA
Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail

Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options.
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor.
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for

Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,

BC1800XL-130 !
BC1800XL-173 !

AX19 !

WINCH !

HYD JACK !

HYD BRAKES !

TREE COM '

10% !

Model upgrade - specify $6,493.00"
BC1800XL Brush Chipper 18" Capacity 130HP T4F Cummins Diesel Engine 1

Model upgrade - specify $15,961.00"
BC1800X! Brush Chipper 18" Capacity 173 HP T4F John Deere Diesel Engine 1

Model upgrade - specify $37,416.00"
AX19 Brush Chipper 19" Capacity 173HP T4F John Deere Diesel Engine |

Model upgrade - specify NA
Model upgrade - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify $3,694.001
Winch 1

Optional equipment - specify $2,243.001
Hydraulic Jack 1

Optional equipment - specify $1,986.00"
Hydraulic Surge Brakes 1

Optional equipment - specifY $2,5 88.00'
Tree Commander Remote Control

Optional equipment - specify $10.00"

DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF MANUFACTURER'S CURRENT PUBLISHED RETAIL PRICE FOR NON-SPECIFIED
OPTIONS AND ANY OPTIONAL MODELS 1

2659



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

TEMP TAG |
TRANS TAG '
NEW TAG '

BC1500

Vermeer Southeast Sales & Vermeer Southeast Sales & Vermeer Southeast Sales & Vermeer Southeast Sales &

Service, Inc
Western
$61,250.00

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Temporary tag

Service, Inc
Northern
$61,250.00

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify

Service, Inc
Central
$61,250.00

Service, Inc
Southern
$61,250.00

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NC!

$210.00"
$210.00"
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BRUSH CHIPPER - TRAILER MOUNTED
SPECIFICATION #63

2018 Vermeer BC1500

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Vermeer BC1500 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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