
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK (Specification #15)
 
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Western $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Western -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Northern $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Northern -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Central $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Central -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Southern $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Southern -- NB --
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Western $103,300.00
 2018 International HX Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Northern $102,300.00
 2018 International HX Northern -- NB --
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International HX Central $102,250.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Central $102,300.00
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International HX Southern $103,734.00
 2018 International HX Southern -- NB --
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Western $92,500.00
 2018 International Workstar Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Northern $91,500.00
 2018 International Workstar Northern -- NB --
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International Workstar Central $91,620.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Central $91,650.00
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International Workstar Southern $90,637.00
 2018 International Workstar Southern -- NB --
 
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Western $101,989.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Western -- NB --
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Northern $101,739.00
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 2018 Kenworth T880 Northern -- NB --
Kenworth of Central Florida 2018 Kenworth T880 Central $100,998.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Central -- NB --
Kenworth of South Florida 2018 Kenworth T880 Southern $97,986.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Western $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Western -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Northern $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Northern -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Central $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Central -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Southern $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Southern -- NB --
 
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Western $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Western -- NB --
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Northern $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Northern -- NB --
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Central $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Central -- NB --
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers inc 2018 Peterbilt 567 Southern $104,416.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Western $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Western $99,072.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Northern $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Northern $99,072.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Central $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Central $98,172.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Southern $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Southern $98,172.00
 
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Western $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Western -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Northern $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Northern -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Central $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Central -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Southern $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Freightliner M2-112 
2018 International HX 
2018 International Workstar 
2018 Kenworth T880 
2018 Mack C or G Series 
2018 Peterbilt 567 
2018 Volvo V Series 
2018 Western Star 4700 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED. 

ENGINE:1.

350 HP 6 cylinder diesel engine, manufacturer's 11L minimuma.

TRANSMISISON & CLUTCH:2.

The following or approved equivalents are acceptable:a.
Fuller 14210B 10 Speed Manual with ODb.

ENGINE EQUIPMENT:3.

Alternator – 12 volt 100Aa.
Premium engine hosesb.
Injection pump – electronic engine controlc.
Radiator – aluminum cored.
Air restriction monitor – intake mountede.

CAB:4.

Cab – welded steel galvanized or aluminum shell with rust preventative coating.a.
Floor covering – black rubber matsb.
Seating – driver air suspension mid back, passenger fixed mid back.c.
Steering wheel – 18" two spoked.
Standard air conditioning and heatinge.

FRAME:5.

Frame – steel construction matched to GVW and mounted body of truck.a.
Wheelbase – 187"b.
Front bumper – painted steelc.
Fuel tank – 70 gallon, minimumd.
Air dryer – Bendix AD9 heated, or approved equivalent.e.

SAFETY:6.
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Horn – single air trumpeta.
Mirrors – West Coast to include 7.5" convex mounted to lower mirror bracket.b.
Brakes – "S" cam type 16.5" x 5" Q + front and 16.5" x 7" Q + rear with anti-lock without automatic traction control,
or approved equivalent.

c.

Slack adjusters – Haldex automatic front and rear.d.
Daytime running lights.e.
Backup alarmf.

FRONT AXLE:7.

Front axle – 12,000 lb.a.
Front wheels – steel 10 hole hub pilotedb.
Front tires – 11R22.5 Goodyear G397LHS, steer or approved equivalent.c.
Front hubs – Ferrous, or approved equivalent.d.
Oil type with synthetic lubee.

REAR AXLE:8.

Rear axle – 40,000 lb.a.
Rear wheels – steel 10 hole hub pilotedb.
Rear tires – 11R22.5 Goodyear G124 unisteel traction or approved equivalent.c.
Hubs – Ferrous, or approved equivalent.d.
Power divider with warning light and buzzer (includes in cab control)e.

ELECTRICAL:9.

Circuit protection – fuses except headlamp and wiper circuits which utilize circuit breakers.a.
Hand throttle – electronic hand throttle operated through cruise control when in PTO mode only.b.
Engine protection – engine shut down system monitoring high water temp, low oil pressure, high exhaust temp, high
transmission temp.

c.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Peterbilt 567
The Peterbilt 567 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,416.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

365 1 Engine/transmission - specify 
Peterbilt Model 365 1 

$528.001 NA 

348 1 Engine/transmission - specify 
Peterbilt Model 348 1 

($14,458.00)1 NA 

Engine/transmission - specify NA NA 
Engine/transmission - specify NA NA 

 

Order Code Add Options

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

2057560 1 
2057544 2 

Engine upgrade - specify 
CUMMINS ISX12-G 350 HP 1450 LB2 TORQUE ISX12-G 400HP ADD $567.00 other available
engine options list -10% see dealer 1 
ISX-12 350 HP 2 

$19,025.001 $1,858.002

2074506 1 
2057745 2 

Engine upgrade - specify 
ISL-G 320/2200 1000@1300 Near Zero Model 348 / 567, 365 other available engine options list
-10% see dealer 1 
ISX-12 425 HP 2 

$21,189.001 $2,856.002

2057746 1 
2059987 2 

Engine upgrade - specify 
CUMMINS ISX-12 425 HP 1650 TORQUE other available engine options 1 
ISX-15 505 HP 2 

$3,758.001 $5,087.002

2059953 1 
2072822 2 

Engine upgrade - specify 
ISX15 550@2000 2050@1200 other available engine options list -10% see dealer 1 
MX-13 455 HP PACCAR ENGINE 2 

$5,233.001 $415.002

2072823 1 
2057732 2 

Engine upgrade - specify 
MX-13 485HP 1650@1000 torque  1 
ISX12-G 400 HP CNG 2 

$1,000.001 $22,505.002

4052110/40552230 1 
4040810 2 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Allison 3500 / 3000 RDSP include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent 1 
RTO 16908LL 2 

$10,850.001 $1,476.002

VEHICLE: 567
DEALER: Rush Truck Centers of

Florida
Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Palm Peterbilt Truck
Centers inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,416.00
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4052420 1 
4024250 2 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent 1 
EATON F017E309-VCS 2 

$20,735.001 $10,985.002

4040810 1 Transmission upgrade - specify 
FULLER RTO16908LL 10 SPEED 1 

$1,225.001 NA 

4024080 1 Transmission upgrade - specify 
F016E308LL-VCS 10 Speed UltraShift PLUS  1 

$9,138.001 NA 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Other Transmission options available -10% off list see dealer 1 

$0.001 NA 

58,000 lb. GVWR package 
see Dealer 1 
AVABLEE SEE DEALER FOR PRICE 2 

$0.001 $0.002

0514020 1 64,000 lb. GVWR package 
10-3/4in Steel Rails 1 
20,000LB.FRONT / 46,000LB. REAR 2 

$658.001 $6,618.002

4543430 /
4543440 1 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
Clear Outside Frame Rail Pkg. 1 

$538.001 NA 

RUSH 1 GVWR upgrade - specify 
40T Pintle pkg (including 1"plate,pintle and D-ringa) •Air liiU!.f and electric supplied by dealer 1 

$1,598.001 NA 

Rush 1 GVWR upgrade - specify 
Wetline kit PTOfor manual transmisaion 1 

$9,500.001 NA 

20758409 1 GVWR upgrade - specify 
PX9 350HP 1150Tourque 1 

$3,953.001 NA 

GVWR upgrade - specify NA NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA Std 
CNG prep - specify Incl. Std 

Momentum 1 CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
Momentum Fuel Technologies 90 DGE Rail Mounted Tanks 80 DGE System Deduct -1191.03 60
DGE System Deduct -2641.03, roof mount and behind the cab mount available see dealer for specs
and pricing.  1 

$39,993.001 NA 

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
see dealer 1 

$0.001 NA 

5554100 1 Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent 
26" Aluminum 70 gal. 1 

$307.001 $398.00 

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA NA 
4052410 1 
4052410 2 

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or
approved equivalent 

$20,923.001 $16,573.002

4052420 1 
4052420 2 

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or
approved equivalent 

$21,568.001 $20,485.002

0601500 1 Double Frame: full steel insert $1,125.001 Incl. 
Front Axle: 14,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs NA NA 

VEHICLE: 567
DEALER: Rush Truck Centers of

Florida
Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Palm Peterbilt Truck
Centers inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,416.00
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1011350 1 
1011350 2 

Front Axle: 14,600 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs $399.001 $719.002

Front Axle: 16,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs NA NA 
Front Axle: 18,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs NA NA 

1011360 1 
1011360 2 

Front Axle: 20,000 lb. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and
springs 

$1,985.001 $2,628.002

1526120 1 
1523340 2 

Rear Axle: 46,000 lb Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent $1,803.001 $5,954.002

1604180 1 
1604180 2 

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires
with steel wheels 

$12,783.001 $12,982.002

1603145 1 
1603445 2 

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5
tires with steel wheels 

$15,638.001 $11,634.002

1604150 1 
1604150 2 

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires
with steel wheels 

$14,232.001 $14,882.002

1603470 1 
1603470 2 

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5
tires with steel wheels 

$15,234.001 $16,200.002

1821810 1 Rear Suspension: 40,000 lb air ride $945.001 Std 
1827440 1 Rear Suspension: 46,000 lb Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or

equivalent 
DEDUCT -$2,530.00 for Hendrickson HaulMax 46K 1 

$5,610.001 $5,954.00 

1821640 1 Rear Suspension: 46,000 lb air ride $1,507.001 $3,676.00 
TBEI 1 12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. 

14' 12/14 yd dump for 114" CT w/ 1/4" plate floor (including Hotshift PTO for Automatic trans ,air
tailgate, electric tarp system)see dealer for additional opti 1 
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2 

$15,554.001 $0.002

TBEI 1 18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. 
16' 17/19yd dump for 138" CT w/ 1/4" plate floor (including hotshift PTO for auto trans air t/gate ,
Elec tarptr system) 1 
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2 

$17,023.001 $0.002

Ring Power 1 Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. 
AMERICAN ROLL-OFF MODEL ART-60-22 / Above Frame 1 
GALBREATH 60K OUTSIDE RAIL HOIST WITH TARP SYSTEM SEE DEALER FOR SPECS 2 

$49,900.001 $40,435.002

7852020 1 Cab suspension - air ride $230.001 Std 
1687090 1 Driver controlled differential lock $1,489.001 Std 
Ring Power 1 Optional mounted body - specify 

Palfinger T-50 Hooklift System / Pioneer SARG Tarp / Recommended Chassis 66,000 GVW 1 
GALFAB 60K OUTSIDE RAIL ROLL/OFF HOIST NO TARP SEE DEALER FOR DETAIL
SPECS 2 

$56,500.001 $31,579.002

Ring Power 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
Palfinger Epsilon Q150 Z84 TI Grapple Loader / American Rolloff ART 60-22 1 
HEIL KWILIFT 24' OUTSIDE RAIL ROLL/OFF HOIST WITH DIABCO TARP SYSTEM SEE
DEALER FOR DETAIL SPECS 2 

$165,600.001 $47,727.002

VEHICLE: 567
DEALER: Rush Truck Centers of

Florida
Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Palm Peterbilt Truck
Centers inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,416.00
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Ring Power 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
Epsilon S260L130 Canal Maintenance Crane Package 1 
GAR-P DUMP BODY MODEL GAR-16 16' SEE DEALEER FOR DETAIL SPECS 2 

$194,000.001 $15,374.002

Ring Power 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
Palfinger A-Line Loader ADD $2,600.00 for TARP SYSTEM 1 
LOADMASTER EXCEL S-25 REAR LOADER SEE DEALEER FOR DETAIL SPECS 2 

$106,500.001 $60,962.002

Petersen Ind. 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
MODEL TL3 BASE LOADER/MODEL HDX-2030 HARDOX BODY 1/8" SIDES, 3/16"
FLOOR/ROUTE ASISTANT-2030 HDX BODIES 1 
J&J ALIMINUM DUMP BODY 16' SEE DEALER FOR DETAIL SPECS` 2 

$86,685.001 $29,318.002

Petersen Ind. 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
ATLAS Loader W/ 2240-HMX HARDOX BODY 3/16 ALL HARDOX 1 
J&J STEEL DUMP BODY 16' SEE DEALEER FOR DETAIL SPECS 2 

$89,779.001 $27,167.002

SSES 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
New Way King Cobra 25RL Rear Loader New Way Cobra Magnum 25RLRear Loader Deduct
-3,225.00 see dealer for additional options and specs.  1 
PAC MAC KNUCKLE BOOM CRANE MODEL KBF 222A AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS 
 2 

$66,872.001 $70,063.002

McNeilus 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
McNeilus Model 3216: 3.5HD 32 yd Rear Loader, 25yd Body Deduct -$661.00 1 
GS 5744D 44 YD RECYCLING BODY AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS 2 

$74,032.001 $77,223.002

WEP 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
Galbreath U5-OR-174 60K Hoist 1 
AMPLRIOLL HOOK LIFT MODEL AL160-1900-22 SEE DEALER FOR DETAIL SECS 2 

$44,659.001 $50,755.002

WEP 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
E-Z Pack G400-25 REL, E-Z Pack G300C-25 REL Deduct -$6,788.00 1 
SUPER VAC RECYLING WATER SYSTEM SEE DEALER FOR DETAIL SPECS 2 

$79,539.001 $296,477.002

HEIL 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Heil Dura-Pack 5000 25yd. 1 

$64,360.001 NA 

HEIL 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Heil Roll-Off 1 

$46,372.001 NA 

Wastebuilt 1 Optional equipment - specify 
AFOR60174S069 Galfab 60K OUTSIDE RAIL ROLL-OFF HST O'Brian or Pioneer Add
$10,500.00  1 

$30,361.001 NA 

Wastebuilt 1 Optional equipment - specify 
LEACH 2 R-III 29yd, 25yd Body Deduct -$3,119.00 1 

$60,983.001 NA 

Pac-Mac 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Pac-Mac KB222A MJ 2440 Body 1 

$77,039.001 NA 

Optional equipment - specify 
McNeilus Concrete Mixers, Ledwell, GAR-P, Heil, Neway, Palfinger, Petersen Ind., Galbreath,
American, and others see dealer for pricing and specs. 1 

$0.001 NA 

WEP 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Amrep 60k Roll-off with Pioneer SARG Tarp 1 

$39,121.001 NA 

Ledwell 1 Optional equipment - specify 
One (1) Ledwell Model 4000 gal 1 

$35,749.001 NA 

VEHICLE: 567
DEALER: Rush Truck Centers of

Florida
Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Palm Peterbilt Truck
Centers inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,416.00

995



Discount 1 Optional equipment - specify 
15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any optional models bid. Discount
applies to a downgrade or an upgrade to Spec #15 only.  1 

Incl.1 NA 

UPB 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Unpublished Bodies Available at Cost plus FSA Fees.  1 

Incl.1 NA 

Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Temporary tag Incl. NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) Incl. NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) Incl. NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Mobile options available see dealer for pricing 1 
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2 

$0.001 $0.002

Maintenance Plan - specify 
Scheduled programs available see dealer for pricing 1 

$0.001 NA 

Maintenance Plan - specify 
Full maintenance plans available see dealer for pricing options. 1 

$0.001 NA 

9402783 1 Warranty - specify 
Cummins ISl-G Protection Plan 1 5yr./150K 1 
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2 

$3,400.001 $0.002

9402659 1 Warranty - specify 
Cummins ISX-12G Protection Plan 1 5yr./150K 1 

$2,350.001 NA 

9401704 1 Warranty - specify 
Basic Vehicle 2/200k 1 

$1,265.001 NA 

9402705 1 Diesel Warranty - specify 
Cummins ISX Protection Plan 1 5yr./200K 1 
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2 

$1,520.001 $0.002

9402534 1 Diesel Warranty - specify 
Paacar PX-9 Protection Plan 1 5yr./150 1 

$2,750.001 NA 

9404001 1 Diesel Warranty - specify 
PACCAR MX Comprehensive Coverage 5/200 1 

$2,335.001 NA 

VEHICLE: 567
DEALER: Rush Truck Centers of

Florida
Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Palm Peterbilt Truck
Centers inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,705.00 $104,416.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Peterbilt 567

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Peterbilt 567 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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