
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

60,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE REFUSE TRUCK (ONLY) (Specification #16)

Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Autocar ACX64 Western $144,500.00
ALT - GENERAL GMC TRUCK SALES &
SERVICE, INC 2018 Autocar ACX64 Western $154,782.00

Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Autocar ACX64 Northern $143,500.00
ALT - GENERAL GMC TRUCK SALES &
SERVICE, INC 2018 Autocar ACX64 Northern $154,782.00

Kenworth of Central Florida 2018 Autocar ACX64 Central $157,924.00
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Autocar ACX64 Central $165,200.00
Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Autocar ACX64 Southern $138,200.00
ALT - GENERAL GMC TRUCK SALES &
SERVICE, INC 2018 Autocar ACX64 Southern $153,882.00

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. 2018 Crane Carrier LET2 Western $176,967.00
2018 Crane Carrier LET2 Western -- NB --

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. 2018 Crane Carrier LET2 Northern $176,967.00
2018 Crane Carrier LET2 Northern -- NB --

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. 2018 Crane Carrier LET2 Central $176,967.00
2018 Crane Carrier LET2 Central -- NB --

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. 2018 Crane Carrier LET2 Southern $176,967.00
2018 Crane Carrier LET2 Southern -- NB --

Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack MR Series Western $138,292.00
2018 Mack MR Series Western -- NB --

Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack MR Series Northern $138,292.00
2018 Mack MR Series Northern -- NB --

Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack MR Series Central $138,292.00
2018 Mack MR Series Central -- NB --

Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack MR Series Southern $138,292.00
2018 Mack MR Series Southern -- NB --

Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 520 Western $132,456.00
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 2018 Peterbilt 520 Western -- NB --
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 520 Northern $132,456.00
 2018 Peterbilt 520 Northern -- NB --
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 520 Central $132,456.00
 2018 Peterbilt 520 Central -- NB --
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers inc 2018 Peterbilt 520 Southern $133,150.00
 2018 Peterbilt 520 Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

60,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE REFUSE TRUCK
(ONLY)

SPECIFICATION #16
2018 Autocar ACX64 
2018 Crane Carrier LET2 
2018 Mack MR Series 
2018 Peterbilt 520 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

ENGINE:1.

300 HP 6 cylinder diesel engine, manufacturer's 11L minimuma.

TRANSMISISON:2.

Allison 4500 RDS automatic transmissiona.

ENGINE EQUIPMENT:3.

Alternator – 12 volt 100Aa.
Premium engine hosesb.
Injection pump – electronic engine controlc.
Radiator – aluminum core, or approved equivalentd.
Air restriction monitor – intake mountede.

CAB:4.

Cab – welded steel galvanized or aluminum shell with rust preventative coating.a.
Low cab, forward mounted, tilt type.b.
Floor covering – black rubber matsc.
Seating – driver air suspension mid back, passenger fixed mid back.d.
Steering wheel – 18" two spokee.
Standard air conditioning and heatingf.

FRAME:5.

Frame – steel construction matched to GVW and mounted body of truck.a.
Wheelbase – 209"b.
Front bumper – painted steelc.
Fuel tank – 70 gallon, minimumd.
Air dryer – Bendix AD9 heated, or approved equivalent.e.

SAFETY:6.

Horn – single air trumpeta.
Mirrors – West Coast to include 7.5" convex mounted to lower mirror bracket.b.
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Mirrors – West Coast to include 7.5" convex mounted to lower mirror bracket.b.
Brakes – "S" cam type 16.5" x 5" Q + front and 16.5" x 7" Q + rear with anti-lock without automatic traction control,
or approved equivalent.

c.

Slack adjusters – Haldex automatic front and rear.d.
Daytime running lights.e.
Backup alarmf.

FRONT AXLE:7.

Front axle – 20,000 lb.a.
Front wheels – steel 10 hole hub pilotedb.
Front tires – 315/8OR/22.5 Goodyear G289c.
Front hubs – iron, or approved equivalent.d.
Oil type with synthetic lubee.

REAR AXLE:8.

Rear axle – 40,000 lb.a.
Rear wheels – steel 10 hole hub pilotedb.
Rear tires – 11R22.5 Goodyear G124 unisteel traction or approved equivalent.c.
Hubs – iron, or approved equivalent.d.
Power divider with warning light and buzzer (includes in cab control)e.

ELECTRICAL:9.

Circuit protection – fuses except headlamp and wiper circuits which utilize circuit breakers.a.
Hand throttle – electronic hand throttle operated through cruise control when in PTO mode only.b.
Engine protection – engine shut down system monitoring high water temp, low oil pressure, high exhaust temp, high
transmission temp.

c.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

60,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE REFUSE TRUCK
(ONLY)

SPECIFICATION #16

2018 Mack MR Series
The Mack MR Series purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Engine/transmission - specify NA 
Engine/transmission - specify NA 
Engine/transmission - specify NA 
Engine/transmission - specify NA 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

1001759 1 Engine upgrade - specify 
MP7 355HP with 1260 ftlbs of torque. 1 

$605.001

Engine upgrade - specify NA 
Engine upgrade - specify NA 
Engine upgrade - specify NA 
Engine upgrade - specify NA 
Transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Transmission upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR upgrade - specify NA 
64,000 lb. GVW package NA 

20F46R 1 GVWR upgrade - specify 
66,000 lb. GVWR package, front tires 425 (900-1364)/ front wheels steel: 22.5x12.50 (531-2724)/ static Load Cushions FA
(384-0001)/ 46,000 Mack (186-1035)/ SS462-Camel Back Suspension. 1 

$2,720.001

GVWR upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR upgrade - specify NA 
Hybrid option NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA 

0023093 1 CNG prep - specify 
633 with Cummins ISL-G 320HP, FUEL TANKS NOT INCLUDED, base chassis upgrade. 1 

$3,500.001

VEHICLE: MR Series
DEALER: Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00
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CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA 

2731001 1 Double Frame: full steel insert Incl.1

2401501 1 Front Axle - specify 
Mack FXL20 Wide Pivot 20,000 lbs. 1 

Std1

2681018 1 Rear Axle - specify 
Mack S40 40,000 lbs. 1 

Std1

1861035 1 Rear Suspension - specify 
Mack SS40, Multileaf Camelback, 40,000 lbs. 1 

Std1

2682010 1 Rear Suspension - specify 
46,000 lbs. Meritor RT46-160 with Hendrickson HN462 Suspension 1 

$4,920.001

NEX 20
RDA 1 

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels $6,952.001

NEX 20 STA 1 Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels 

$8,450.001

FEPTO-pkg 1 Front Engine PTO Provision (FEPTO) 
2240015 Front Frame Extension for Extended Bumper, 1830002 Flange Adapter 1350, 826-0004 Pump Mounting Kit,
353001 Skid Plate Under Bumper/Radiator. 1 

$1,455.001

LCF with right hand steering NA 
LCF with dual steering NA 

1442100 1 LCF Low Profile with left hand steering 
Model LR613 Terra Pro 1 

$5,754.001

1442102 1 LCF Low Profile with dual steering 
Model LR613 with dual sit down, dual steering 1 

$6,857.001

1442101 1 LCF Low Profile with dual steering & right hand stand up 
Model LR613 Terra Pro standard configuration 1 

$5,754.001

2540401 1 Driver controlled differential lock 
Inter Wheel Differential Lock (Both Axles) 1 

$1,373.001

NEX 60
174/RP 4500 1 

Refuse body - state model bid and description 
60,000 Roll Off Hoist & Tarp 1 

$35,767.001

NEX 60
GAL/RP
4500 1 

Optional mounted body - specify 
60,000 Hook Hoist & Tarp 1 

$47,200.001

NEX 20 RRL
LM 1 

Optional mounted body - specify 
20 CU YD Refuse Rear Loader 1 

$53,750.001

NEX 25 RRL
H 1 

Optional mounted body - specify 
25 CU YD Refuse Rear Loader 1 

$64,750.001

NEX 32 RRL
MCN 1 

Optional mounted body - specify 
32 CU YD Refuse Rear Loader 1 

$74,420.001

NEX 40 RFL
H 1 

Optional mounted body - specify 
40 CU YD Refuse Front Loader 1 

$105,260.001

VEHICLE: MR Series
DEALER: Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00
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NEX CC 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
Currotto Can - Add on 1 

$27,115.001

NEX 28 RASL
MCN 1 

Optional mounted body - specify 
28 CU YD Refuse Automated Side Loader 1 

$108,501.001

NEX 31
RASL 1 

Optional mounted body - specify 
31 CU YD Refuse Automated Side Loader 1 

$116,450.001

60K AFR 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
60K Above Frame Rolloff Hoist & Tarp 1 

$44,352.001

NEX 36 FEL 1 Optional mounted body - specify 
36 CU YD Refuse Front End Loader 1 

$101,741.001

SINGLE
AXLE 1 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Single Axle Option ($8,000 Deduction) 1 

($8,000.00)1

Optional mounted body - specify NA 
Optional mounted body - specify NA 
Optional mounted body - specify NA 
Optional mounted body - specify NA 

2931004 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Racor Non Heater Fuel Filter 1 

$345.001

3180001 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Battery Disconnect Switch "Flaming River" with Configuration Light 1 

$126.001

9011359 1 Optional equipment - specify 
F+R (10) 315/80R22.5x20 M860A Bridgestone All Postition Tires on Steel Wheels 1 

$2,271.001

4240003 1 Optional equipment - specify 
MC Type Cab Doors with Roll-up Windows RH+LH Standard sliding Windows 1 

$145.001

1529009 1 Optional equipment - specify 
West Coast "Moto Mirror" Package, LH+RH Motorized and Heated (MRU Series Only) 1 

$527.001

4710001 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Rectangular Convex Mirror Above RH Door 1 

$33.001

BOT0001 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Body Builder Air Lines, Facotry Installed for Pneumatic Joy Stick Controls 1 

$257.001

6410002 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Auto Shut-Off for Radio/Entertainment Systems, When in Reverse Gear 1 

$67.001

0159003 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Drop Frame Modifications for LCF Chassis 1 

$8,602.001

ME80001 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Cab Front Corner Protection/Reinforcement for LCF Chassis 1 

$305.001

3530001  1 Optional equipment - specify 
Skid Plate Under Bumper + Radiator 1 

$295.001

084064 1 Optional equipment - specify 
All Aluminum Wheels 1 

$1,202.001

Optional equipment - specify NA 

VEHICLE: MR Series
DEALER: Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00
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Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 

TempTag 1 Temporary tag Std1

Transfer 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $100.001

New 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) $300.001

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

PLAN B HD
MP7 1 

Warranty - specify 
Extended Warranty 60 Months 250,000 Miles on Mack After Treatment System and Mack MP7 Engine Under 460HP 1 

$2,700.001

Allison
Refuse 1 

Warranty - specify 
Extended Warranty for Allison Transmission 4500RDS, 60 Months 500,000 Miles, Refuse Application 1 

$1,100.001

Warranty - specify NA 
Base 1 Diesel Warranty - specify 

Standard Mack Engine Warranty 24 Months 250,000 1 
Std1

Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: MR Series
DEALER: Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00 $138,292.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

60,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE REFUSE TRUCK
(ONLY)

SPECIFICATION #16

2018 Mack MR Series

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Mack MR Series purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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