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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK (Specification #15)

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 * Western
2018 Freightliner M2-112 Western
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 * Northern
2018 Freightliner M2-112 Northern
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 * Central
2018 Freightliner M2-112 Central
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 * Southern
2018 Freightliner M2-112 Southern
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Western
2018 International HX Western
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Northern
2018 International HX Northern
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International HX Central
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Central
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International HX Southern
2018 International HX Southern
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Western
2018 International Workstar Western
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Northern
2018 International Workstar Northern
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International Workstar Central
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Central
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International Workstar Southern
2018 International Workstar Southern
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Western
2018 Kenworth T880 Western
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Northern

Base Unit
Price

$57,750.00
- NB --
$57,750.00
- NB --
$57,750.00
—-NB --
$57,750.00
- NB --

$103,300.00
- NB --
$102,300.00
--NB --
$102,250.00
$102,300.00
$103,734.00
- NB --

$92,500.00
--NB --
$91,500.00
--NB --
$91,620.00
$91,650.00
$90,637.00
--NB --

$101,989.00

—-NB --
$101,739.00
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Kenworth of Central Florida

Kenworth of South Florida

Nextran Corporation

Nextran Corporation

Nextran Corporation

Nextran Corporation

Rush Truck Centers of Florida
Rush Truck Centers of Florida
Rush Truck Centers of Florida
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers inc
Nextran Corporation

ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC.
Nextran Corporation

ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC.
Nextran Corporation

ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC.
Nextran Corporation

ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC.
Tampa Truck Center LLC
Tampa Truck Center LLC

Tampa Truck Center LLC

Tampa Truck Center LLC

2018 Kenworth T880
2018 Kenworth T880
2018 Kenworth T880
2018 Kenworth T880
2018 Kenworth T880

2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series

2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567

2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series

2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

- NB --
$100,998.00
- NB --
$97,986.00
—-NB --

$107,780.00
- NB --
$107,780.00
—-NB --
$107,780.00
--NB --
$107,780.00
- NB --

$104,705.00
- NB --
$104,705.00
—-NB --
$104,705.00
--NB --
$104,416.00
- NB --

$94,752.00
$99,072.00
$94,752.00
$99,072.00
$94,752.00
$98,172.00
$94,752.00
$98,172.00

$81,816.00
--NB --
$81,816.00
--NB --
$81,816.00
--NB --
$81,816.00
--NB --
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52,000 LB GYVYWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Freightliner M2-112
2018 International HX
2018 International Workstar
2018 Kenworth T880

2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Peterbilt 567

2018 Volvo V Series

2018 Western Star 4700

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:
a. 350 HP 6 cylinder diesel engine, manufacturer's 11L minimum
2. TRANSMISISON & CLUTCH:

a. The following or approved equivalents are acceptable:
b. Fuller 14210B 10 Speed Manual with OD

3. ENGINE EQUIPMENT:

a. Alternator — 12 volt 100A

b. Premium engine hoses

c. Injection pump — electronic engine control
d. Radiator — aluminum core

e. Air restriction monitor — intake mounted

a. Cab — welded steel galvanized or aluminum shell with rust preventative coating.
b. Floor covering — black rubber mats

c. Seating — driver air suspension mid back, passenger fixed mid back.

d. Steering wheel — 18" two spoke

e. Standard air conditioning and heating

5. FRAME:

. Frame — steel construction matched to GVW and mounted body of truck.
. Wheelbase — 187"

. Front bumper — painted steel

. Fuel tank — 70 gallon, minimum

. Air dryer — Bendix AD9 heated, or approved equivalent.

o o Ow

6. SAFETY:
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a. Horn — single air trumpet
b. Mirrors — West Coast to include 7.5" convex mounted to lower mirror bracket.

c. Brakes —"S" cam type 16.5" x 5" Q + front and 16.5" x 7" Q + rear with anti-lock without automatic traction control,

or approved equivalent.
d. Slack adjusters — Haldex automatic front and rear.
e. Daytime running lights.
f. Backup alarm

7. FERONT AXLE:

a. Front axle — 12,000 Ib.

. Front wheels — steel 10 hole hub piloted

. Front tires — 11R22.5 Goodyear G397LHS, steer or approved equivalent.
. Front hubs — Ferrous, or approved equivalent.

. Oil type with synthetic lube

o o o

8. REAR AXLE:

a. Rear axle — 40,000 1b.

b. Rear wheels — steel 10 hole hub piloted

c. Rear tires — 11R22.5 Goodyear G124 unisteel traction or approved equivalent.
d. Hubs — Ferrous, or approved equivalent.

e. Power divider with warning light and buzzer (includes in cab control)

9. ELECTRICAL:

a. Circuit protection — fuses except headlamp and wiper circuits which utilize circuit breakers.
b. Hand throttle — electronic hand throttle operated through cruise control when in PTO mode only.

c. Engine protection — engine shut down system monitoring high water temp, low oil pressure, high exhaust temp, high

transmission temp.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Mack C or G Series

The Mack C or G Series purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

Order Code

C or G Series

Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation

Western Northern Central Southern

$107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00
Delete Options All Zones
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

1001764 !
1001761 !
1001770 !

1001785 !

1362131 !
1361311 !
1361328 !
1361327 !
1361509 !

14F44R !

20F44R !

Engine upgrade - specify
Mack MP7 395HP |

Engine upgrade - specify
Mack MP7 425HP 1

Engine upgrade - specify
Mack MP8 455HP, Includes: FRO-18210C (1362174) and Spicer Heavy Duty Driveline (1952203) 1

Engine upgrade - specify
Mack MP8 505HP, Includes: FRO-18210C (1362174) ad Spicer Heavy Duty Driveline (1952203) 1

Engine upgrade - specify

Transmission upgrade - specify
Eaton Fuller 14908LL, Includes: Transmission Cooler (1390001) 1

Transmission upgrade - specify
Mack T310M or Eaton Fuller 16908LL 1

Transmission upgrade - specify
Mack T313 or Eaton Fuller 169134 1

Transmission upgrade - specify
Mack T318 or Eaton Fuller 18918B 1

Transmission upgrade - specify
Mack 13 speed M- Drive Creeper Gear and Multi Speed Reverse 1

58,000 1b. GVWR package
Includes Options: 14K Front Axle (2401507), 44K Rear Axle (2681004), Mack Camelback Suspension (1861034)
1122.5 Tires (9001176), Upgraded Frame Rail (2741028) 1

64,000 Ib. GVWR package

Includes Option: 20K Front Axle (2401501), 44K Rear Axle, (2681004), Mack Camelback Suspension (1861034), 425
Front Tires (9001364), Steel 12.25 Wheels (5312726), Upgraded Steering Box (2452211) Heavy Frame Rail
(2741029)

$456.00"
$848.00'
$3,190.00"
$3,868.00"

NA
$520.00"

$1,197.00"
$1,717.00"
$3,000.00"
$6,400.00"

$2.923.00"

$4.877.00"

983



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

20F46R '

2902A50 !

1364540 !
2710208 !

2401507 !

2401500 !

2401501 !

2681026 !

NEX 13 RDA '

NEX 13 SDA !

NEX 20 RDA !
NEX 20 STA !

1862420 !

C or G Series

Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation
Western Northern Central Southern
$107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00

GVWR upgrade - specify
66,000 [b GVWR Package, Includes Options: 20K Front Axle (2401501) 46K Rear Axle (2681020), Mack Camelack
Suspension (1861035), 425 Front Tires (9001364), Steel 12.25 Wheels (5312726), Upgraded Steering Box (2452211)
Heavy Frame Rail (2741029) 1

GVWR upgrade - specify

GVWR upgrade - specify

GVWR upgrade - specify

GVWR upgrade - specify

Bi-fuel model - specify

CNG prep - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent
Includes 50 Gallon Aluminum Fuel Tank on Right Hand Side 1

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire
Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent

Double Frame: full steel insert
Includes: Hizavy Frame Rail (2741029), SMM Steel Channel Insert (2731007), Heavy Duty Cross Members
(2811056)

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 14,600 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Includes Tire and Wheel Upgrades 1

Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Includes:425 Front Tires (9001364), 12.25" Steel Wheels (5312726), 16.5x6 Front Brakes (2411105), Upgraded
Steering Box (2452211) 1

Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Includes:425 Front Tires (9001364), 12.25" Steel Wheels (5312726), 16.5x6 Front Brakes (2411105), Upgraded
Steering Box (2452211) Heavy Duty Frame Rail (2741029) 1

Rear Axle: 46,000 1b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent
Includes: 46K Mack Rear Axle with Camelback or M-ride Suspension 1

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rear Suspension: 40,000 1b air ride

Rear Suspension: 46,000 Ib Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent
46K Haulmax Suspension (1862420) Includes: 46K Rear Axle (2681026), 16.5x7 Brakes (2531104) 1

$5,323.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
$564.00"

NA
NA
$14,542.00"
$1,655.00"

NA
$763.00"

NA
$2.720.00"

$3,782.00"

$2,875.00"

$6.146.00"
$7.657.00"

$6,952.00"
$8.450.00"

NA
$2,050.00"
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

1861508 !
NEX 12SD !
NEX 18 SD !

NEX 60
174/RP4500 !

2540401 !

NEX 60
DPHK/RP4500 '

NEX 20 RRL
NEX 25 RRL !
NEX 32 RRL
33K GVW Lube

Fuel TK '

66K GVW Lube
Fuel TK !

6x6 Option !

NEX 60 KGF '

5,000 GL Tanker !

6x6 Wetline !
2882088 !
2901A50 !
5313774 !
NEX WKLB '

NEX WKSLD '

C or G Series

Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation

Western Northern Central
$107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b air ride
Includes 46K Rear Axle (2681904) 1

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
12 Cubic Yard, 14' Steel Dump Body 1

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
18 Cubic Yard, 16' Steel Dump Body 1

Rolloff hoist system and tarP system. State model bid.
60,000 LB Rolloff Hoist and Tarp

Cab suspension - air ride

Driver controlled differential lock
Diff Lock 1

Optional mounted body - sPecify
60,000LB, Hook Hoist and Tarp

Optional mounted body - specify
20 Cubic Yard Refuse Rear Loader 1

Optional mounted body - specify
25 Cubic Yard Refuse Rear Loader 1

Optional mounted body - specify
32 Cubic Yard Refuse Rear Loader 1

Optional mounted body - specify
33K GVW Lube Fuel Truck 1

Optional mounted body - specify
66K GVW Lube Fuel Truck 1

Optional mounted body - specify
6x6 Option From Mod Center 1

Optional mounted body - specify
60,000 Ib Above Frame Roll-off Hoist and Tarp 1

Optional mounted body - specify
5,000 GL Tanker 1

Optional mounted body - s;i)ecify
6x6 Wet Kit and Catwalk Option

Optional equipment - specify
LH 111 Gallon Fuel Tank 1

Optional equipment - specify
RH 50 Gallon Fuel Tank 1

Optional equipment - specify
All Aluminum Wheels 1

Optional equipment - specify
Hydraulic Wet Kit, Low Boy Application 1

Optional equipment - specify
Hydraulic Wet Kit, Single Line Dump 1

Nextran Corporation

Nextran Corporation
Southern
$107,780.00

$1,536.00"
$15,770.00'
$17,295.00"
$35,767.00"

Std
$1,102.00"

$47,200.00"
$53,750.00'
$64,750.00"
$74,420.00"
$84,152.00'
$113,596.00"
$46,850.00"
$44,352.00'
$193,928.00"
$14,998.00"
$374.00"
$498.00"
$1,056.00"

$6,500.00"

$5,800.00"
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

NEX WK2LWF !

GU433/GU533-56 '

GU433/GU533-64 '

SINGLE AXLE !

1890011 !

1919007 !

BV !

NEX WKSLD
AMT !

HLT '

25 Ton Pintle
Hook !

TempTag !

Transfer !

New !

300,000

400,000 '

3YR/300K '
4YR/300K !

5YR/400K !

C or G Series

Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation Nextran Corporation
Western Northern Central Southern
$107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00 $107,780.00

1

Optional equipment - specify $6,297.00

Hydraulic Wet Kit, Two Line Walking Floor 1
Optional equipment - specify $105,000.001
MHD Option. Mack Medium Heavy Duty, 56,500 GVWR Cab and Chassis, Cummins ISL-D 345, Allsion 3000RDS-6,
Jake Brake, 16,500 Front Axle, 40,000 Rear Axle, Hendrickson HMX400 Suspension 1

Optional equipment - specify $108,000.001
MHD Option, Mack Medium Heavy Duty, 64,000 GVWR Cab and Chassis, Cummins ISL-D 345. Allison 3000RDS-6,

Jake Brake, 18,000 Front Axle, 46,000 Rear Axle, Hendrickson or Chalmers 46,000 Suspension 1

1

Optional equipment - specify ($8,000.00)
Single Axle Option ($8,000 deduction) 1

Optional equipment - s[}ecify $2,800.001
M-Drive Transmission PTO

Optional equipment - specify $215.00"
Factory Prep for PTO 1

Optional equipment - specify $843.00"
Body Vibrator 1

Optional equipment - specify 337,800.001
Hydraulic Wetline Single Line Dump with Automatic Manual Transmission 1

Optional equipment - specify $1,621 00"
High Lift Tailgate 1

Optional equipment - specify $1,565.001
25 Ton Pintle Hook with Electric and Air Hook Up 1

Temporary tag Incl.!
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $100.00"
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) $300.00"
Maintenance Plan - specify 332,475.001
Normal Duty 1

Maintenance Plan - specify 954,080.001
Normal Duty 1

Maintenance Plan - specify NA
Warranty - specify $1,750.00"
3 Year, 300,000 Mile Warranty on Mack Engine Plan 2 and Exhaust after Treatment System with Engines Under

460HP |

Warranty - specify $2,475.00"
4 Year, 300,000 Mile Warranty on Mack Engine Plan 2 and Exhaust after Treatment System with Engines under

460HP |

Warranty - specify $4,150.001
5 Year, 400,000 Mile Warranty on ack Engine Plan 2 and Exhaust after Treatment System with Engines under

460HP |

Diesel Warranty - specify NA
Diesel Warranty - specify NA
Diesel Warranty - specify NA
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52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Mack C or G Series

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Mack C or G Series purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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