
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK (Specification #15)
 
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Western $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Western -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Northern $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Northern -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Central $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Central -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Southern $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Southern -- NB --
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Western $103,300.00
 2018 International HX Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Northern $102,300.00
 2018 International HX Northern -- NB --
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International HX Central $102,250.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Central $102,300.00
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International HX Southern $103,734.00
 2018 International HX Southern -- NB --
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Western $92,500.00
 2018 International Workstar Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Northern $91,500.00
 2018 International Workstar Northern -- NB --
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International Workstar Central $91,620.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Central $91,650.00
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International Workstar Southern $90,637.00
 2018 International Workstar Southern -- NB --
 
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Western $101,989.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Western -- NB --
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Northern $101,739.00
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 2018 Kenworth T880 Northern -- NB --
Kenworth of Central Florida 2018 Kenworth T880 Central $100,998.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Central -- NB --
Kenworth of South Florida 2018 Kenworth T880 Southern $97,986.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Western $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Western -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Northern $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Northern -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Central $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Central -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Southern $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Southern -- NB --
 
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Western $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Western -- NB --
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Northern $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Northern -- NB --
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Central $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Central -- NB --
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers inc 2018 Peterbilt 567 Southern $104,416.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Western $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Western $99,072.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Northern $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Northern $99,072.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Central $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Central $98,172.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Southern $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Southern $98,172.00
 
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Western $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Western -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Northern $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Northern -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Central $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Central -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Southern $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Freightliner M2-112 
2018 International HX 
2018 International Workstar 
2018 Kenworth T880 
2018 Mack C or G Series 
2018 Peterbilt 567 
2018 Volvo V Series 
2018 Western Star 4700 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED. 

ENGINE:1.

350 HP 6 cylinder diesel engine, manufacturer's 11L minimuma.

TRANSMISISON & CLUTCH:2.

The following or approved equivalents are acceptable:a.
Fuller 14210B 10 Speed Manual with ODb.

ENGINE EQUIPMENT:3.

Alternator – 12 volt 100Aa.
Premium engine hosesb.
Injection pump – electronic engine controlc.
Radiator – aluminum cored.
Air restriction monitor – intake mountede.

CAB:4.

Cab – welded steel galvanized or aluminum shell with rust preventative coating.a.
Floor covering – black rubber matsb.
Seating – driver air suspension mid back, passenger fixed mid back.c.
Steering wheel – 18" two spoked.
Standard air conditioning and heatinge.

FRAME:5.

Frame – steel construction matched to GVW and mounted body of truck.a.
Wheelbase – 187"b.
Front bumper – painted steelc.
Fuel tank – 70 gallon, minimumd.
Air dryer – Bendix AD9 heated, or approved equivalent.e.

SAFETY:6.
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Horn – single air trumpeta.
Mirrors – West Coast to include 7.5" convex mounted to lower mirror bracket.b.
Brakes – "S" cam type 16.5" x 5" Q + front and 16.5" x 7" Q + rear with anti-lock without automatic traction control,
or approved equivalent.

c.

Slack adjusters – Haldex automatic front and rear.d.
Daytime running lights.e.
Backup alarmf.

FRONT AXLE:7.

Front axle – 12,000 lb.a.
Front wheels – steel 10 hole hub pilotedb.
Front tires – 11R22.5 Goodyear G397LHS, steer or approved equivalent.c.
Front hubs – Ferrous, or approved equivalent.d.
Oil type with synthetic lubee.

REAR AXLE:8.

Rear axle – 40,000 lb.a.
Rear wheels – steel 10 hole hub pilotedb.
Rear tires – 11R22.5 Goodyear G124 unisteel traction or approved equivalent.c.
Hubs – Ferrous, or approved equivalent.d.
Power divider with warning light and buzzer (includes in cab control)e.

ELECTRICAL:9.

Circuit protection – fuses except headlamp and wiper circuits which utilize circuit breakers.a.
Hand throttle – electronic hand throttle operated through cruise control when in PTO mode only.b.
Engine protection – engine shut down system monitoring high water temp, low oil pressure, high exhaust temp, high
transmission temp.

c.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Kenworth T880
The Kenworth T880 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $101,989.00 $101,739.00 $100,998.00 $97,986.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options
Western
& Northern Central Southern

012569 1 
0129582 3 

Engine/transmission - specify 
PACCAR PX-9 370 2017 370@2000 1250@1400 1 
PACCAR PX-9 ENGINE 380 HP 380@1900 1250@1400 3 

($5,022.00)1 NA ($7,708.00)3

Engine/transmission - specify NA NA NA 
Engine/transmission - specify NA NA NA 
Engine/transmission - specify NA NA NA 

 

Order Code Add Options
Western
& Northern Central Southern

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

0700197 1 
0125833/1105240 2 
0700656 2058362 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
PACCAR MX-11 2017 430MT 430@1600 1450/1650@900 Multi Torque
w/engine brake  1 
ISX12L-425hp 2 
PACCAR MX-13 455HP TRANSMISSION FRO16210C 3 

$398.001 $4,648.002 $646.003

0125790 1 
0123645/1105220 2 
0125790 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
ISX12 385V 385@1800 370@2100 1450@1100, w/Engine Retarder.
Diagnostic Plug for data link, Oil Cooler, Aluminum Flywheel
Housing.  1 
X15L-450hp 1650ft/lb {must upgrade trans} 2 
CUMMINS ISX12 385 HP W ENGINE RETARDER 3 

$3,319.001 $3,252.002 $3,908.003

0123709 1 
0123690/1105220 2 
0125807 2058362 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
X15 500 2017 500@1800 1650@1000 w/Intebrake, Diagnostic Plug for
data link, Oil Cooler, Aluminum Flywheel Housing  1 
X15L-485hp {must upgrade trans} change to 0123715 X15L-505hp
$5,073.00 [must upgrade trans} 2 
CUMMINS ISX12 400V HP 1650 @1000RPM TRANSMISSION
FRO16210C 3 

$4,711.001 $3,995.002 $3,982.003

0700607 1 
0700656 2 
0123645 2058362 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
PACCAR MX-13 405 2017 405@1600 1450@900 with engine brake 1 
Paccar MX-455hp {must upgrade trans} 2 
CUMMINS X15 450 HP 1650 @1000RPM TRANSMISSION
FRO16210C 3 

$910.001 $453.002 $3,156.003

VEHICLE: T880
DEALER: KENWORTH OF

JACKSONVILLE
KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Kenworth of South
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $101,989.00 $101,739.00 $100,998.00 $97,986.00
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0700656 1 
0700701 2 
0123709 2058362 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
PACCAR MX-13 455 2017 455@1600 1650@900 with engine brake 1 
Paccar MX-500hp {must upgrade trans} change to 0700686 MX-485hp
$1,315.00 {must upgrade trans} 2 
CUMMINS X15 500 HP 1650 @1000RPM TRANSMISSION
FRO16210C 3 

$1,120.001 $2,342.002 $5,170.003

2058362 1 
BUC 2 
2057371 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Transmission: Fuller FRO16210C 10-speed w/pump & external oil
cooler. Standard with synthetic lubricant. Includes severe-duty pilot
bearing on all class 8 models  1 
Back up camera 2 
FULLER RTO-14908LL 10-SPEED 3 3 

$231.001 $1,176.002 $950.003

2057371 1 
2058372 2 
2058437 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Transmission: Fuller RTO14908LL 10-speed. Standard with synthetic
lubricant. Includes severe-duty pilot bearing on all class 8 models.
*Torque Limit: 1450 pound-feet 1 
RTO16908LL 10 speed 2 
FULLER ADVANTAGE FAO-16810C-EA3 3 

$1,023.001 $1,771.002 $4,491.003

2058444 1 
2058444 2 
2058409 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Transmission: Fuller RTLO16913A 13-speed w/oil cooler & pump.
Standard with synthetic lubricant. Includes severe-duty pilot bearing on
all class 8 models. *Torque Limit: 1650 pound-feet.  1 
RTLO16913A 13 speed 2 
FULLER FO16E308LL VCS 10-SPEED ULTRASHIFT AUTOMATED 3 

$1,325.001 $2,100.002 $10,996.003

2057384 1 
2058409/2450114 2 
2058444 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Eaton FO17E308LL-VCS Ultrashift Transmission 1 
UltraShift F016E308LL VCS 10spd w/traction control{must add/have
Jake Brake}  2 
FULLER RTLO-16913A 13-SPEED  3 

$8,589.001 $8,717.002 $1,737.003

2058755 1 
2058756/2450114 2 
2058402 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Eaton FO16E318B-MXP Ultrashift Plus Transmission 1 
UltraShift F018E318B MXP 18spd w/traction control {must add/have
Jake Brake}  2 
FULLER RTO-16908LL 10-SPEED FOR OTHER TRANSMISSION
ENGINE COMBINATION CALL THE DEALER 3 

$8,622.001 $9,686.002 $2,370.003

GVW58K 1 
3142161/3749209 2 
58.6K 3 

58,000 lb. GVWR package 
14600 Steer, 44,000lb Rears 1 
Chalmers 46k w/10.75" frame 2 
58,600# GVWR PACKAGE: MERITOR 14,600# FRONT & 44,000#
TANDEM; KENWORTH 46,000# AIR BAG SUSPENSION  3 

$6,812.001 $5,306.002 $4,466.003

GVW64K 1 
64k/GVW 2 
64K 3 

64,000 lb. GVWR package 
Dana Spicer D2000 Steer 46k Rears 1 
Package includes: 20k Front axle/front tires/wheels; 46k rear
axle/suspension 2 
64,000# GVWR PACKAGE: MERITOR 20,000# FRONT & 44,000#
TANDEM; KENWORTH 46,000# AIR BAG SUSPENSION FOR
OTHERS GVW COMBINATIONS CONTACT DEALER 3 

$10,822.001 $9,934.002 $8,927.003

VEHICLE: T880
DEALER: KENWORTH OF

JACKSONVILLE
KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Kenworth of South
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $101,989.00 $101,739.00 $100,998.00 $97,986.00
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GVW66KCH 1 
000800 2 
T800 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
66k GVW Package 20k steer, 46k rears with 46k Chalmers suspension 1 
T800 Model Cab 2 
T800 CAB OPTION with Paccar MX 13 FOR OTHERS T800
COMPONENTS CONTACT DEALER 3 

$11,320.001 ($2,583.00)2 NC3

GVW66KHN 1 
0129569/2011205 2 
90K GVW 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
66k GVW Package 20k steer, 46k rears with 46k Hendrickson
suspension 1 
52,000 GVW T880 PX9-370hp / 3000RDS  2 
DANA SPICER D2000 20K FRONT AXLE & DANA SPICER D70-590
DUAL REDUCTION 70K REAR TANDEM & HENDRICKSON
HAULMAXX 70K SUSPENSION TO HANDLE KLEIN K700 WATER
TANK  3 

$10,210.001 $5,900.002 $45,684.003

70006/0129552/2011205 2 
3808119 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
52,000 GVW T370 PX9-350hp / 3000 or 3500RDS 2 
LIFT AXLE: STEERABLE PUSHER 13,500 3 

NA ($8,316.00)2 $9,991.003

000410/2016158 2 
3808802 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
52,000 GVW T440 PX9-370hp w/4500RDS: with 0128920 3000RDS
$2,901.00  2 
LIFT AXLE: STEERABLE PUSHER 20,000 3 

NA $9,123.002 $12,800.003

000410/0128920 2 
66KGVW 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
52,000 GVW T440 ISL-G 320hp w/4500RDS: with 2011205 3000RDS
$12,178.00 2 
66,000LB GVW 66,000# GVWR PACKAGE: MERITOR 20,000# FRONT
& 46,000# TANDEM; KENWORTH 46,000# AIR BAG SUSPENSION  3 

NA $18,971.002 $10,171.003

Bi-fuel model - specify NA NA NA 
0125805 1 
0125806 2 

CNG prep - specify 
Cummins ISX12G 400HP - Must Add CNG Tank System 1 
ISX12-G 400hp-1450 ft/lb: change to 0128921 ISL-G 320hp $19,697.00
{must add CNG tanks for both} 2 

$28,756.001 $22,191.002 NA 

CNGTNKS 2 
0125806 3 

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
80DGE CNG tanks: change to 90DGE $36,970.00 2 
ISX12L-G 400hp (Must add CNG Tanks fOR DIFFERENT CNG
ENGINE AND TANKS COMBINATION CALL DEALER  3 

NA $35,756.002 $33,136.003

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA NA NA 
DUALFUEL 1 
7214090/6090 2 
7216075 3 

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent 
ADD 100 GALLON FUEL TANK 1 
Dual 90 gallon alum fuel tanks w/20gal DEF tank 2 
DUAL 75 GALLONS ALUMINUM TANKS, ROUND, WITH 20.7
GALLONS DEF TANK. *OTHER CAPACITIES AVAILABLE -
CONTACT DEALER 3 

$1,625.001 $1,489.002 $1,502.003

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA NA NA 
2016154 1 
2016154 2 
2016154 3 

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic
oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent 
6 Speed  1 

$16,355.001 $15,962.002 $19,783.003

2016158 1 
2016158 2 
2016158 3 

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic
oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent 
6 Speed 1 

$17,220.001 $16,795.002 $20,923.003

VEHICLE: T880
DEALER: KENWORTH OF

JACKSONVILLE
KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Kenworth of South
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $101,989.00 $101,739.00 $100,998.00 $97,986.00
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6141200 1 
6141600 2 
6141600 3 

Double Frame: full steel insert 
Full Steel Insert: for 10-5/8 in. or 10-3/4 in. Steel to 284 in. or 2nd insert
for 11-5/8 in. steel frame.  1 

$920.001 $1,800.002 $1,424.003

2503467 1 
Telma 2 
2513010 3 

Front Axle: 14,000 lb rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs 
Dana Spicer E-1462W Front Axle rated 14.6K 3-1/2in. drop, wide track
for better turning radius  1 
Telma Retarder 2 
14,600# FRONT AXLE & SPRINGS, 16,000# POWER STEERING
GEAR 3 

$2,302.001 $12,355.002 $1,138.003

2503467 1 
2513014 2 
2513010 3 

Front Axle: 14,600 lb rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs 
Dana Spicer E-1462W Front Axle rated 14.6K 3-1/2in. drop, wide track
for better turning radius  1 
{must add tires/wheels for rating 2 
14,600# FRONT AXLE & SPRINGS, 16,000# POWER STEERING
GEAR 3 

$2,302.001 $1,102.002 $1,138.003

205618116 1 
2864016 2 
16KFA 3 

Front Axle: 16,000 lb rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs 
Dana Spicer D2000 Front Axle with 16k springs 1 
{must add tires/wheels for rating 2 
20,000# FRONT AXLE & 16K SPRINGS, 16000# POWER STEERING
GEAR 3 

$4,420.001 $2,873.002 $4,746.003

205618118 1 
2865018 2 
FA18K 3 

Front Axle: 18,000 lb rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs 
Dana Spicer D2000 Front Axle with 16k springs 1 
Includes front tires/wheels 2 
20,000# FRONT AXLE & 18K SPRINGS, 20,000# DUAL POWER
STEERING GEAR 3 

$4,838.001 $3,872.002 $5,660.003

2506181 1 
2517020 2 
FA20 3 

Front Axle: 20,000 lb. rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs 
Dana Spicer D2000 Front Axle 1 
Includes front tires/wheels 2 
20,000# FRONT AXLE & SPRINGS, 20,000# DUAL POWER
STEERING GEAR 3 

$4,880.001 $5,493.002 $5,664.003

3144170 1 
3142170 2 
3142160 3 

Rear Axle: 46,000 lb Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or
equivalent 
Dual Dana Spicer D46-170 rear axle rated at 46K. Tandem rear axles.
w/ 12.5mm housing and 2.06in. shaft diameter. Tandem rear axles  1 
Meritor RT46-160 2 
MERITOR RT-46-160  3 

$6,475.001 $2,528.002 $2,128.003

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 lb rating air lift to
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels 

NA NA NA 

3818119 1 
3808119 2 
3808119 3 

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 lb rating air lift to
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels 
Factory Installed Watson Chalin Steerable 13,200lb lift axle. Requires
Full Frame Insert and suspension upgrade  1 
Requires double frame and rear suspension upgrade 2 

$9,180.001 $9,831.002 $9,991.003

VEHICLE: T880
DEALER: KENWORTH OF

JACKSONVILLE
KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Kenworth of South
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $101,989.00 $101,739.00 $100,998.00 $97,986.00
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3818025 1 
3808025 2 
3808026 3 

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels 
Factory Installed Watson Chalin Non-Steerable 20,000lb lift axle.
Requires Full Frame Insert and suspension upgrade 1 
Requires double frame and rear suspension upgrade 2 

$10,531.001 $11,282.002 $10,376.003

3818802 1 
3808802 2 
3808802 3 

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels 
Factory Installed Watson Chalin Steerable 20,000lb lift axle. Requires
Full Frame Insert and suspension upgrade  1 
Requires double frame and rear suspension upgrade 2 

$11,320.001 $14,517.002 $12,800.003

3730032 1 
3730032 2 
3730026 3 

Rear Suspension: 40,000 lb air ride 
Rear suspension: Tandem Kenworth Airglide 400 40K 54 in. axle
spacing. 10.5 in. ride height. Includes air suspension dump valve 1 
KW Airglide 2 
Airglide 400 L 3 

$2,302.001 $2,165.002 $996.003

3742020 1 
3749209/383226 2 
3747460 3 

Rear Suspension: 46,000 lb Chalmers, Hendrickson,
Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent 
Rear suspension: Tandem Hendrickson Primaax EX462 46K. Steel
crossmember & gussets. 54 in. axle spacing. 10 in. ride height 1 
Chalmers 46k w/shocks 2 
CHALMERS 3 

$3,820.001 $3,722.002 $2,100.003

3740130 1 
3744150/383510 2 
3740130 3 

Rear Suspension: 46,000 lb air ride 
Rear suspension: Tandem Kenworth Airglide 460 46K 54 in. axle
spacing. 10.5 in. ride height. Includes air suspension dump valve 1 
Neway 46k w/dual leveling valves: change to 3740130 KW AG460
$2,409.00 2 
KENWORTH AIRGLIDE AG460, 46,000#  3 

$2,450.001 $4,062.002 $2,471.003

EC-GT15DP 1 
12YD DMP 2 
12GP864046 3 

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system.
State model bid. 
15' 12 YARD DUMP BODY ELECTRIC TARP 1 
OX w/hot shift PTO {or equivalent} 2 
GAR-P 12.36 CUBIC YARDS (HEAPED)STEEL DUMP BODY, 12' X
96"; INCLUDES HOT SHIFT P.T.O. FOR AUTO TRANSMISSION 3 

$16,100.001 $16,928.002 $16,212.003

EC-GT16DP 1 
18YD DMP 2 
16GP865151 3 

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system.
State model bid. 
16' 18 YARD DUMP BODY ELECTRIC TARP 1 
OX w/hot shift PTO {or equivalent} ADD Option Hi-Lift Gate $1,547.00
OX / $1,637.00 Gar-P 2 
GAR-P 18.3 CUBIC YARDS CAPACITY (HEAPED)STEEL DUMP
BODY, 16' X 96", INCLUDES HOT SHIFT P.T.O. FOR AUTO
TRANSMISSION 3 

$18,005.001 $17,664.002 $16,812.003

EC-DC0XU5 1 
GALBREATH 2 
GF 3 

Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. 
GALLBREATH U5-OR-174 CABLE HOIST WITH/TARP 1 
Galbreath AFOR174-60k above frame w/Pioneer tarp: change to
U5OR174-60k w/Pioneer tarp $45,801.00 2 
GALFAB 60,000# OUTSIDE/INSIDE RAIL HOIST 3 

$39,105.001 $48,420.002 $49,320.003

8890876 2 Cab suspension - air ride Std Std2 Incl. 

VEHICLE: T880
DEALER: KENWORTH OF

JACKSONVILLE
KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Kenworth of South
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $101,989.00 $101,739.00 $100,998.00 $97,986.00
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3532130 1 
3511420 2 
3532130 3 

Driver controlled differential lock 
FORWARD AND REAR DRIVE DIFFERENTIAL LOCKS 1 
(4) wheel lock for both rear axles 2 

$1,905.001 $1,688.002 $1,869.003

EC-DCTB24SB 1 
HEIL ROLLOFF 2 
KBF222A 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
24' STAKE BODY (INCLUDES 40" HIGH STEEL RACKS ON BOTH
SIDES) 1 
Roll off: Heil Kwik Lift 60k w/ Diablo tarp system: Add Low Lift option +
$3,778.00  2 
PAC MAC KBF222A KNUCKLE BOOM CRANE, 3,000# LIFT @ 22'; 40
CUBIC YARDS CAPACITY DUMP BODY (TBK2450); INCLUDING
HOT SHIFT P.T.O. REQUIRES 64,000# GVW  3 

$9,503.001 $47,727.002 $82,248.003

EC-DCTB24T 1 
AMER ROLL 2 
RLX25 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
24' TRASH DUMP (INCLUDING 48" SIDES, DOUBLE BARN DOOR
TAILGATE GROUND LEVEL TARP SYSTEM 1 
Roll Off: American ART-60k above frame w/ tarp system 2 
PAC MAC RLX25 HIGH COMPACTION REAR LOADER, W/CART
ATTACHMENTS, 15,000# REEVING SYSTEM, 4 AMBER SMART
STROBES, HOPPER WORKLIGHT & REAR VIEW CAMERA,
INCLUDING HOT SHIFT P.T.O. 3 

$18,605.001 $51,685.002 $78,508.003

EC-DCTBU5EX 1 
AMREP ROLL 2 
PK44502-C 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
GALBREATH U5-EX-174 EXTENDABLE HOIST W/TARP 1 
Roll Off: AMREP AMRO-H-22 60k w/Pioneer tarp system 2 
PALFINGER KNUCKLE BOOM CRANE, MAXIMUM REACH OF 37'
9", MAXIMUM CAPACITY OF 15,200 KGS (33,450#), INSTALLED
BOC OR BOF, INCLUDING HOT SHIFT P.T.O.  3 

$40,215.001 $40,422.002 $176,000.003

EC-DCTB14CB 1 
HOOKLIFT 2 
K350 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
14' CHIPPER BODY (60" WITH 12" REMOVABLE TOP) 1 
Hook Lift: Ampliroll 65k hoist: change to Palfinger T50 or equivalent
$58,385.00  2 
KLEIN H.D. STEEL WATER TANK, BASE UNIT, 3,271 GALLONS
CAPACITY, INCLUDING HOT SHIFT P.T.O. PLEASE CONTACT US
FOR SPECIAL ADD-ON OPTIONS 3 

$17,210.001 $57,558.002 $33,600.003

RING-A-LINE 1 
ATLAS 2 
K400 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
PALFINGER A-LINE LAODER CLASSIFICATION HC1/HD4/B4 NET
SLEWING TORQUE 14,010 FT LBS RIGHT SODE JOY STICK
OPERATOR STATION  1 
Grapple crane: Petersen AL-1 Atlas w/40yd dump: change to Pac Mac
KB220 $89,015.00  2 
KLEIN H.D. STEEL WATER TANK, BASE UNIT, 3,847 GALLONS
CAPACITY, INCLUDING HOT SHIFT P.T.O. PLEASE CONTACT US
FOR SPECIAL ADD-ON OPTIONS 3 

$109,100.001 $91,460.002 $38,400.003

RING-ROLL-OFF 1 
EPSIL CRANE 2 
K500 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
ROLL-OFF MODEL ART -60-22 60,000 LB CAPACITY 22FT HOIST  1 
Crane: Palfinger-Epsilon S260L130 w/40yd body 2 
KLEIN H.D. STEEL WATER TANK, BASE UNIT, 5,200 GALLONS
CAPACITY, INCLUDING HOT SHIFT P.T.O. PLEASE CONTACT US
FOR SPECIAL ADD-ON OPTIONS. REQUIRES 72,000# G.V.W.
AVAILABLE AT EXTRA COST 3 

$49,900.001 $196,866.002 $40,920.003

VEHICLE: T880
DEALER: KENWORTH OF

JACKSONVILLE
KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Kenworth of South
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $101,989.00 $101,739.00 $100,998.00 $97,986.00

974



HEIL REL 2 
K700 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Rear Loader: Heil DP5000 25yd: Add Bayne cart tipper $4,514.00 2 
KLEIN H.D. STEEL WATER TANK, BASE UNIT, 6,500 GALLONS
CAPACITY, INCLUDING HOT SHIFT P.T.O. PLEASE CONTACT US
FOR SPECIAL ADD-ON OPTIONS. REQUIRES 90,000# G.V.W.,
AVAILABLE AT EXTRA COST 3 

NA $65,850.002 $79,080.003

EZ REL 2 
14GP864046 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Rear Loader: E-Z Pack Goliath G400 25yd: change to G300 25yd
$74,305.00 2 
GAR-P 14.4 CUBIC YARDS CAPACITY (HEAPED)STEEL DUMP
BODY, 14' X 96", INCLUDES HOT SHIFT P.T.O. FOR AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION 3 

NA $81,144.002 $16,212.003

MCN REL 2 
KTT 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Rear Loader: McNeilus 2516RL HD 25yd: change to McNeilus 3216
32yd rear loader $75,496.00 2 
KTT 24' CUSTOM MOBILE COMMAND/OPERATIONS CENTER.
FULL DESCRIPTION UPON REQUEST. SUITABLE FORBOTH
CIVILIAN AND POLICE RESPONSE TO INCIDENTS AND/OR
NATURAL DISASTERS. INCLUDES 40,600# GVW, AND FULL
TRAINING AT KTT WALLED LAKE, MI HEADQUARTERS 3 

NA $74,830.002 $266,400.003

NEWAY REL 2 
FB24 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Rear Loader: New Way King Cobra 25yd 2 
GAR-P 24' X 96" STEEL FLATBED BODY, DIAMOND-PLATE FLOOR,
W/40" H.D. REMOVABLE STEEL STAKES 3 

NA $68,381.002 $12,483.003

GTDB15 1 
LOAD REL 2 
AL WH 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 15' 12 YARD DUMP BODY ELECTRIC
TARP W/ PTO $17,700.00  1 
Rear Loader: Loadmaster Excel S 25yd 2 
ALUMINUN WHEELS PER PAIR 3 

$17,700.001 $60,962.002 $306.003

GTDB16 1 
TCM600 2 
8879917 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 16' 18 YARD DUMP BODY, ELECTRIC
TRAP W/ PTO $19,200.00  1 
Pro Patch TCM 600-120-DHE 6yd Asphalt patch body 2 
Two Additional Outboard windows 19"x12 3 

$19,200.001 $79,989.002 $299.003

GTLBT 1 
VAC TNK 2 
8850812 8850813 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify WETLINE LOW BOY TRAILER $5,800.00
 1 
4000gal steel septic tank w/hoist/hyd gate/ NVE 4310 blower system:
{w/NVE 866 500cfm vac system -w/out hyd gate $64,354.00} 2 
Dual 8" Hood Mounted Mirrors  3 

$5,800.001 $94,881.002 $211.003

GTWF 1 
WATERTNK 2 
8800260 8800372 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify WETLINE WALKING FLOOR $7,500.00
 1 
Water Tank: 4,000 Gallon steel w/hyd pump: Direct w/out hyd pump
$48,783.00 2 
DUAL EXTERIOR GRAB HANDLES 3 

$7,500.001 $65,790.002 $151.003

GTDT 1 
PINTLE HK 2 
8890135 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
WETLINE DUMP TRAILER  1 
Tow Pkg: 25ton Pintle Hook / Plate 2 
DUAL EXTERIOR GRAB HANDLES 3 

$6,100.001 $1,461.002 $640.003
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AAWH 1 
LUBESVCBODY 2 
2607811 3392604 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
All Aluminum wheels  1 
Lube Specialists 18' 1550 gal Fuel / Lube Body 2 
Air Disc Brakes FOR 12 ANDE 40K AXLES 3 

$2,225.001 $115,006.002 $2,280.003

DOJP 1 
AUTLUBE 2 
DHS 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Jack plate for detachable lowboy  1 
Auto Lube System: Lube Core for chassis/body 2 
DELETE HOT SHIFT P.T.O. 3 

$775.001 $6,700.002 ($1,250.00)3

8879917 1 
5042315/524215 2 
AHS 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Two additional outboard windows 19in x 12in  1 
11R-24.5 tires/wheels-steel (10) 2 
ADD HOT SHIFT P.T.O. 3 

$378.001 $539.002 $1,250.003

3392604  1 
5242367/4288678 2 
SDDS 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Splined rotor for dual rear air disc brake for use with aluminum hubs  1 
315/80R-22.5 rear tires/wheels 2 
MONROE SIT-DOWN DUAL DRIVE CONVERSION, PROVIDING
SEATING POSITION TO DRIVE LH OR RH. 3 

$2,660.001 $3,474.002 $15,360.003

SSV 1 
5242367/4238810 2 
HLTG 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Stainless Steel Visor  1 
12R-22.5 rear tires/wheels 2 
GAR-P HI-LIFT REAR TAILGATE 3 

$580.001 $3,278.002 $2,400.003

DOFF 1 
5045265/5245265 2 
GP1065KP 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Full fenders Tandem  1 
Front/Rear Aluminum wheels (10) 2 
GAR-P 25 TON PINTLE HITCH, D-RINGS & 7-WAY ELECTRICAL
PLUG 3 

$1,925.001 $1,981.002 $1,278.003

8850831 2 
GP12X750 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Hood mounted mirror {each} 2 
GAR-P TWO WAY TAILGATE 3 

NA $124.002 $1,020.003

8480065 2 
M090091  3 

Optional equipment - specify 
2 passenger vinyl bench seat 2 
DONALDSON SPARK ARRESTOR, INSTALLED 3 

NA $287.002 $1,500.003

Discount% 2 
6340041 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any
optional models bid. This discount only applies to a downgrade or an
upgrade to the model listed in this specification. It does not apply to a
completely different make or model 2 
REAR ENGINE POWER TAKE-OFF (REPTO), ISX-12 ONLY 3 

NA Incl.2 $2,952.003

05UNPUB 2 
8700966 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Unpublished bodies available at cost + 5% including fees 2 
KENWORTH NAVPLUS H.D. NAVIGATION SYSTEM 3 

NA Incl.2 $1,794.003

TEMP TAG 2 
TT 3 

Temporary tag Incl. Incl.2 NC3

DOTT 1 
TRANSFER 2 
TRANSFER 3 

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $79.751 Incl.2 $200.003
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NEWTAG 2 
NST 3 

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
ALL 3 

NA Incl.2 $425.003

9209689 2 Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty: Engine PX9 PP1 5yr/100,000 miles 2 

NA $2,468.002 NA 

9206284 2 Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty: Engine ISL-G PP1 5yr/150,000 miles 2 

NA $3,123.002 NA 

9206498 2 Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty: Engine ISX-G PP1 5yr/150,000 miles 2 

NA $2,670.002 NA 

9202622 1 
9209407 2 
9202622 3 

Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify EW: US Basic Vehicle 2 year/200,000 miles, United
States only.  1 
ISX PP1 Efficiency 5yr/150,000 miles 400hp-500hp 2 
EXTENDED BASIC VEHICLE WARRANTY - 2 YEARS/200,000 MILES 
 3 

$950.001 $1,214.002 $950.003

9202633 1 
9209422 2 
9202633 3 

Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify EW: US Basic Vehicle 3 year/300,000 miles, United
States only.  1 
ISX PP1 Performance 5yr/100,000 miles 485hp-605hp 2 
EXTENDED BASIC VEHICLE WARRANTY - 3 YEARS/300,000
MILES 3 

$2,725.001 $1,869.002 $2,725.003

9202133 1 
9206767 2 
9202634 3 

Warranty - specify 
EW: US Heater & Air Conditioner 3 year/300,000 miles, United States
only  1 
MX Comprehensive Plan A 5yr/100,000 miles below 460hp 2 
EXTENDED BASIC VEHICLE WARRANTY - 3 YEARS/400,000 MILES
For additional Extended Components warranty contact Dealer 3 

$500.001 $2,353.002 $3,425.003

PP1AT-5/300  1 
9209519 2 
9206762 9206879 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify PACCAR Comp Plan A with After Treatment -
5 yr / 300,000 miles  1 
ISX After Treatment 5yr/100k {must order PP1} - 9209698 PX9 After
Treatment 5yr/100k $605.00{must order PP1} 2 
PACCAR MX PLAN A 460HP OR LESS 3Y/300K AFTERTREATMENT
3Y/300K FOR ADDITIONALS PACCAR ENGINE E.W.CONTACT
DEALER 3 

$4,310.001 $655.002 $1,945.003

PP1AT-5/400 1 
9206886 2 
9209400 9209512 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify PACCAR Comp Plan A with After Treatment -
5 yr / 400,000 miles  1 
MX After Treatment 5yr/100k {must order Comprehensive Plan A} 2 
CUMMINS EW:PP1 2017 X15 EFFICIENCY 3Y/300K
AFTERTREATMENT 3Y/300K  3 

$5,515.001 $554.002 $1,710.003

PP1AT-5/500 1 
4500 5YR 2 
9202409 9209591 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify PACCAR Comp Plan A with After Treatment -
5 yr / 500,000 miles  1 
Allison 5yr/unlimited miles {Utility/P&D $786.00} 2 
CUMMINS EW:PP1 2017 X15 EFFICIENCY 5Y/500K
AFTERTREATMENT 5Y/300K FOR ADDITIONALS CUMMINS
ENGINE E.W.CONTACT DEALER 3 

$6,450.001 $1,009.002 $2,930.003
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Kenworth T880

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Kenworth T880 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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