
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK (Specification #15)
 
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Western $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Western -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Northern $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Northern -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Central $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Central -- NB --
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Southern $57,750.00
 2018 Freightliner M2-112 Southern -- NB --
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Western $103,300.00
 2018 International HX Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Northern $102,300.00
 2018 International HX Northern -- NB --
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International HX Central $102,250.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Central $102,300.00
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International HX Southern $103,734.00
 2018 International HX Southern -- NB --
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Western $92,500.00
 2018 International Workstar Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Northern $91,500.00
 2018 International Workstar Northern -- NB --
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International Workstar Central $91,620.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Central $91,650.00
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International Workstar Southern $90,637.00
 2018 International Workstar Southern -- NB --
 
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Western $101,989.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Western -- NB --
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Northern $101,739.00
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 2018 Kenworth T880 Northern -- NB --
Kenworth of Central Florida 2018 Kenworth T880 Central $100,998.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Central -- NB --
Kenworth of South Florida 2018 Kenworth T880 Southern $97,986.00
 2018 Kenworth T880 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Western $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Western -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Northern $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Northern -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Central $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Central -- NB --
Nextran Corporation 2018 Mack C or G Series Southern $107,780.00
 2018 Mack C or G Series Southern -- NB --
 
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Western $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Western -- NB --
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Northern $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Northern -- NB --
Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Peterbilt 567 Central $104,705.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Central -- NB --
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers inc 2018 Peterbilt 567 Southern $104,416.00
 2018 Peterbilt 567 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Western $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Western $99,072.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Northern $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Northern $99,072.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Central $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Central $98,172.00
Nextran Corporation 2018 Volvo V Series Southern $94,752.00
ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Volvo V Series Southern $98,172.00
 
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Western $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Western -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Northern $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Northern -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Central $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Central -- NB --
Tampa Truck Center LLC 2018 Western Star 4700 Southern $81,816.00
 2018 Western Star 4700 Southern -- NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Freightliner M2-112 
2018 International HX 
2018 International Workstar 
2018 Kenworth T880 
2018 Mack C or G Series 
2018 Peterbilt 567 
2018 Volvo V Series 
2018 Western Star 4700 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED. 

ENGINE:1.

350 HP 6 cylinder diesel engine, manufacturer's 11L minimuma.

TRANSMISISON & CLUTCH:2.

The following or approved equivalents are acceptable:a.
Fuller 14210B 10 Speed Manual with ODb.

ENGINE EQUIPMENT:3.

Alternator – 12 volt 100Aa.
Premium engine hosesb.
Injection pump – electronic engine controlc.
Radiator – aluminum cored.
Air restriction monitor – intake mountede.

CAB:4.

Cab – welded steel galvanized or aluminum shell with rust preventative coating.a.
Floor covering – black rubber matsb.
Seating – driver air suspension mid back, passenger fixed mid back.c.
Steering wheel – 18" two spoked.
Standard air conditioning and heatinge.

FRAME:5.

Frame – steel construction matched to GVW and mounted body of truck.a.
Wheelbase – 187"b.
Front bumper – painted steelc.
Fuel tank – 70 gallon, minimumd.
Air dryer – Bendix AD9 heated, or approved equivalent.e.

SAFETY:6.
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Horn – single air trumpeta.
Mirrors – West Coast to include 7.5" convex mounted to lower mirror bracket.b.
Brakes – "S" cam type 16.5" x 5" Q + front and 16.5" x 7" Q + rear with anti-lock without automatic traction control,
or approved equivalent.

c.

Slack adjusters – Haldex automatic front and rear.d.
Daytime running lights.e.
Backup alarmf.

FRONT AXLE:7.

Front axle – 12,000 lb.a.
Front wheels – steel 10 hole hub pilotedb.
Front tires – 11R22.5 Goodyear G397LHS, steer or approved equivalent.c.
Front hubs – Ferrous, or approved equivalent.d.
Oil type with synthetic lubee.

REAR AXLE:8.

Rear axle – 40,000 lb.a.
Rear wheels – steel 10 hole hub pilotedb.
Rear tires – 11R22.5 Goodyear G124 unisteel traction or approved equivalent.c.
Hubs – Ferrous, or approved equivalent.d.
Power divider with warning light and buzzer (includes in cab control)e.

ELECTRICAL:9.

Circuit protection – fuses except headlamp and wiper circuits which utilize circuit breakers.a.
Hand throttle – electronic hand throttle operated through cruise control when in PTO mode only.b.
Engine protection – engine shut down system monitoring high water temp, low oil pressure, high exhaust temp, high
transmission temp.

c.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 International Workstar
The International Workstar purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $92,500.00 $91,500.00 $91,620.00 $90,637.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options
Western
& Northern Central Southern

SF62530 1 
12EHU 2 
SF625300 3 

Engine/transmission - specify 
Workstar 7400 with Cummins L9 300 hp engine. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP. 1 
WORKSTAR MODEL 7400 6 X 4 CUMMINS L9 300 HP ENGINE , MANUAL
TRANSMISSION Reference Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2 
Workstar 7400 6x4 with Cummins L9 300 HP / 860 ft/lb torque engine with manual
transmission. Factory option code 12EHU. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$8,895.001 $8,880.002 $14,818.003

SF62533 1 
12EHV 2 
SF625330 3 

Engine/transmission - specify 
Workstar 7400 with Cummins L9 330 hp engine. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP. 1 
WORKSTAR MODEL 7400 6 X 4 CUMMINS L9 330 HP ENGINE , MANUAL
TRANSMISSION Reference Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2 
Workstar 7400 6x4 with Cummins L9 330 HP / 1000 ft/lb torque engine with
manual transmission. Factory option code 12EHV. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$8,125.001 $8,120.002 $13,286.003

SF62535 1 
12EHW 2 
SF625350 3 

Engine/transmission - specify 
Workstar 7500 with Cummins L9 350 hp engine. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP. 1 
WORKSTAR MODEL 7500 6 X 4 CUMMINS L9 350 HP ENGINE , MANUAL
TRANSMISSION Reference Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2 
Workstar 7400 6x4 with Cummins L9 350 HP / 1150 ft/lb torque engine with
manual transmission. Factory option code 12EHW. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$4,490.001 $4,490.002 $9,822.003

SF62537 1 
12EHY 2 
SF637370 3 

Engine/transmission - specify 
Workstar 7500 with Cummins L9 370 hp engine. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP. 1 
WORKSTAR MODEL 7500 6 X 4 CUMMINS L9 370 HP ENGINE , MANUAL
TRANSMISSION Reference Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2 
Workstar 7500 6x4 with Cummins L9 370 HP / 1250 ft/lb torque engine with
manual transmission. Factory option code 12EHY. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$3,790.001 $3,790.002 $7,367.003

 

Order Code Add Options
Western
& Northern Central Southern

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

VEHICLE: Workstar
DEALER: Maudlin International

Trucks
Maudlin International
Trucks

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL
TRUCKS

Rechtien International
Trucks Inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $92,500.00 $91,500.00 $91,620.00 $90,637.00
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12BDD 1 
12BDD 2 
12BDD 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
Navistar N13 365 HP engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 1 
International N13 365 HP engine Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
International N13 365 HP 1250 ft/lb torque engine. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

NC1 Std2 NC3

12BCP 1 
12BCP 2 
12BCP 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
Navistar N13 390 HP engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
International N13 390 HP engine Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
International N13 390 HP 1450 ft/lb torque engine. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$220.001 $220.002 $211.003

12BCR 1 
12BCR 2 
12BCR 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
Navistar N13 410 HP engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
International N13 410 HP engine Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
International N13 410 HP 1450 ft/lb torque engine. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$575.001 $575.002 $1,231.003

12BCS 1 
12BCS 2 
12BCS 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
Navistar N13 430 HP engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
International N13 430 HP engine Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
International N13 430 HP 1550 ft/lb torque engine. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$800.001 $800.002 $1,794.003

7SDK 1 
7SDK 2 
7SDK 3 

Engine upgrade - specify 
Engine compression brake.  1 
JAKE BRAKE Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2 
Engine comprssion brake by Jacobs with selector switch and on/off switch. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$2,050.001 $2,150.002 $2,033.003

13AVR 1 
13AVR 2 
13AVR 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Allison 3000 RDS transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Allison 3000 RDS automatic tranSmission for use with N13 365 HP engine
code12BDD Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
Allison 3000 RDS automatic transmission. For use with order codes SF625300,
SF625330, SF625350, SF637370, & 12BDD only. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$6,800.001 $6,890.002 $8,553.003

13GHP 1 
13GHP 2 
13GHP 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
FRO 15210C 10 speed manual transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount
from MSRP 1 
Fuller 15210 C 10-speed manual transmission Includes a 4% minimum discount
from manufacturers MSRP  2 
Eaton Fuller FRO-15210C 10-speed manual with overdrive. A minimum discount
of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$650.001 $650.002 $658.003

13GHS 1 
13GHS 2 
13GHS 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
FRO 16210C 10 speed manual transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount
from MSRP 1 
Fuller 16210 C 10-speed manual transmission Includes a 4% minimum discount
from manufacturers MSRP  2 
Eaton Fuller FRO-16210C 10-speed manual with overdrive. A minimum discount
of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$1,250.001 $1,350.002 $1,018.003

VEHICLE: Workstar
DEALER: Maudlin International

Trucks
Maudlin International
Trucks

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL
TRUCKS

Rechtien International
Trucks Inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $92,500.00 $91,500.00 $91,620.00 $90,637.00
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13GWP 1 
13GWP 2 
13GWP 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
Eaton Fuller Ultra shift Fully automated manual transmission. Includes a minimum
of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
{Eaton Fuller UltraShift 10-Speed Fully Automated Manual; with Aluminum Clutch
Housing, Overdrive, Electronic Shift Controls, Electric Clutch Actuation, Air Range
Shift, Internal Lube Oil Pump, Hill Start Aid Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
Eaton Fuller UltraShift+ FO-16E308LL-VCS 10-speed Fully automated manual
with overdrive, Electronic shift controls, and electric clutch actuation. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$13,500.001 $13,500.002 $12,065.003

13GHX 1 
13GHX 2 
13GWX 3 

Transmission upgrade - specify 
RTLO 16908LL manual transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from
MSRP 1 
Fuller RTO 16908LL Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 
 2 
Eaton Fuller UltraShift+ FO-17E309ALL-VMS 11-speed Fully automated manual
with overdrive, Electronic shift controls, and electric clutch actuation. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$3,500.001 $3,545.002 $13,561.003

58GVWR 1 
58GVWR 2 
58GVWR 3 

58,000 lb. GVWR package 
18000 front axle 40000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to
match. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
18,000 FAWR & 40,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
18,000 lbs. front axle, 40,000 lbs. rear axle. Includes order code 2ARZ. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$6,900.001 $6,900.002 $5,718.003

64GVWR 1 
64GVWR 2 
64GVWR 3 

64,000 lb. GVWR package 
18000 front axle 46000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to
match. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
18,000 FAWR & 46,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
18,000 lbs. front axle, 46,000 lbs. rear axle. Includes order code 2ARZ & 14GRD. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$9,200.001 $9,300.002 $9,243.003

60GVWR 1 
60GVWR 2 
60GVWR 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
18000 front axle 40000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to
match. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
20,000 FAWR & 40,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
60,000 GVWR pkg. 20,000 lbs. front axle, 40,000 lbs. rear axle. Includes order code
2ARY. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$7,500.001 $9,200.002 $6,047.003

66GVWR 1 
66GVWR 2 
66GVWR 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
20000 front axle 46000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to
match. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
20,000 FAWR & 46,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
66,000 GVWR pkg. 20,000 lbs. front axle, 46,000 lbs. rear axle. Includes order code
2ARY & 14GRD. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is
applied.  3 

$9,500.001 $9,500.002 $10,100.003

56GVWR 1 
56GVWR 2 
56GVWR 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
16000 front axle 40000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to
match. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
16,000 FAQWR & 40,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSR  2 
56,000 GVWR pkg. 16,000 lbs. front axle, 40,000 lbs. rear axle. Includes order code
2ARU. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$5,800.001 $5,800.002 $4,884.003

VEHICLE: Workstar
DEALER: Maudlin International

Trucks
Maudlin International
Trucks

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL
TRUCKS

Rechtien International
Trucks Inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $92,500.00 $91,500.00 $91,620.00 $90,637.00
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54GVWR 1 
54GVWR 2 
54GVWR 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
14000 front axle 40000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to
match. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
14,000 FAQWR & 40,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSR  2 
54,000 GVWR pkg. 14,000 lbs. front axle, 40,000 lbs. rear axle. Includes order code
2ARV. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$3,000.001 $3,500.002 $1,992.003

SAFETY 1 
SAFETY 2 
SAFETY 3 

GVWR upgrade - specify 
Safety Kit. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 1 
SAFETY KIT 2 
Safety kit - Fire extingusher & triangle reflectors. Dealer installed. 3 

$150.001 $160.002 $150.003

Bi-fuel model - specify NA NA NA 
CNG prep - specify NA NA NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA NA NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA NA NA 

15DYJ 1 
15DYJ 2 
15DYT 3 

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent 
Dual 70 gallon fuel tanks. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Dual 70 gallon fuel tanks Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP  2 
Dual fuel tanks - 40 gal. & 50 gal., left & right side mounted. CA restricted - c
ontact dealer for availability. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list
price is applied. 3 

$890.001 $895.002 $871.003

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA NA NA 
13ATR 1 
13ATR 2 
13ATR 3 

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES
295 or approved equivalent 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP13 1 
Allison 4000 RDS automatic transmission Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
Allison 4000RDS automatic transmission. Includes factory option codes 13WAW,
13WBL, 13WLM, 13WUC, & 13WYU. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$14,500.001 $14,890.002 $14,661.003

13UAW 1 
13AUN 2 
13AUW 3 

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES
295 or approved equivalent 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Allison 4500 RDS automatic transmission Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2 
Allison 4500RDS automatic transmission. Includes factory option codes 13WAW,
13WBL, 13WLM, 13WUC, & 13WYU. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$15,800.001 $15,880.002 $15,956.003

1GBP 1 
1GBP 2 
1GBP 3 

Double Frame: full steel insert 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Double frame Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
Diuble frame. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$1,600.001 $1,580.002 $1,601.003

VEHICLE: Workstar
DEALER: Maudlin International

Trucks
Maudlin International
Trucks

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL
TRUCKS

Rechtien International
Trucks Inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $92,500.00 $91,500.00 $91,620.00 $90,637.00
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2ARV 1 
2AVR 2 
2ARV 3 

Front Axle: 14,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
14,000 FAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
14,000 lbs. front axle. Includes factory option codes 3ADD and 12R22.5 tires. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$1,300.001 $1,260.002 $1,992.003

Front Axle: 14,600 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs 

NA NA NA 

2AUR 1 
2AUR 2 
2ARU 3 

Front Axle: 16,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
16,000 FAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
16,000 lbs. front axle. Includes factory option codes 3ADD and 315/80R22.5 tires. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$5,200.001 $5,250.002 $4,884.003

2ARZ 1 
2ARZ 2 
2ARZ 3 

Front Axle: 18,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
18,000 FAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2 
18,000 lbs. front axle. Includes factory option codes 3ADG, 5PTB and 385/65R22.5
tires. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$5,850.001 $5,800.002 $5,718.003

2ARY 1 
2ARY 2 
2ARY 3 

Front Axle: 20,000 lb. rating to include equal capacity steering
gear and springs 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
20,000 FAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2 
20,000 lbs. front axle. Includes factory option codes 3ADG, 5PTB and 425/65R22.5
tires. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$7,500.001 $7,500.002 $6,047.003

14HRB 1 
14HRB 2 
14GRD 3 

Rear Axle: 46,000 lb Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
46,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
46,000 lbs. rear axle. Includes factory order codes 14UHK, 14WAL, & 14WMK. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$5,200.001 $5,250.002 $4,053.003

14WLN 1 
14WLM 2 

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 lb rating air lift to include
11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Rigid 13,200 lbs. pusher Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP  2 

$7,500.001 $7,350.002 NA 

14WNH 1 
14WNH 2 
14WNH 3 

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 lb rating air lift to include
11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
SteeRRable 13,200 lbs. pusher Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
Cab to Axle restricted - contact dealer. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$9,500.001 $9,350.002 $10,947.003

14WLM 1 
14WLM-4 2 
14WLM 3 

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to include
11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Rigid 20,000 lbs. pusher Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2 
Cab to Axle restricted - contact dealer. A minimum discount of 6.5% of

$9,400.001 $9,390.002 $10,874.003

VEHICLE: Workstar
DEALER: Maudlin International

Trucks
Maudlin International
Trucks

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL
TRUCKS

Rechtien International
Trucks Inc

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $92,500.00 $91,500.00 $91,620.00 $90,637.00
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manufaturers list price is applied. 3 
14WNM 1 
14WNW 2 
14WNM 3 

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to include
11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Steerable 20,000 lbs. pusher Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP  2 
Cab to Axle restricted - contact dealer. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$12,900.001 $12,500.002 $13,957.003

14UNU 1 
14UNU 2 
14ULU 3 

Rear Suspension: 40,000 lb air ride 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
40,000 air ride rear suspension Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
Hendrickson HAS 420-55 air ride. Includes factory option code 14899. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$2,100.001 $2,200.002 $2,095.003

14ULY 1 
14ULY 2 
14ULY 3 

Rear Suspension: 46,000 lb Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo
"T" ride or equivalent 
Hendrickson HMX. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
46000 HMX rear suspension Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2 
Hendrickson HMX-460-54 Walking beam type suspension. Includes factory option
codes 14WAL, 14WBV. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is
applied.  3 

$3,800.001 $3,895.002 $2,886.003

14UNX 1 
14UNX 2 
14UNX 3 

Rear Suspension: 46,000 lb air ride 
46000 Primax air ride Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2 
Hendrickson PRIMAX EX 55" air ride. Includes factory option code 14899. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$4,200.001 $4,275.002 $4,195.003

OX12YD 1 
OX12YD 2 
12DMP 3 

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model
bid. 
Ox 12 YD dump. 1 
12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.  2 
Steel body with electric tarp system. Gar-P or equal. Recomment order code
54GVWR - 54,000 lbs. GVWR minimum. 3 

$17,250.001 $17,200.002 $16,960.003

OX18YD 1 
OX18YD 2 
18DMP 3 

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model
bid. 
Ox 18 YD dump. 1 
18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.  2 
Steel body with electric tarp system. Gar-P or equal. Recomment order code
64GVWR - 64,000 lbs. GVWR minimum. 3 

$18,300.001 $18,200.002 $17,999.003

ROLLOFF 1 
GALFAB 2 
ROLLOFF 3 

Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. 
Gal-Fab U5-OR-174 with Pioneer RP4500SA RG tarp system. 1 
Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. Galbreath Standard
Equipment included Steel Fenders, In cab and outside controls, 16"X 24"X 48"
toolbox,light bar,50 gallon hyd tank Hotshift PTO for automatic Pioneer RP4500SA
RG tarp system  2 
Galfab 60K outside rail with tarp. Requires automatic transmission order code
13AVR, 13ATR or 13AUW.Recommend 58GVWR - 58,000 lbs. GVWR minimum. 3 

$44,500.001 $43,835.002 $37,981.003

Cab suspension - air ride Std Std Std 
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14GVN 1 
14GUN 2 
14GVN 3 

Driver controlled differential lock 
40,000 LBS axles. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
For use with 40,000 lbs. rear axle. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers
list price is applied. 3 

$1,900.001 $1,950.002 $1,418.003

VAC 1 
VACCHASSIS 2 
SEWERVAC64 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Vac chassis prep package. 1 
VAC CON CHASSIS PREP  2 
Basic sewer vacuum 64,000 GVWR prep cab & chassis. Includes order codes
SF625350,13AVR, 64GVWR, 7BKS, LEDPKG, & 15SJR 3 

$5,500.001 $5,500.002 $5,917.003

NW25RL 1 
NW25RL 2 
KC25RL 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
New way 25 YD King Cobra rear loader. 1 
NEW WAY GB  2 
New Way King Cobra 25RL or equal 25 cubic yard rear load refuse body. Requires
order code 64GVWR minimum and 13AVR, 13ATR, or 13AUW automatic
transmission. 3 

$69,900.001 $69,900.002 $71,404.003

NWSW31 1 
NWSW31 2 
SEWERVAC66 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
New Way Sidewinder 31 YD side loader 1 
NEW WAY AUTO SIDE  2 
Basic sewer vacuum 66,000 GVWR prep cab & chassis. Includes order codes
SF625350,13AVR, 66GVWR, 7BKS, LEDPKG, & 15SJR 3 

$118,500.001 $118,500.002 $7,366.003

4000D 1 
4000D 2 
PNTLELEC 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
4000 gallon steel water truck. 1 
4000 DOLPHIN TANK water tank 2 
Pintle Hitch with D-rings for safety chains and electric lighting plug, dealer
installed. Includes factory option code 8HAH. For use with electric brake trailers.
For air brake trailers use order code PNTLAIR - Price $2153.00.A discount of a
minimum of 6.5% of the manufacturers list prices is applied. 3 

$41,500.001 $42,125.002 $1,798.003

LELYS 1 
LEYSST 2 
4000STL 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Lely 4200 gallon steel sewer sucker 1 
LEY STEEL 4200 GALLON 2 
Lely 4000 gallon steel water tank with hydrant fill and PTO driven pumping system,
spray bars, hose reel. Requires order code 64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR minimum.
Recommend automatic transmission.  3 

$59,500.001 $66,900.002 $68,810.003

LELYA 1 
LEYAST 2 
4200STL 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Lely 4200 gallon aluminum sewer sucker. 1 
LEY ALUMIMUM 4200 GALLON  2 
Amthor or equal 4200 gallon steel water tank with hydrant fill and PTO driven
pumping system. Requires order code 64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR minimum.
Recommend automatic transmission.  3 

$67,900.001 $76,000.002 $50,865.003

MP88133D 1 
MP133 d  2 
4000SPC 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
GS Products 33 YD single stream recycling body includes stand up right hand
drive. 1 
RECYCYCLE BODY MP88 133D gC PRODUCTS SINGLE STREAM RECYCLED ,
INCLUDED STAND UP RIGHT HAND DRIVE  2 
Lely 4000 gallon steel single compartment setic tank with PTO driven vacuum
pumping system. Requires order code 64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR minimum.
Recommend automatic transmission. 3 

$121,000.001 $121,000.002 $67,173.003
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EAMWT4000 1 
EAMWT4000 2 
4000SPCHYDP 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
Stainless steel 4000 gallon water truck with pony motor. Contact dealer for spec. 1 
4000 gallon stainless water tanker with pony motor. See dealer for spec 2 
Lely 4000 gallon steel single compartment setic tank with hydraulic hoist and full
opening rear, PTO driven blower system with silencer. Requires order code
64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR minimum. Recommend automatic transmission. 3 

$64,855.001 $64,885.002 $97,700.003

EZRELG400 1 
EZRELG400 2 
8WPZ 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
E-Z Pack 31YD rear loader. Contact dealer for spec 1 
E-Z pack Goliath G400 31YD rear loader. See dealer for spec 2 
Test Exterior Lights, Pre-Trip esterior light inspection. A minimum discount of
6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$88,000.001 $88,000.002 $40.003

J&JDUMP 1 
16SDT 3 

Optional mounted body - specify 
J&J 16 foot aluminum dump body. 1 
Heated & powered mirrors, black heads. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$32,000.001 NA $511.003

7BEP 1 
7BEP 2 
7BKS 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Vertical Exhaust. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 1 
Vertical exhaust Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2 
Horizontal after-treatment device with vertical exhaust tailpipe. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$1,200.001 $1,200.002 $911.003

14HRE 1 
14HRE 2 
14HRE 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
46,000 diff locks. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 1 
46,000 RAWR driver controlled diff lock Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2 
Driver controlled differential lock for use with 46,000 lbs. rear axle. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$1,950.001 $1,950.002 $1,827.003

5708 1 
5708 2 
5708 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Tilt steering column. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 1 
Tilt steering column Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 

 2 
Tilt steering column. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is
applied. 3 

$118.001 $110.002 $118.003

5710 1 
5710 2 
5710 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Tilt and telescoping steering column. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from
MSRP. 1 
Tilt & Telescopic Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
Tilt & telescopioc steering column. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers
list price is applied. 3 

$425.001 $420.002 $436.003

16SDC 1 
16SDC 2 
16SDC 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Exterior grab handles. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 1 
Exterior grab handles Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 
 2 
Exterior grab handle(s) for use with standard cab. Use order code 16SDD for 4
door cab - Price $445.00. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is
applied. 3 

$225.001 $250.002 $222.003
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16WJU 1 
16WJU 2 
16WJU 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Power windows and locks. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 1 
Power windows & door locks Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP  2 
Power windows & door locks for use with standard cab & extended cab. For 4-door
cab - order code 16196 - use order code 16WJV - Price $ 669.00. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$345.001 $350.002 $346.003

10WJH 1 
10WJH 2 
10WJH 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Silver package. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Silver package Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
Silver Package, includes factory option codes 8WGL & 8WXD, & order codes
8WPZ & 8WRB. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is
applied.  3 

$175.001 $175.002 $124.003

16PPN 1 
16PPN 2 
16PPN 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Air ride passengers seat. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Air ride passenger seat Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP  2 
Air ride passenger seat. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is
applied.  3 

$590.001 $590.002 $132.003

8MKX 1 
8MKX 2 
8MKX 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
2775 CCA batteries. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Three batteries 2775 CCA Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP  2 
Three (3) batteries, 2775 cca Total. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers
list price is applied. 3 

$185.001 $195.002 $167.003

LEDPKG 1 
LEDPKG 2 
LEDPKG 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
LED light package. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
LED lighting pkg Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
LED lighting package for cab & chassis and mounted equipment. Includes factory
option codes 8TRS, 8WPH, & 8XGT. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers
list price is applied.  3 

$525.001 $540.002 $528.003

15LKY 1 
15SGD 2 
15SJR 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Davco fuel water separator. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
or 15SJR - 100 gallon fuel tank Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
Fuel tank, 100 gallon capacity non-polished aluminum. Optional 80 gallon capacity
non-polished aluminum fuel tank use order code 15SJZ - Price $140.00  3 

$420.001 $430.002 $285.003

29007 1 
15LKY 2 
15LKY 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Spare tire and wheel. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Davco fuel water seperator Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP  2 
Davco fuel water seperator. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price
is applied. 3 

$950.001 $480.002 $412.003

60AAA 1 
29007 2 
29007 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Remote power module. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Spare tire & wheel Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP  2 
Includes 11R22.5 14-ply tire and wheel equal to standard. Contact dealer for
additional tire sizes. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is
applied.  3 

$650.001 $940.002 $855.003
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8WRB 1 
60AAA 2 
60AAA 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Headlights on with wipers. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Remote power module Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 

 2 
Remote Power Module for body builder interface. 6 inputs & 6 outputs with
switches on dash. Includes factory otion codes 60ABE & 60ABM. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$20.001 $550.002 $711.003

8WPZ 1 
8WRB 2 
8WRB 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Test exterior lights. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
Head lights on with wipers Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP  2 
Headlights on with wipers automatically. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$40.001 $20.002 $21.003

TEMP 1 
TEMP 2 
TEMPTAG 3 

Temporary tag 
TEMP 2 

$15.001 $50.002 $10.003

Transfer 1 
TRANSFERTAG 2 
TRANTAG 3 

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
TRANSFER EXISTING TAG 2 

$200.001 $235.002 $95.003

New tag 1 
NEWTAG 2 
NEWTAG 3 

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
NEW TAG 2 

$300.001 $295.002 $250.003

Maintenance Plan - specify NA NA NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA NA NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA NA NA 

40PJW 1 
40PJW 2 
40PJW 3 

Warranty - specify 
Navistar 24 month/100,000 miles excludes engine and transmission. Includes a
minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
NAVISTAR 24 MONTH 100K MILES EXTENEDED WARRANTY COVERAGE
EXCLUDES ENIGNE & TRANMISSION Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
Extended Vehicle Coverage To 24-Month/100,000 Miles, Excludes Extended
Warranty for Engine and Transmission. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied. 3 

$2,200.001 $2,200.002 $2,160.003

40PJZ 1 
40PJZ 2 
40PJZ 3 

Warranty - specify 
Navistar 36 month/150,000 miles excludes engine and transmission. Includes a
minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
NAVISTAR 36 MONTH 150K MILES EXTENEDED WARRANTY COVERAGE
EXCLUDES ENIGNE & TRANMISSION Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
Extended Vehicle Coverage To 36-Month/150,000 Miles, Excludes Extended
Warranty for Engine and Transmission. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

$5,100.001 $4,985.002 $4,860.003

40PKD 1 
40PKD 2 
40PKJ 3 

Warranty - specify 
Navistar 48 month/200,000 miles excludes engine and transmission. Includes a
minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 1 
NAVISTAR 48 MONTH 200K MILES EXTENEDED WARRANTY COVERAGE
EXCLUDES ENIGNE & TRANMISSION Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP  2 
Extended Vehicle Coverage To 60-Month/150,000 Miles, Excludes Extended

$8,250.001 $8,200.002 $8,100.003
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Warranty for Engine and Transmission. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufaturers list price is applied.  3 

40MCH 1 
40MCH 2 
40MCH 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar 36 month/300,000 miles engine warranty. Includes engine, engine
electronics, turbo, water pump and injectors. Includes a minimum of 5% discount
from MSRP  1 
Navistar} To 36-Month/300,000 Miles (480,000 km), 10,800 Hours;Includes
Engine, Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump and Fuel Injectors, for
Navistar N13 Engines Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 

 2 
Extended Coverage To 36-Month/300,000 Miles, 10,800 Hours; Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump, Fuel Injectors, and after-treatment
system for Navistar N13 Engines. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list
price is applied. Contact dealer for Cummins L9 pricing.  3 

$1,700.001 $1,650.002 $2,475.003

40MCM 1 
40MCM 2 
40MCM 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar 48 month/400,000 miles engine warranty. Includes engine, engine
electronics, turbo, water pump and injectors. Includes a minimum of 5% discount
from MSRP  1 
Navistar} To 48-Month/400,000 Miles (640,000 km), 14,400Hours;Includes
Engine, Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump and Fuel Injectors, for
Navistar N13 Engines Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2 
Extended Coverage To 48-Month/400,000 Miles, 14,400 Hours; Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump, Fuel Injectors, and after-treatment
system for Navistar N13 Engines. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list
price is applied. Contact dealer for Cummins L9 pricing.  3 

$3,400.001 $3,300.002 $5,040.003

40MCV 1 
40MCV 2 
40MCV 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar 60 month/400,000 miles engine warranty. Includes engine, engine
electronics, turbo, water pump and injectors. Includes a minimum of 5% discount
from MSRP  1 
Navistar} To 60-Month/400,000 Miles (640,000 km), 14,400 Hours;Includes
Engine, Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump and Fuel Injectors, for
Navistar N13 engines Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 

 2 
Extended Coverage To 60-Month/400,000 Miles, 14,400 Hours; Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump, Fuel Injectors, and after-treatment
system for Navistar N13 Engines. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufaturers list
price is applied. Contact dealer for Cummins L9 pricing.  3 

$3,900.001 $3,885.002 $5,850.003
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 International Workstar

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The International Workstar purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer
for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $91,650.00 -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options

Western
&
Northern
&
SouthernCentral

SF62530 2 Engine/transmission - specify 
Workstar 7400 with Cummins L9 300 hp engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 2 

$8,895.002

SF62533 2 Engine/transmission - specify 
Workstar 7400 with Cummins L9 330 hp engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 2 

$8,125.002

SF62535 2 Engine/transmission - specify 
Workstar 7500 with Cummins L9 350 hp engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 2 

$4,490.002

SF62537 2 Engine/transmission - specify 
Workstar 7500 with Cummins L9 370 hp engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 2 

$3,790.002

 

Order Code Add Options

Western
&
Northern
&
SouthernCentral

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

12BDD 2 Engine upgrade - specify 
Navistar N13 365 HP engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 2 

NC2

12BCP 2 Engine upgrade - specify 
Navistar N13 390 HP engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$220.002

12BCR 2 Engine upgrade - specify 
Navistar N13 410 HP engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$575.002

12BCS 2 Engine upgrade - specify 
Navistar N13 430 HP engine. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$800.002

7SDK 2 Engine upgrade - specify 
Engine compression brake.  2 

$2,050.002

13AVR 2 Transmission upgrade - specify 
Allison 3000 RDS transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$6,800.002

13GHP 2 Transmission upgrade - specify 
FRO 15210C 10 speed manual transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$650.002

VEHICLE: Workstar (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $91,650.00 -- No bid --
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13GHS 2 Transmission upgrade - specify 
FRO 16210C 10 speed manual transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$1,250.002

13GWP 2 Transmission upgrade - specify 
Eaton Fuller Ultra shift Fully automated manual transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from
MSRP 2 

$13,500.002

13GHX 2 Transmission upgrade - specify 
RTLO 16908LL manual transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$3,500.002

58GVWR 2 58,000 lb. GVWR package 
18000 front axle 40000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to match. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP 2 

$6,900.002

64GVWR 2 64,000 lb. GVWR package 
18000 front axle 46000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to match. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP 2 

$9,200.002

60GVWR 2 GVWR upgrade - specify 
18000 front axle 40000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to match. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP 2 

$7,500.002

66GVWR 2 GVWR upgrade - specify 
20000 front axle 46000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to match. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP 2 

$9,500.002

56GVWR 2 GVWR upgrade - specify 
16000 front axle 40000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to match. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP 2 

$5,800.002

54GVWR 2 GVWR upgrade - specify 
14000 front axle 40000 rear axle with tires wheels steering gear and frame to match. Includes a minimum of 5%
discount from MSRP 2 

$3,000.002

SAFETY 2 GVWR upgrade - specify 
Safety Kit. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 2 

$150.002

Bi-fuel model - specify NA 
CNG prep - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 

15DYJ 2 Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent 
Dual 70 gallon fuel tanks. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$890.002

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA 
13ATR 2 Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved

equivalent 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP13 2 

$14,500.002

13UAW 2 Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved
equivalent 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$15,800.002

1GBP 2 Double Frame: full steel insert 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$1,600.002

2ARV 2 Front Axle: 14,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$1,300.002
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Front Axle: 14,600 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs NA 
2AUR 2 Front Axle: 16,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs 

Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 
$5,200.002

2ARZ 2 Front Axle: 18,000 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$5,850.002

2ARY 2 Front Axle: 20,000 lb. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$7,500.002

14HRB 2 Rear Axle: 46,000 lb Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$5,200.002

14WLN 2 Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$7,500.002

14WNH 2 Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with
steel wheels 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$9,500.002

14WLM 2 Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$9,400.002

14WNM 2 Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 lb rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with
steel wheels 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$12,900.002

14UNU 2 Rear Suspension: 40,000 lb air ride 
Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$2,100.002

14ULY 2 Rear Suspension: 46,000 lb Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent 
Hendrickson HMX. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$3,800.002

14UNX 2 Rear Suspension: 46,000 lb air ride $4,200.002

OX12YD 2 12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. 
Ox 12 YD dump. 2 

$17,250.002

OX18YD 2 18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. 
Ox 18 YD dump. 2 

$18,300.002

ROLLOFF 2 Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. 
Gal-Fab U5-OR-174 with Pioneer RP4500SA RG tarp system. 2 

$44,500.002

Cab suspension - air ride Std 
14GVN 2 Driver controlled differential lock 

40,000 LBS axles. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 
$1,900.002

VAC 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
Vac chassis prep package. 2 

$5,500.002

NW25RL 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
New way 25 YD King Cobra rear loader. 2 

$69,900.002

NWSW31 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
New Way Sidewinder 31 YD side loader 2 

$118,500.002
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4000D 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
4000 gallon steel water truck. 2 

$41,500.002

LELYS 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
Lely 4200 gallon steel sewer sucker 2 

$59,500.002

LELYA 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
Lely 4200 gallon aluminum sewer sucker. 2 

$67,900.002

MP88133D 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
GS Products 33 YD single stream recycling body includes stand up right hand drive. 2 

$121,000.002

EAMWT4000 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
Stainless steel 4000 gallon water truck with pony motor. Contact dealer for spec. 2 

$64,855.002

EZRELG400 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
E-Z Pack 31YD rear loader. Contact dealer for spec 2 

$88,000.002

J&JDUMP 2 Optional mounted body - specify 
J&J 16 foot aluminum dump body. 2 

$32,000.002

7BEP 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Vertical Exhaust. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 2 

$1,200.002

14HRE 2 Optional equipment - specify 
46,000 diff locks. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 2 

$1,950.002

5708 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Tilt steering column. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 2 

$118.002

5710 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Tilt and telescoping steering column. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 2 

$425.002

16SDC 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Exterior grab handles. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 2 

$225.002

16WJU 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Power windows and locks. Includes a minimum discount of 5% from MSRP. 2 

$345.002

10WJH 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Silver package. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$175.002

16PPN 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Air ride passengers seat. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$590.002

8MKX 2 Optional equipment - specify 
2775 CCA batteries. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$185.002

LEDPKG 2 Optional equipment - specify 
LED light package. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$525.002

15LKY 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Davco fuel water separator. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$420.002

29007 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Spare tire and wheel. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$950.002

60AAA 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Remote power module. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$650.002

8WRB 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Headlights on with wipers. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$20.002
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8WPZ 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Test exterior lights. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP 2 

$40.002

TEMP 2 Temporary tag $15.002

Transfer 2 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $200.002

New tag 2 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) $300.002

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

40PJW 2 Warranty - specify 
Navistar 24 month/100,000 miles excludes engine and transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from
MSRP 2 

$2,200.002

40PJZ 2 Warranty - specify 
Navistar 36 month/150,000 miles excludes engine and transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from
MSRP 2 

$5,100.002

40PKD 2 Warranty - specify 
Navistar 48 month/200,000 miles excludes engine and transmission. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from
MSRP 2 

$8,250.002

40MCH 2 Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar 36 month/300,000 miles engine warranty. Includes engine, engine electronics, turbo, water pump and
injectors. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP  2 

$1,700.002

40MCM 2 Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar 48 month/400,000 miles engine warranty. Includes engine, engine electronics, turbo, water pump and
injectors. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP  2 

$3,400.002

40MCV 2 Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar 60 month/400,000 miles engine warranty. Includes engine, engine electronics, turbo, water pump and
injectors. Includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP  2 

$3,900.002
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