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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK (Specification #15)

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 * Western
2018 Freightliner M2-112 Western
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 * Northern
2018 Freightliner M2-112 Northern
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 * Central
2018 Freightliner M2-112 Central
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2-112 * Southern
2018 Freightliner M2-112 Southern
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Western
2018 International HX Western
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Northern
2018 International HX Northern
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International HX Central
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International HX Central
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International HX Southern
2018 International HX Southern
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Western
2018 International Workstar Western
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Northern
2018 International Workstar Northern
SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS 2018 International Workstar Central
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Workstar Central
Rechtien International Trucks Inc 2018 International Workstar Southern
2018 International Workstar Southern
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Western
2018 Kenworth T880 Western
KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE 2018 Kenworth T880 Northern

Base Unit
Price

$57,750.00
- NB --
$57,750.00
- NB --
$57,750.00
—-NB --
$57,750.00
- NB --

$103,300.00
- NB --
$102,300.00
--NB --
$102,250.00
$102,300.00
$103,734.00
- NB --

$92,500.00
--NB --
$91,500.00
--NB --
$91,620.00
$91,650.00
$90,637.00
--NB --

$101,989.00

—-NB --
$101,739.00
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Kenworth of Central Florida

Kenworth of South Florida

Nextran Corporation

Nextran Corporation

Nextran Corporation

Nextran Corporation

Rush Truck Centers of Florida
Rush Truck Centers of Florida
Rush Truck Centers of Florida
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers inc
Nextran Corporation

ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC.
Nextran Corporation

ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC.
Nextran Corporation

ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC.
Nextran Corporation

ALT - TRUCKMAX, INC.
Tampa Truck Center LLC
Tampa Truck Center LLC

Tampa Truck Center LLC

Tampa Truck Center LLC

2018 Kenworth T880
2018 Kenworth T880
2018 Kenworth T880
2018 Kenworth T880
2018 Kenworth T880

2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Mack C or G Series

2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567
2018 Peterbilt 567

2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series
2018 Volvo V Series

2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700
2018 Western Star 4700

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

- NB --
$100,998.00
- NB --
$97,986.00
—-NB --

$107,780.00
- NB --
$107,780.00
—-NB --
$107,780.00
--NB --
$107,780.00
- NB --

$104,705.00
- NB --
$104,705.00
—-NB --
$104,705.00
--NB --
$104,416.00
- NB --

$94,752.00
$99,072.00
$94,752.00
$99,072.00
$94,752.00
$98,172.00
$94,752.00
$98,172.00

$81,816.00
--NB --
$81,816.00
--NB --
$81,816.00
--NB --
$81,816.00
--NB --
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FLORIDA
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GYVYWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Freightliner M2-112
2018 International HX
2018 International Workstar
2018 Kenworth T880

2018 Mack C or G Series
2018 Peterbilt 567

2018 Volvo V Series

2018 Western Star 4700

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:
a. 350 HP 6 cylinder diesel engine, manufacturer's 11L minimum
2. TRANSMISISON & CLUTCH:

a. The following or approved equivalents are acceptable:
b. Fuller 14210B 10 Speed Manual with OD

3. ENGINE EQUIPMENT:

a. Alternator — 12 volt 100A

b. Premium engine hoses

c. Injection pump — electronic engine control
d. Radiator — aluminum core

e. Air restriction monitor — intake mounted

a. Cab — welded steel galvanized or aluminum shell with rust preventative coating.
b. Floor covering — black rubber mats

c. Seating — driver air suspension mid back, passenger fixed mid back.

d. Steering wheel — 18" two spoke

e. Standard air conditioning and heating

5. FRAME:

. Frame — steel construction matched to GVW and mounted body of truck.
. Wheelbase — 187"

. Front bumper — painted steel

. Fuel tank — 70 gallon, minimum

. Air dryer — Bendix AD9 heated, or approved equivalent.

o o Ow

6. SAFETY:

908



a. Horn — single air trumpet
b. Mirrors — West Coast to include 7.5" convex mounted to lower mirror bracket.

c. Brakes —"S" cam type 16.5" x 5" Q + front and 16.5" x 7" Q + rear with anti-lock without automatic traction control,

or approved equivalent.
d. Slack adjusters — Haldex automatic front and rear.
e. Daytime running lights.
f. Backup alarm

7. FERONT AXLE:

a. Front axle — 12,000 Ib.

. Front wheels — steel 10 hole hub piloted

. Front tires — 11R22.5 Goodyear G397LHS, steer or approved equivalent.
. Front hubs — Ferrous, or approved equivalent.

. Oil type with synthetic lube

o o o

8. REAR AXLE:

a. Rear axle — 40,000 1b.

b. Rear wheels — steel 10 hole hub piloted

c. Rear tires — 11R22.5 Goodyear G124 unisteel traction or approved equivalent.
d. Hubs — Ferrous, or approved equivalent.

e. Power divider with warning light and buzzer (includes in cab control)

9. ELECTRICAL:

a. Circuit protection — fuses except headlamp and wiper circuits which utilize circuit breakers.
b. Hand throttle — electronic hand throttle operated through cruise control when in PTO mode only.

c. Engine protection — engine shut down system monitoring high water temp, low oil pressure, high exhaust temp, high

transmission temp.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Freightliner M2-112

The Freightliner M2-112 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: * Western * Northern * Central * Southern
BASE PRICE: $57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE: M2-112
DEALER: Lou Bachrodt Freightliner Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ZONE: * Western % Northern * Central * Southern
BASE PRICE: $57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00
Order Code Delete Options All Zones
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Order Code Add Options All Zones
Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.
101-2X3 ! Engine upgrade - specify $350.00"
380 HP DDI3 |
101-2X5 ! Engine upgrade - specify $475.00"
410 HP DDI3 1
Engine upgrade - specify NA
Engine upgrade - specify NA
Engine upgrade - specify NA
Transmission upgrade - specify NA
Transmission upgrade - specify NA
Transmission upgrade - specify NA
Transmission upgrade - specify NA
Transmission upgrade - specify NA
DLR-58GVW ! 58,000 Ib. GVWR package $32,900.00"
58000 HD GVW PCK WITH ALLISON AUTO TRANS. 1
DLR-64GVW | 64,000 Ib. GVWR package $39,900.00'
64000 HD GVW PCK WITH ALLISON AUTO TRANS. 1
DLR-66GVW | GVWR upgrade - specify $43,900.00'
66000 HD GVW PCK WITH ALLISON AUTO TRANS. |
GVWR upgrade - specify NA
GVWR upgrade - specify NA
GVWR upgrade - specify NA
GVWR upgrade - specify NA
Bi-fuel model - specify NA
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

CNG-PREP !

204-156
206-156 !

342-1M1
DLR-58GVW !

342-1M3
DLR-64GVW !

546-102
547-001 !

620-010
400-099 !

400-1AA
620-026 "

400-1AB
DLR-58GVW !

400-1AC DLR
66GVW !

420-059 DLR
64GVW !

DLR-13PT '

DLR-20PT !

622-006 !
DLR-64GVW

DLR-12YDB !

1

M2-112

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~ Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner

* Western % Northern * Central * Southern
$57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00

CNG prep - specify
CNG CHASSIS WITH CNG ENGINE 1

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
INCLUDES 64,000 HD GVW PCK |

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
INCLUDES 64,000 HD GVW PCK 1

Double Frame: full steel insert

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 14,600 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
PRICE INCLUDES 58000 HD GVW PCK

Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
PRICE INCLUDES 66000 HD GVW PCK 1

Rear Axle: 46,000 1b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent
PRICE INCLUDES 64000 HD GVW PCK |

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel

wheels
DEALER INSTALLED 1

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel

wheels
DEALER INSTALLED 1

Rear Suspension: 40,000 1b air ride

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent
PRICE INCLUDES 64000 GVW PCK 1

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b air ride

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.

12 YD DUMP BODY-GAR-P WARREN-OX-KNAPHEIDE--AD CONVEYOR SYSTEM FOR$14,900.00-ALUMINUM
BODY ADD $12,900.00-2 WAY AIR GATE ADD $2500.00 OR BED VIBRATOR ADD $1500.00- REQUIRES 64000 HD
GVW PACKAGE AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00 1

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner

$79,900.00"

NA
NA
$990.00"

NA
$39,900.00'

$39,900.00"
$990.00"

NA
$1,590.00"

$3,090.00"
$32,900.00'
$43,900.00"
$39,900.00'
NA

$15,900.00"

NA
$16,400.00"

$400.00"
$39,900.00"

NA
$24,900.00"
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

DLR-18YDB !

DLR-ROHS !

452-006 !

SEWER PREP
PACK !

DLR-TCRN !

DLR-NC !

DLR-4000 !

DLR-4000VC !

DLR-CC4000 !

DLR ZIM !

DLR-CTEC

M2-112

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
* Western % Northern * Central * Southern

$57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. $26,900.001
18 YD DUMP BODY BY GAR-P, WARREN, OX, OR KNAPHEIDE.-ADD CONVEYOR SYSTEM FOR $15,900.00
ALUMINUM BODY ADD $14900.00 REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00 1
Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. $56,900.001
GALBREATH OR GALFAB WITH AUTO TARP AMERICAN ROLLOFF MODEL ART-60-22 ADD $4000.00 FOR 75000

ROLLOFF ADD $3500.00 REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900. 001

Incl.
$1,290.00"

Cab suspension - air ride

Driver controlled differential lock
BOTH REAR AXLES 1

Optional mounted body - specify $44,900.001
SEWER CLEANER PREP PCK#1 WITH 64000 GVW PCK AUTO TRANS, 370 HP ENGINE. SEWER CLEANER PREP
PCK#2 AUTO TRANS, 370 HP ENGINE DEDUCT -$7,800. ALLISON 4500 RDS TRANS ADD $8,9001

Optional mounted body - specify $204,700.001
TEREX BT 70100 35 TON CRANE WITH OPTIONS TEREX RS 70100 35 TON CRANE ADD $28000.00. TEREX BT4792-
23.5 TON CRANE TOTAL PRICE IS $160000.00. TEREX 19 TON CRANE TOTAL PRICE $134000.00. DIFFERENT
MODELS REQUIRE DIFFERENT ADDITIONAL GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST, PLEASE CALL DEALER FOR
THIS COST!

Optional mounted body - specify $289,600.001
NATIONAL CRANE 26 TON CRANE -REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00 1
Optional mounted body - specify $69,800.001
4000 GAL STEEL WATER TANKER- REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00. ADD

ON OPTION=PUMP B4ZKRS $2000.00 SD CAB OPTION FOR FRONT FRAME EXT. ADD $6900.00 -HYD DRIVE
SYSTEM WITH COOLER $7600.00 ,SPRAY HEADS EACH SIDE ADD $1800.00-EXTENDED REAR SILL WITH
PLATFORM ADD 8980.00- SELF LOADING SYSTEM ADD $1990.00-WHELAN TA 1660LS ARROW BOARD ADD
$4990.00 AND WHELAN 4 STROBE SYSTEM ADD $1000.00-18 X 18 TOOL BOX ADD $990.00-ELHARD SIDE WINDER
MONITOR WITH JOYSTICK ADD $8500.00- ALUMINUM UPGRADE ADD $13900.00 SS UPGRADE ADD $19000.00
AND REAR CAMERA ADD $2950.00 DIVERSHIFIED 4000 GALLON WATER TANKER INSTALLED ON A 64K GVW
TOTAL BODY PRICE IS $ 78,500 1

Optional mounted body - specify $83,500.001
4000 GALLON ALUM VAC TANKER REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00. FOR
HOIST SETUP ADD $23000.00 FOR FULL OPEN REAR DOOR ADD $15900.00-FOR 5000 GALLON TANK ADD
$9900.001

Optional mounted body - specify $96,500.001
CARDINAL CLASSIC 4000 GALLON FUEL TANKER REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF

$39,900.00, -FOR COMBO STYLE BUCKET BOX ADD $6800.00, ADDITIONAL COMPARTMENTS WITH VALVING

3000/1000 ADD $2990.00, SELF LOADING SYSTEM THRU ADDITIONAL HOSE REEL INSTALLED IN REAR OF

BUCKET BOX WITH AUTO VALVING ADD $25900.00.FOR 1 6 INCH ALUM HOSE TUBE ADD $2600.00-FOR FUEL

FILTER EACH COMPARTMENT ADD $990.00. FOR MANHOLE COVERS LOCKING NO CHARGE. ADDITIONAL

EMERGENCY SHUTOFF NO CHARGE. TO LOAD AT PORT BOTTOM LOADING VAPOR RECOVERY AND SCULLY

SYSTEM ADD $11000.00!

$99,500.00"

Optional mounted body - specify

ZIMMERMAN CONCRETE MIXER MOBILE 5 YD.-6 YARD ADD $2000.00 7 YARD ADD $5000.00, 8 YARD ADD
$7000.00. 9 YARD ADD $9500.00- ELECTRIC RECOIL TARP ADD $4600.00 LIQUID ADMIXTURE SYSTEM ADD
$3000.00 HIGH PRODUCTION ADD $ 6000.00 AGGREGATE BIN LINER ADD $4000.00. STROBE LIGHT ADD
$700.00 POWER TELESCOPIC CHUTES ADD $5800.00POZZOLAN BIN ADD $19900.00 FLOWABLE FILL PACKAGE
ADD $6500.00 TICKET PRINTER ADD $2000.00 LIQUID COLOR DISPENSER ADD $6800.00 VM VIBER DISPENSER
ADD $4500.00 18 INCH PUMP CHUTE ADD $500.00 LED NIGHT WORK LIGHT ADD $1000.00 1.5 INCH DECK
LEVEL WATER FILL ADD $900.00 SS ADMIX TANK ADD $3000.00 2 DAYS TRAINING ADD $1500.00. REQUIRES
64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00

Optional mounted body - specify $1 19,800.001
CEMENT TECH CONCRETE MIXER REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00 1

913



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

PALFINGER
LOADER !

DLR-25RL !

PAC MAC !

G-S
AUTOMATED !

DLR-PRT !

REAR LOADER
25YD !

DLR-AH-P '

DLR-HRL '

DLR-PPL3 !

DLR-PBL3 '

DLR-ARL '

DLR-GSB8232 '

M2-112

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
* Western % Northern * Central * Southern

$57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00

Optional mounted body - specify

PALFINGER A-LINE LOADER WITH 40 YD TRASH BODY WITH AUTO TARP REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT
ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00 PALFINGER T-50 HOOKLIFT WITH PIONEER TARP REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW
PACKAGE TOTAL PRICE FOR BODY $65,500/ EPSILON Q150 Z84 TI GRAPPLE LOADER/AMERICAN ROLLOFF
60-22 TOTAL BODY PRICE $184,500 EPSILON S260L130 CANAL CRANE TOTAL BODY PRICE $218,600!

Optional mounted body - specify
NEW WAY COBRA MAGNUM 25RL REAR LOADER NEW WAY SIDE WINDER 31 YD SIDE LOADER TOTAL PRICE
$123,500 ALL REQUIRE 64000 HD GVW PACKAGE AT ADDITIONAL COST $39,900.00 1

Optional equipment - specify
PAC MAC 1§NUCLE BOOM CRANE KBF334 REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PACKAGE AT ADDITIONAL COST OF
$39,900.00

Optional equipment - specify

G-S PRODUCTS CS91334 33 YD FULLY AUTOMATED BODY WITH ALL OPTIONS. G-S SB8238 2 STREAM
COMPACTION COLLECTION BODY WITH ALL OPTIONS REQUIRES RH STANDUP CAB AND 64000 HD GVW
PACKAGE AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00. BODY PRICE ONLY $148,500. G-S MP8133D 33 YD SINGLE
STREAM BOlDY WITH AL OPTIONS BODY PRICE ONLY $109,800 REQUIRE RH STANDUP CAB AND 64K GVW
PACKAGE

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify
PRENTICE 2124 LOADER REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF %39,900.00 1

Optional equipment - specify
25 YD REAJle LOADER WITH OPTIONS REQUIRE 64000 HD GVW PACKAGE AT ADDITIONAL COST OF
$39,900.00

Optional equipment - specify
PALFINGER AMERICAN HAWK CRANE WITH 40 YARD BODY- REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL
COST OF $39,900.00.1

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify
HEIL 25 YD1 REAR LOADER REFUSE BODY- REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF
$39,900.00

Optional equipment - specify

PL-3 BASE ROLLOFF SKID LOADER WITH WALD THROUGH CONTROLS AND 18-24 CY BODY. ADD 2026 BODY
FOR ADDITIONAL $2000.00. QUADSTICK MECHANICAL JOYSTICK ADD $5000.00 ,PI SEL WINGING LOAD
COVER ADDS$1000.00. HDHI OUTRIGGER STROBES ADD $750.00. REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT
ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.001

Optional equipment - specify

BL-3 BASE LOADER FOR ROLLOFF WITH WALK THROUGHT CONTROLS. QUADSTICK MECHANICAL JOYSTICK
CONTROLS ADD $600.00 HDHI OUTRIGGER STROBES ADD $700.00. HOSE GUARD ADD $500.00. REQUIRES
64000 GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00 1

Optional equipment - specify

AL-1 ATLAS LOADER- 2240 MHX HARDOX 22FT 40 CU YD ADD $37000.00. PI SEL WINDING LOAD COVER ADD
$1000.00. TOOL BOX ADD $700.00. AMBER LED FLASHERS ADD $600.00. WORK LIGHT CURB SIDE ADD $500.00.
WORK LIGHIT STREET SIDE ADD $500.00 REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST OF

$39,900.00.

Optional equipment - specify

G-S PRODUCTS SB-8232 SPLIT BODY SIDELOADER 2 STREAM RECYCLE BODY OR CO COLLECTION
REFUSE/RECYCLE BODY32 YARD. FOR 38 YD ADD $5000.00. G-S MP 8129 REFUSE OR SINGLE STREAM
RECYCLE BODY 29 YARDS TOTAL PRICE IS $120900.00. FOR 33 YD ADD $5000.00 G-S 5738D DUAL STREAM 38
YD RECYCLE BODY ADD $99500.00. FOR 44 YD ADD $8000.00 REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL
COST OF $39,900.00. 1

$119,600.00"

$72,900.00"

$78,600.00"

$127,500.00"

NA
$129,000.00"

$78,500.00"

$117,900.00"

NA
$86,500.00"

$66,800.00"

$58,700.00"

$65,700.00"

$159,600.00"
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

LELY 4000
WATER !

DLR-HAL !

DLR-LMAS '

DLR-TT '
DLR-TER !

WBB-242 !
WBB-246 !
WBB-250 !
WAI-13E !
WAI-4K6 !

WAI-963 !

M2-112

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner ~Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
* Western % Northern * Central * Southern

$57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00 $57,750.00

Optional equipment - specify $74,500.001
LELY 4000 GALLON STEEL SEPTIC TANK LELY 4000 GALLON STEEL SEPTIC TANK WITH FULL OPEN REAR AND
HOIST TOTAL BODY PRICE $108400 ALL REQUIRE 64000 HD GVW PACKAGE AT ADDITIONAL COST OF
$39,900.00L

Optional equipment - specify $129,800.001
HEIL AUTOMATED SIDE LOADER. AUTO LUBE SYSTEM FOR AUTOMATED ARM ADD $7800. CUROTTO CAN

ASSEMBLY ADD $30000.00. REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT ADDITIONAL COST HEIL ROLLOFF WITH

TARPER REQUIRES 64000 GVW PACKAGE AT ADDITIONAL COST. TOTAL BODY PRICE $56,500 |

Optional equipment - specify $67,400.00'
LOADMASTER EXCEL S 25 YD HI COMPACTION REAR LOADER. REQUIRES 64000 HD GVW PCK AT

ADDITIONAL COST OF $39,900.00 27 CU YD ADD $850 33 CU YD ADD $2900 1

Temporary tag NC!
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $50.00"
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA
Maintenance Plan - specify NA
Maintenance Plan - specify NA
Maintenance Plan - specify NA
Warranty - specify $1,800.00"
3 YEARS 200000 MILES 1

Warranty - specify $4,800.00"
4 YEARS 500000 MILES 1

Warranty - specify $5,000.00"
7 YEARS 250000 MILES 1

Diesel Warranty - specify $1,650.00"
3 YEARS 300000 MILES FULL COVERAGE 1

Diesel Warranty - specify $4,1 15.00'
5 YEARS 300000 MILES FULL COVERAGE 1

Diesel Warranty - specify $6,455.00"

7 YEARS 400000 MILES FULL COVERAGE 1
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52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2018 Freightliner M2-112

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Freightliner M2-112 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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