
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

1 TON CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X4 (Specification #06)

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD
(CK36003) Western $25,747.00

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD
(CK36003) Western -- NB --

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD
(CK36003) Northern $25,447.00

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD
(CK36003) Northern -- NB --

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD
(CK36003) Central $25,547.00

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD
(CK36003) Central -- NB --

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD
(CK36003) Southern $25,947.00

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD
(CK36003) Southern -- NB --

Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) Western $24,855.00
ALT - Duval Ford 2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) Western $25,526.00
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) Northern $24,755.00
ALT - Duval Ford 2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) Northern $26,003.00
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) Central $24,755.00
ALT - Duval Ford 2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) Central $26,003.00
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) Southern $24,855.00
ALT - Duval Ford 2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) Southern $26,003.00

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) Western $26,183.00
ALT - Kelley Buick GMC, Inc 2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) Western $26,445.00
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) Northern $25,883.00
ALT - Kelley Buick GMC, Inc 2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) Northern $26,445.00
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) Central $25,983.00
ALT - Kelley Buick GMC, Inc 2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) Central $26,445.00
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Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) Southern $26,383.00
ALT - Kelley Buick GMC, Inc 2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) Southern $26,445.00
 
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) Western $25,259.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) Western $25,426.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) Northern $25,159.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) Northern $25,326.00
Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) Central $25,126.00
ALT - AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) Central $25,134.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) Southern $25,059.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) Southern $25,326.00
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

1 TON CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #6

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003) 
2018 Ford F-350 (F3H) 
2018 GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) 
2018 Ram 3500 (DD8L63) 

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND
SIRENS SECTION WITHIN THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS
AND AWARDED VENDOR PRICING.

ENGINE:1.

Manufacturer's standard gas engine, alternator, battery and cooling package.a.

TRANSMISSION/AXLES:2.

Manufacturer's standard automatic transmission.a.
Manufacturer's standard drive axle ratio for engine and transmission combination.b.
Manufacturer's standard transfer casec.
Limited slip differential on rear axlesd.

PERFORMANCE ITEMS:3.

Manufacturer's standard power steering.a.
Manufacturer's standard gauges.b.

COMFORT ITEMS:4.

Manufacturer's standard air conditioning with 134A system.a.
Manufacturer's standard tinted glass all around.b.
Manufacturer's standard AM/FM stereo.c.
Heavy duty rubber floor covering instead of carpet.d.
Manufacturer's standard production seats. Purchaser will select color at time of order.e.
Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).f.

SAFETY ITEMS:5.

Dual mount outside mirrors to provide field of vision for vehicles to 96" wide.a.
Interior dome lights with left and right door activated switches.b.
Manufacturer's standard air bags.c.

BRAKES:6.

Four wheel anti-lock brake ABS system.a.

TIRES AND WHEELS:7.
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Manufacturer's standard tires and wheels.a.

CHASSIS, FRAME, CAB:8.

Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agencies.a.
Manufacturer's standard fuel tank.b.
Manufacturer's standard bumper.c.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE. 
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

1 TON CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #6

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003)
The Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by
the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $25,747.00 $25,447.00 $25,547.00 $25,947.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
5-speed manual transmission with overdrive in lieu of automatic overdrive NA 

K35903-ZW9 1 Single rear wheels, 9,900 lbs. GVWR 
Regular Cab Chassis SRW with 56" CA  1 

NC1

Air conditioning NA 
AM/FM stereo radio NA 
Limited slip differential on rear axles NA 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

L5P MW7 1 Engine upgrade - specify 
Engine, Duramax 6.6L Turbo-Diesel V8, B20-Diesel compatible (445 hp [332 kW] @ 2800 rpm, 910 lb-ft of torque
[1220 Nm] @ 1600 rpm) with Allison 1000 6-speed automatic transmission and (GT4) 3.73 rear axle ratio. Includes
capped fuel fill, (K40) exhaust brake and (K05) engine block heater.)  1 

$8,995.001

FPF 1 Engine upgrade - specify 
DPF, Diesel particulate filter, manual regeneration. Customer regeneration will not be allowed until DPF load
percentage has reached 100% full and a driver information center message has been shown. Requires L5P.  1 

$249.001

L96 MYD 1 Bi-fuel model - specify 
6.0L VVT E-85 flex fuel capable V8 with 6-speed automatic transmission.  1 

Std1

CNG prep - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
Dual fuel tanks 
Dual fuel tanks standard (N2M - Delete rear fuel tank, leaves front 23.5 gal front tank only N/C.) -or- (N2L - Front
fuel tank delete, leaves rear 40 gal tank only (requires diesel engine) N/C.)  1 

Std1

KW5 1 Alternator, extra HD 
220 amp alternator (K4B - HD Auxiliary battery with gas engine $134) - or - (DRYCELL - Dealer provided Optima
RED TOP drycell battery replaces factory lead acid battery $379, each.)  1 

$149.001

KHB 1 Dual alternators 
150amp and 220amp dual alternators, requires diesel engine upgrade  1 

$379.001

UF3 1 Idle control $199.001

JL1 1 Electric brake controller $274.001

VEHICLE: Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $25,747.00 $25,447.00 $25,547.00 $25,947.00
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1LT CK36##3 1 Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) 
1LT package includes: electronic transfer case with rotary dial, body color door handles, 17" steel wheels with chrome
trim, black power heated vertical camper mirrors with manual fold and extend, deep tint rear glass, Chevy MyLink 8"
color touch screen display, USB Ports, single slot CD/MP3 player, streaming bluetooth capability, 4G LTE capability,
handsfree smart phone,Sirus XM capable radio, bluetooth for phone, power windows with driver express up down,
remote keyless entry w/ 2 transmitters, 6 mos OnStar service, 6 speaker audio, cloth 40/20/40 split bench w/ lockable
storage compartment, storage pockets, color keyed carpet w/ rubberized vinyl mats, leather wrapped steering wheel
with audio & cruise controls, 4.2" DIC display in instrument cluster, auto dimming rear view mirror, driver and pass
illum vanity mirrors. (ADD $2018 when ordering with double or crew cab upgrades)  1 

$4,230.001

PCR CC 35 1 Power windows/door locks 
Power door locks standard, WT fleet convenience package includes: Power windows, outside heated/power adjustable
vertical camper mirrors, and remote keyless entry.  1 

$964.001

Speed control/tilt steering wheel Std 
AM/FM radio with single CD 
Included and only available with manufacturers upgrade package.  1 

NA1

"Blue Tooth" connectivity Std 
UE1 1 On-Star 

OnStar Guidance plan for 6 months, including Automatic Crash Response, Stolen Vehicle Assistance, Roadside
Assistance, Turn-by-Turn Navigation, Advanced Diagnostics and more (trial excludes Hands-Free Calling minutes)
(Retail orders receive limited service trial. Visit www.onstar.com for coverage map, details and system limitations.
Services vary by model. OnStar acts as a link to existing emergency service providers. Not all vehicles may transmit
all crash data.)  1 

$174.001

U2K 1 Satellite radio 
SiriusXM Satellite Radio is standard on nearly all 2018 GM models. Enjoy a 3-month All Access trial subscription with
over 150 channels including commercial-free music, plus sports, news and entertainment. Plus listening on the app and
online is included, so you'll hear the best SiriusXM has to offer, anywhere life takes you. Welcome to the world of
SiriusXM. (Requires (UE1) OnStar. If you decide to continue service after your trial, the subscription plan you choose
will automatically renew thereafter and you will be charged according to your chosen payment method at then-current
rates. Fees and taxes apply. To cancel you must call us at 1-866-635-2349. See our Customer Agreement for complete
terms at www.siriusxm.com. All fees and programming subject to change.)  1 

$194.001

AK0 1 Deep tinted glass 
Factory Deep Tint Rear Window Only, ADD $100 for double or crew cab. - or - (DT2 - Dealer installed SolarGuard
deep tint film on driver and pass doors $149) - or - (DTF 2 TRK - Dealer installed SolarGuard deep tint film on all
door and rear window glass $259) - or - (DTF 4 TRK - Dealer installed SolarGuard deep tint film on all door and rear
window glass $279) - and - (WSTP - add $49 for SolarGuard windshield strip).  1 

$99.001

Sliding rear window 
(C49 - Rear Window Defogger $194) 1 

NA1

H2Q 1 40/20/40 seat in vinyl 
Dark ash vinyl, base model only - add - (DRC - Dealer remove center section leaving bare floor ADD $110 ) - add -
(CC-MC-14 - Troy Products 14" console with vehicle specific floor plate, 4" dual internal cupholder, 3" shallow
console tray, (3) 12V DC outlets, height adjustable 5"x8" armrest, and blank filler plates. $740) - or - (CC-WBOS-20 -
Troy Products 20" wide body console with vehicle specific floor plate, 4" dual internal cupholder, 3" shallow console
tray, (3) 12V DC outlets, height adjustable 5"x8" armrest, and blank filler plates. $915) - or - (CC-WBOS-16-FB -
Troy Products 16" wide body console with vehicle specific floor plate, 4" dual internal cupholder, 3" shallow console
tray, (3) 12V DC outlets, 9" lidded file box at rear console with large leather pad, and blank filler plates. $1075.)
***Specify agency radio for faceplate(s)***  1 

Std1

H0U 1 40/20/40 seat in cloth 
Jet Black cloth seat trim  1 

NC1

AY0 1 Side air bags 
Air bags, single stage frontal and thorax side-impact, driver and front passenger, and head curtain side-impact, front
and rear outboard seating positions.  1 

$394.001

VEHICLE: Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $25,747.00 $25,447.00 $25,547.00 $25,947.00
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5H1 1 Third key 
Factory Ordered, dealer programmed 2 additional Keys - or - (3K - dealer provided third key $149) - or - (3KR -
dealer provided third key and remote $373)  1 

$149.001

K35953-ZW9 1 Extended cab model 
3500HD Double Cab Chassis with 56" CA.  1 

$4,050.001

K36043 1 Crew cab (4 door) 
Includes four full doors with power windows and locks.  1 

$4,275.001

RVS 1 Cab steps 
LPO assist steps, 4" black round, ADD $100 for crew cab. - or - (VXJ - LPO assist steps, 4" chrome round $584, ADD
$100 for crew cab.) -or- (VXH - LPO assist steps, 6" chrome rectangular $649, ADD $125 for crew cab.) - or - (Step3
REG - Dealer provided Aries 3" black round cab steps for regular cab pickup $495.00) - or - (Step3 CRW - Dealer
provided Aries 3" black round cab steps for crew cab pickup $525.00)  1 

$529.001

Daytime running lights Std 
Immobilize daytime running lights NA 

L-SPOT 1 Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Unity incandescent left hand spot lamp. - add - (LED - Add $225 for dealer installed LED bulb)  1 

$520.001

LR-SPOT 1 Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Unity incandescent left and right hand hand spot lamp.- add - (LED2 - Add $450 for dealer installed LED bulbs)  1 

$1,050.001

RS 1 Vent visors - stick-on style 
WeatherTech stick on vent visors, two doors.  1 

$145.001

RSF 1 Rainshields - flange style 
WeatherTech flange style rain shields, two doors.  1 

$145.001

BS 1 Bug shield 
Dealer installed Weather Tech bug shield hood protector.  1 

$189.001

WGG 1 Wrap-around grille guard 
Westin Sportsman / Sterling vehicle specific wrap around grille guard, add $300 for Winch Mount Plate.  1 

$995.001

USOB 1 Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
HD spray on bed liner for cargo area of 9' utility body only. -or - (USOB-11 HD spray on bed liner for cargo area of
11' utility body only, $897.) - or - (USOB-T - HD spray on bed liner for cargo area of 9' utility body including tops of
boxes $1026) - or - (USOB-T-11 - HD spray on bed liner for cargo area of 11' utility body including tops of boxes
$1176) - and - (RB - spray on bed liner for rear bumper $75.)  1 

$747.001

QZT 1 All terrain tread tires 
LT235/80R17E All Terrain BSW tires.  1 

$199.001

NZZ 1 Skid plates 
Underbody shield from front bumper to first cross member protecting front under body, oil pan, differential case, and
transfer case.  1 

$149.001

NQF 1 Shift on the fly 
Transfer case, electronic shift with rotary dial controls  1 

$199.001

PTO provision 
Included and only available with diesel engine upgrade option.  1 

NA1

PTO auto trans provision 
Included and only available with diesel engine upgrade option.  1 

NA1

VEHICLE: Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $25,747.00 $25,447.00 $25,547.00 $25,947.00
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4004 EH 1 4,000 lb. EH Auto Crane, or approved equivalent, with crane reinforcements with manual
outriggers 
Auto Crane 4,000lb EH Crane includes: man. outriggers, aux batt., spring buildup & boom rest requires Knapheide
Crane Body -or- (EC4000 Stellar 16,000ft-lb Crane includes: man. outriggers, aux batt., spring buildup & boom rest
$16,270 ** Req's Knapheide Crane Body.) - or - (PSC3216 Palfinger 12,500ft-lb Crane includes: man. outriggers, aux
batt., spring buildup & boom rest $16,765.** Req's Warner Crane Body) -or- (ET16KX Venturo 16,000ft-lb Crane
includes: man. outriggers, aux batt., spring buildup & boom rest $19,415 **Req's Crane Body**) (Requires GTY Wide
Track Axle with Chevy/GMC Chassis)***  1 

$17,705.001

6108D54J 16K 1 9 ft. Auto Crane body, or approved equivalent, with shelf package, 12" bumper with crank
outriggers 
9' DRW Knapheide 16K Rated with Crane Reinforcement and 12" Work Bumper. - or - [(WS2108 LDCR Warner 9'
18.5K Reinforced Body w/ Standard Shelving and 12" Work Bumper $10,825.)] -or- [(U108ADW CR Reading Classic
II 9' DRW Reinforced Body for up to 4K Cranes $8,910)] (Outriggers included with crane pricing.) **(Chevy/GMC
Requires GTY Wide Track Axle) **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification & manufacturer required PDI as
"completed vehicle".)**  1 

$11,165.001

6132D54J 16K 1 11 ft. Auto Crane body, or approved equivalent, with shelf package, 12" bumper with crank
outriggers 
Knapheide 11' 16K DRW Knapheide 16K Rated with Crane Reinforcement and 12" Work Bumper. -or- [(WS2132
LDCR Warner 11' 18.5K HD Crane Body w/ Standard Shelving and 12" Work Bumper $13,325.) -or- (U132ADW CR
Reading Classic II 9' DRW Reinforced Body for up to 4K Cranes $10,455) (Outriggers included with crane pricing.)
**(Chevy/GMC Requires GTY Wide Track Axle) **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification & manufacturer
required PDI as "completed vehicle".)**  1 

$12,820.001

TG16 UB 1 1,500 lb. lift gate 
Tommy Gate G2-1600 LB. (Add $298 for 2 piece gate) for Knapheide and Warner Bodies -or- [With READING Bodies
- (TTL15ET Thieman 1500lb liftgate Steel $3595) -or- (TTL15ET AL Thieman 1500lb liftgate Aluminum $3945)] -or-
[RG16 Railgate 96" Wide 1600lb capacity for use with stake body applications $4241]  1 

$3,990.001

VR12000 1 12,000 lb. winch with remote 
Warn 12,000lb recovery winch with remote, Requires WGG with winch mount plate.  1 

$1,395.001

Headlight flashers NA 
ZQO SKP 1 Full size spare tire & rim 

LT235/80R17E with 17" steel wheel (ships loose).  1 
$379.001

N2 DRW 1 Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire 
($209 with single rear wheel option)  1 

$249.001

CLVWC D2B 1 Trailer towing package, to include heavy duty flashers, wiring for trailer plug (7 prong round),
and class IV frame mounted trailer hitch with 2" square removable receiver, 1" shank with 2"
ball. May be dealer installed. 
Dealer provided HD Class V Titan 2.5" Receiver, 7 Pin Wire Harness, Rigid solid steel shank draw bar, 2 & 5/16"
Ball, pin & clip. - and - (PTL - Upgrade from standard draw bar & ball to 2" ball-pintle hook combo $169) - and -
(PTL2 - Upgrade from standard draw bar & ball to 2-5/16" ball-pintle hook combo $169).  1 

$785.001

K36403 1 84" cab to axle $699.001

SLU132ADW  1 Manufacturer's certified factory 11 ft. extended service body (requires 84" CA) 
Reading Standard Line 11' DRW service body powder coated white. -or- (UR132ADW 11' Reading Classic II $9,825)
Add $2295 for Flip Top lids, $1195 for lighted compartments, $985 for Latchmatic Remote Locking System. - or -
(6132D54J Knapheide 11' Standard Service Wide Body Painted White $9,000, Add $1530 for Flip Top Lids, $770 for
Compartment Lights, $555 for Master Locking System) **(Chevy/GMC Requires GTY Wide Track Axle) **(Includes
FHSMV required chassis certification & manufacturer required PDI as "completed vehicle".)**  1 

$8,595.001

VEHICLE: Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $25,747.00 $25,447.00 $25,547.00 $25,947.00
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SLU108ADW 1 Manufacturer's certified factory standard wide service body for dual rear wheels to include
appropriate mirrors - specify. May be dealer installed. (NOTE: If you are ordering a service
body, we are advising you to contact your awarded vendor.) 
Reading Standard Line 9' Service Body Powder Coated White. -or- (U108ADW 9' Reading Classic II $8,145.) Add
$945 for Flip Top Lids, $970 for Compartment Lighting, $920 for Latchmatic Remote Locking System. - or -
(K6108D54J Knapheide 9' Standard Service Wide Body Painted White $7355. Add $805 for Flip Top Lids, $590 for
Compartment Lighting, $555 for Master Locking System.) **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification &
manufacturer required PDI as "completed vehicle".)**  1 

$7,280.001

PGNA96 1 Optional body - specify 
Knapheide 9' GOOSENECK BODY.*(Add $320 for 11' Body) - or - (PGNB96 - Duplicate Stop/Turn Signals to top of
Bulkhead $5,105)* (Add $320 for 11' Body) - or - (PGNC96 - Duplicate signals at top of bulkhead plus Full Lower
Skirts and integral tool boxes $7760)*(Add $430 for 11' Body) **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification &
manufacturer required PDI as "completed vehicle".)**  1 

$4,345.001

BUCKET 29 1 Optional body - specify 
KNAPHEIDE 6108D BODY WITH DT-29FP DURALIFT 29' BUCKET CATEGORY D AERIAL LIFT, FISH PLATE
MNTG KIT DTDC. BACKUP, HIGH SPEED PUMP3 AXIS NON HREC JOYSTICK SINGLE LOCKOUT, LEVEL
RIDE RR 36" X 94" WALKUP TAILSHELF, INCLINOMETER BODY AND MOUNTING HARDWARE KIT FRAME
EXT. CLASS 5 FOR HITCH2" COMBO PINTLE/BALL HITCH, RECEIVER STYLE7 PIN SPADE TRAILER PLUG
ALUMINUM POOL HANDLEGRAB HANDLES- SMALL CHROME BACKUP ALARMPTO & PUMP, CLASS 5MUD
FLAPS W/ MOUNTING BRACKETS FOR UTILITY BODIESASSEMBLY; 10" BELTING STEP (Chevy/GMC requires
GTY Wide Track Axle)**(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification & manufacturer required PDI as "completed
vehicle".)**  1 

$43,450.001

WS2132MDWU 1 Optional body - specify 
Warner Select 11' Service Body POWDER COATED WHITE. Add $850 for Flip Top Lids, $1165 for LED
Compartment Lighting, $490 Master Locking, $675 Brooklyn Bars. **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification
& manufacturer required PDI as "completed vehicle".)**  1 

$10,325.001

WS2108MDW 1 Powder coating for utility body 
Warner Select 9' Service Body POWDER COATED WHITE. Add $900 for Flip Top Lids, $980 for LED Compartment
Lighting, $440 Master Locking, $615 Brooklyn Bars. **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification &
manufacturer required PDI as "completed vehicle".)**  1 

$7,950.001

9 2YD 1 2-3 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp 
SLMD92 Reading 9ft 2/4 Yard Dump 60" CA. Includes ground control tarp, 1/4 cab shield, painted black with 12ga
steel construction, single acting electric hoist, ICC bumper. Add $600 for Tarp Arms (requires DRW & GTY) - or -
[(11 2YD SLMD113 Reading 11ft 3/4 Yard Dump 84" CA. Includes ground control tarp, 1/4 cab shield, painted black
with 12ga steel construction, single acting electric hoist, ICC bumper $10,225. Add $600 for Tarp Arms) Requires 84"
CA **(Chevy/GMC requires GTY)] **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification & manufacturer required PDI
as "completed vehicle".)**  1 

$9,650.001

9STK 1 Manufacturer's certified factory 9 ft. flat stake body with 40" stake sides and gates (requires
60" CA) 
9' Flat bed includes: Fixed bulkhead w/ removable side & rear stakes. (ADD $3290 for Electric hoist) * (CREDIT
$825 to delete stakes)**(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification & manufacturer required PDI as "completed
vehicle".)**  1 

$5,810.001

12STK 1 Manufacturer's certified factory 12 ft. flat stake body with 40" stake sides and gates (requires
84" CA) 
12' Flat bed includes: Fixed bulkhead w/ removable side & rear stakes. (ADD $3350 for Electric hoist) (CREDIT
$1025 to delete stakes) **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification & manufacturer required PDI as "completed
vehicle".)**  1 

$6,350.001

Backup alarm - Factory Installed NA 
BUA 1 Backup alarm - Dealer Installed 

Dealer installed STAR 90db back up alarm.  1 
$179.001

VEHICLE: Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003)
DEALER: Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick

GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick
GMC Cadillac

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $25,747.00 $25,447.00 $25,547.00 $25,947.00
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AVF 5F9 1 Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at
rear of vehicle) - Factory Installed 
Factory rear camera calibration with dealer provided GM camera. BCM will be flashed at the plant for acceptance of
GM camera, option only pertains to box removal applications.  1 

$525.001

BUC-RM 1 Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at
rear of vehicle) - Dealer Installed 
Dealer provided Rear View Safety brand back up camera with rear view mirror display. - or - (BUC-DASH - Dealer
provided Rear View Safety brand back up camera with top of dash mounted monitor (not in center stack) $679.)  1 

$679.001

HAR 1 Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab) 
Custom manufactured vehilce & body specific cab shield, installed.- add - (HAR-MNT - Light mount brackets
fabricated on cab shield $175.)  1 

$925.001

Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup bed) NA 
ALPRU9 1 Pipe rack w/expended metal basket over cab (for utility body) 

Custom HD aluminum pipe rack for 9' utility bodies fabricated using 1-1/2" square tubing installed from rear of utility
body to windshield/hood line of vehicle over cargo area, includes expanded aluminum basket over cab, add $600 for
11' bodies - or - (ALPRU-SS9 - Single side custom HD aluminum pipe rack for 9' utility body fabricated using 1-1/2"
square tubing installed on curb side from rear of utility body to front bumper, includes expanded aluminum basket
over cab $2400 add $400 for 11' body.)- or - (ALPRU-9BB - Custom HD aluminum pipe rack for 9' utility bodies
fabricated using 1-1/2" square tubing installed from rear of utility body to front bumper, includes expanded aluminum
basket over cab $3,200, add $600 for 11' body.)  1 

$2,500.001

WG1425-3 1 Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or curbside) 
WeatherGuard Aluminum single side mounted ladder rack.  1 

$798.001

GTY 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Wide track axle (Increases Rear Axle Width by 8" for Crane, Service, & Dump Bodies) - and - (BJA - Fuel fill kit for
service body applications $49.) - and - (TRW - Provision for cab roof mounted lamp/beacon, provides an instrument
panel mounted switch and wiring under the headliner for warning lamp $29.)  1 

$189.001

VR70-G 1 Optional equipment - specify 
VMAC-70 Under hood Compressor for Gas Engines 70cfm @ 125 psi 2 year warranty Furnished and Installed by
Compressed Air Systems of Florida.) -or- (VR70-D VMAC-70 Under hood Compressor for Diesel Engines 70cfm @
125 psi 2 year warranty Furnished and Installed by Compressed Air Systems of Florida. $12,705.) - add - (VMAC AIR
COOLER - VMAC air-cooled after cooler $1179) - add - (REG - ¾ Wilkerson regulator add $210) - and - (FILTER -
¾” liquid removal filter add $225) - or - (COMBO - Vanair "Contractor" model compressor/generator with 14HP
Kohler engine, 5kW generator, 20 cfm reciprocating compressor with 30gal storage tank, and 1.75 gal gas fuel tank,
installed $5136.) - or - (VIPER 40CFM - Vanair "Viper" model compressor generator with 25hp Kohler engine, 5.2kW
generator, 40CFM rotary screw compressor. Self-contained unit with 5gal gas fuel tank, installed $12,345.) - add -
(50HR - add 50' air hose and reel to any unit $890, specify mounting location.)  1 

$11,395.001

12 + 4 DOVE 1 Optional equipment - specify 
16' Knapheide Dove Tail landscaper body 12' platform + 4' dove tail w/ expanded metal sides and weed wacker rack
(REQUIRES 84" CA.) **(Includes FHSMV required chassis certification & manufacturer required PDI as "completed
vehicle".)**  1 

$7,445.001

CE6K-3 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Venturo 2000lb Electric Mast Folding Crane 6,000 ft - lbs crane with 2,000lb lifting capacity with manual extension,
rotation, and elevation. Includes spring buildup and reinforced bumper or bed.) - or - (ET6K - Venturo 2,000lb
capacity (6,000 ft-lb) E/H crane with hydraulic elevation, manual extension 6'-10', continuous rotation, and 50' of
3/16" wire rope. Price includes manual outriggers, boom rest, crane re-inforcement, and spring buildup $12,965
requires utility body (N/A with Reading SL series.)  1 

$5,660.001

80FT 1 Optional equipment - specify 
80 Gallon minimun fuel transfer tank, 12GPM fuel transfer pump, hose, nozzle, and GPI inline digital flow meter
installed against bulkhead. - and - (SAFE-T - Amerex 5lb Fire extinguisher, First Aide Only first aid kit, and King
James & Co road triangles $329).  1 

$2,082.001
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RAM-VB-###-SW1 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Ram vehicle specific no-drill laptop mount, includes freight and installation. - add - (806-1206 - 600w pure sine wave
inverter, installed $429.) - add - (806-1210-UB - 1000 watt pure sine wave inverter installed in curbside FRONT
compartment of utility body, includes 808-9001 Xantrex user control / ignition control switch mounted to dash. $798) -
add - (806-1220-UB - 2000 watt pure sine wave inverter installed in curbside FRONT compartment of utility body
includes 808-9001 Xantrex user control / ignition control switch mounted to dash. $1220) - add - (813-3000-UB -
3000 watt modified sine wave inverter installed in curbside FRONT compartment of utility body includes installation
with 4/0 power/ground & ignition control solenoid $1695 (dealer strongly recommends upgrading alternator and
addition of auxiliary battery).)  1 

$519.001

RSL CC 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Roadside lighting truck package incudes: Whelen four corner hide away LED kit, STAR 8-LED traffic advisor mounted
in rear window glass or on cab shield dual color (AMBER/CLEAR), STAR D-LITE grille lights (AMBER), STAR
D-LITE rear lights (AMBER) installed to back of body, all wired to factory upfitter switches or 6-switch controller. -
or - (ALB-TA - STAR dual color (Amber/White) LED Light Bar with Front Takedowns, Side Alley lights, and Rear
Arrow Stick Traffic Advisor $1895) - add - (20074- LED Go Light with dash and wireless remote, installed $696.)  1 

$1,895.001

UBT24 1 Optional equipment - specify 
24” Under Body Tool Box - or - (UBT30 - 30” Under Body Tool Box $509) - or - (UBT36 - 36” Under Body Tool Box
$528) - or - (UBT48 - 48” Under Body Tool Box $568) - or - (CHEST - 48” Tool Chest mounted against bulkhead
inside utility bed $529)  1 

$489.001

LABOR 1 Optional equipment - specify 
(Labor Rates Based on Single Vehicle Build)  1 

$110.001

BXR 1 Optional equipment - specify 
(Body Transfer or 3rd Party Body Installations) In the event end user chooses to purchase cab & chassis only dealer
will facilitate obtaining Manufacturer completed certificate, perform Manufacturer Required Pre-Delivery Inspection
and ensure all proper tag and title documents are present to certify the vehicle as a complete vehicle in the State of
Florida (Ref State Statutes 319.21 & 319.23). Alan Jay Fleet will coordinate with Certified Manufacturer and bring
vehicle to Alan Jay to complete Manufacturer required pre-delivery inspection prior to delivering to customer.
Transportation cost to facilitate the above transaction will be set at $1.85 per mile from Alan Jay Fleet to 3rd Party
Vendor back to Alan Jay to complete Inspection. Final Delivery from Alan Jay to customer is included in bid price.
**Customer or agent MUST inspect vehicle at 3rd party location at time of delivery. Payment for Chassis will be due
upon delivery of chassis to 3rd party vendor.  1 

$497.001

TEMP-TAG 1 Temporary tag $45.251

TRANS-TAG 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
Includes temp tag & two way overnight shipping for signature.  1 

$198.851

NEW-TAG 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Includes temp tag & two way overnight shipping for signature.  1 

$248.331

D-R9Y 1 Maintenance Plan - specify 
24mo / 24k mile scheduled maintenance program to include oil / filter change, 4-wheel tire rotation, and conduct a
27-point vehicle inspection. The plan covers up to (4) service visits within the 24 month period. (ADD $41 WHEN
ORDERING WITH DIESEL ENGINE)  1 

$89.001

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

AMW 1 Warranty - specify 
All VENDOR INSTALLED aftermarket equipment subject to 1 year parts only warranty FOB Alan Jay Fleet
Processing Cetner, Sebring FL. Reference FSA Contract Terms and Conditions 3.21 - Vendor Installed.  1 

Incl.1

APPMG575 1 Warranty - specify 
Ally Protection Plan Major Guard 5 years or 75,000 mile Extended Warranty for Commercial Use with $0 Deductible.
(Emergency Use Surcharge Add $1775.)  1 

$3,240.001

APPMG6100 1 Warranty - specify 
Ally Protection Plan Major Guard 6 years or 100,000 mile Extended Warranty for Commercial Use with $0
Deductible. (Emergency Use Surcharge Add $1775.)  1 

$3,791.001
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Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

1 TON CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #6

2018 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003)

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by
the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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