FLORIDA
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All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
25.500 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2 (Specification #12)

TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Hino 268A Western
ALT - Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Hino 268A Western
TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Hino 268A Northern
ALT - Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Hino 268A Northern
TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Hino 268A Central
ALT - Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Hino 268A Central
TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Hino 268A Southern
ALT - Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Hino 268A Southern
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) * Western
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) Western
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) * Northern
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) Northern
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) * Central
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) Central
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) * Southern
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) Southern
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2 Western
2018 Freightliner M2 Western
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2 Northern
2018 Freightliner M2 Northern
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2 Central
2018 Freightliner M2 Central
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2 Southern
2018 Freightliner M2 Southern
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Durastar Western
2018 International Durastar Western
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Durastar Northern

Base Unit
Price

$59,234.00
$61,972.00
$59,234.00
$61,972.00
$59,234.00
$61,972.00
$59,234.00
$61,972.00

$47,140.00
$47,500.00
$47,140.00
$47,500.00
$47,140.00
$47,500.00
$47,140.00
$47,500.00

$52,750.00
- NB --
$52,750.00
- NB --
$52,750.00
—-NB --
$52,750.00
- NB --

$61,850.00

—-NB --
$60,850.00
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SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks Inc

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE

Kenworth of Central Florida

Kenworth of South Florida

Rush Truck Centers of Florida

Rush Truck Centers of Florida

Rush Truck Centers of Florida

Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers inc

2018 International Durastar
2018 International Durastar
2018 International Durastar
2018 International Durastar

2018 International Durastar

2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270

2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

--NB --
$60,890.00
$60,950.00
$59,999.00

--NB --

$67,920.00
--NB --
$67,670.00
--NB --
$68,650.00
--NB --
$68,945.00
--NB --

$70,790.00
--NB --
$70,790.00
--NB --
$70,790.00
--NB --
$70,597.00
--NB --
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FAC

FLORIDA
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

25,500 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #12

2018 Hino 268A

2018 Ford F-650 (F6D)
2018 Freightliner M2

2018 International Durastar
2018 Kenworth T270

2018 Peterbilt 330

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:
a. Diesel engine, minimum 200 HP
2. TRANSMISSION/AXLES:

a. All axles, synthetic lube.
b. Manufacturers standard automatic transmission or approved equivalent (with PTO provision).
c. 17,500 1b. rear axle

3. PERFORMANCE ITEMS:

a. Manufacturer's standard power steering.
b. Manufacturer's standard gauges.

4. COMFORT ITEMS:

a. Air conditioning, factory installed.

b. Manufacturer's standard tinted glass all around.

c. Manufacturer's standard AM/FM stereo.

d. Heavy duty rubber floor covering instead of carpet.

e. Manufacturer's standard production seats. Purchaser will select color at time of order.
f. Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).

5. SAFETY ITEMS:

a. Dual mount outside mirrors must provide a field of vision for vehicles to 102" width, and for towing.
b. Convex mirrors mounted below standard mirrors.
c. Interior dome lights with left and right door activated switches.

6. BRAKES:

a. Factory air brakes
b. Anti-lock brake system

7. TIRES AND WHEELS:
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a. BSW 11R22.5 (14 PR) or approved equivalent, front and rear.
b. Oil bath hubs, with synthetic lube.

8. CHASSIS. FRAME, CAB:

a. Minimum 25,500 1bs. GVWR.

b. Cab & chassis only.

¢. Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agencies.
d. Manufacturer's standard front bumper, bright or painted.

e. Factory front tow hooks.

f. Fuel tank capacity, 45 gallons minimum.

g. Cab to center of rear axle - 84" approximately.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FAC

FLORIDA
COUNTIES
-
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

25,500 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #12

2018 Kenworth T270

The Kenworth T270 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $67,920.00 $67,670.00 $68,650.00 $68,945.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE: T270
DEALER: KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF Kenworth of Central Kenworth of South
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE Florida Florida
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $67,920.00 $67,670.00 $68,650.00 $68,945.00
Western
Order Code Delete Options & Northern Central Southern
Gas engine in lieu of diesel NA NA NA
Provide 5 speed manual with base engine - specify NA NA NA
2050121 ! Provide 6 speed manual with base engine - specify ($3,745.00)"  ($2,807.00)%  ($3,598.00)°
2051121 2 Eaton Fuller FS54064 6 speed Transmission
2050121 3 Fuller FS064064 6spd manual 2
FULLER FS54064 6-SPEED MANUAL TRANSMISSION 3
Provide 7 speed manual with base engine - specify NA NA NA
2701000 > Air brakes if compatible with transmission Std Std? Incl.
5890000 ' Wheel seals $38.00" NA NA
V2B Double seal Cap Valves 1
Handling package NA NA NA
8601421 ! AM/FM stereo radio ($214.00)' | ($207.00)*  ($48.00)°
8601421 2 AM/FM STEREO RADIO 3
8601420 °
Satellite radio NA NA NA
On-Star NA NA NA
Western
Order Code Add Options & Northern Central Southern
Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.
0120221 ! Engine/transmission upgrade - specify $399.00'  $1,292.00°  $1,237.00°
0120241 2 PACCAR PX-7 220 2017 220@2400 520@1600 Includes turbo exhaust brake,
0120241 3 Diagnostic Plug for data link, Oil Cooler, Aluminum Flywheel Housing.
PX7-240hp / 560ft/Ib 2
PX-7 240 HP 2017 560 FT/LB TORQUE INCLUDES EXHAUST 3
0120241 ! Engine/transmission upgrade - specify $1,091 00t 81 ,959.002 $1,663 00°
0120262 2 PACCAR PX-7 240 2017 240@2400 560@1600 Includes turbo exhaust brake,
0120251 3 Diagnostic Plug for data link, Oil Cooler, Aluminum Flywheel Housing. 1

PX7-260hp / 660fi/1b 2

()12()2513PX-7 250 HP 2017 560 FT/LB TORQUE INCLUDES EXHAUST
BRAKE
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

0120301 !
0120282 2
0120262 3

2010860 !
0120301 2
0120282 3

0129461/3000HS
0120301/2011205 >
0120301 °

0129461/3000RDS !
120262/2011205 2
0120262 2011205 >

129471/2011205 >
0120301 2011205 °

129502/2011205 >
0129502 3

8282009 2

8226667 !
8226667 >
8222667

2010851 2

7135045 !
7132045 2

9101210 2

T270

KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE
Western Northern
$67,920.00 $67,670.00

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
PACCAR PX-7 300 2017 300@2600 660@1600 Includes turbo exhaust brake,
Diagnostic Plug for data link, Oil Cooler, Aluminum Flywheel Housing. 1

PX7-280hp / 660fi/Ib 2

PX-7 2603HP 2017 560 FT/LB TORQUE INCLUDES INCLUDES EXHAUST
BRAKE

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission: Allison 2500RDS 6-Speed 1

PX7-300hp / 660fi/Ib 2
PACCAR PX-7 280 HP/660 FT/LB TORQUE 3

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
PACCAR PX-7 260 2017 260@2200 720@1300 Includes turbo exhaust brake.
Includes Transmission Upgrade - Allison 3000HS 5-Speed 1

PX7-300hp-660f/Ib - 3000/0r/3500RDS 2
PACCAR PX-7 300 HP/660 FT/LB TORQUE 3

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
PACCAR PX-7 260 2017 260@2200 720@1300 Includes turbo exhaust brake.
Includes Transmission Upgrade - Allison 3000HS 5-Speed 1

PX7-260hp-660ft/b - 3000/0r/3500RDS 2

PX7-260hp-660fi/Ib - WITH ALLISON 3000RDS AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION
3

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
PX9-270hp-800ft/Ib - 3000/0r/3500RDS 2

PACCAR PX-7 300 HP/660 FT/LB TORQUE WITH ALLISON 3000RDS
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION 3

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
PX9-300hp-860fi/1b - 3000/01/3500RDS 2

PACCAR PX-9 300 HP/860 FT/LB TORQUE WITH ALLISON 3000RDS 6-SPEED
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION 3

Bi-fuel model - specify

CNG model - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)
Engine hour meter

Trans oil temp meter
Indicator light 2

Allison authorized synthetic oil, TES 295 or equivalent (required
for extended warranty)

Premium hoses

Dual 45 gallon fuel tanks
Dual 56gal aluminum ILO 45gallon steel $1,245.00 2

DUAL @ 56 GALLONS CAPACITY ALUMINUM, ROUND TANKS, ONE EACH
SID,UNDER CAB. TOTAL OF 112 GALLONS CAPACITY 3

Air dryers

Kenworth of Central

Florida
Central

$68,650.00

$2.239.00"

$123.00"

$8,319.00"

$9,292.00"

NA

NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
Std

$28.00'

Incl.

Std
$570.00"

Incl.

Kenworth of South
Florida
Southern
$68,945.00
$2,195.00°  $1,875.00°
$2,671.00°  $2,102.00°
$7.382.00°  $2,540.00°
$6,712.00°  $6,391.00°
$11,921.00°  $7,056.00°
$12,766.00> ' $12,138.00°
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
Std? NA
$28.007 $30.00°
Incl.2 Incl.
Std Std
$784.00>  $1,052.00°
Std2 Incl.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

9102040 2
9102040 3

8879213 !
8879213 2
8879213 °

8700188 2
8879213 8700188

N09300 2

8201200 '
8201200 2
8201200 °

8601422 !
8601422 2
8601422 3

3K !
8203060 >
8203060 °

2561010 !
2561010/232237 2

3

2561010 2322239 3

AWD

DRSCC !
CREWCAB
AWD?

4070011 4270011

8867202 !
8867202 2
8865001 °

3

T270
KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF Kenworth of Central Kenworth of South
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE Florida Florida
Western Northern Central Southern
$67,920.00 $67,670.00 $68,650.00 $68,945.00
Moisture ejectors Incl. $224.00° $205.00°
Power windows, only $86.00" $98.00° $97.00°

8879213 Electric-powered LH & RH door window lifts. Switch located on door 1

—

Power windows/door locks Std
Door locks are standard. Powers windows are optional 1
Power windows w/ Keyless entry 2

DUAL @ 56 GALLONS CAPACITY ALUMINUM, ROUND TANKS, ONE EACH
SID,UNDER CAB. TOTAL OF 112 GALLONS CAPACITY 3

Speed control Std'
Dash-mounted cruise control with switches 1

Tilt steering wheel NA
Telescopic and tilt steering wheel $402.00"

Adjustable telescoping tilt steering column 1
ADJUSTABLE TELESCOPIC/TILT STEERING COLUMN 3

AM/FM radio with single CD $326.00"
Kenworth Radio with AM/FM/WB/CD/USB and Bluetooth 1

Side air bags NA
Third key $30.00"
5 Keys 2

5 SETS OF KEYS 3

Upgrade to 4x4 (specify factory or after market) $19, 122.00"
Fabco FSD-10A4 Front Drive Axle at 10,0001bs 1

Factory 4x4 FSD10A; TC237 2spd Transfer Case 2

FABCO FSD-104 DRIVING FRONT AXLE/FABCO TC-237 2-SPEED TRANSFER
CASE, WITHOUT P.T.O.; FACTORY INSTALLED AND WARRANTED 3

Model upgrade - specify NA
CREW CAB CONVERSION, 52" WITH REAR BENCH SEAT, 4 DOORS, SEAT
BELTS, ACCESS STEPS, WITH FULL FACTORY WARRANTY 3

Model upgrade - specify NA
Crew cab (84" CA) $28,297.001

Factory approved Crew Cab modification includes Vinyl Bench Seat in rear 2

CREW CAB CONVERSION, 4 DOORS, W/REAR BENCH SEAT, (5) SEAT BELTS,
W/FULL FACTORY WARRANTY 3

Super cab (84" CA) NA
Cutaway cab NA
Low profile package NA

245/70R19.5 (6) TIRES 3

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify $358.001
Dual Motorized Mirrors 1

Dual motorized mirrors 2
Dual Kenworth Aero Heated 3

$368.00°  $374.00°

Incl.? Std

NA NA
$448.00°  $456.00°

$90.002 $82.00°

NA NA
$23.007 $23.00°

$31,015.00°  $24,666.00°

NA  $32,394.00°

NA NA
$29,485.00°  $32,394.00°

NA NA
NA NA
NA  ($277.00)°

$409.00°  $316.00°
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

8480060 |
5045192 2
8478330 °

8480060 2
5045162 52451523

LHSL !
golight 2

L&RHSL '
9080126 2

VVsO !

CMH !

LINEX 2

TOOL !
18x18x36 2
TBU3618A °

8850817 !
8850817 2
8850817 >

8841303 !
8841303 2
8841303 °

9490213/404 2
9490206 9490404 *

3836300 !
3836300 2
3836300 3

3836310 !
3836310 2
3866310 °

3636422 2
3636422 °

1321305 3

T270

KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE
Western Northern
$67,920.00 $67,670.00

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify
Two Man Bench Seat 1

Aluminum Wheels (Per set of 2) 2
TWO-MAN BENCH PASSENGER SEAT VINYL 3

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify
2 man passenger bench seat

ALCOA 88367 ALUMINUN WHEELS (6) 3

Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb,

dealer installed
Golight 2

Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen

bulb, dealer installed
Dual Factory Roof Mounted Amber Strobes 2

Vent visors - stick-on style
Rainshields - flange style

Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent)

Knapheide under body tool boxes or approved equivalent
18"x18"x36" 1

Under body tool boxes - 18x18x306 steel 2
36" X 18" X 18" STEEL, W/STEEL FRAME-MOUNT BRACKETS 3

Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors
Dual fender Mtd Convex Mirrors 2

DUAL FENDER-MOUNTED CONVEX MIRRORS, 3

Airhorn
Air Horn 2

SINGLE RECTANGULAR 23" DIAMETER AIR HORN, TOP-OF-CAB
MOUNTED 3

Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles
Fire Extinguisher & Triangles 2

Front stabilizer bars
N/A - Rear Stabilizer Bar 1

Front N/A: Rear Stabilizer Bar 2
Front N/A Rear Stabilizer Bar 3

Rear shock absorbers
Rear Shock absorbers for Reyco 79K 2

Aucxiliary rear springs

Heated fuel water separator
START ID W 12V HEAT 3

Kenworth of Central

Florida
Central
$68,650.00

$374.00"

NA

$525.00"

$995.00"

$225.00"
NA
$875.00"

$435.00"

$188.00"

$87.00"

Std

$932.00"

$199.00"

NA

NA

Kenworth of South
Florida
Southern
$68,945.00
$491.00°  $424.00°
$422.00° $942.00°
$680.007 NA
$722.00> NA
NA NA
NA NA
$982.00> NA
$680.00°  $680.00°
$181.00°  $179.00°
$135.00° $134.00°
$142.00°  $134.00°
$956.00°  $915.00°
$223.00°  $214.00°
$384.00°  $376.00°
NA $50.00°
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

9110020 '
9110020 2
9110020 3

DOTTP '
25TPINTAIR 2
KWTCP *

DOTTP !
25TPINTELC >
KWTCPE *

6721102/2094 2

6721102 672200 °

Fsss !
SPTR *

9090000 !
9090000 >
9090000 3

16VAN 2
SVA-16°

GTUB6132 !
HDRI132ADW 2
6132D54F]

0X2-32
KDBF1112A 3

T270

KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE
Western Northern
$67,920.00 $67,670.00

Trailer towing package - specify
Full Truck Kit: GladHands and Seven Way Plug mounted at the end of frame 1

Factory air w/ Glad hands & 7 Prong plug end of frame 2
FULL TRUCK KIT FOR TRAILER CONNECTIONS, NO PINTLE HOOK 3

Trailer towing package for air operated trailer brakes

Trailer towing package, to include heavy duty flashers, wiring for trailer plug(7
prong round) and Class 1V frame mounted trailer hitch with 2" square removable
receiver. 1" shank with 2" ball. Dealer installed1

Trailer tow pkg: Glad hands-7prong plug;20ton pintle hook 2

FULL TRUCK KIT, INCLUDING TRAILER AIR BRAKE & ELECTRICAL
CONNECIONS + 15T PINTLE HOOK, FRAME-MOUNTED 3

Trailer towing package for electric operated trailer brakes

Trailer towing package, to include heavy duty flashers, wiring for trailer plug(7
prong round) and Class 1V frame mounted trailer hitch with 2" square removable
receiver. 1" shank with 2" ball. Dealer installed1

Trailer tow pkg: Elec Brk -7prong plug,;20ton pintle hook 2

FULL TRUCK KIT, INCLUDING TRAILER AIR BRAKE & ELECTRICAL
CONNECIONS + 15T PINTLE HOOK, FRAME-MOUNTED 3

Mud flaps
Mud Flaps & Brackets 2

BETTS B-25 MUDFLAPS ARMS/REAR MUD FLAP SHIELDS 3

Full size spare tire & rim

Jack and wheel wrench
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Daytime running lights

Immobilize daytime running lights

16 ft. dry freight van

16’ Dry Freight Van Body 2

SUPREME 16' X 96" ALUMINUM DRY FREIGHT VANBODY 3

Knapheide 6132 utility body or approved equivalent (requires 84"
CA)

KNAPHEIDE 6132D54 11' UTILITY BODY 1

11 1/2' Service Body Reading HD132ADW inc spray in liner-comp lights-master
lock sys 2

KNAPHEIDE WIDE BODY, FLIP-TOP OPTION, T-HANDLE LATCHES,
COMPARTMENT LIGHTING & MASTER LOCK SYSTEM 3

Heil 2-3 yd. dump body with manual ground control tarp or
approved equivalent (requires 84" CA)
2-3yd OX dump w/man ground control tarp 2

KNAPHEIDE 11' LONG, 2-3 CUBIC YARDS CAPACITY DUMP BODY, 12"
SIDES + MANUAL GROUND CONTROL TARP 3

Kenworth of Central Kenworth of South

Florida Florida
Central Southern
$68,650.00 $68,945.00
$418.00" | $496.00> $475.00°
$1,088.00" | $1.461.00°  $1,295.00°
$1,088.00"  $1,662.00>  $1,225.00°
Std $159.00° $108.00°
$750.00" NA  $814.00°
NA NA NA
NA NA NA
$137.00" Incl? $133.00°
NA NA NA
NA  $8,671.00°  $10,908.00°
$6,775.00" ' $12,557.00%>  $10,447.00°
NA  $14,828.00°  $10,947.00°
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

GT5D !
OX5CY 2
GP56°

GTI2FS40 !
12Stake 2
FBSI12°

GT12CD !
12CONTD >
GP-12°

GT14FS40 !
14Stake 2
FB14 3

GT14CD '
14CONTD >
GP-14 3

GTI6FS !
16STAKE 2
FB16 >

GT16CD !
16CONTD 2
GP-16 3

GTI9RB !
KY19/JD19 °

GT20FS '
20STAKE 2
FB20 *

T270

KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE
Western Northern
$67,920.00 $67,670.00

5 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA)
GODWIN 300 5 YD 10’ DUMP, TARP W/ PTO 1

Syd Ox dump w/man ground control tarp 2

GAR-P 5/6 CUBIC YARDS CAPACITY 10" X 96" STEEL DUMP, W/MANUAL
GROUND CONTROL TARP 3

12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84" CA)
12' FLAT STAKE PVMXS 40" STAKE SIDE, FRONT & REAR 1

12" Stake body w/40"sides all around 2

GAR-P 12' X 96" STEEL FLATBED BODY, SMOOTH FLOOR, W/40"
REMOVABLE STEEL STAKES 3

12 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14"

sides (requires 84" CA)
12' HD CONTRACTOR DUMP BR12, 14" SIDE, TRAP W/ PTO |

12'Contractor dump w/man Tarp /14"sides 2

GAR-P 12' X 96" STEEL CONTRACTORS' DUMP, W/GROUND CONTROL
TARP & 14" SIDES 3

14 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 108" CA)
14' KNAPHEIDE PVMXS FLAT STAKE, 40" STAKE SIDE & FRONT 1

14" Flat stake w/40"sides all around 2

GAR-P 14' X 96" STEEL FLATBED BODY, SMOOTH FLOOR, W/40"
REMOVABLE STEEL STAKES 3

14 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14"

sides (requires 108" CA)
14" HD CPNTRACOTR DUMP BR14, 14" SIDE, TRAP W/ PTO |

14' Contractor dump w/man Tarp /14"sides 2

GAR-P 14' X 96" STEEL CONTRACTORS' DUMP, W/GROUND CONTROL
TARP & 14" SIDES 3

16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around(requires 120" CA)
16' KNAPHEIDE PVMXS FLAT STAKE |

16' Flat stake w/40"sides all around 2

GAR-P 16' X 96" STEEL FLATBED BODY, SMOOTH FLOOR, W/40"
REMOVABLE STEEL STAKES 3

16 ft. contractors dump with manual tarp, 14" sides (requires 120"

CA)
16' CONTRACOT DUMP BR16, 14" SIDES, TARP W/PTO 1

16’ Contractor dump w/man Tarp /14"sides 2

GAR-P 16' X 96" STEEL CONTRACTORS' DUMP, W/GROUND CONTROL
TARP & 14" SIDES 3

19 ft. rollback wrecker with wheel lift (requires 120" CA)
19' GODWIN ROLL BACK W/ PTO 1

KYLAR OR JERR-DAN 19' X 96" H.D. STEEL DECK ROLLBACK WRECKER,
W/WHEEL LIFT & REMOVABLE SIDES 3

20 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around(requires 156" CA)
20' KNAPHEIDE PVMXS FLATBED, 40" STAKE SIDE FRONT & REAR |

20" Flat stake w/40"sides all around 2

GAR-P 20' X 96" STEEL FLATBED BODY, SMOOTH FLOOR, W/40"
REMOVABLE STEEL STAKES 3

Kenworth of Central

Florida
Central
$68,650.00

$13,300.00"

$4,400.00"

$11,970.00"

$4,970.00"

$13,800.00"

$5.400.00"

$13,800.00"

$23,600.00"

$6,600.00"

Florida

Southern

Kenworth of South

$68,945.00

$14,901.00°

$5,520.00°

$15,855.00°

$6,116.00°

$15,855.00°

$6,722.00°

$16,094.00°

NA

$7.547.00°

$14,408.00°

$6,840.00°

$15,605.00°

$7.908.00°

$16,385.00°

$9.072.00°

$17,204.00°

$34,500.00°

$9.,480.00°
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

GT20VAN '
20VAN 2
SVA-20°

GT24VAN '
24VAN 2
SVA-243

GT24FS !
24STAKE 2
FB24 *

DIAM SREL 2
DIAMOND *

VIPER 13REL >

GAL CONT 2
GAL SLCH-R 2
HEIL 20REL 2

PWDRCT 2

2406801 !
2406801/206 >

2406801 6054410

2406801 !
2406804/232 2

2406801 6054410 >

2406801 !
2406802/245 2

2406801 6054410 °

2406801 !
24068020/256 >

2406801 6054410

T270

KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE

Western
$67,920.00

KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE

Northern
$67,670.00

20 ft. van roll qu door (requires 156" CA)

20" VAN COM 20

20 ft Dry Freight Van Body with Roll Up Door 2
SUPREME 20' X 96" ALUMINUM DRY FREIGHT VAN BODY 3

24 ft. van roll up door (requires 186" CA)

24'VAN COM 24 1

24 ft Dry Freight Van Body with Roll Up Door 2
SUPREME 24' X 96" ALUMINUM DRY FREIGHT VAN BODY 3

24 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around(re
24' KNAPHEIDE PVMXS FLAT/STAKE 40" SIDE & REAR

24" Flat stake w/40"sides all around 2

GAR-P 24' X 96" STEEL FLATBED BODY, SMOOTH FLOOR, W/40"

REMOVABLE STEEL STAKES 3

Optional body - specify

Neway Diamond Back 8yd Rear Load Refuse 2

DIAMOND PLATE FLOOR OPTION ON ALL GAR-P FLATBEDS, ADD $20.00,

PER LINEAL FOOT 3

Optional body - specify
Neway Viper 13yd Rear Load Refuse 2

Optional body - specify

Galbreath CH-8000R container carrier w/out rotator 2

Optional body - specify

LCH 8000 Loaded container handler / hoist 2

Optional body - specify
Heil PT1000 20yd Rear Load Refuse 2

Powder coating for utility body
Powder coating for utility body 2

108" cab to axle
120" cab to axle

138" cab to axle
206" Wheelbase 2

206 3

156" cab to axle
232" Wheelbase 2

180" cab to axle
245" Wheelbase 2

186" cab to axle
256" Wheelbase 2

cl[uires 186" CA)

Kenworth of Central Kenworth of South

Florida
Central

$68,650.00

$9.725.00"

$10,600.00"

$7,625.00"

NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

NC
NC
$330.00"

$330.00"

$330.00"

$330.00"

Florida
Southern
$68,945.00

$9,949.00° | $11,816.00°

$10,907.00°  $12,950.00°

$8,473.00° | $11,880.00°

$41,400.00° Incl.?
$48,328.00° NA
$31,419.00° NA
$35,333.00° NA
$55,334.00° NA
$932.007 NA
NC NC

NC NC
$752.00° $943.00°
$1,157.00°  $943.00°
$1,641.00° $943.00°
$2,577.00°  $943.00°
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

GTLG2000 '
2KTUCK >
203

GTAC50 '
AC50K11 2
BODY-A >

ACHC6006 >
BODY-B >

EC-TCBHYDO !

ACHYDRIGG 2

EC-DCCHC !
ACHC6406 >

EC-TCB8406HYD '

AC8406 >

9090126 !
9090126 >
9090126 3

BOBUA !
BUALARM
ALARM 3

2

1
2

BUC
BUC
BUC*®

8879911 !
PACKB20 >
3632277 3

T270

KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE
Western Northern
$67,920.00 $67,670.00

2,000 Ib. lift gate
2000#% WALTCO LIFT GATE TUCKAWAY 1

2,000LB Lifi Gate Tuck Away 2

WALTC3O C-20 2,000# CAPACITY, TUCK-UNDER LIFTGATE, W/DUAL
STEPS

12 jon jack cab mounted, if available

Auto Crane 50K-22 crane body with shelf package, 24" bumper

with crank outriggers, or approved equivalent
AUTO CRANE 50K-22 24" BUMOER, MANUAL OUTRIGGERS 1

Auto Crane 50K-11 Crane Body 2

KNAPHEIDE KMT-2 BODY + AUTOCRANE 5005EH CRANE, W/SPRING
BUILDUP & MANUAL OUT/DOWN OUTRIGGERS 3

Auto Crane 6006EH electric hydraulic crane, boom support &

chassis springs, or approved equivalent
Autocrane HC6006 Hydraulic crane/boom support / springs 2

KNAPHEIDE KMT-2 BODY + AUTOCRANE 6006EH CRANE, BOOM SUPPORT

+ CHASSISS PRINGS BUILDUP 3

Auto Crane hydraulic outriggers, or approved equivalent
HYDRAULIC OUTRIGGERS IN-OUT UP-DOWN 1

Hydraulic in-out/up-down 2
STANDARD ITEM ON KNAPHEIDE KMT-2 3

Auto Crane 6406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump,

boom supprt & chassis springs, or approved equivalent
AUTOCRANE HC-6 HYDRAULIC CRANE, OUTRIGGERS, BOOM SUPPORT,
SPRINGS 1

Auto Crane HC6406 Hydraulic Crane 2

Auto Crane 8406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump,

boom supprt & chassis springs, or approved equivalent
AUTO]CRANE 8406 HYD. CRANE, BOOM SUPPORT, SPRINGS FIT ABOVE
WO

Auto Crane 8406 Hydraulic Crane w/hot shift PTO 2

Backup alarm - Factory Installed
Factory Back Up Alarm 2

Backup alarm - Dealer Installed
Dealer Installed Back Up Alarm 2

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide
wide angle field of vision at rear of vehicle) - Factory Installed

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide

wide angle field of vision at rear of vehicle) - Dealer Installed
Ecco Wireless Back Up Camera 2

Optional equipment - specify

Two Cab and One Rear Stationary Window 1
Grapple: Pac Mac KB20 Includes 24yd Dump Body 2
Rear Suspension Hendrickson HAS230L 3

Kenworth of Central Kenworth of South

Florida Florida
Central Southern
$68,650.00 $68,945.00
$3,550.00"  $3,739.00>  $4,465.00°
NA NA NA
$25.500.00" ' $24.361.00°  $65,715.00°
NA | $26,512.00°  $68,684.00°
$3,900.00'  $6,900.00° Incl.?
$25,735.00" | $29,031.00° NA
$28,635.00" ' $31,963.00° NA
$81.00" $90.002 $86.00°
$235.00"  $151.00>  $215.00°
NA NA NA
$875.00'  $1,219.00°  $814.00°
$456.00" | $69.611.00> $942.00°
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

3630021 !
G2224C 2
8879911 3

3632277 |
8879911 2
3531000 3

3531001 !
3531000 2
DIAMOND *

TCM35080DHE 2

LOADELT6 >
LOADELTS 2

Discount % 2

05UPB 2

15% 3

TT !

TEMP TAG >
TT?

DOTT '
TRANSFER 2
TRANSFER °

NEWTAG 2
NsT?

T270

KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE
Western Northern
$67,920.00 $67,670.00

Optional equipment - specify
Rear Suspension: Kenworth Air Glide 210L 1

Grapple: Brush Hawg Includes 24.5yd dump Body 2
Cab corner windows 3

Optional equipment - specify
Rear Suspension: Hendrickson HAS230L 1

Cab corner windows 2
Driver controlled differential lock 3

Optional equipment - specify

Driver Controlled Differential Lock 1

Driver controlled differential lock 2

DIAMOND PLATE STEEL FLOOR IN ALL GAR-P FLATBEDS, ADD $20.00,

PER LINEAL FOOT 3

Optional equipment - specify

Pro-Patch Model TCM 350-80-DHE Req. 26k GVW 2

Optional equipment - specify

Loadmaster Elite 6yd Rear Load Refuse Body 2

Optional equipment - specify

Loadmaster Elite 8yd Rear Load Refuse Body 2

Optional equipment - specify

15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any optional models
bid. This discount ONLY applies to a downgrade or an upgrade to the model listed
in this specification It does not apply to a completely different make or model 2

Optional equipment - specify

Unpublished Bodies Available at Cost plus 5% including Fees 2

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

FOR NOT LISTED COMPONENTS AND pOWER TRAIN COMBINATIONS
CONTACT DEALER, WHO WILL SUPPLY AT A 15% DISCOUNT 3

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

ALL 3

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Kenworth of Central Kenworth of South
Florida Florida
Central Southern
$68,650.00 $68,945.00
$735.00"  $66,854.00%  $453.00°
$830.00" | $446.00> $911.00°
$803.00'  $895.007 Incl.?
NA = $75,889.00° NA
NA  $44,945.00° NA
NA | $45,196.00° NA
NA Incl.? NA
NA Incl. NA
NA NA NA
NA NA NA
NA NA NA
NA NA NA
NA NA NA
NA NA Incl.?
Incl.1 Incl.2 NC3
$79.75! Incl? $200.00°
NA Incl?  $425.00°
NA NA NA
NA NA NA
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

9202633 2

9202622 !
2500 5YR 2
9202622 3

9202633 !
3000 5YR 2
9202633 3

9202133 !
9209647 2

9209645 9209656 °

5/2 PPIAT '
9209658 2

9209649 9209660 >

5/25 PP1AT |
9209689 2

9209651 9209662 3

5/3 PPIAT '
9209698 2

9209653 9209661 *

T270

KENWORTH OF KENWORTH OF
JACKSONVILLE JACKSONVILLE
Western Northern
$67,920.00 $67,670.00

Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty: Kenworth Base Vehicle Extended to 3yr/300,000 miles 2

Warranty - specify
US Basic Vehicle Warranty 2 yr / 200,000 miles 1

Warranty: Allison 2500RDS - 3yrs Std + 2yrs extended {Refuse Application

$910.00} 2
EXTENDED BASE VEHICLE COVERAGE 2 YEARS/300,000 MILES 3

Warranty - specify
US Basic Vehicle Warranty 3 yr / 300,000 miles 1

Allison: 3000RDS 3yrs Std +2yrs extended {Refuse Application $910.00) 2

EXTENDED BASE VEHICLE COVERAGE 3 YEARS/300,000 MILES 3

Warranty - specify
US Heater and Air Conditioner 3 yr/ 300,000 miles 1

Engine PX7 PP1 5yr/100,000 miles 2

PX-7 PROTECTION PLAN I 4 YEARS/150,000 MILES WITH AFTER
TREATMENT 3

Diesel Warranty - specify
PACCAR PX-7 PP1 and After treatment 5 yr / 200,000 miles 1

After Treatment PX7 5yr/100,000 miles {must purchase PP1} 2

PX-7 PROTECTION PLAN 1 5 YEARS/200,000 MILES WITH AFTER
TREATMENT 3

Diesel Warranty - specify
PACCAR PX-7 PP1 and After treatment 5 yr / 250,000 miles 1

Engine PX9 PP1 5yr/100,000 miles 2

PX-7 PROTECTION PLAN 1 5 YEARS/300,000 MILES WITH AFTER
TREATMENT 3

Diesel Warranty - specify
PACCAR PX-7 PPI and After treatment 5 yr / 300,000 miles 1

After Treatment PX9 5yr/100,000 miles {must purchase PP1 2

PX-7 ROTECTION PLAN 1 6 YEARS/250,000 MILES WITH AFTER
TREATMENT 5Y/250,000 MILES 3

Kenworth of Central Kenworth of South

Florida Florida
Central Southern
$68,650.00 $68,945.00
NA  $1,108.00° NA
$375.00'  $472.00°  $375.00°
$1,100.00" = $472.00°  $1,100.00°
$200.00" = $655.00%  $1,275.00°
$1,850.00" = $479.00°  $1,850.00°
$2.250.00"  $2.166.00>  $2,350.00°
$2,350.00' = $605.00>  $2,750.00°
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COUNTIES
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All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

25,500 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #12

2018 Kenworth T270

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Kenworth T270 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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