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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
25.500 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2 (Specification #12)

TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Hino 268A Western
ALT - Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Hino 268A Western
TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Hino 268A Northern
ALT - Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Hino 268A Northern
TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Hino 268A Central
ALT - Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Hino 268A Central
TRUCKMAX, INC. 2018 Hino 268A Southern
ALT - Rush Truck Centers of Florida 2018 Hino 268A Southern
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) * Western
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) Western
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) * Northern
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) Northern
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) * Central
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) Central
Coggin Ford 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) * Southern
ALT - Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 2018 Ford F-650 (F6D) Southern
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2 Western
2018 Freightliner M2 Western
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2 Northern
2018 Freightliner M2 Northern
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2 Central
2018 Freightliner M2 Central
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2018 Freightliner M2 Southern
2018 Freightliner M2 Southern
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Durastar Western
2018 International Durastar Western
Maudlin International Trucks 2018 International Durastar Northern

Base Unit
Price

$59,234.00
$61,972.00
$59,234.00
$61,972.00
$59,234.00
$61,972.00
$59,234.00
$61,972.00

$47,140.00
$47,500.00
$47,140.00
$47,500.00
$47,140.00
$47,500.00
$47,140.00
$47,500.00

$52,750.00
- NB --
$52,750.00
- NB --
$52,750.00
—-NB --
$52,750.00
- NB --

$61,850.00

—-NB --
$60,850.00
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SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks Inc

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE

Kenworth of Central Florida

Kenworth of South Florida

Rush Truck Centers of Florida

Rush Truck Centers of Florida

Rush Truck Centers of Florida

Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers inc

2018 International Durastar
2018 International Durastar
2018 International Durastar
2018 International Durastar

2018 International Durastar

2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270
2018 Kenworth T270

2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330
2018 Peterbilt 330

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

--NB --
$60,890.00
$60,950.00
$59,999.00

--NB --

$67,920.00
--NB --
$67,670.00
--NB --
$68,650.00
--NB --
$68,945.00
--NB --

$70,790.00
--NB --
$70,790.00
--NB --
$70,790.00
--NB --
$70,597.00
--NB --
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FLORIDA
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

25,500 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #12

2018 Hino 268A

2018 Ford F-650 (F6D)
2018 Freightliner M2

2018 International Durastar
2018 Kenworth T270

2018 Peterbilt 330

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:
a. Diesel engine, minimum 200 HP
2. TRANSMISSION/AXLES:

a. All axles, synthetic lube.
b. Manufacturers standard automatic transmission or approved equivalent (with PTO provision).
c. 17,500 1b. rear axle

3. PERFORMANCE ITEMS:

a. Manufacturer's standard power steering.
b. Manufacturer's standard gauges.

4. COMFORT ITEMS:

a. Air conditioning, factory installed.

b. Manufacturer's standard tinted glass all around.

c. Manufacturer's standard AM/FM stereo.

d. Heavy duty rubber floor covering instead of carpet.

e. Manufacturer's standard production seats. Purchaser will select color at time of order.
f. Keys: two (2) per vehicle, single key locking system, (each vehicle keyed differently).

5. SAFETY ITEMS:

a. Dual mount outside mirrors must provide a field of vision for vehicles to 102" width, and for towing.
b. Convex mirrors mounted below standard mirrors.
c. Interior dome lights with left and right door activated switches.

6. BRAKES:

a. Factory air brakes
b. Anti-lock brake system

7. TIRES AND WHEELS:
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a. BSW 11R22.5 (14 PR) or approved equivalent, front and rear.
b. Oil bath hubs, with synthetic lube.

8. CHASSIS. FRAME, CAB:

a. Minimum 25,500 1bs. GVWR.

b. Cab & chassis only.

¢. Manufacturer's standard colors, factory painted. Colors to be determined by individual agencies.
d. Manufacturer's standard front bumper, bright or painted.

e. Factory front tow hooks.

f. Fuel tank capacity, 45 gallons minimum.

g. Cab to center of rear axle - 84" approximately.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

25,500 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #12

2018 Peterbilt 330

The Peterbilt 330 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $70,790.00 $70,790.00 $70,790.00 $70,597.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

4040940 !

Order Code

330

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Western
$70,790.00

Delete Options
Gas engine in lieu of diesel

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Northern
$70,790.00

Provide 5 speed manual with base engine - specify

Provide 6 speed manual with base engine - specify

Fuller FS54064 6 SP 1

Provide 7 speed manual with base engine - specify

Air brakes if compatible with transmission

Wheel seals
Handling package
AM/FM stereo radio
Satellite radio

On-Star

Add Options

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Central
$70,790.00

Palm Peterbilt Truck

Centers inc
Southern
$70,597.00

Western
& Northern
& Central

NA
NA
$4,365.00"

NA
NC
Incl.
NA
Incl.
NA
NA

Western
& Northern
& Central

Southern
NA

NA
$3,733.00

NA
NA
Std
NA
$323.00
NA
NA

Southern

add options.

the Vendor.

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

2073109 !
2073109 2

2073110 !
2073312 2

2073208 !
2073305 2

2073304 !

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify

PX-7 220 HP 520 LB TORQUE |
PX7 220 HP 2

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify

PX-7 240 HP 560 LB TORQUE |
PX7 240 HP 2

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify

PX-7 250 HP 660 LB TORQUE |
PXT 300 HP 2

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify

PX-7 300 HP 660 LB TORQUE 1

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
Other unpublished options available -10% off list see Dealer 1

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify

$896.00"

$1,678.00"

$1,948.00"

$3.261.00"
$0.00"

NA

$137.00°

$1,249.00°

$2,397.00°

NA
NA

NA
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

5577020 !

7564110 |
7564410 2

7001520 !

3K !
3K 2

6540720 !

7851780 !

330

Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of
Florida Florida

Western Northern

$70,790.00 $70,790.00

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify
Bi-fuel model - specify

CNG model - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Engine hour meter

Trans oil temp meter

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Central
$70,790.00

Allison authorized synthetic oil, TES 295 or equivalent (required for extended

warranty)

Premium hoses

Dual 45 gallon fuel tanks
Air dryers

Moisture ejectors

Power windows, only

Power windows/door locks

Speed control

Tilt steering wheel

Telescopic and tilt steering wheel
AM/FM radio with single CD
Side air bags

Third key

Upgrade to 4x4 (specify factory or after market)
Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Crew cab (84" CA)

Super cab (84" CA)

Cutaway cab

Low profile package

see dealer
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify
10 Inch Extension 1

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify
AIR RIDE CAB 1

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify

Palm Peterbilt Truck

Centers inc
Southern
$70,597.00

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
Std
Std
Std

Std
$293.00"
Std
Std
NA
$293.00"

Std
Std
$119.00"
$325.00
NA
$25.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

$0.00"

$4,328.00"
$765.00"

NA

NA
NA
Std
NA
NA
NA
Std
Std
Std

Std
NA
Std
Std
NA

$340.00°
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Std
Std
$114.00
$413.00
NA
$50.00°

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

$0.00°

NA
NA

NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

7560940/7560950 |
7560941/7560950 >

7610020 2
7900090 !

1920380 !
1911070 !

0651010 !

330

Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of

Florida Florida Florida
Western Northern Central
$70,790.00 $70,790.00 $70,790.00

Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer

installed
Vent visors - stick-on style
Rainshields - flange style

Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Knapheide under body tool boxes or approved equivalent
see dealer 1

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors

Airhorn

Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles
Front stabilizer bars

Rear shock absorbers

Auxiliary rear springs
4,500LB HELPER SPRINGS 2

Heated fuel water separator
see dealer 1

Trailer towing package - specify
see dealer

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Trailer towing package for air operated trailer brakes
see dealer

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Trailer towing package for electric operated trailer brakes
see dealer

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Mud flaps

Full size spare tire & rim

Jack and wheel wrench

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire
Daytime running lights

Immobilize daytime running lights

16 ft. dry freight van

See dealer for specs and pricing 1
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Knapheide 6132 utility body or approved equivalent (requires 84" CA)

See dealer for specs and pricing
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Rush Truck Centers of

Palm Peterbilt Truck

Centers inc
Southern
$70,597.00

NA
NA

NA
NA
NA

$0.00"

$148.00"

$145.00
$123.00'
NA
$225.00"
$378.00"

$0.00"

$0.00"

$0.00"

$0.00"

$109.00"
$758.00
NA

NA

Incl.

NA
$0.00"

$0.00"

NA
NA

NA
NA
$0.00°

$0.00>

$154.00°

$161.00°
Incl.

Std
$219.00
$375.00°

Std

$0.00>

$0.00°

$0.00

Incl.
NA
NA
NA
Std
Std
$0.00°

$0.00>
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

TEBI !

TEBI '

TEBI |

FA00081868 !

FA00081876 '

FA00081869 '

FA00082160 !

Jerr-Dan !

FA00081871 '

Dealer !

FA00081872 '

Discount !

UPB

330

Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of
Florida Florida Florida

Western Northern Central

$70,790.00 $70,790.00 $70,790.00

Heil 2-3 yd. dump body with manual ground control tarp or approved equivalent

(requires 84" CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

5 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84" CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

12 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 84"

CA)
See Dealer |

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

14 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 108" CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

14 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 108"

CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around(requires 120" CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

16 ft. contractors dump with manual tarp, 14" sides (requires 120" CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

19 ft. rollback wrecker with wheel lift (requires 120" CA)
Jerr-Dan See Dealer for Specs and Pricing 1

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

20 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around(requires 156" CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

20 ft. van roll up door (requires 156" CA)

Morgan, Kidron, Supreme and American Commercial
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

24 ft. van roll up door (requires 186" CA)

Morgan, Kidron, Supreme and American Commercial 1
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

24 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around(requires 186" CA)
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Optional body - specify
15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any optional models bid. Discount
applies to a downgrade or an upgrade to Spec #11 only. 1

PAC MAC RL-10 10 YD REAR LOADER 2

Optional body - specify
Unpublished Bodies Available at Cost plus FSA Fees. 1
HEIL SMALL REAR LOADER CARAHEE 9 YD AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS 2

Optional body - specify

See Dealer
HEIL SMALL SIDE LOADER RETRIEVER 6 OR 10 YD AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS 2

Palm Peterbilt Truck
Centers inc
Southern
$70,597.00
$13,950.00" $0.00>
$13,950.00" $0.00>
$7.829.00" $0.00°
$0.00" $0.00>
$8.220.00" $0.00°
$14,737.00" $0.00>
$8.581.00" $0.00>
$14,974.00" $0.00>
$0.00" $0.00°
$9.055.00" $0.00>
$0.00" $0.00°
$0.00" $0.00>
$9.606.00" $0.00>

Incl.' $43.511.00°

Incl.' | $43,511.00°

$0.00" | $54,647.00°
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

TCB

TCB

TCB

TCB

TCB

TCB

330

Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of
Florida Florida Florida

Western Northern Central

$70,790.00 $70,790.00 $70,790.00

Optional body - specify

See Dealer

Optional body - specify

See Dealer

Powder coating for utility body

See Dealer 1

108" cab to axle
120" cab to axle
138" cab to axle
156" cab to axle
180" cab to axle
186" cab to axle

2,000 Ib. lift gate
RAILGATE FOR STAKE AND FLATBED BODIES, 2500 TUK Under Lift Gate add $1,750.00 1

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

12 jon jack cab mounted, if available
see dealer 1

Auto Crane 50K-22 crane body with shelf package, 24" bumper with crank

outriggers, or approved equivalent
AUTO CRANE 50K 14’ CRANE BODY, BUMPER, SHELF KIT |

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Auto Crane 6006EH electric hydraulic crane, boom support & chassis springs, or

approved equivalent
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Auto Crane hydraulic outriggers, or approved equivalent
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Auto Crane 6406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom supprt &

chassis springs, or approved equivalent
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Auto Crane 8406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom supprt &

chassis springs, or approved equivalent
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Backup alarm - Factory Installed

see dealer

Backup alarm - Dealer Installed
see dealer

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of

vision at rear of vehicle) - Factory Installed
see dealer 1

AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Palm Peterbilt Truck

Centers inc

Southern

$70,597.00
$0.00"
$0.00"

$0.00"

NC
NC

NC

NC

NC

NC
$4,500.00"
$0.00"

$29,541.00"

$24,555.00"

$3,500.00"

$25,565.00"

$28.475.00"

$0.00"
$0.00"

$0.00"
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NA
NA

Incl.
Incl.
Incl.
Incl.
Incl.
Incl.
$0.00°
NA

$0.00>

$0.00>

$0.00>

$0.00°

$0.00>

Incl.
Incl.

$0.00>



VEHICLE: 330

DEALER: Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of Palm Peterbilt Truck
Florida Florida Florida Centers inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $70,790.00 $70,790.00 $70,790.00 $70,597.00
BUC ! Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of $0.00" $0.00°
BUC 2 vision at rear of vehicle) - Dealer Installed

see dealer 1
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

TCB! Optional equipment - specify $1,500.OO1 NA
40T or 25T Pintle pkg (including 1"plate,pintle and D-ringa) *Air liiU!.f and electric supplied by
dealer

WEP ! Optional equipment - specif]y $56,204.OO1 NA
Chagnon Durabac Hiker-20 REL

WEP ! Optional equipment - specify $45,107.001 NA
Chagnon Durabac Tracker-10yd REL 1

Ring Power ! Optional equipment - specify $37,500.00l NA
American Rolloff ACC-80 Container Carrier 1

Container Optional equipment - specify $53,714.OO1 NA

Systems 1 Loadmaster Legacy 3-20 yd Renr Loader 18yd deduct -$500.00 25yd add $375.00 See dealer for 1

Discount | Optional equipment - specify Incl.! NA
15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any optional models bid. Discount
applies to a downgrade or an upgrade to Spec #7 only. 1

UPB ! Optional equipment - specify Incl.! NA
Unpublished Bodies Available at Cost plus FSA Fees. 1
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Temporary tag Incl. NA
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) Incl. NA
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) Incl. NA
Maintenance Plan - specify $0.00" $0.00°
See Dealer 1
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2
Maintenance Plan - specify $0.00 NA
See Dealer 1
Maintenance Plan - specify $0.00" NA
See Dealer 1

9404716 ! Warranty - specify $650.00" $0.00°

PX 7 Protection Plan 1 5/100K 1
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

9404726 !

330

Rush Truck Centers of Rush Truck Centers of
Florida Florida

Western Northern

$70,790.00 $70,790.00

Warranty - specify
PX 7 Aftertreatment Coverage 5/100K 1

Warranty - specify

Diesel Warranty - specify
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR SPECS AND PRICE 2

Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify

Rush Truck Centers of
Florida

Central
$70,790.00

Palm Peterbilt Truck
Centers inc

Southern
$70,597.00
$475.00"

NA
NA

NA
NA
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

25,500 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #12

2018 Peterbilt 330

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Peterbilt 330 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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