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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
SKID STEER LOADER - 3100 LB OPERATING CAPACITY TRACKED ONLY (Specification #27

Bobcat Company 2018 Bobcat T750 Western
2018 Bobcat T750 Western
Bobcat Company 2018 Bobcat T750 Northern
2018 Bobcat T750 Northern
Bobcat Company 2018 Bobcat T750 Central
2018 Bobcat T750 Central
Bobcat Company 2018 Bobcat T750 Southern
2018 Bobcat T750 Southern
Trekker Group 2018 Case TR310 Western
2018 Case TR310 Western
Trekker Group 2018 Case TR310 Northern
2018 Case TR310 Northern
Trekker Group 2018 Case TR310 Central
2018 Case TR310 Central
Trekker Group 2018 Case TR310 Southern
2018 Case TR310 Southern
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 279D Western
2018 Caterpillar 279D Western
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 279D Northern
2018 Caterpillar 279D Northern
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 279D Central
2018 Caterpillar 279D Central
Kelly Tractor 2018 Caterpillar 279D Southern
2018 Caterpillar 279D Southern
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 331G Western
2018 John Deere 331G Western
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 331G Northern

Base Unit
Price

$50,616.00
- NB --
$50,616.00
- NB --
$50,616.00
—-NB --
$50,616.00
- NB --

$42,702.00
- NB --
$40,668.00
- NB --
$40,668.00
—-NB --
$40,668.00
- NB --

--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
$51,268.00
—-NB --

$54,645.00

—-NB --
$54,645.00
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 27.pdf

Everglades Farm Equipment
ALT - Nortrax, Inc.
Everglades Farm Equipment
ALT - Nortrax, Inc.

Futch's Tractor Depot
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.
Futch's Tractor Depot
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.
Futch's Tractor Depot
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.
Futch's Tractor Depot
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co. Inc.

Cowin Equipment Company Inc

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Cowin Equipment Company Inc

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC.

2018 John Deere 331G
2018 John Deere 331G
2018 John Deere 331G
2018 John Deere 331G
2018 John Deere 331G

2018 Kubota SVL75-2
2018 Kubota SVL75-2
2018 Kubota SVL75-2
2018 Kubota SVL75-2
2018 Kubota SVL75-2
2018 Kubota SVL75-2
2018 Kubota SVL75-2
2018 Kubota SVL75-2

2018 Takeuchi TL12
2018 Takeuchi TL12
2018 Takeuchi TL12
2018 Takeuchi TL12
2018 Takeuchi TL12
2018 Takeuchi TL12
2018 Takeuchi TL12
2018 Takeuchi TL12

2018 Volvo MCT135C
2018 Volvo MCT135C
2018 Volvo MCT135C
2018 Volvo MCT135C
2018 Volvo MCT135C
2018 Volvo MCT135C
2018 Volvo MCT135C
2018 Volvo MCT135C

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

--NB --
$51,476.00
$52,965.00
$51,476.00
$52,965.00

$38,500.00
$39,350.00
$38,200.00
$39,250.00
$38,200.00
$39,250.00
$38,500.00
$39,350.00

$68,630.00
--NB --
$68,525.00
--NB --
$68,525.00
--NB --
$68,525.00
--NB --

$49,729.00
--NB --
$51,650.00
--NB --
$51,650.00
--NB --
$51,650.00
--NB --
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SKID STEER LOADER -3100 LB OPERATING CAPACITY TRACKED ONLY

SPECIFICATION #27

2018 Bobcat T750
2018 Case TR310
2018 Caterpillar 279D
2018 John Deere 331G
2018 Kubota SVL75-2
2018 Takeuchi TL12
2018 Volvo MCT135C

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:

a. Minimum 3 cylinder 74 HP Diesel
b. Spin on type filters
c. Dry type air filters

2. TRANSMISSION:

a. Hydrostatic drive
b. Forward, reverse, travel speed controlled by two hand levers

3. OPERATOR ENVIRONMENT:

a. OSHA approved ROPS canopy shall be integral

b. Front and rear work lights, hazard lights

c. Engine monitoring system or gauges, with audible alarm
d. Horn and backup alarm

4. BRAKES:

a. Parking brake
b. Hydrostatic braking

5. BUCKET:

a. Minimum 66" construction bucket
b. Bolt on, replaceable cutting edge for bucket
c. Operating capacity 3,100 Ibs. minimum

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
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THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH
THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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SKID STEER LOADER - 3100 LB OPERATING CAPACITY TRACKED ONLY
SPECIFICATION #27

2018 Volvo MCT135C

The Volvo MCT135C purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $49,729.00 $51,650.00 $51,650.00 $51,650.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE: MCT135C

DEALER: Cowin Equipment Flagler Construction Flagler Construction Flagler Construction
Company Inc Equipment, LLC. Equipment, LLC. Equipment, LLC.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $49,729.00 $51,650.00 $51,650.00 $51,650.00
Northern
& Central
Order Code Delete Options Western & Southern
MCT125C ! Optional equipment - specify $7,687.00'  ($11,650.00)
Volvo Volvo MCT125C compact track loader, 2,797Ib ROC, 72.6 hp. Base unit cost - $42,042.00. Options qualify for

2 | 32% discount from MSRP. Please contact John Edwards for more information:jedwards@cowin.com,
MCT85C™  $50.685.7055. 1

Volvo MCT85C Radial Lift (Base Machine Only)-32% Discount Off Volvo CE Current Published List Prices
For Volvo Track Skid Steer Options and Attachments Not Listed 2

MCT110C ! Optional equipment - specify $10,282.00' ' ($11,650.00)
Volvo Volvo MCT110C compact track loader, 2,250lb ROC, 72.6 hp. Base unit cost - $39,447.00. Options qualify for
2 | 32% discount from MSRP. Please contact John Edwards for more information:jedwards@cowin.com,
MCTLIOC™ | g50.685-7055. 1
Volvo MCT110C Radial Lift (Base Machine Only)-32% Discount Off Volvo CE Current Published List Prices
For Volvo Track Skid Steer Options and Attachments Not Listed 2

MCT85C ! Optional equipment - specify $10,407.00' = ($8,650.00)
Volvo Volvo MCT85C compact track loader, 1,900lb ROC, 60.5 hp. Base unit cost - $39,322.00. Options qualify for
32% discount from MSRP. Please contact John Edwards for more information:jedwards@cowin.com,

2
MCTI25C™ | s50.685-7055. 1

Volvo MCT125C, Vertical Lift(Base Machine Only)-32% Discount Off Volvo CE Current Published List Prices
For Volvo Track Skid Steer Options and Attachments Not Listed 2

Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA
Optional equipment - specify NA NA

Northern

& Central

Order Code Add Options Western & Southern

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

MZ11029 2 Optional equipment - specify NA $3,760.002
Basic Canopy: Reversing Fan, 2 Speed, Control PatternSelection: 1SO or H-Pattern, Foot Throttle, Work lights
with 2 Rear Lights, Parallel Lift/Self-Leveling, Creep Speed Control 2
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

MCT135C

Cowin Equipment Flagler Construction Flagler Construction
Company Inc Equipment, LLC. Equipment, LLC.

Western Northern Central

BASE PRICE: $49,729.00 $51,650.00 $51,650.00

MZ11030 >

MZ52001 2

warranty !
Standard 2

Extended !

32%
Discount !
32%
Discount >

Optional equipment - specify
Premium Cab: Air Conditioning & Heat, Reversing Fan, 2 Speed, Control Pattern Selection: I1SO or H-Pattern,
Foot Throttle, Work Lights with 2 Rear Lights, Parallel Lifi/Self-Leveling, Creep Speed Control 2

Optional equipment - %pecify

Rotating beacon, magnetic
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Maintenance Plan — specify
Maintenance Plan — specify

Warranty - specify

Standard Manufacturers warranty of 12 months or 1500 hours, whichever occurs first. 1
1 Year/2500 Hour Full Machine warranty with Travel Time and Mileage 2

Warranty - specify

Extended warranty options available upon request 1

Discount percentage off Manufacturers Current Published Retail prices for non-specified
options and any optional models bid. This discount ONLY APPLIES to a downgrade or
an upgrade to the model listed in this specification. It does not apply to a completely
different make or model. (The discount is applied to the manufacturer's current published

retail prices.)
Factory models, options and attachments not listed qualify for 32% discount from MSRP 1

Southern
$51,650.00

NA

NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
Incl.!

std!

Std!

Flagler Construction
Equipment, LLC.

$7,152.00°

$181.00°
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NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
Std?

NA

Std?
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SKID STEER LOADER - 3100 LB OPERATING CAPACITY TRACKED ONLY
SPECIFICATION #27

2018 Volvo MCT135C

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Volvo MCT135C purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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