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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
4X4 LOADER BACKHOE WITH CANOPY (STANDARD STICK ecification #24

Trekker Group 2018 Case 580 SN Western
2018 Case 580 SN Western
Trekker Group 2018 Case 580 SN Northern
2018 Case 580 SN Northern
Trekker Group 2018 Case 580 SN Central
2018 Case 580 SN Central
Trekker Group 2018 Case 580 SN Southern
2018 Case 580 SN Southern
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 416 Western
2018 Caterpillar 416 Western
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 416 Northern
2018 Caterpillar 416 Northern
Price Extension from FSA16-VEH14.0 - See Ring Power Rollover 2018 Caterpillar 416 Central
2018 Caterpillar 416 Central
Kelly Tractor 2018 Caterpillar 416 Southern
2018 Caterpillar 416 Southern
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 310SL * Western
2018 John Deere 310SL Western
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 310SL * Northern
2018 John Deere 310SL Northern
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 310SL * Central
2018 John Deere 310SL Central
Nortrax, Inc. 2018 John Deere 310SL * Southern
2018 John Deere 310SL Southern

Base Unit
Price

$72,903.00
- NB --
$69,432.00
- NB --
$69,432.00
—-NB --
$69,432.00
- NB --

--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
$67,486.00
—-NB --

$66,499.00
- NB --
$66,499.00
- NB --
$66,499.00
—-NB --
$66,499.00
- NB --
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https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA17-VEH15.0 - Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Award Spec 24.pdf

FAC

FLORIDA
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

4X4 LOADER BACKHOE WITH CANOPY (STANDARD STICK)
SPECIFICATION #24

2018 Case 580 SN
2018 Caterpillar 416
2018 John Deere 310SL

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. ENGINE:

a. Minimum 87 HP Diesel engine
b. Dry type, radial seal air cleaner and pre-cleaner unit
c. Spin on type engine oil filter

2. TRANSMISSTON:

a. Four speed power shift or power shuttle transmission

3. OPERATOR ENVIRONMENT:

o

. OSHA approved ROPS canopy shall be integral

b. Two front and two rear work and driving lights

c. Stop and turn signals with flashing hazard lamps

d. Instrument panel with a complete set of gauges or an electronic monitoring device
e. Standard horn and audible back-up alarm

4. BRAKES:

a. Brakes shall be oil immersed, hydraulically actuated, multiple disc on final drive input shaft
b. Brakes shall be completely enclosed and sealed, fully self-adjusting

5. LOADER (SINGLE TILT CYLINDER):

a. Loader shall be equipped with a return to dig mechanism
b. Loader shall have positive down pressure sufficient to lift the tractor front end off level ground
c. Loader bucket SAE heaped capacity of minimum 1.3 yards with replaceable bolt on edge

6. BACKHOE:

. Fixed length dipper stick digging depth approximately 14'
. Reach from swing center, approximately 18'

. Dump height, approximately 11'3"

. Digging force approximately 8,000 Ibs.

. Bucket dig force, approximately 11,990 lbs.

f. 24" general purpose bucket with replaceable teeth

o o Ow
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DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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4X4 LOADER BACKHOE WITH CANOPY (STANDARD STICK)
SPECIFICATION #24

2018 Caterpillar 416

The Caterpillar 416 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $67,486.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

416

Western

BASE PRICE: -- No bid --

Order Code
4152

Order Code

Delete Options
Optional equipment - specify

MODEL DOWNGRADE TO BASE 415 BACKHOE LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Add Options

Northern
-- No bid --

Central
-- No bid --

Kelly Tractor
Southern
$67,486.00

Western

&

Northern

&

Central Southern

($17,269.00)>

Western

&

Northern

&

Central Southern
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VEHICLE: 416

DEALER: Kelly Tractor
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $67,486.00

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

420 2 Optional equipment - specify (398,516.00)2
MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE 420 BACKHOE LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

2 Optional equipment - specify ($3,406.00)2

MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE 420 IT BACKHOE LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

420 1T

2

430 Optional equipment - specify $1,735.002

MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE 430 BACKHOE LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2
2 Optional equipment - specify 957,083.002
MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE 430 IT BACKHOE LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

430 IT

2 Optional equipment - specify $54,174.00°

MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE 450 BACKHOE LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

450

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
27% Optional equipment - specify
QISCOUNT 2T Zo) LDS]gCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE ON CAT MODELS 415-450. 16% DISCOUNT ON ALL CAT WORK
Temporary tag
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
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VEHICLE: 416
DEALER: Kelly Tractor
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $67,486.00
3YR/3000HR ' Maintenance Plan - specify $6,433.002
PM PKG 2 PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 3 YRS OF 3000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS PKG
INCLUDES 6 TOTAL PM'S2
5YR/5000HR | Maintenance Plan - specify $10,924.002
PM PKG 2 PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 5 YRS OR 5000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS PKG

INCLUDES 10 TOTAL PM'S 2

Extended Warrant Plan — specify
Extended Warrant Plan — specify
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4X4 LOADER BACKHOE WITH CANOPY (STANDARD STICK)
SPECIFICATION #24

2018 Caterpillar 416

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Caterpillar 416 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

416 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western

BASE PRICE: - No bid -

Order Code

Order Code

Delete Options

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Add Options

Northern
-- No bid --

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --

All Zones

All Zones

add options.

the Vendor.

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
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VEHICLE:

416 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western
BASE PRICE: --No bid --

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Extended Warrant Plan — specify
Extended Warrant Plan — specify

Northern
-- No bid --

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --
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