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Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

Zone

10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE (Specification #53

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Sewer Equipment

Sewer Equipment

Sewer Equipment

Sewer Equipment

Container Systems & Equipment

Container Systems & Equipment

Container Systems & Equipment

2019 Aquatech B-10
2019 Aquatech B-10
2019 Aquatech B-10
2019 Aquatech B-10
2019 Aquatech B-10
2019 Aquatech B-10
2019 Aquatech B-10
2019 Aquatech B-10

2019 Sewer Equipment Co.

900-ECO-12YD Combo

2019 Sewer Equipment Co.

900-ECO-12YD Combo

2019 Sewer Equipment Co.

900-ECO-12YD Combo

2019 Sewer Equipment Co.

900-ECO-12YD Combo

2019 Sewer Equipment Co.

900-ECO-12YD Combo

2019 Sewer Equipment Co.

900-ECO-12YD Combo

2019 Sewer Equipment Co.

900-ECO-12YD Combo

2019 Sewer Equipment Co.

900-ECO-12YD Combo

of America

of America

of America

of America

of America

of America

of America

of America

2019 Super Products Camel Maxxx
2019 Super Products Camel Maxxx

2019 Super Products Camel Maxxx

2019 Super Products Camel Maxxx
2019 Super Products Camel Maxxx

2019 Super Products Camel Maxxx

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western

Western

Northern

Northern

Central

Central

Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central

Central

Base Unit
Price

$217,196.00
—-NB --
$217,196.00
--NB --
$217,196.00
- NB --
$217,196.00
—-NB --

$257,540.00

—-NB --

$257,540.00

--NB --

$257,540.00

- NB --

$257,540.00

—-NB --

$218,560.00
—-NB --
$218,560.00
--NB --
$218,560.00
- NB --


https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 53.pdf

Container Systems & Equipment

Great Southern Equipment

Great Southern Equipment

Great Southern Equipment

Great Southern Equipment

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Environmental Products of Florida

Environmental Products of Florida

Environmental Products of Florida

Environmental Products of Florida

2019 Super Products Camel Maxxx
2019 Super Products Camel Maxxx

2019 Vacall AJV 1010
2019 Vacall AJV 1010
2019 Vacall AJV 1010
2019 Vacall AJV 1010
2019 Vacall AJV 1010
2019 Vacall AJV 1010
2019 Vacall AJV 1010
2019 Vacall AJV 1010

2019 Vac-Con 11 Yard
2019 Vac-Con 11 Yard
2019 Vac-Con 11 Yard
2019 Vac-Con 11 Yard
2019 Vac-Con 11 Yard
2019 Vac-Con 11 Yard
2019 Vac-Con 11 Yard
2019 Vac-Con 11 Yard

2019 Vactor 21001 Plus
2019 Vactor 21001 Plus
2019 Vactor 21001 Plus
2019 Vactor 21001 Plus
2019 Vactor 21001 Plus
2019 Vactor 21001 Plus
2019 Vactor 21001 Plus
2019 Vactor 21001 Plus

Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

$218,560.00
- NB --

$198,435.00
- NB --
$198,435.00
—-NB --
$198,435.00
--NB --
$198,435.00
- NB --

$181,891.00
- NB --
$181,891.00
—-NB --
$181,891.00
--NB --
$181,891.00
- NB --

$245,141.00
- NB --
$245,141.00
—-NB --
$245,141.00
--NB --
$245,141.00
- NB --
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10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE
SPECIFICATION #53

2019 Sewer Equipment Co. of America 900-ECO-12YD Combo

The Sewer Equipment Co. of America 900-ECO-12YD Combo purchased through this contract comes with all the standard
equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included
and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $257,540.00 $257,540.00 $257,540.00 $257,540.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

Order Code

900-ECO-12YD Combo

Sewer Equipment Sewer Equipment Sewer Equipment

Western Northern Central

$257,540.00 $257,540.00 $257,540.00
Delete Options

Downgrade to smaller unit - specify
Downgrade to 9-yard unit. 1

Downgrade to smaller unit - specify
Downgrade to 6-yard unit. 1

Downgrade to smaller unit - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify

Add Options

Upgrade to larger unit - specify
Upgrade to 15 yard unit. 1500 gallons of water standard. 1

Upgrade to larger unit - specify
Upgrade to larger unit - specify
Articulating hose reel

Hi-dump

Wireless remote
Upgrade to Wireless remote from wired Pendant. 1

Variable flow water system

Hydraulic pump-off system
4" Hydraulic Power Debris Body Pump off system. 1

Positive displacement blowers

Optional equipment - specify
Add 200 gallon water tank mounted between the rails or frame mounted drivers side, 1

Optional equipment - specify
Upgrade to Automatic Hose Reel Level Wind guide. 1

Optional equipment - specify
Add analog footage counter. 1

Optional equipment - specify
Add digital smart counter.

Optional equipment - specify

Add central lubrication system.

Optional equipment - specify
Add 6 safety cones and holder. 1

Optional equipment - specify
Upgrade to 80gmp@2500psi single piston pump from triplex pump. Includes accumulator. 1

Sewer Equipment
Southern
$257,540.00

All Zones
$7.877.00"

$13,626.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

All Zones
$7.876.00"

NA
NA
Std
Std
$1,754.00'

Std
$12,469.00"

Incl.
$7.456.00"

$7,108.00"
$720.00"
$2,839.00"
$2,689.00"
$359.00"

$16,912.00"



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

900-ECO-12YD Combo

Sewer Equipment Sewer Equipment Sewer Equipment
Western Northern Central
$257,540.00 $257,540.00 $257,540.00

Optional equipment - specify

Add standard hydro-excavation system.

Optional equipment - specify
Add long handle tool storage and cabinet. 1

Optional equipment - specif?/
Add debris body wash out system.

Optional equipment - specify

Add back up camera system. Includes front mounted camera. 1

Optional equipment - specify
Safety Lighting. LED Arrow Stick & (2) LED strobe lights. 1

Optional equipment - specify
Work light package. (2) boom lights, front hose reel work light, & curb side work light. 1

Optional equipment - specif¥
LED Handheld Wireless Spotlight

Optional equipment - specify
Custom Paint Colors (Other than Factory Standard Options.) 1

Optional equipment - specify

Training at Customers Locaction

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
Temporary tag

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

1-year standard warranty on Module and 10-year warranty on water tanks. 1

Warranty - specify

Sewer Equipment

Southern
$257,540.00

$5,974.00"

$730.00"
$1,136.00'
$1,460.00'
$2,129.40"
$1,869.00'

$338.00'
$2,813.00"
$1,602.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
Std!

NA
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10 CU YD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE
SPECIFICATION #53

2019 Sewer Equipment Co. of America 900-ECO-12YD Combo

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Sewer Equipment Co. of America 900-ECO-12YD Combo purchased through this contract comes with all the standard
equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included
and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE: 900-ECO-12YD Combo (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central

BASE PRICE: - No bid - - No bid -- - No bid --

Order Code Delete Options
Downgrade to smaller unit - specify

Downgrade to smaller unit - specify
Downgrade to smaller unit - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify

Order Code Add Options
Upgrade to larger unit - specify

Upgrade to larger unit - specify
Upgrade to larger unit - specify
Articulating hose reel
Hi-dump

Wireless remote

Variable flow water system
Hydraulic pump-off system
Positive displacement blowers
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Southern
-- No bid --

All Zones

All Zones



VEHICLE: 900-ECO-12YD Combo (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:

ZONE: Western Northern Central
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
Temporary tag

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

Warranty - specify

Southern
-- No bid --





