
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14,000 LB GVWR (Specification #52)
 
Environmental Products of Florida 2019 PacificTek PV800 Western $114,368.00
 2019 PacificTek PV800 Western -- NB --
Environmental Products of Florida 2019 PacificTek PV800 Northern $114,368.00
 2019 PacificTek PV800 Northern -- NB --
Environmental Products of Florida 2019 PacificTek PV800 Central $114,368.00
 2019 PacificTek PV800 Central -- NB --
Environmental Products of Florida 2019 PacificTek PV800 Southern $114,368.00
 2019 PacificTek PV800 Southern -- NB --
 
Sewer Equipment 2019 RamVac 1000 Vacuum Excavator Western $140,901.00
 2019 RamVac 1000 Vacuum Excavator Western -- NB --
Sewer Equipment 2019 RamVac 1000 Vacuum Excavator Northern $140,901.00
 2019 RamVac 1000 Vacuum Excavator Northern -- NB --
Sewer Equipment 2019 RamVac 1000 Vacuum Excavator Central $140,901.00
 2019 RamVac 1000 Vacuum Excavator Central -- NB --
Sewer Equipment 2019 RamVac 1000 Vacuum Excavator Southern $140,901.00
 2019 RamVac 1000 Vacuum Excavator Southern -- NB --
 
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales 2019 Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Western $101,000.00
 2019 Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Western -- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales 2019 Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Northern $101,000.00
 2019 Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Northern -- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales 2019 Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Central $101,000.00
 2019 Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Central -- NB --
Southern Sewer Equipment Sales 2019 Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Southern $101,000.00
 2019 Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Southern -- NB --
 
Vermeer Southeast 2019 Vermeer LP873SDT Western $83,900.00
 2019 Vermeer LP873SDT Western -- NB --
Vermeer Southeast 2019 Vermeer LP873SDT Northern $83,900.00

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 52.pdf


 2019 Vermeer LP873SDT Northern -- NB --
Vermeer Southeast 2019 Vermeer LP873SDT Central $83,900.00
 2019 Vermeer LP873SDT Central -- NB --
Vermeer Southeast 2019 Vermeer LP873SDT Southern $83,900.00
 2019 Vermeer LP873SDT Southern -- NB --
 
Pat's Pump & Blower 2019 X-Vac X800 Western $108,350.00
 2019 X-Vac X800 Western -- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower 2019 X-Vac X800 Northern $108,350.00
 2019 X-Vac X800 Northern -- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower 2019 X-Vac X800 Central $108,350.00
 2019 X-Vac X800 Central -- NB --
Pat's Pump & Blower 2019 X-Vac X800 Southern $108,350.00
 2019 X-Vac X800 Southern -- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14,000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #52

2019 PacificTek PV800
The PacificTek PV800 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $114,368.00 $114,368.00 $114,368.00 $114,368.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
PV66-PT1000SH-D1 1 Downgrade to small excavator - specify 

66 Gallon w/8' Valve Exerciser 20HP Gas 1 
$59,339.001

PV100-PT25 D1HT 1 Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
100 Gallon w/33" Reach Valve Exerciser 20HP Gas 1 

$56,451.001

PV100-PT1000SH D 1 Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
250 Gallon w/8' ReachValve Exerciser 20 HP Gas 1 

$55,239.001

PV250 DSO PT 1000 1 Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
250 Gallon w/8' Reach Valve Exerciser 29HP Diesel 1 

$35,696.001

PV250 PT1000SH D 1 Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
250 Gallon w/8" Reach Valve Exerciser 26HP Gas 1 

$42,575.001

PV350 PT1000SH 1 Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
350 Gallon w/8" Reach Valve Exersiser 26 HP Gas 1 

$49,166.001

PV500 DHO WB T 1 Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
500 Gallon 46 HP Diesel 1 

$51,684.001

PV800 DHO WB T 1 Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
800 Gallon 46 HP Diesel 1 

$44,389.001

Man 1 Delete hydraulic boom to manual 
Manual Boom ILO Hydraulic 1 

$750.001

Rev 1 Optional equipment delete - specify 
Reverse Flow 1 

$2,550.001

SWANDS 1 Optional equipment delete - specify 
2 Dielectic 3" Suction Wands 1 

$780.001

Optional equipment delete - specify NA 
 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Emulsifier gun NA 
Electric tongue jack NA 
Auxiliary hydraulics NA 

Spare 1 Spare tire $225.001

VEHICLE: PV800
DEALER: Environmental Products of

Florida
Environmental Products of
Florida

Environmental Products of
Florida

Environmental Products of
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $114,368.00 $114,368.00 $114,368.00 $114,368.00



LED Stick 1 Arrow board 
Arrowstick 1 

$2,568.001

Air brakes NA 
Gooseneck hitch NA 

PTLRHGC-S 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Valve Operator Skid or Truck 1 

$36,540.001

PT8 Port 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Exerciser w/Power Pack and Hose 1 

$24,163.001

SOFT 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Field Mapplet Software Package 1 

$7,706.001

PT-BLRG-T 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Long Reach Valve Operator 1 

$29,793.001

80-1008 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Slide Rail 1 

$4,200.001

Optional equipment - specify NA 
NTAG 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) $150.001

TRANS 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $100.001

TEMP 1 Temporary tag NC1

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Warranty - specify NA 
Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: PV800
DEALER: Environmental Products of

Florida
Environmental Products of
Florida

Environmental Products of
Florida

Environmental Products of
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $114,368.00 $114,368.00 $114,368.00 $114,368.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14,000 LB GVWR
SPECIFICATION #52

2019 PacificTek PV800

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The PacificTek PV800 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
Downgrade to small excavator - specify 
Delete hydraulic boom to manual 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Emulsifier gun 
Electric tongue jack 
Auxiliary hydraulics 
Spare tire 
Arrow board 
Air brakes 
Gooseneck hitch 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 

VEHICLE: PV800 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
Temporary tag 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: PV800 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --




