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Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

3 WHEEL MECHANICAL OR REGENERATIVE AIR SWEEPER (Specification #54)

Environmental Products of Florida

Environmental Products of Florida

Environmental Products of Florida

Environmental Products of Florida

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

2019 Elgin Pelican
2019 Elgin Pelican
2019 Elgin Pelican
2019 Elgin Pelican
2019 Elgin Pelican
2019 Elgin Pelican
2019 Elgin Pelican
2019 Elgin Pelican

2019 Global M3 Regenerative Air Sweeper
2019 Global M3 Regenerative Air Sweeper
2019 Global M3 Regenerative Air Sweeper
2019 Global M3 Regenerative Air Sweeper
2019 Global M3 Regenerative Air Sweeper
2019 Global M3 Regenerative Air Sweeper
2019 Global M3 Regenerative Air Sweeper
2019 Global M3 Regenerative Air Sweeper

2019 Global R3 3 Wheel Regenerative Air
Sweeper

2019 Global R3 3 Wheel Regenerative Air
Sweeper

2019 Global R3 3 Wheel Regenerative Air
Sweeper

2019 Global R3 3 Wheel Regenerative Air
Sweeper

2019 Global R3 3 Wheel Regenerative Air
Sweeper

2019 Global R3 3 Wheel Regenerative Air
Sweeper

2019 Global R3 3 Wheel Regenerative Air
Sweeper

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western

Western

Northern

Northern

Central

Central

Southern

Southern

* Western

Western

* Northern

Northern

* Central

Central

* Southern

Base Unit
Price

$208,162.00
—-NB --
$208,162.00
--NB --
$208,162.00
- NB --
$208,162.00
—-NB --

$202,705.00
—-NB --
$202,705.00
--NB --
$202,705.00
- NB --
$202,705.00
—-NB --
$197,899.00
—-NB --
$197,899.00
--NB --
$197,899.00

- NB --

$197,899.00


https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 54.pdf

2019 Global R3 3 Wheel Regenerative Air

Southern --NB --
Sweeper
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3 WHEEL MECHANICAL OR REGENERATIVE AIR SWEEPER
SPECIFICATION #54

2019 Elgin Pelican

The Elgin Pelican purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $208,162.00 $208,162.00 $208,162.00 $208,162.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Order Code

1120933 !

Order Code
1121610 !

1089429 !
1091361 !
1120820 !
1120827 !
1101017 !
1089502 !

1087668 !
1092236 !
1101318 !

1087539 !

1127329 !
1124183 !

1123319 !

Pelican

Environmental Products of Environmental Products of Environmental Products of

Florida
Western
$208,162.00

Delete Options

Single Left Hand Steering in lieu of Dual Steering

Single Gutter Broom in lieu of Dual Gutter Brooms

Includes RH Single Steer 1
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify

Add Options
Upgrade option - specify

Waterless Pelican

Upgrade option - specify

Hydraulic Level & Temperature Shutdown 1

Upgrade option - specify
Strip Broom Center Sweep 1

Upgrade option - specify

Conveyor Cleanout

Upgrade option - specify
In Cab Air Restriction Gauge 1

Remote adjustment heated mirrors
Heated and Motorized 1

Side broom tilt
with Indicator Per Side 1

Automatic lubrication system
Lifeliner hopper liner
Beacon light with protector

Electric side broom tilt indicator
Included with Broom Tilt 1

Broom hours and mileage recorder
Main Broom

Diesel cold weather start aid

Limb guards
Dual with Front Light Rail 1

Sliding rear window
Litter hose

Front broom

Florida
Northern

$208,162.00

Florida

Central

$208,162.00

Environmental Products of

Florida

Southern

$208,162.00

All Zones

NA

$11,072.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

All Zones
$44.290.00"

$358.00'
$909.00"
$510.00"
$373.00'
$1,272.00'
$1,924.00"

$6,337.00"
$4,029.00"
$969.00"

Incl.1
$388.00"

$565.00"
$2.888.00"

$903.00"
NA
NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

1124786 !
1120744 !
1101326
1106698 !
1101244 !

Temp !
Trans |
New Tag !

Main PL !

Warr P !

Environmental Products of Environmental Products of Environmental Products of

Pelican

Florida Florida
Western Northern
$208,162.00 $208,162.00

Powder coating - specify

Optional equipment - specify
Conveyor Stall Alarm 1

Optional equipment - specify
2 Rear LED Flood & Back-up Lights 1

Optional equiPment - specify
LED Arrowstick

Optional equipment - specify
Greaseable Carbide Dirt Shoes 1

Optional equipment - specify
AM/FM Radio with CD and Map Lights 1

Temporary tag
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify
Full Maintenance Plan Per Year up to 5 Years 1

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify
Extended Warranty Per Year up to 4 Additional Years 1

Warranty - specify

Florida
Central
$208,162.00

Environmental Products of

Florida
Southern
$208,162.00

Std
$727.00"

$787.00"
$1,651.00"
$1,343.00"
$590.00"

NC!

$100.00"
$150.00"
$14,400.00"

NC
$3,300.00"

NA
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3 WHEEL MECHANICAL OR REGENERATIVE AIR SWEEPER
SPECIFICATION #54

2019 Elgin Pelican

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Elgin Pelican purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE: Pelican (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Order Code Delete Options
Single Left Hand Steering in lieu of Dual Steering

Single Gutter Broom in lieu of Dual Gutter Brooms
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify
Downgrade - specify

Order Code Add Options
Upgrade option - specify
Upgrade option - specify
Upgrade option - specify
Upgrade option - specify
Upgrade option - specify
Remote adjustment heated mirrors
Side broom tilt
Automatic lubrication system
Lifeliner hopper liner
Beacon light with protector
Electric side broom tilt indicator
Broom hours and mileage recorder
Diesel cold weather start aid
Limb guards
Sliding rear window
Litter hose
Front broom
Powder coating - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

Southern
-- No bid --

All Zones

All Zones



VEHICLE: Pelican (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:

ZONE: Western Northern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- --No bid --

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

Warranty - specify

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --





