
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4 (Specification #56)
 

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LD
(CK10753) Western $24,374.00

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC, Inc. 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LD
(CK10753) Western $24,523.00

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LD
(CK10753) Northern $24,274.00

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC, Inc. 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LD
(CK10753) Northern $24,323.00

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LD
(CK10753) Central $24,274.00

ALT - Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC, Inc. 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LD
(CK10753) Central $24,423.00

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LD
(CK10753) Southern $24,274.00

ALT - Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LD
(CK10753) Southern $24,449.00

 
Coggin Auto (Ford) 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4WD (X1E) Western $24,479.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4WD (X1E) Western $24,579.00
Coggin Auto (Ford) 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4WD (X1E) Northern $24,369.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4WD (X1E) Northern $24,490.00
Coggin Auto (Ford) 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4WD (X1E) Central $24,479.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4WD (X1E) Central $24,559.00
Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4WD (X1E) Southern $24,569.00
ALT - Coggin Auto (Ford) 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4WD (X1E) Southern $24,579.00
 
Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-150 XLT 4WD (X1E) Western $27,029.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-150 XLT 4WD (X1E) Western $27,060.00
Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-150 XLT 4WD (X1E) Northern $26,959.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-150 XLT 4WD (X1E) Northern $27,029.00
Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-150 XLT 4WD (X1E) Central $27,027.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-150 XLT 4WD (X1E) Central $27,226.00

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEL26.0 Police Rated, Administrative, Utility Vehicles Trucks and Vans Award Spec 56.pdf


Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-150 XLT 4WD (X1E) Southern $27,037.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-150 XLT 4WD (X1E) Southern $27,326.00
 
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 GMC Sierra 1500 1SA (TK15753) Western $24,734.00
 2019 GMC Sierra 1500 1SA (TK15753) Western -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 GMC Sierra 1500 1SA (TK15753) Northern $24,734.00
 2019 GMC Sierra 1500 1SA (TK15753) Northern -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 GMC Sierra 1500 1SA (TK15753) Central $24,734.00
 2019 GMC Sierra 1500 1SA (TK15753) Central -- NB --
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 GMC Sierra 1500 1SA (TK15753) Southern $24,734.00
 2019 GMC Sierra 1500 1SA (TK15753) Southern -- NB --
 
Terry Taylor DeLand Nissan 2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) Western $28,252.00
 2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) Western -- NB --
Terry Taylor DeLand Nissan 2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) Northern $28,147.00
 2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) Northern -- NB --
Terry Taylor DeLand Nissan 2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) Central $28,092.00
 2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) Central -- NB --
Terry Taylor DeLand Nissan 2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) Southern $28,081.00
 2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) Southern -- NB --
 
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2019 Ram 1500 Tradesman 4WD (DS6L41) Western $22,064.00
ALT - Beck Auto Sales 2019 Ram 1500 Tradesman 4WD (DS6L41) Western $22,316.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2019 Ram 1500 Tradesman 4WD (DS6L41) Northern $21,944.00
ALT - Beck Auto Sales 2019 Ram 1500 Tradesman 4WD (DS6L41) Northern $22,261.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2019 Ram 1500 Tradesman 4WD (DS6L41) Central $22,034.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2019 Ram 1500 Tradesman 4WD (DS6L41) Central $22,184.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2019 Ram 1500 Tradesman 4WD (DS6L41) Southern $22,034.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2019 Ram 1500 Tradesman 4WD (DS6L41) Southern $22,184.00
 
Coggin Toyota 2019 Toyota Tundra SR Double Cab (8339) Western $30,528.00
 2019 Toyota Tundra SR Double Cab (8339) Western -- NB --
Coggin Toyota 2019 Toyota Tundra SR Double Cab (8339) Northern $30,354.00
 2019 Toyota Tundra SR Double Cab (8339) Northern -- NB --
Coggin Toyota 2019 Toyota Tundra SR Double Cab (8339) Central $30,396.00
 2019 Toyota Tundra SR Double Cab (8339) Central -- NB --
Coggin Toyota 2019 Toyota Tundra SR Double Cab (8339) Southern $30,528.00
 2019 Toyota Tundra SR Double Cab (8339) Southern -- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES
1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4

SPECIFICATION #56

2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019)
The Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by
the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $28,252.00 $28,147.00 $28,092.00 $28,081.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
AM/FM stereo radio NA 
Air conditioning NA 
Full size spare tire and rim NA 
Power Window and Door Locks NA 
Keyless Entry NA 
Programmed Key Fobs NA 
Limited slip differential on 4-wheel drive NA 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 
V-8 1 Engine upgrade - specify 

Standard drive train; 5.6 liter V8 (390 HP / 394 lb. ft.), 7 speed Automatic Transmission, Final Drive Ratio (2.937);  1 
Std1

Engine upgrade - specify NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA 
CNG model - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
Battery, 650 cca or greater NA 
Dual batteries NA 
7,700 lbs. GVWR NA 

Electric
Brake 1 

Electric brake controller $395.001

Traction control Std 
37219 1 Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) 

(SV UPGRADE PKG) Standard drive train; 5.6 liter V8 (390 HP / 394 lb. ft.), 7 speed Automatic Transmission, Final Drive
Ratio (2.937); King Cab S features plus: 18" x 8" Silver Painted Alloy Wheel, P265/70/R18 Tires, Chrome Front and Rear
Bumper, Chrome Door Handles, Power Adjust Outside Mirror w/ Heat, Chrome Grille with Painted Insert Fender louver
with V8 ENDURANCE Badge, Side Turn Signal Lamp on Mirror Housing, Glovebox Interior Lamp, Illuminated Vanity
Mirrors with Extensions, Standard Floor Carpet, Cloth Seat w/ Vinyl Bolster, Overhead Console with Sunglass Holder,
Grocery Hooks on Cushion Backside, Mood Light, Trailer Sway Control, Advanced Drive-Assist® Display,
NissanConnect? with Mobile Apps, SiriusXM Satellite Radio;  1 

$3,680.001

Speed control Std 
Tilt steering wheel Std 
Passenger dome lamp Std 
Bucket seats in lieu of bench seat 
40-20-40 Seats Std 1 

NA1

Carpet in lieu of rubber floor covering 
Included with SV model upgrade 1 

NA1

L94 1 Floor mats 
FLOOR MATS - ALL SEASON (2 PC); (L92) FLOOR MATS - CARPET (2 PC) Option Price $178.00 To be ordered with
SV upgrade package  1 

$140.001

VEHICLE: Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019)
DEALER: Terry Taylor DeLand

Nissan
Terry Taylor DeLand
Nissan

Terry Taylor DeLand
Nissan

Terry Taylor DeLand
Nissan

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $28,252.00 $28,147.00 $28,092.00 $28,081.00



Tint 1 Deep tinted glass 
S Model all windows; SV Upgrade Model includes Front doors and Windshield Visor Strip Reduced to $190.00  1 

$370.001

Sliding rear window Std 
AM/FM radio with single CD Std 
On-Star NA 
Satellite radio 
Included in SV Model upgrade package  1 

NA1

Side air bags Std 
Cab Steps 1 Cab Steps $380.001

Long bed in lieu of short bed NA 
Single
Spotlight 1 

Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
LED bulb is $180.00 extra  1 

$495.001

Dual
Spotlighrts  1 

Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
LED bulb is $360.00 extra  1 

$990.001

Vent Shades 1 Vent visors - stick-on style 
Front doors only 1 

$145.001

Rainshields - flange style NA 
Bug shield NA 

T01 1 Trailer tow mirrors 
SV TOW PACKAGE - TOW MIRRORS (MANUALLY EXTENDING w/HEAT AND PUDDLE) REQUIRES SV
CONVENIENCE (U01/CNV) and SV Upgrade Package;  1 

$480.001

WGG 1 Wrap-around grille guard 
Dealer installed Grill guard: Winch mount plate additional $400  1 

$1,190.001

Aluminum
Box 1 

Aluminum tool box 
14" deep box; $45.00 extra for 18" deep box  1 

$468.001

A92 1 Bedliner 
8 FOOT DROP-IN BED LINER; NOT AVAILABLE ON S Model with K01/UT1 or SV with K02/UT2  1 

$548.001

Spray
Bedliner 1 

Spray-on bedliner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
Dealer Installed 6.5 ft bed; Included in UT1 and UT2 Utility option packages;  1 

$675.001

Tow hooks Std 
Class 4 1 Class IV hitch and ball 

Dealer installed hitch with 2" ball mount with 2" ball or 2 5/16" and pin and clip  1 
$575.001

Winch 1 8,000 lb. winch with remote 
Requires Grill guard (WGG) and mounting plate  1 

$1,280.001

Class 3 1 Heavy duty towing package up to 5,000 lbs. with appropriate hitch 
[K01] S Convenience & Utility Package -inc: Front Overhead Console, map lamp, sunglass and storage, Spray-In
Bedliner, 4-Pin/7-Pin Wiring Harness Connector (Rear Bumper), Receiver Hitch, 4/7-pin wiring harness with Dealer
installed 2" ball mount with 2" ball or 2 5/16" and pin and clip; DEALER INSTALLED HITCH with 2" ball mount with 2"
ball or 2 5/16" and pin and clip Price - $575.00  1 

$894.001

Heavy duty
tow 1 

Heavy duty towing package up to 7,200 lbs. with appropriate hitch 
Dealer installed hitch with 2" ball mount with 2" ball or 2 5/16" and pin and clip  1 

$575.001

Skid plates Std 
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Shift on the Fly NA 
Fiberglas Lid 1 Fiberglass tonneau cover (painted to match) 

Add $400.00 for ROLL-N-LOCK or ROLLBAK IN LIEU OF Fiberglass Tonneau Cover  1 
$1,695.001

Fiberglas
Topper 1 

Fiberglass cab high topper with front, side and rear windows (painted to match) 
Swing out side windows additional $380.00; Topper with no side windows - additional $450.00  1 

$1,995.001

Daytime running lights Std 
Immobilize daytime running lights NA 
All terrain tires in lieu of all season tires Std 

Nitro Fill 1 Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire $149.001

Midbox body option NA 
Metal Topper 1 Steel truck cap 

Aluminum or Steel toppers same price; ARE 23" DCU Aluminum Cap with inside Aluminum skin, Additional $1200.00;
Cargo Glide 1000 # capacity installed in bed Additional $1740.00;  1 

$1,690.001

Cab Shield 1 Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab) $535.001

Pipe Rack 1 Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup bed) $1,475.001

Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for utility body) NA 
Ladder Rack 1 Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or curbside) $755.001

Front license bracket Std 
Backup alarm, factory installed NA 

BUA 1 Backup alarm, dealer installed 
92 db 1 

$147.001

3rd key 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Additional Key Fob(s) Includes dealer programing  1 

$347.001

Strobes 1 Optional equipment - specify 
4 corner LED Strobes surface mounted  1 

$590.001

Safety Kit 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Includes Fire extinguisher and Triangle Flare  1 

$88.001

New Tag 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Includes secure overnight delivery  1 

$146.001

Tag Transfer 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
Includes secure overnight delivery  1 

$120.001

Temp Tag 1 Temporary tag $20.001

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

5 yr/100,000
mile 1 

Warranty - specify 
Bumper to Bumper 5 Yr/100,000 Mile Warranty; Contact dealer for Complete details  1 

Std1

Warranty - specify NA 
Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019)
DEALER: Terry Taylor DeLand

Nissan
Terry Taylor DeLand
Nissan

Terry Taylor DeLand
Nissan

Terry Taylor DeLand
Nissan

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $28,252.00 $28,147.00 $28,092.00 $28,081.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES
1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK - 4X4

SPECIFICATION #56

2019 Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019)

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Nissan Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by
the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
AM/FM stereo radio 
Air conditioning 
Full size spare tire and rim 
Power Window and Door Locks 
Keyless Entry 
Programmed Key Fobs 
Limited slip differential on 4-wheel drive 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Engine upgrade - specify 
Engine upgrade - specify 
Bi-fuel model - specify 
CNG model - specify 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
Battery, 650 cca or greater 
Dual batteries 
7,700 lbs. GVWR 
Electric brake controller 
Traction control 
Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) 
Speed control 
Tilt steering wheel 
Passenger dome lamp 
Bucket seats in lieu of bench seat 
Carpet in lieu of rubber floor covering 
Floor mats 
Deep tinted glass 
Sliding rear window 
AM/FM radio with single CD 
On-Star 
Satellite radio 
Side air bags 
Cab Steps 
Long bed in lieu of short bed 

VEHICLE: Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Vent visors - stick-on style 
Rainshields - flange style 
Bug shield 
Trailer tow mirrors 
Wrap-around grille guard 
Aluminum tool box 
Bedliner 
Spray-on bedliner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
Tow hooks 
Class IV hitch and ball 
8,000 lb. winch with remote 
Heavy duty towing package up to 5,000 lbs. with appropriate hitch 
Heavy duty towing package up to 7,200 lbs. with appropriate hitch 
Skid plates 
Shift on the Fly 
Fiberglass tonneau cover (painted to match) 
Fiberglass cab high topper with front, side and rear windows (painted to match) 
Daytime running lights 
Immobilize daytime running lights 
All terrain tires in lieu of all season tires 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire 
Midbox body option 
Steel truck cap 
Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab) 
Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup bed) 
Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for utility body) 
Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or curbside) 
Front license bracket 
Backup alarm, factory installed 
Backup alarm, dealer installed 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 

VEHICLE: Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



Temporary tag 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: Titan King Cab S 4WD (37019) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --




