
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

15 FT. FLEX WING ROTARY MOWER - PTO DRIVEN (Specification #19)
 
 2019 Woods BW15.50 Western -- NB --
 2019 Woods BW15.50 Western -- NB --
 2019 Woods BW15.50 Northern -- NB --
 2019 Woods BW15.50 Northern -- NB --
Kelly Tractor Co 2019 Woods BW15.50 Central $13,300.00
 2019 Woods BW15.50 Central -- NB --
Kelly Tractor Co 2019 Woods BW15.50 Southern $13,300.00
 2019 Woods BW15.50 Southern -- NB --
 
Alamo Industrial 2019 Alamo Eagle 15 Western $21,413.00
 2019 Alamo Eagle 15 Western -- NB --
Alamo Industrial 2019 Alamo Eagle 15 Northern $21,413.00
 2019 Alamo Eagle 15 Northern -- NB --
Alamo Industrial 2019 Alamo Eagle 15 Central $21,413.00
 2019 Alamo Eagle 15 Central -- NB --
Alamo Industrial 2019 Alamo Eagle 15 Southern $21,413.00
 2019 Alamo Eagle 15 Southern -- NB --
 
 2019 Bush Hog 3815 Western -- NB --
 2019 Bush Hog 3815 Western -- NB --
 2019 Bush Hog 3815 Northern -- NB --
 2019 Bush Hog 3815 Northern -- NB --
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 Bush Hog 3815 Central $17,380.00
ALT - Creel Tractor 2019 Bush Hog 3815 Central $17,783.00
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 Bush Hog 3815 Southern $17,380.00
ALT - Creel Tractor 2019 Bush Hog 3815 Southern $17,488.00
 
 2019 John Deere HX15 Western -- NB --
 2019 John Deere HX15 Western -- NB --
 2019 John Deere HX15 Northern -- NB --

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 19.pdf


 2019 John Deere HX15 Northern -- NB --
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 John Deere HX15 Central $16,900.00
 2019 John Deere HX15 Central -- NB --
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 John Deere HX15 Southern $16,900.00
 2019 John Deere HX15 Southern -- NB --
 
Futch's Tractor Depot 2019 Landpride Batwing (RC5615) Western $15,250.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Landpride Batwing (RC5615) Western $15,456.00
Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Landpride Batwing (RC5615) Northern $14,956.00
ALT - Futch's Tractor Depot 2019 Landpride Batwing (RC5615) Northern $15,250.00
Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Landpride Batwing (RC5615) Central $14,956.00
ALT - Futch's Tractor Depot 2019 Landpride Batwing (RC5615) Central $15,250.00
Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Landpride Batwing (RC5615) Southern $15,206.00
ALT - Creel Tractor 2019 Landpride Batwing (RC5615) Southern $15,219.00
 
 2019 Rhino 4150 Western -- NB --
 2019 Rhino 4150 Western -- NB --
 2019 Rhino 4150 Northern -- NB --
 2019 Rhino 4150 Northern -- NB --
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 Rhino 4150 Central $15,460.00
 2019 Rhino 4150 Central -- NB --
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 Rhino 4150 Southern $15,460.00
 2019 Rhino 4150 Southern -- NB --
 
 2019 Schulte FX-1800 Western -- NB --
 2019 Schulte FX-1800 Western -- NB --
 2019 Schulte FX-1800 Northern -- NB --
 2019 Schulte FX-1800 Northern -- NB --
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 Schulte FX-1800 Central $16,890.00
 2019 Schulte FX-1800 Central -- NB --
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 Schulte FX-1800 Southern $16,890.00
 2019 Schulte FX-1800 Southern -- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

15 FT. FLEX WING ROTARY MOWER - PTO DRIVEN
SPECIFICATION #19

2019 Schulte FX-1800
The Schulte FX-1800 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $16,890.00 $16,890.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options

Western
&
Northern

Central
& Southern

FX1200 2 10 ft. Flex Wing in lieu of 15 ft. 
10' FLEXWING CUTTER, CLEVIS HITCH, 5 SEVERE DUTY TIRES, CHAINS  2 

($3,290.00)2

Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 
Delete option - specify NA 

 

Order Code Add Options

Western
&
Northern

Central
& Southern

LAMINATED 2 Laminated sectional tires 
IN LIEU OF SEVERE DUTY TIRES 2 

NC2

Upgrade to Hydro 15 NA 
FX520 2 Upgrade to 20 ft. Flex Wing 

20' FLEXWING ROTARY CUTTER, 6 A/C TIRES, CHAINS  2 
$15,610.002

Additional Key NA 
XH1000 2 Optional equipment - specify 

10' FLEXWING ROTARY CUTTER, EQUAL ANGLE HITCH, 5 SEVERE DUTY TIRES, CHAINS (THIS IS A
TOTAL PRICE) 2 

$20,800.002

XH1500 2 Optional equipment - specify 
15' FLEXWING ROTARY CUTTER, EQUAL ANGLE HITCH, 6 SEVERE DUTY TIRES, CHAINS, (THIS IS A
TOTAL PRICE) 2 

$23,500.002

FX318 2 Optional equipment - specify 
18' FLEXWING ROTARY CUTTER, EQUAL ANGLE HITCH, 6 SEVERE DUTY TIRES, CHAIN, (THIS IS A
TOTAL PRICE)  2 

$21,200.002

1000PTO 2 Optional equipment - specify 
IN LIEU OF 540 PTO  2 

NC2

W/AXLE-1000 2 Optional equipment - specify 
WALKING AXLE OPTION FOR XH1000, INCLUDES 1 EXTRA TIRE 2 

$1,000.002

W/AXLE-1500 2 Optional equipment - specify 
WALKING AXLE OPTION FOR XH1500, INCLUDES 2 EXTRA TIRES  2 

$1,800.002

CLEVIS 2 Optional equipment - specify 
CLEVIS HITCH IN LIEU OF EQUAL ANGLE HITCH  2 

NC2

P HITCH 2 Optional equipment - specify 
PRECISION HITCH IN LIEU OF EQUAL ANGLE  2 

NC2

DISCOUNT 2 Optional equipment - specify 
20% DISCOUNT OFF OF MSRP ON OPTIONS & NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONAL MODELS PER SPEC #19.
INCLUDES ANY FREIGHT AND REQUIRED INSTALLATION COSTS  2 

Std2

VEHICLE: FX-1800
DEALER: Everglades Equipment Group Everglades Equipment Group
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $16,890.00 $16,890.00



Optional equipment - specify NA 
Temporary tag NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

1 YEAR 2 Warranty - specify 
PARTS & LABOR-DOES NOT INCLUDE TRANSPORTATION  2 

Std2

5 YEAR 2 Warranty - specify 
LIMITED GEARBOX WARRANTY-DOES NOT INCLUDE TRANSPORTATION  2 

Std2

VEHICLE: FX-1800
DEALER: Everglades Equipment Group Everglades Equipment Group
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $16,890.00 $16,890.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

15 FT. FLEX WING ROTARY MOWER - PTO DRIVEN
SPECIFICATION #19

2019 Schulte FX-1800

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Schulte FX-1800 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
10 ft. Flex Wing in lieu of 15 ft. 
Delete option - specify 
Delete option - specify 
Delete option - specify 
Delete option - specify 
Delete option - specify 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Laminated sectional tires 
Upgrade to Hydro 15 
Upgrade to 20 ft. Flex Wing 
Additional Key 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: FX-1800 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --




