
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

70 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR (STANDARD TRACK - WIDE TRACK OPTIONAL) (Specification #37)
 
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case 650M Western $85,620.00
 2019 Case 650M Western -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case 650M Northern $81,543.00
 2019 Case 650M Northern -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case 650M Central $81,543.00
 2019 Case 650M Central -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case 650M Southern $81,543.00
 2019 Case 650M Southern -- NB --
 
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar D3 Western $84,749.00
 2019 Caterpillar D3 Western -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar D3 Northern $84,749.00
 2019 Caterpillar D3 Northern -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar D3 Central $84,749.00
 2019 Caterpillar D3 Central -- NB --
Kelly Tractor Co 2019 Caterpillar D3 Southern $77,485.00
 2019 Caterpillar D3 Southern -- NB --
 
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 450K Western $78,850.00
 2019 John Deere 450K Western -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 450K Northern $78,850.00
 2019 John Deere 450K Northern -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 450K Central $78,850.00
 2019 John Deere 450K Central -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 450K Southern $78,850.00
 2019 John Deere 450K Southern -- NB --

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 37.pdf


FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

70 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR (STANDARD TRACK - WIDE
TRACK OPTIONAL)
SPECIFICATION #37

2019 John Deere 450K
The John Deere 450K purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $78,850.00 $78,850.00 $78,850.00 $78,850.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Downgrade model - specify NA 
Downgrade model - specify NA 
Standard track NA 

Non-Specified
Option
Discount
25% 1 

Standard dozer blade 
Discount Option: A discount of 25% off manufacturers current published list price (MSRP) will be applied to all
non-specified factory options. This discount would apply to both base units, and optional models. 1 

NA1

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 
JD 450K
LGP 1 

Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere model 450K LGP dozer 1 

$5,850.001

JD 550K
XLT 1 

Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere model 550K XLT dozer 1 

$22,875.001

JD 550K
LGP 1 

Model upgrade - specify 
Upgrade to John Deere model 550K LGP dozer 1 

$27,500.001

Model upgrade - specify NA 
1076/4570 1 Wide track 24" minimum 

Add 24" LGP wide track option to the John Deere model 450K dozer 1 
$3,682.001

7075 1 Wide track dozer blade, PAT 
Add 124" wide track dozer blade, PAT, to John Deere model 450K dozer 1 

$3,072.001

5085 1 Cab with air conditioning 
Enclosed cab with air conditioning 1 

$11,107.001

9403/7975 1 Winch 
Winch, power in / power out 1 

$16,775.001

9168 1 Cab mounted lights 
Add optional work lights, for use on both cab and canopy equipped dozers 1 

$252.001

BYT10165 1 Cab mounted sweeps 
Limb risers/sweeps, for use on both cab and canopy equipped dozers 1 

$1,452.001

9168 1 Canopy mounted lights 
Add optional work lights, for use on both cab and canopy equipped dozers 1 

$252.001

BYT10165 1 Canopy mounted sweeps 
Limb risers/sweeps, for use on both cab and canopy equipped dozers 1 

$1,452.001

9450 1 Canopy rear screen 
Rear screen for canopy equipped dozers 1 

$777.001

9455 1 Cab rear screen 
Rear screen for cab equipped dozers 1 

$995.001

9345 1 Draw bar 
Draw bar, with pin 1 

$197.001

9325 1 Heavy duty grille 
Severe duty grill 1 

$963.001

VEHICLE: 450K
DEALER: Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $78,850.00 $78,850.00 $78,850.00 $78,850.00



Radiator sandblast grid NA 
9130 1 Optional equipment - specify 

Engine pre-cleaner 1 
$368.001

9410 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Winch fairlead 1 

$2,888.001

9440 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Winch drawbar, with pin 1 

$784.001

9380 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Single speed rear wiper 1 

$502.001

AT320934 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Lift cylinder guards 1 

$175.001

BY10166 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Full screen package, for dozers equipped with enclosed cab 1 

$5,760.001

BYT10409 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Full screen package, for dozers equipped with canopy 1 

$4,795.001

BYT10770 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Tank guard 1 

$1,845.001

Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 

Non-Specified
Option
Discount
25% 1 

Optional equipment - specify 
Discount Option: A discount of 25% off manufacturers current published list price (MSRP) will be applied to all
non-specified factory options. This discount would apply to both base units, and optional models 1 

NA1

Temporary tag NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Please contact your dealer for a quote. 1 

NA1

Maintenance Plan - specify 
Please contact your dealer for a quote. 1 

NA1

5 year/7500 extended powertrain warranty 
Please contact your dealer for a quote. 1 

NA1

Warranty - specify 
Please contact your dealer for a quote. 1 

NA1

Warranty - specify 
Please contact your dealer for a quote. 1 

NA1

VEHICLE: 450K
DEALER: Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $78,850.00 $78,850.00 $78,850.00 $78,850.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

70 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR (STANDARD TRACK - WIDE
TRACK OPTIONAL)
SPECIFICATION #37

2019 John Deere 450K

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The John Deere 450K purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Downgrade model - specify 
Downgrade model - specify 
Standard track 
Standard dozer blade 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Wide track 24" minimum 
Wide track dozer blade, PAT 
Cab with air conditioning 
Winch 
Cab mounted lights 
Cab mounted sweeps 
Canopy mounted lights 
Canopy mounted sweeps 
Canopy rear screen 
Cab rear screen 
Draw bar 
Heavy duty grille 
Radiator sandblast grid 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 

VEHICLE: 450K (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
5 year/7500 extended powertrain warranty 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: 450K (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --




