
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 LB CAPACITY (Specification #71)
 
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Western $33,489.00
 2019 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Western -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Northern $33,489.00
 2019 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Northern -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Central $33,489.00
 2019 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Central -- NB --
Kelly Tractor Co 2019 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Southern $21,600.00
 2019 Caterpillar 2CC4000 Southern -- NB --
 
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Mitsubishi FG25 Western $35,341.00
 2019 Mitsubishi FG25 Western -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Mitsubishi FG25 Northern $35,341.00
 2019 Mitsubishi FG25 Northern -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Mitsubishi FG25 Central $35,341.00
 2019 Mitsubishi FG25 Central -- NB --
 2019 Mitsubishi FG25 Southern -- NB --
 2019 Mitsubishi FG25 Southern -- NB --
 
Southern States ToyotaLift 2019 Toyota 8FGCU20 Western $23,203.00
 2019 Toyota 8FGCU20 Western -- NB --
Southern States ToyotaLift 2019 Toyota 8FGCU20 Northern $23,203.00
 2019 Toyota 8FGCU20 Northern -- NB --
Southern States ToyotaLift 2019 Toyota 8FGCU20 Central $23,203.00
 2019 Toyota 8FGCU20 Central -- NB --
Southern States ToyotaLift 2019 Toyota 8FGCU20 Southern $23,203.00
 2019 Toyota 8FGCU20 Southern -- NB --

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 71.pdf


FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 LB CAPACITY
SPECIFICATION #71

2019 Mitsubishi FG25
The Mitsubishi FG25 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $35,341.00 $35,341.00 $35,341.00 -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

FG15N5-LE 1 Downgrade to 3000 lb. lift truck 
DOWNGRADE TO FG15N5-LE, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

($13,729.00)1 

FG20CN5-LE 1 Downgrade model - specify 
DOWNGRADE TO FG20N5-LE, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

($11,821.00)1 

PWR30-42X27 1 Downgrade model - specify 
DOWNGRADE TO PWR30-42X27, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

($25,323.00)1 

Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 

 

Order Code Add Options

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

FD25N5-D 1 Upgrade to 5000 lb. lift truck 
UPGRADE TO FD25N5-D, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

($2,759.00)1 

FD30N5-D 1 Upgrade to 6000 lb. lift truck 
UPGRADE TO FD30N5-D, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

($13.00)1 

FBC30NS-36V 1 Model upgrade - specify 
UPGRADE TO FBC30NS-36V, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

($9,588.00)1 

FG30N5-LE 1 Model upgrade - specify 
UPGRADE TO FG30N5-LE, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

($6,486.00)1 

FG40N1-LE 1 Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO FG40N1-LE, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

$5,242.001 

FD50N1-D 1 Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO FD50N1-D, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

$19,488.001 

ESR23N2-36V 1 Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO ESR23N2-36V, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

$896.001 

FD40N1-D 1 Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO FD40N1-D, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 

$11,296.001 

Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 

VEHICLE: FG25
DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $35,341.00 $35,341.00 $35,341.00 -- No bid --



Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 

DISCOUNT 1 Optional equipment - specify 
7% DISCOUNT OFF OF ALL MITSUBISHI LIFT TRUCKS AND OEM NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS 1 

1 

Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 

WAR24UNLIM1
 1 

Warranty - specify 
24 MONTHS / UNLIMITED HOURS FULL COVERAGE; 36 MONTHS / 6,000 HOUR POWERTRAIN 1 

$815.001 

WAR48GRP21 1 Warranty - specify 
48 MONTHS / 8,000 HOUR FULL COVERAGE 1 

$1,378.001 

VEHICLE: FG25
DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $35,341.00 $35,341.00 $35,341.00 -- No bid --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 LB CAPACITY
SPECIFICATION #71

2019 Mitsubishi FG25

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Mitsubishi FG25 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Downgrade to 3000 lb. lift truck 
Downgrade model - specify 
Downgrade model - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 
Optional equipment delete - specify 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Upgrade to 5000 lb. lift truck 
Upgrade to 6000 lb. lift truck 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Maintenance Plan - specify 

VEHICLE: FG25 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: FG25 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --




